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MARSDEN SCHOOL
KARORI, WELLINGTON.

CHURCH OF ENGLAND
BOARDING AND DAY SCHOOL

FOR GIRLS.— —.— .i
Chairman of the Board of Governors:

The Right Reverend the Bishop of <

Wellington.
Headmistress: Miss: Mayhew (Late

'
Vice-Principal of ;Marsden School
and of the Diocesan School for \
Girls' Windsor, Nova Scotia). |

Chaplain: The Rev. F. M. Kemp- j
thorne.

The School, standing m its own
grounds of 12£ acres, is completely
equipped with spacious buildings of
modern construction and design. The
excellent health, work and games
records of the school testify to the
bracing air of Karori, the well-venti-
latedand warmedrooms, thecarefully- j
planneddietand the generalhappiness |
and well-being of the girls. j

The School course includes a wide ,
choice of general subjects and affords :
a sound preparation for the usual :
examinations. Aural Training, Sing-
ing, Art, Handicrafts, Domestic Sci- ,

i ence, Typewriting and Shorthand are
included m the curriculum, and for j
those interested special facilities are j
offered m Dramatic Work, Photo- jgraphy, Gardening, and the study of
New Zealand Plants.

The physical side is provided for \by a fully-equipped Gymnasium, Ten- }
nis and Net-ball Courts, Cricket and i
Hockey Fields, and a new and attrac- !
tive Swimming Pool.

Prospectus and further information ''
may be obtainedon application to the
Headmistress.

DIOCESANHIGH SCHOOL
FOR GIRLS,

Epsom, Auckland.

Head Mistress:
MISS E. R. EDWARDS, M.A.

(Cantab.)

BOARDING AND DAY SCHOOL
FOR GIRLS.

Prospectus may be obtained
uponapplication to the Secretary,

Diocesan High School,
Epsom, Auckland.

ROYAL EXCHANGE ASSURANCE
CORPORATION OF LONDON.

FIRE:— MARINE— ACCIDENT.

BOWMAN'S BUILDINGS,
TENNYSON STREET,

NAPIER.
P.O. Box 231. 'Phone 509

FINCH & WESTERHOLM,
Registered Architects

and StructuralEngineers,.
Kaiapoi Woollen Co.'s Building,

TENNYSON STREET, NAPIER.

'Phones: Office 632.
Private Residences, 633

or 1129.

*
BAIRD'S *j

QUALITY MEN'S WEAR j
DRAPERS SPECIALISTS .j

■
"" ■'„"'' '■■■'..-' . - ' .. 'i— -

" ■ i

Use our Mail Order Shopping Service. Let us know your ■ j
requirements and we will give you prices and particulars j

of the things you desire. 1
SATISFACTION GUARANTEED IN EVERY
TRANSACTION OR MONEY REFUNDED.

i

and WAIPUKURAU X*

For that afternoon or bridge party order your sandwiches from THE TROCADERO, HASTINGS STREET
NAPIER.

EDMUND ANSCOMBE, F.N.Z.1.A.,
AND ASSOCIATES.

Architects & StructuralEngineers,

WELLINGTON.
And at HASTINGS, H.B.

CHURCH BOOK STORE,
18 Mulgrave St., Wellington, N.l.

IMPORTANT ANNOUNCEMENT
In response to numerous in-

quiries we have to inform our cus-
tomers that for some months yet
only a limited number of bindings
of Prayer and Hymn Books con-
taining the King Edward Prayers
willbe available.

We have a shipment now to
hand and have them to retail m
leather only from 5/6 to 33/-, and
descriptions of bindings and types
willbe sent on request.
CHURCHPEOPLE— SUPPORT
YOUR OWN BOOK STORE!.

NATIONAL
INSURANCECO. OFNEW ZEALAND

FIRE
— MARINE— ACCIDENT
Head Office: Dunedin.

Chief Agents for Hawke's Bay
and Poverty Bay.

WILLIAMS & KETTLE, LTD.,
NAPIER.

UNDERTAKERS
aha

FUNERAL DIRECTORS

KERSHAW'S
Heretaunga Street East,

HASTINGS
REASONABLE RATES.

'Phone 4234, Day or Night.

NOTICE TO ADVERTISERS.
Inquiries for advertising space |

on this cover willbe welcomed by
the Business Manager,

■-:>■..- P.O. Box 227, Napier,
Or the Editor,

18 Colenso Avenue,
Napier.
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CALENDAR FOR AUGUST.

2— Eighth Sunday after Trinity.
6 (Th.)— Transfiguration of Our

Lord.
9
— Ninth Sunday after Trinity.

16— Tenth Sunday after Trinity.
23

—
EleventhSunday after Trinity.

24 (M.)— S.Bartholomew A.M.
30— Twelfth Sunday after Trinity.

THEBISHOP'SENGAGEMENTS
August 2

—
Dannevirke.

August 9— Auckland.
August 16— Woodville.
August 19— S. John's, Napier,
August 23— Takapau.
August 30

— Porangahau.

DIOCESAN NOTES.
The Venerable Archdeacon Butter-

field is resigning the cure of Wairoa
as on December 31st. The Bishop is
arranging to appoint him as a super-
numerary priest, with the title of
Diocesan Chaplain, which should
prove of great advantage to the Dio-
cese. He will retain the Arch-
deaconry of Waiapu.

The Board of Nominationhas ap-
pointed the Rev. Claude Hyde as
Vicar of Wairoa.

TheClericalMembers of theStand-
ing Committee have electedthe Rev.
C. Mortimer-Jones as a member of
the Board of Nominationm the place
of the late ArchdeaconChatterton.

FREDERICK WILLIAM CHAT-
TERTON.

Frederick William Chatterton, who
died on Thursday, July 16th, was
born m 1860 at Tamworth, where he
received his early education. At
seventeen he obtained a position m
Lloyd's Bank m Londonand worked
there for sevenyears.

In 1884 Bishop Suter of Nelson
visited England, and during his visit
arranged that Mr Chatterton should
return with him to New Zealand.
After a course of training under the
Bishop at Bishopsdalehe was ordain-
ed deaconm 1886 and priest m the
following year. For two years he
actedas the Bishop's domestic chap-
lain withanominalcuracy at Whaka-

maka. In 1888 he was appointed
Vicar of AllSaints' Church m Nelson,
wherehe remainedtill 1902, whenhe
became Principalof the Maori Theo-
logical College at Te Rau, Gisborrie.
While at the college he sat for and
obtainedthe degree of 8.D., Durham,
and was made a Canon of Waiapu
m1918.

In 1919 he was appointed to the
Cure of Rotorua, where he worked
till failing health compelled his re-
signation m 1934. He was Arch-
deaconof Tauranga from 1919 tillhis
death..

The Archdeacon was a staunch
Evangelical, but always tolerant of
the views of others. He was a deep
thinker, and habitually formed a
judgmatical view of any problem
presented to him. In his early days
at Nelson he imbibed an interest m
the Maori race, whichheretainedfor
the rest of his life. He took a very
keen interestm foreign missions, and
was one of the active movers m the
formationof theNew ZealandBranch
of the ChurchMissionary Society. He
was very musical, and during his
residence mLondon he acted as or-
ganist m one of the London churches.
He was for many years a prominent
member of the New Zealand. Alli-
ance and an ardent advocate of Pro-
hibition.

He wasnever reallyrobust,but was
accustomed to fatiguing activities,be-
ing always careless of his own ease
whenhe consideredthat his duty de-
mandedaction. A few years ago he
underwenta serious operation,which
while it gave him relief, seriously
diminished his strength, and to on-
lookers it appeared that it was only
his indomitable will which enabled
him to carry out his duties.

While he held his own views
strongly, his sense of justice made
him considerate to those who dif-
fered fromhim. His affectionate dis-
position won the love of others and
createda very widecircle of friends.
He willbemuch missedby Maoriand
Pakeha, not only m the Diocese of
Waiapu, but throughout the whole of
New Zealand.

Mrs Chatterton may be assured of
the heartfelt sympathy of her many
thousands of friends.

OTHER DIOCESES.

WELLINGTON.
Work is going on apace at Putiki

with the building of the third re-
placement of the first Church to be
erectedm the WellingtonDiocese. On
June sth Sir Apirana Ngata and a
party of Rotorua carvers on their way
toput thefinishing touches to thenew
carvedhouse at Waitara, paid a visit
to Putiki,andan enthusiasticmeeting
was heldat the Pahm the evening.
After inspecting the building with the
contractor, and going over the plans
for theinterior carvings andpanelling
work, Sir Apirana advised us to aim
at another five hundred pounds for
the completion of the building and
decorations. The localMaori repre-
sentative of the Native Department
has assured us that he is confident of
beingable toraisehalf of this amount
among the Wanganui Maoris,and the
chairman of the H. and W. Williams
Memorial Trust has also given his
assurance that, if the Maoris do raise
this further contributiontowards the
cost of the Church, the Trustees will
subsidise it with a further grant"of
two hundred and fifty pounds. This
will be the second grant for this
amount that they have made towards
the cost of the Church.'

The building is being erected as a
memorial to those who have been
specially connected with the work of
the MaoriMissionmWanganui m the
past,andseveralhandsomegifts have
already been received towards the
furnishings. Mrs H. D. Bates has
given fiftypounds to providea carved
altar and choir stalls m memory of
her husband, who was a pupilmMr
Richard Taylor's Mission School, and
who was always keenly interestedm
the work at Putiki. A sum of £200,
which was part of a legacy fromMr.
Bates' estate forMaoriMission work,
was the first contribution received
towardsthe building fundfor the new
Church. The altar and choir stalls
will forma 'fitting companion to the
carvedpulpitmmemory of the Revs.
Richard and Basil Taylor, for which
the members of the Taylor family
have given thesum of £75. Mrs. A.
E. Barton, of Wanganui, has given a
handsomesanctuary chair, carved by



herself, m memory of her mother,
Mrs. Harper, who was a daughter of
Richard Taylor. Mrs. Scott andMrs.
Katene,of Putiki,have given a carv-
edfontmmemoryof MissM. Tahana,
who stood as godmother to many of
the childrenat Putiki, and who was
well known for many years as the
contralto soloist of the Putiki Choir.
We understand that there is amove-
ment on foot m Wanganui to put
stainedglass m the two east windows
m memory of the Rev. A. O. Wil-
liams, who was for 35 years super-
intendentof the MaoriMission m this
Diocese. Contributions may be sent
to Mr. C. R. White, City Council
Office, Wanganui. We still hope tc
see memorials to the Rev. John
Mason, who was actually the first
missionary m the Wanganui district;
the Rev. Thos. Grace, who preceded,
the Rev. A. O. Williams for three
years; and the Rev. Arona Te Hana,
who splendidly carried on the work
between the death of the Rev. Basil
Taylor m 1876 and the coming of
Mr. Grace m 1883. A carvedPrayer
Desk, Lectern and Credence Table
wouldform fittingmemorialsto these
three pioneers. We also areurgently
m need of a new organ for the
Church. The present instrument was
the original organ m the Collegiate
School Chapel, and was given by the
lateMr. Walter Empson to the Rev.
A. O. Williams when the first pipe
organ was installed m the Chapel
about forty-five years ago.

The Maoricarvers andpanelweav-
ers will begin their part of the work
mAugust, by which time the erection
of the building itself will be com-
pleted. The roof will be lined with
kakaho and the wallswith panels of
tukutuku work. All exposed wood-
work, including the ends of the pews,
will be carved, and a carved canopy
will be erected over the font at the
west end. The Church when com-
pletedwillcertainly be unique among
those m the westernportion of New
Zealand.

The newBishop of Wellington,who
will have been consecrated before
this Gazette is published, landed m
Wellington on July 16thandwas wel-
comed by the Commissary, Canon
James, and others. As usual,he was
beset by reporters for his opinion of
New Zealand before he had set foot

m the country. He seems to have
dealt with them with wisdom and
tact.

We adda report of his farewell to
his oldparishand diocese, for which
the Editor is indebted to Dean
Brocklehurst.

The clergy of the Kineton Rural
Deanery met on Friday afternoon at
BarfordRectory to take leave of the
Archdeaconof Warwick,Bishop-elect
of Wellington, N.Z., and to give him
a token of their gratitude for all that
he has done for them as Leader of
the Way of Renewal Meetings for
Prayer and Study and as a mark of
their affection and esteem.

The gift took the formof aPastoral
Staff, the shaft of which was made
of twelfth century oak from Strat-
ford-on-Avon Parish Church; this
was surmounted by a Shepherd's
Crook m polished wrought iron, a
facsimile of one which has been m
the possession of a Warwickshire
shepherd for more than 70 years.
The Crook carried an inscription cut
into the iron and was enclosed m a
leather case bearing the Archdeacon's
initials.

The Bishop-electsaid:"Seven years
ago Icame here with one purpose
only

—
so to lift up Christ that many

of youmight be drawn to Him,might
enter into His service, and help to
bring m His reign of joy and peace
m this place. To-nightIam largely
conscious of failure. IfIhad not
failed there would not be so many
who, while accepting their pastor as
a friend, do not want him for their
leader and guide m spirit things."

Taking as his text, "Herein is my
Father glorified, that ye bear much
fruit," the Archdeacon spoke of the
waym which he was moved by the
sight of somany friends come to hear
bislast messageas their pastor. After
expressing doubts as to the success
of his ministry, he saidhe wanted to
put on one side this doubt, and the
inevitable grief of parting from, so
many friends, and to let the service
be one of thanksgiving. During his
life amongthem he hadbeen blessed
with the loyalty and affection of
many, and the pain of parting was
mutual. However, he did not want
his closing message to be about him-
self, but about Christ. The joyful
message of the Christian faith was

"Sursum corda" — "Lift up .your
hearts"— andhe wantedthat to be his
parting thought.

At theconclusion of the service the
Archdeacon stood at the church door
to say farewell to the many friends
from a distance, and afterwards the
Rectory grounds were thrown up to
visitors.

WAIKATO.
St. Stephen's, Lewisham.

—
About

forty- years ago the Bishop of Wai-
kato, New Zealand (the Right Rev.
C. A. Cherrington, 8.D.), was one of
the altar servers at St. Stephen's,
Lewisham. Hereturned to the church
on his visit to England, sat m the
chancel during High Mass, sung with
the beauty of music and ceremonial
for which this church is famous, and
preached at the end of the service.
Recalling the days whenhe served at
St. Stephens's, he said he lived two
miles away and used to walk to and
from the church to serve. He felt
very proud at being asked to return
and preach there. His diocese was
only ten years old,and theyhadbeen
able to make its affairs financially
sound, but he was over now to try
to raise £5000 for six parishes which
were handed to him m 1926 heavily
m debt and still werem that condi-
tion. They had no endowments and
had to collect every halfpenny for
clergy and parishes. He gave in-
stances of his dioces's lack of means,
and said that all the six parishes had
Eucharistic vestments and three had
Reservation.

Some of the Waikato clergy have a
revolutionary suggestion about the
observance of Sunday. One of them
says:

We are all aware of the difficulty of
Sunday observancem these days, and
we are also aware of the futility of
pious exhortations of how the day
shouldbe spent, and of diatribes on
the wayit is misused. What is needed
is a carefulexamination of the whole
problemm the light of modern con-
ditions;and theurgency of the matter
is increased with the approach of
what isknown as the 40-hour week.

Tobegin with, thereis nothingpar-
ticularly sacred about our habit of
beginning the day at midnight; it is
a comparatively modern innovation,
aridm the early Church the day be-
gan and endedat sunset, the method
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of computing the days apparently
being bettered at one of the many
calendarreforms. At a meeting of the
TaranakiArchdeaconry Boardm this
diocese, the suggestion was made that
a possible solution of the.problem of
Sunday might be found if we revert-
ed to this earliermethodof beginning
the day at sunset. It would mean
that the twenty-four hour period
known as Sunday would be moved
forwardby six hours and wouldbe-
gin at, say, 6 p.m. on Saturday and
end at 6 p.m. on Sunday, and the
present laws m force regulating the
observance of Sunday would extend
over that period. Saturday would
be an ordinary work day andMonday
wouldbe a wholeholiday, seeing that
the 40-hour week now seems to be a
matter of practicalpolitics.

What would be the advantage of
this change?

(1) Ev'ensorfg could be said on
Saturday evening, and would be a
devotional preparation for Holy
Communion on the following morn-
ing. Such a preparation would be
preferable to the present habit of
pictures and dances on Saturday
night which is the real reason at
the bottom of so many lapsed com-
munica)nts. It would be also m
accordance with the ancient custom
of Eves and Vigils, which finds ex-
pression m the Revised Lectionary.

(2) If the 40-hour week becomss
general, it is more fitting that the
worship and recognition of God
should come at the beginning of the
period of rest and rscreation, rather
than at the end, or wouldbe easier
if Saturday becamea whole holiday.

(3) A whole holiday on Saturday
will make worship m the Summer
months evenmore difficult than it is
at present, seeing that week-endex-
cursions and,week-endcamps willget
an even greater stimulus than at
present. The change suggested
would not, of course, make people
come to Church, but it would enable
the faithful to fulfil their religious
obligations before setting out for
their recreation.
It is of course quits obvious that a

change like this could only be
brought about by Act of Parliament,
as it is a matter that affects the
whole community m more ways than
one. New Zealand is, more or less,
a self-contained entity and it would
be easier to introduce the change

here than it would be m a country
like England, which is closely tied
to the Continent of Europe. Such
difficulties as would arise could eas-
ily be overcomeby the exercise of a
little common-sense. The Church
of herself can do nothing practical
m the matter, but she stands as a
guardian" of Sunday as a holy day,
and not just a holiday. She must
bestir herself m her stewardship,
and do something for the spiritual
observanceof Sunday under the con-
ditions of modern lifa. A practical
scheme sponsored by the whole
Church would demand the attention
of the Government. The above is
offered as a first step towards a solu-
tion of the problem.

THE CHURCH ARMY.
Printing Press.— Mr. F. Day, of

Christchurch, has nobly offered him-
self and his private-owned printing
press to the Church Army, whichoffer
has been accepted. For some years
Mr. Day has been making a living
fromhis work, andnow feels that he
would like to dedicate himself and
his tools of trade for the furthering
of the Kingdom of God and the
Church. The printing press is to
become the property of the Church
Army. Mr.Day asked that little or
no wages be paid him, but it has
been decided to give him the pay
and status of a C.A. officer (which
pay is very little) andhe will most
likely be known as Capt.-Manager.
.The press willbe installedat Church
Army Headquarters. As the dis-
tribution of Church literature is a
special feature of the work of the
Church Army, this gift willbe a tre-
mendousasset. It is a very refresh-
ing thing that a young man of to-
day, akin to the disciples of old,
offers his all for the Kingdom of
God.

The fifth New Zealander to be
accepted for probationary training
is Mr. A. M.H.Dswar, of Masterton.
He will be at the Church Army
HeadquartersfromJuly 25th onward
for his preliminary training. A
sixth trainee is to be selected next
month.

Waiapu Diocesan Caravan.—Re-
ports from Capt. Sutcliffe tell of
good workbeing done m the Wairoa
parish and district. A slight acci-
dent to the trailer vanhas been re-
paired. Part of the expense was

met by insurance, and the occasion
of repairs was used to give the van
an overhaul and to make necessary
adjustments for the rough travel of
the back-block districts. This has
cost the C.A. £8 ss.

GIRLS' FRIENDLY SOCIETY.
A Day of Thanksgiving and Inter-

cession for the Girls' Friendly So-
ciety all over the world, was held
on Sunday, sth July, m St. Mat-
thew's Church, Hastings. Canon
Mortimer-Jones took the services.
At 5 p.m. m the evening, tea was
given m St. Matthew's Hall as the
G.F.S. Room was not large enough
for the number attending. Miss
Millie Dalton, the very energetic
secretary was very busy, looking
after associates and members. The
Diocesan Secretary, Miss M. S.
White, andDiocesan Literary Secre-
tary, Miss Helen Paseley, were in-
vited, and were present. After tea,
48 members and associates attended
evsning service m St. Matthew's
Church, Canon Mortimer-Jones giv-
ing a most uplifting address on the
aims and objects of theG.F.S., which
had celebrated its Diamond Jubilee
last year.

MARIE S. WHITE,
Dio. Sec, G.F.S.

A day of thanksgiving and Inter-
cession for the Girls' Friendly So-
ciety all over the world was heldm
St. John's Church, Napier, on Sun-
day, 21st June. H.C, 8 a.m. Rev.
L. Foulkes read the G.F.S. Prayer
and G.F.S. Prayers of Intercession
also at St. Augustine's Church on
Sunday, 21st June,H.C, 8 a.m. Rev.
S. R. Gardiner, M.A., read the
G.F.S. Prayer and G.F.S. Prayers of
Intercession. There was a good at-
tendance of associates and members
at St. John's Church and at
St. Augustine's Church.

MARIE S. WHITE,
Dio. Sec, G.F.S.

BOARD OF MISSIONS NOTES.
CHINA.

Here is a short and businesslike
noteon healingbyprayer,fromNurse
K.Hall,m NorthChina.

Wife of churchwarden at Sung Chia
Chuang, five young children. Inbad
health,onexaminationsuspectedcan-
cer. Assisted to Peiping, examined
at P.U.M.C, diagnosed malignant
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growth, given treatment. Bad reac-
tion to treatment and general condi-
tion appearedmuch worse.. Return-
ed home. Christians hadbeen pray-
ing earnestly forher while away and
continuedm spite of disappointment
at her appearance. Shebegan to im-
prove, put on weight and the symp-
toms disappeared. Again assisted to
P.U.M.C, where she was examined
and pronounced free fromdisease.

Christian Chinese Statesman.—Dr.
H.H. Kung (Minister of Agriculture)
recently arranged a dinner at Nan-
king at which Bishop Roots (Chair-
man of National Christian Council)
spoke to leading membersof the Gov-
ernment on Christianity as a revo-
lutionary force to-day, especially m
China.

INDIA, AFRICA AND HOME.
From Bishop Norman Tu'bbs.—

From the Church Overseas, fronr
Africa,India and the Far East, comes
inspiring news of Christ changing
men's lives. What a story the Bishop
of Dornakal has to tell! Last year
half the communicants of his diocese
gave up a whole week to a special
Evangelistic Campaign, and it cost
them a week's pay! The Bishops m
Africa have much the same story to
tell. So, too, m the Home Church,
we see a new spirit of Evangelism,
and, whether we are "Groupers" or
not, it is only fair to say that the
movementhas openedour eyes to the
needs and possibilities of evangelism.
In almost every diocese news-teams
are springing up. They are not gal-
vanisedintolifeby headquarters,but
arespringing up as naturally as water
bubles from a spring. The Parochial
Church Councils are breaking away
fromthe oldidea that their only con-
cern is business or finance. In mis-
sionary week-endcampaigns, and m
evangelistic crusades, they devote
hours to house-to-house visitation,
and m many cases are prepared to
givepersonal witness. Now that lay-
menare realising that to give witness
does not mean giving a sermon or
anaddress there is areleaseof power
and persuasion.

Situation m Palestine.— The Right
Rev.Bishop Norman Tubbs, who was
leader of the Society's Commissionof
Inquiry to Palestine, reviewed the
situation andput before the meeting
some of the recommendations of the

Commission. The Bishop compli-
mented the. Society on its mission-
aries, men andwomen who were ut-
terly devotedto their workof reach-
ing the Jews with the Gospel. They
were all face to face to-day with the
astounding progress of the Jews m
Palestine. And m God's inscrutable
providence the Britishhad apeculiar
responsibility m regard to the Holy
Landand to the Jewishpeople. There
was freedom there for the proclama-
tion of the Gospel, andwhatanamaz-
ing opportunity that was. "Speak-
ing quite frankly," the Bishop said,
"you arenot doing your jobmPales-
tine. We are doing less m Palestine
to-day for the 375,000 Jews there to-
day than we did for the 55,000 Jews
who were there at the end of -the
war." Jerusalem was the heart of
Jewry. The Bishop knew that they
hada deficit;but could they not ven-
ture forth and trust Christ to meet
theneed? They must strengthen their
staff m Palestine. It was also most
important that the missionaries
should learn the Hebrew language.

Not Crisis, but Opportunity.— The
Rev. C. H. Gill (secretary), who is
also a member of the Commission,
spoke of the Jews who werenow go-
ing into Palestine, many of them not
the old orthodox type, but a keen,
enthusiastic, nationalistic, non-reli-
gious type of young Jew. Were they
at home going to take up the chal-
lenge that was presented to them?

IRAN (PERSIA).
The point of view of the man m

the street m these days, m regard to
the modernconceptionof nature, was
stated recently m direct and simple
language m one of the daily papers:

This World and the Next.—When-
ever civilisation, inventions and dis-
coveries are discussed we are sure to
hear that God has given this world
to the foreigners and the next world
to us. And if you ask: "If the next
worldbelongs to you, then why have
you come into this world?" there is
no answer. This world, to us, is a
sad house whereby the force of God
we have to live for a time with
mourning and sorrow. We must suf-
fer and see hardships. This is the
doctrine of our ancestors. We have
all kinds of unseen creatures threat-
ening us; such as genii, monsters
fairies and evil spirits. We have so

many superstitiousideas thatwe can't
move. No matter what happens to
us we say "God is great." So we
sit andhope that one day nature will
have pity on us.
, Other people look at the world

from a different angle. They work
hard, learn science and without re-
garding the angels or devils they do
things andmake themselvescomfort-
able. We are lost. They have both
worlds, while we have neither.

The most notable characteristic of
the new attitude towards history is
the marked interest that is being
shown m all things pre-Islamic m
Iran. The nameof the present dyn-
asty, Pahlavi (Parthian), is m itself
an index of what is happening. The
ideais gaining ground that the people
of Iranmust breakloose from the law
and customs of Islam, and, building
rather on their old national founda-
tions, find their own place right
abreast of others m the family of
modernpeoples. This is whatmakes
the abandonment of the turban and
the adoption of "international" hats
significant. And as the movement to
free women from the curse of the
Hidjab (curtain or veil) that has
meant theirsegregation,makes steady
progress, andmore andmore women
are able to discard the ugly, stuffy,
insanitary black garment (chadar)
they have been required to wear m
the street,,it means that the country
of Iranis declaring to itself andto all
the worldthat the Islamicsocialsys-
tem that was forcedupon it has had
its days and has failed to meet the
demands of present-day life.

WHO IS THE AGA KHAN?
The hereditary Chief and Unre-

vealed Imam of the Ismailis . . .
claiming descent m direct line from
Ali, the Vicar of God, through the
Seventh (and according to the Ismaili
creed) the last of the Revealed
Imams, Ismail, the son of Jaffir
Seeduck.

The Khojah minority laid stress on
the fact that the Khojahs of Scinde
marriedandburiedaccording to Suni
rites. "Yes," said Sir Joseph m
effect, "but that is because the
Ismailishave a custom calledTakiah,
or concealment of religious opinion."
Under this custom for centuries they
seemed to their neighbours to be

THE WAIAPU CHURCH GAZETTE Ist August, 1936,4



Sunis, while all the while they were
Shias.

'

Sir Josephalso turnedhis*attention
to abook calledthe Dussuatar, which
"from the beginning" had been "the
acceptedscripture, so to speak,of the
.Khojah sect." Here another surprise
awaits us, for the Dussautur is "a
treatise m ten chapters, containing
the account of ten avatars or incar-
nations," and "the first nine of these
chapters treat of the nine incarnations
of the Hindoo god Vishnu; the tenth
chapter treats of the incarnation of
"theMostHoly All.'" But whathave
!Mahomedans to do with Vishnu?
"Well," saysSirJosephmeffect, "this
only illustrates another practice of
the Ismailis," and he turns to De
Sacy's book, "Religion des Druzes,"
and finds that Ismaili missionaries
wereto assume "to a greatextentthe
religious standpoint of the person
whom they desire to convert." Pir
Surordin was surely apastmaster m
this art.

A TRIBUTE FROMA JOURNALIST.
H. Anstice.

Every unbiassed observer of recent
years has borne witness to the re-
markable progress made m China.
Not always,however,have the Chris-
tianbodies receivedthe credit due to
them for the part they have played
making this progress possible. While
they may not appear on the surface
to be doing much, yet it is they who
laid many of the foundation stones
on whichmodernChinaisbeing built;
who, to employ another metaphor,
prepared the soil m which the new
spirit of national endeavourhas been
able to take root and grow.

Even to-day themajorityof China's
leading women, fromMadameChiang

Kai Shek down, are Christians, and
the organised women's movement,

which is doing so much m the way
"of social reform, is largely Christian
m composition.

Last,butnot least, there.is the New
Life Movement. Its language and
philosophy do not, it is true, contain
a single direct Christian reference.
They go back rather to Confucius
and Confucian ideals. Chiang Kai
Shek, however, is not a Confucian,
lie is a Christian, and one cannot but
think that his Christian associations
and Christian influences have been
mainly responsible forhis decision to

attempt to bring about a national
spiritualrevival.

ModernChina owesmore to Chris-
tianity is indeedmore the creationof
Christianity than ison the surfaceap-
parent or is generally admitted. In
terms of converts, m the formal ac-
ceptance of Christian dogma and
Christian doctrine,progressmay seem
to be slow, but progress is not to be
reckoned only m these terms. It is
the spirit that matters, and if the
individual Chinese is less self— or
rather family— centred, and has a
widerconceptionof his social respon-
sibilities, if public life is cleaner and
graft, nepotism and inefficiency are
no longer regarded as the natural
thing, andif,as a result,public works
forge ahead and industry thrives,
then the credit must largely go to
those Christianbodies which for long
years have waged almosta lone fight.

FINANCE.
End of the Year.— Again we can

sound a note of thankfulness, as the
receipts this year are £358 m excess
of last year's amount. We do "thank
God and take courage," but we long
for the time when a more distinct
advance can be made, and we shall
be able to "thrust forth labourers
into the harvest" m co-operationwith
the Lordof the harvest.

The total budget money received
was £14,852. Details will be found
m the Reaper for July.

The sums wehave beenenabled to
give to our various missions (with a
comparison with last year) are as
follows:— Melanesianreceives £5974;
last year £5728"; an increase of £246.
The New ZealandChurch Missionary
Society receives' £4635 ; last year
£4466; an increase of £169. Poly-

nesia is given £781; last year £749;
increase £32. The S.P.G. (North
China) is given £653; last year £691.
This shows one of the only two de-
creases, which is here £38. The
reason is that last year this mission
received a very large amount of
"designationed"money, thereby ex-
ceeding its quota. Ithas done almost,
but not quite, as well this year. The
Jerusalem and the East Mission re-
ceives £455; last year £403; increase
£52. And theLocalChinese Mission
gets £45, as against £105 last year.
The decreasehereis seemingly heavy,
but it was budgetted for at the be-

ginning of the year,as this smallmis-
sion neededless.

On the whole the result would ap-
pear to be encouraging, if one cannot
say satisfactory. It is to be remem-
bered that we arestill very far short
of the full provincial budget, which
is £16,500. The shortage is £1648.
Itis also to be bornemmindthat this
is a reduced budget, cut down from
£18,000 to meet the hardtimes! Now
that we are wellclear of the depres-
sion it is to be sincerely hoped that
church people will give generously
m the incoming year"and so let the
cause of Christ's Mission sharem the
return to prosperity.

SUNDAY OBSERVANCE.
This statement is commended by

the Archbishop of Canterbury,and is
issued on behalf of the Archbishops
of York and Wales and many Dio-
cesan Bishops.

We believe that our nationis suf-
feringserious loss through widespread
misunderstanding andmisuse of Sun-
day. As Bishops of the Church we
therefore remind Christian people of
the true nature of the day and the
purposes for which it was instituted.

First, Sunday is the Lord's day. It
is the weekly commemoration of His
Resurrection. For Christians, there-
fore, it should be a day of worship
and a day of thanksgiving.

Secondly, Sunday, is the day of
rest. The principle of one day of
rest m seven was observed m the
Jewish Law, and has been justified
by human experience. AHmen need
a weekly day of rest. Theconditions
of modern lifemakethis more neces-
sary than ever if the nervous energy
of the nationis to bemaintained.

Every Christian ought therefore to
regard himself as a trustee both for
himself and others of thatinheritance
of Sunday rest and worship which
Christianity has hitherto preserved.

Accordingly, we urgedupon the at-
tention of Christian people the fol-
lowing principles:-—

1. Christians will use the day as a
day of religion, for the united wor-
ship of God and the strengthening of
their own spiritual life. They will
do this best by attendanceat the ser-
vices of the Church, especially the
Holy Communion,andby giving time
to reading, prayer andmeditation.

Ist August, 1936 THE WAIAPU CHURCH GAZETTE 5



2. Christians will be careful so to
order their Sundays that other people
shall not be deprived of the same
opportunities for worship and rest as
they desire to safeguard for them-
selves and their families. Transport
and other workers should never be
continuously employed on Sundays,
and should have at least some Sun-
days freefrom work. Christians will
ask for no labour from others save
whatis necessaryfor the generalwel-
fare.

3. Christians, although healthy re-
creations and amusements are not
forbidden to them on Sundays, will
not occupy themselves withpastimes
at the expense of their religious
duties andresponsibilities. They will
seek foropportunities of activeChris-
tian service on Sundays as on other
days.

4. Christians, while defending Sun-
day as a day of rest and spiritualop-
portunity, will recognise that there
aremany people wholivem circum-
stances whichmakechange of air and
scene on Sunday desirable for their
welfare. Such people, if they are
Christians, will be careful to make
use on each Sunday of opportunities
of worship.

5. Christians will also recognise
their obligation to assist by their wit-
ness and influence the common cause
of preserving Sunday fromencroach-
ment. For the sake of the nations
moral character andphysical welfare
they willopposeallenterpriseswhich
m the interests of commercial advan-
tage or their own enjoyment would
make Sunday like any other day m
the week.

Christian, public opinion should
honour and support all those who at
cost to themselves refuse to deviate
from the principles herein set forth.

THE HOLY SPIRIT.
The day of Pentecost, the 50th day

after the Jewish Passover— a week of
Weeks— has become m the Christian
Church Calendar— Whitsunday, and
commemorates the coming into the
church of the Holy Spirit, to be the
abiding presence of its Founder, and
the fulfilment of His promise. "I
amWith you to the endof the world."
It is sometimes called the Birth-

day of the Church, but as the
Church really began with the calling

of the twelve, it may be regarded as

the day of its second birth, "born
of the Spirit." As Pentecost was the
HarvestFestival of the Jews, it.sug-
gests the harvest of souls, that would
result from the Spirit's out-pouring.

The Prayer Book has quite a lot
to say about the Holy Spirit. Finding
a place m all the Creeds, He is the
Lord, the Giver of Life,He proceeds
from the Father and from the Son,
He is the Inspirer of the Old Testa-
ment Prophets. We are baptised
into His name; we call uponHim m
Confirmation and Ordination; our
prayers end with "the grace of our
Lord Jesus Christ, the love of God,
the fellowship of the Holy Ghost";
our praises end with "Glory be to
the Father, and to the Son, and to
the Holy Ghost," and we depart from
our worship with the Church's bless-
ing "the blessing of God Almighty,
the Father, the Son, and the Holy
Ghost."

But the Prayer Book makes no at-
tempt to explain these phrases, and
we find it very difficult to put into
words what we understand by our
beliefm the thirdpersonof the Trin-
ity.

Let us watch the Spirit m opera-
tion. Two features stand out,
change or conversion, and power or
inspiration. Consider Peter before
and after the first Whitsunday. At
first impulsive yet vacillating, bold
yet fearful, confident yet unstable,
"Thou art the Christ" yet "I know
not the Man."

Can it be the same man we see
presently preaching from the house-
tops Christ crucified and risen, de-
nouncing to their faces the Pharisees
andPriests for having slain the Lord
of Glory? Whence this change, and
this power?

Consider Saul, Scholar of Gamaliel,
Pharisee of the Pharisees, a persecu-
tor of "that way,"becoming Paul the
Apostle of the Gentiles, labouring
more abundantly than they all.
Again, when -this change, this
power?

Insearchof TruthcameNicodemus
to Jesus by night, to be told "You
must be born again." ButNicodemus
is old, conservative. How can a
man be born, when he is old? How?
When?

"The windblowethwhereit listeth,
thou hearest the sound thereof but
canst not tell when it cometh or
whither it goeth; so is everyone that

isborn of the Spirit."
So it is never t6o late, there are

no limits to the Spirit's action, or
to His power.
It is God's free gift to each and

everyoneof us, and there is only one
condition, "Ask." "Ask andye shall
receive." There will be no rush-
ing windor tongues of fire, but there
will be a changed outlook on life, a
new set of values, a true conversion;
and therewillbe power to live anew
kind of life.

You send your boy to a greatpub-
lic school, andthe older boysprompt-
ly "initiate" him. He is made to
learn the records of bygone scholars,
prizes, scholarships, sports trophies,
the names of soldiers, sailors, states-
men, who have issued from its por-
tals; and so from being self-centred,
self-opinionated,salf satisfied, he be-
comes filled with the Spirit of the
School, what the French so delight-
fully callEsprit de corps.

A soldier joins up into one of the
famous regiments, and learns of the
victories and scars, heroes and Vic-
toria Crosses, gazes on the tattered
remnants of a flag that has braved,
a thousand battles, and he too be-
comes filled with the Spirit of the
Order.

And aman joins the Church. What
does itmean to join the Church? To-
sing m the choir, take up the collec-
tion, sit on the Vestry? Let Paul,
meet you engaged on these tasks
some Sunday, and his greeting is:
"Have you received the Holy Ghost
since you joined the Church?" An
awkward question to answer, is it
not?

Read the Life of its Founder. Read
the second chapter of the Acts of
the Apostles. Read the story of the
struggle of the Church of the first
three centuries against' the Roman
Empire. Read the history of the
Holy Roman Empire m the Dark
Ages, and of the gallant struggle for
freedom put up by the Church of
England during her long islandstory.
Read the long roll of Saints and
Martyrs, of heroes and missionaries.
Look forwardinto the distant future,
into the pictures of the Church Tri-
umphant— "a vast multitude which
no man can number." Then

— try to-
realise into what a goodly Company
you have entered when you joined'
the Church.
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PARISH NOTES.
WOODVILLE.

(G. W. Davidson.)
Our Church Warden, Mr. Hust-

wick, has returned home from hos-
pital, and is steadily improving. Mrs.
King is still there, very ill— her stay
is nownearly six months. We hope
that the greatcare of the Dannevirke
doctor and staff will be successful.

Mr. A. Davidson and Mr. Vowell
have been spending severalmornings
m improving the Church grounds m
preparation for the Rhodes shrubs,
whichare on order. More lawnhas
been prepared, and, with its brick
wall,a very pleasingappearancehas
been achieved.. We arehoping that
other volunteers will complete the
big work so nearly finished.

The Vicar represented the Church
at the Methodist Diamond Jubilee
banquet, and was given charge of
the principal toast of the evening,
-"The MethodistChurch m New Zea-
land." Nearly two hundred attends
ed, including ministers of Presby-
terian and other Methodist circuits,
and the Salvation Army officer. The
series of services and socials have
been a great success, and we wish
our Methodist friends God's blessing
with good will.

TAURANGA.
The funeral of the late Archdeacon

Chatterton tookplace at Tauranga on
Saturday, July 18th, and was attend-
ed by friends from Tauranga, Roto-
rua and other districts. The Service
m Holy Trinity Church was an im-
pressive one, both choir and congre-
gationtaking a full andreverentpart.
In addition to the Tauranga clergy
the Rt. Rev. The Bishop of Aotea-
roa, andthe Revs. S.F.N. Waymouth,
W. Lea, M.M. Tumatahi, E. A. Mc-
Cutcheon, G. F. Oulds, and D. Ran-
kin were also present. The Service
was taken by the Rev. O. S. O. Gib-
son, the lesson being read by the
Rev. E. A. McCutcheon. The Bishop
of Aotearoa spoke feelingly of his
long connection with the Archdeacon
and of the loss which the whole
church had sufferedm the passing of
one so notable for his saintlinessand
great gifts. On the Sunday follow-
ing, MemorialServices were held m
Holy Trinity Church, and there was
evidenced the great affection and
esteem which Archdeacon Chatter-
tonhad inspired. Tributes to his life

and work were paid by the Vicar m
the morning and by the Bishop of
Aotearoa at Evensong.

A SERMON ON THE PHYCHO-
PHYSIOLOGY OF THE BIBLE.

(By Cecil Gilbertson

I.Thess. 1V.,3. This is the will of
God, even your salification. Sancti-
fication means holiness, which is
only another word for wholeness, or
perfection; and it doejs mot apply
merely to the spiritual part of man,
but to his wholebeing. Christ came
to save the wholeman, andnot just a
part of him. There is a very defi-
nite relationship between man's
body and soul, and holiness of the
soul will cause the whole man to
radiate with health and happiness.
And yet the outward man must
perish,and flesh andbloodcannot in-
herit the kingdom of heaven. There
are two kinds of sickness, the sick-
ness of disease and decay, and the
sickness of transmutation and glori-
fication. Our Blessed Lord's

'
body

whilst it was m the tombdid not see
corruption, but it was changed, and
became a glorified Body with which
He ascended up into heaven. We
shall not all die, but we shall all be
changed, and this corruptible must
put on incorruption. When we die
our bodies must either see corrup-
tion or sanctification. Death means
separation, a separation from God
who is life and true consciousness.
In this world we are not truly con-
scious until we are conscious of God.
So long as we are living m a state
of unconsciousness of God we are
living as "the dead" of whom our
Lord said "let the dead bury the
dead." When webecomeconscious of
God, and that consciousness turns to
love and devotion, then death is but
a sleeping while, this corruptible puts
on its incorruption. We live, but
yet not we, but Christ lives m us.
We are dead— separated from our
sins— our life is hid with Christ m
God.

In modern terms this is all a
psycho-physiological process; for
right thinking and holy thinking,
bring about a definite physiological
change m our bodies through the me-
dium of what the medical profes-
sioncalls the endocrine glands, which
m turn act upon the nervous

system by means of the hormones m
the blood. Loosely speaking there
are seven of these endocrine glands,
and the sympathetic nervous system
consists of two main nerves which
run parallel on either side of the
spinal cord. And this spinal cord
runs from the base of the spine to
the brain with which it is connected;
the brain, of course, being the organ
of the Ego. This is allcomparative-
ly newknowledge to the medicalpro-
fession, and until quite recent years
these endocrine, or ductless glands,
wereregarded as beingmerevesticges
of our animalancestors, and of little
importance to our physical well-r
being. It is only m very recent
years that their tremendous import-
ance has beendiscovered, and we are
still ignorant of exactly how they
function. But— and this is the im-
portant part from the Church's point
of view— there are strongreasons for
believing that m ancient times the
functions of the glands andthe whole
nervous system was known to man,
and much can be learned of these
things from the Bible.

In Zechariah IV. we read a&
follows:—
"Ihave seen, andbehold, a candle-

stick all of gold, with its bowlupon
the top of it, and its seven lamps
thereon; there are seven pipes to
each of the lamps, which are upon
the top thereof; and two olive trees
by it, one upon the right side of the
bowl, and the other upon the left
side thereof." In this vision surely
we may see the golden candlestick
as a symbol of the spinal cord with
the brain on top of it. The seven
lamps are endocrine glands connect-
ed with the spinal cord by the seven
"pipes," and the two olive trees, one
on either side, are the sympathetic
nervous system.

The Explanationof the vision given
later m the chapter is as follows:—
"This is the word of the Lord unto
Zerubbabel, not by might, nor by
power but by my Spirit saith the
Lord of Hosts. Who art thou, O
great mountain? before. Zerubbabel
thou shalt become a plain: and he
shall bring forth a headstone with
shoutings of grace, grace, unto it.
Moreover,thewordofLordcame unto
me saying, The hands of Zerubbabel
have laid the foundation of this
house; his hands shall also finish it;
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and thou shalt know that that Lord
of Hosts hath sent me unto you.For
who hath despised the day of small
things? for they shall rejoice and
shall see the plummet m the hand of
Zerubbabel, even the seven which
are the eyes of the Lord; they run
to and fro through the whole earth.
AndIanswered and said, What are
these two olive trees upon the right
side of the candlestick andupon the
left side thereof?.... What be these
two olive branches which are beside
the two golden spouts, thatempty the
golden oil out of themselves? And
he answered me and said, Knowest
thou not what these be? ... ." These
are the two sons of oil, that stand
by the Lord of the whole earth."

This is obviously symbolical lan-
guage. But every Christian realises
that it is "Notbymight,norbypower,
but by My Spirit" that peace is
brought to the disorderedsoul. The
name Zerubbabel has the meaning
of "the dispersor of confusion" and
he appears to stand for that principle
m man. He is that principle mus
which lays the "foundation of this
house" m the tabernacle of our
bodies which are the temple of the
Holy Spirit. Hitherto the endocrine
glands which are "small things"
have been despised,but now "they
shall rejoice and shall see the plum-
met m thehand of Zerubbabel."The
pineal gland is shaped like a plum-
met, andhas alwaysbeenregardedas
the vestige of a third eye, but m an-
cient times it was known as the Eye
of the Seer. The sympathetic ner-
vous system, here symbolised as the
"two olive branches that empty the
golden oil out of themselves," is the
means- by which all outward sensa-
tions reach our inner consciousness.
And our inner consciousness is very
truly the "Lord of the whole earth"
of our bodies.

This fourth chapter of Zechariah
is perhaps the simplest illustration
of how modern psycho-physiology
seems to be unveiling some of the
mysteries of our spiritualnature.But
a deep study of the Book of Revela-
tion of St. John, with its messages
to the seven Churches is Asia, the
opening of the^seven seals, thesound-
ing of the seven trumpets, the seven-
foldharvest, and the sevenscourges;
and finishing with the sacred "Mar-
riage of the Lamb," or the union of

the human soul with the Christ of
God yields even more startling re-
sults, which, of course, cannot* be
entered intonow. But it is safe to
say that the psychotherapist of the
future will come to realise more and
more that the only realcure for the
ills of man lies m the holy Sacra-
ments of -the Church. All forms of
neurosis, and even immorality and
crime, are being traced by the psy-
chologist to "complexes," "disposi-
tions" and "impulses" which are
deep-hiddenm the unconscious mind
of man. The cure of such ills can
only be brought about by bringing
these deep-hidden diseases of the
innermost soul to the surface, or m
plain Christian language, by open
confession, following upon the most
carefully self-examination. But this
is made difficult, and sometimes
almost impossible because the cause
of the disease is so deeply buriedm
thesoil of theunconscious mind. This
soil can only be made friable by the
influenceof the Sacraments withtheir
wonderful powers of suggestion, by
prayer, andby what may very liter-
ally be called the Light of the Holy
Spirit. Religion alone can uplift
fallen humanity. Religion alone
can so educate him that the God m
him is "lead out" to the surface, and
given the power of self-expression.
More and more we are learning the
absolute necessity m these modern
times of rush and bustle of training
men and women to "be still and
knowthatIam God."

ABRAHAM.
(Continued fromlast month)

lt is true that Sir Leonard builds
up what his publishers justly des-
cribes as "an extraordinarily con-
vincing case" for the view that the
traditional story of Abraham is an
accurate, though simplified, account
of what actually happened; but he
adds to the picture such a wealth of
details,and sets the Patriarchmsuch
a vivid background of urban civi-
lisation and culture, that the reader
feels a newkinship with him.

Abrahamnow emergesa very dif-
ferent person from the Arab sheik
of the OldTestament; andbeneaththe
Bedouin cloak Sir Leonard enables
us to see the civilised offspring of a
great city. "Instead;1 of being an
unexplainedphenomenon, the be-

getter of a nation, but himself with-
out roots m the past, he takes his
place m the rational process of evo-
lution.'"

Sir Leonard is largely concerned
with the religious inheritance of
Abraham, witha view to accounting
for his conversion. That he under-
went a definite process of conversion
cannot be doubted. Ur appears as
a city of the grossest polytheism-
no fewer than five thousand names
of gods have come to light

— m whicii
every house had its private chapel
despite the high value of land m.
the overcrowdedcity of a quarter of
a million inhabitants. Sir Leonard
implies that an intellectual revolt,
from the religion of his fathers was.
the beginning of his new conception
of the one God, albeit a very imper-
fect conception.

Elsewhere, Sir Leonard has des-
cribedthe environment of Abraham's,
youth. The system of law was that,
of the famous and enlightened code,
of Hammurabi; m the schools there
were text-books dealing with astro-
nomy, history, medicine and mathe-
matics, and m the last-named sub-
jects the students were set problems
m the extraction of cube-root. They
read the Akkadian classics as boys,
to-day study those of Greece and.
Rome.

Not least, the people of Ur m
Abraham's days had behind them a
tradition of artistic achievement
and craftsmanship which m soma
respects has never been surpassed..
In the Babylonian galleries and m
the Museum at Baghdad are to be
seen some of the exquisite objects
unearthedm the course of Sir Leon-
ard's successive expeditions.

Inparticular, the goldsmiths knew
cverything that is at present known
of the craft, except such part of it as:
employs chemical action.

In his book on the developmentof
Sumerian art, also published by
Messrs. Fabar and Faber, Sir Leon-
ard describedvery fully the evidence:
for a high cultural development m.
the fourth millennium B.C. m the
ancient city of Ur. The point of
interest it has m relation to his new
book, which contains no illustrations,
is that such abundance of finely de-
signed and exquisitely wrought ob-
jects should belong to aperiodmore,
than a thousand years before the
traditionaldateof the birth of Abra-
hamround about the year 2000 8.C..

THE WAIAPU CHURCH GAZETTE8 IstAugust, 1936.



PRAYERS & INTERCESSIONS.

For International Peace.
—

O God,
Who hast taught us that we aremem-
bers one of another,andhastordained
our brotherhoodm the bond of the
Spirit; remove, we beseech Thee,
from allnations and classes, distrust,
bitterness and discontent; that seek-
ing whatis just and equal,and caring
for the needs of others, they may live
and work together m brotherly con-
cord and love; through Jesus Christ
our Lord. Amen.

For the Guidance of Statesmen.
—

O God, Who alone givest wisdomand
understanding, inspire, we pray Thee,
the minds of all to whom Thou hast
committed the responsibility of gov-
ernment and leadershipm the nations
of the world.Give to them the vision
of truth and justice, that by their
counsel all nations and classes may
work together m true brotherhood
and Thy Church may serve Thee m
Unity and Peace; through Jesus
Christ our Lord. Amen.

For Our Parishes.
— 0 God the

Holy Ghost, Sanctifier of the faithful,
sanctify ourParishes withThine abid-
ing Presence. Bless those who
minister m holy things. Enlighten
the minds of Thy people more and
more with Thine everlasting Gospel.
Bring erring souls to the knowledge
of God our Saviour, and those who
are walking m the way of life, keep
steadfast to the end. Give patience
to the sick and afflicted, that their
sufferings may prove a blessing to
them. Guard from forgetfulness of
Thee those who are strongand pros-
perous; andmake Us all to be fruit-
ful m good works. OBlessed Spirit,
Whom with the Father and the Son
together we worship and adore, one
God, world without end. Amen.

For Those Who Work on the
Land.

— Almighty God, Who hast
blessed the earth that it should be
fruitful and bring forth abundantly
whatsoever is needed for the life of
man:Prosper, we pray Thee, the la-
bours of the husbandmen,bothm this
Dominion and throughout the world
and grant to them such skill and
knowledge, and such reasonable
weather, that the fruits of the earth
may be gathered m and men may

even rejoice m Thy goodness, to the
praise of Thy Holy Name; through
Jesus Christ our Lord. Amen.

For Church Schools.
— Almighty

God, our Heavenly Father, Who hast
committed to Thy Holy Church the
care and nurture of Thy children;
enlighten with Thy wisdom those
who teach and those who learn; that
rejoicing m the knowledge of Thy
truth, they may worship Thee and
serve Thee all the days of their life;
through Jesus Christ our Lord.
Amen. "

To Missionaries.— Bestow, O Lord,
Thy richest blessing on allMission-
aries. Make them to be joyful m
spirit, radiant m life, steadfast m
faith, zealous m service; and at all
times deepenm them the sense of de-
pendence on Thee, and give them
peace m Thy service: Through Jesus
Christ our Lord. Amen.

FRASER&BULL,
Tennyson Street, Napier.

District Agents
ALLIANCE ASSURANCE CO.,

LTD.

DIOCESE OF WAIAPU.
Letters for the Bishop should be

addressed: Bishopscourt,. Chaucer
Road, Napier.

All parochial or business communi-
cations shouldbe sent to the Diocesan
Secretary, P.O. Box 227, Napier.

Cheques should be crossed, marked
"not negotiable," and made payable
to the order of "The Diocese of
Waiapu," and not to anyone by name.

Diocesan Secretary and Treasurer,
Mr. R, E. H. Pilson.

All correspondence and literary
matter is to be sent to The Editor,
Waiapu Ohurch Gazette, 18 Colenso
Avenue,Napier, and should reach him
not laterthan the 18th of the month.

THE CHILD OF GOD
(sthEdition)

"The Sunday School Manual for the
Children of the Church."

New Features.— Carols for Christmas,
Additional Prayers, Canticles and
Psalms pointed, etc.

Price
—

7/6 per dozen copies, posted.
(6/6 cash). Sample copy Sixpence
(posted).

From the Rev. G. F. Petrie, Kelburn,
Wellington, or the Church Book Store,

Wellington.

Brass flDemorials ';;,.'
JOHN SWAN & Co.
:: Art Engravers ::
23 Bath St., Dunedin, G.l

BeingBrass Memorial Tablet Specialists
will be pleased to submit designs and
prices of Tablets on application.

Your Gazette Subscription Is DUE

if a Blue Cross appears hers

It Is OVERDUE if a Red Cross
appears.

2/- PER ANNUM

3/- PER ANNUM POSTED

There's a rest room for ladies and 'phone for the convenience ofall at THE TROCADERO, HASTINGS
STREET, NAPIER.



Printedand Published for the Diocese of WaiapuJby the telegraph Co., Ltd., at their registered Printing
Office, Tennyson Street, Napier, N.Z.

NAPIER.

Oliver's ARCADIA Private Hotel,
No. 2 STATION STREET.

C.T. Rates and A.A.A.
"WAYSIDE," SURFDALE,

WAIHEKE ISLAND.
REST AND HOLIDAY HOUSE.
AH communications to

Miss RUDDOCK (Nurse),
The Mission House,

100 Grey's Avenue,
Auckland, C.1.

WOOL! WOOL!! WOOL!!!
Ityou wish your Wool treatedm the
best way and put on the best market
write to. ALFRED WEAVER, the

Wool Man.

ALFRED WEAVER,
Box 22, Hastings.

P.O. Box 86
"

'Phone 783
P. ASHCROFT,

STOCK AND SHAREBROKER.
Country Member Wellington

. Stock Exchange.
NORWICH UNION FIRE

INSURANCE SOCIETY, LTD.

TENNYSON STREET, NAPIER.
F. & R. SMITH Phone 721

BUILDERS & CONTRACTORS,
tomYROAbk

Estimates Free.
Satisfaction Guaranteed.

NAPIER.
HOTEL CENTRAL,

New Zealand's Most Modern
Hotel.

F. G. STAFF, Proprietor.

"CHARLES DICKENS' COMPLETE
WORKS, 22 Vols.

Beautifully bound. Good clear type.
Frontispieces.

Wonderful value. A liftime treasure.
Dickens the Immortal.

This uniform Library Edition of 22
volumes, m type that is easily read, may
be yours,at once, on paymentof 'only 5/-

-
deposit and 5/- per month (15/- per quar-
ter) for 6 quarters. Or you may have
the set for £4 cash.

Prospectuses on appilcation or volurrie
sent for inspection.

An Important New Zealand Book.
EARLY MAORILAND ADVENTURES

OF J. W. STACK.
Edited by A. H. Reed.

A fascinating story based on MSS.
covering the period 1835-1890.

Price 7/6. De Luxe Edition, 15/-

A. HrTEED,
Dept. "G," 33 JETTY ST., DUNEDIN.

Dept "G," 182 WAKEFIELD ST.,
WELLINGTON.

(Write to either address.)

Agencies still open for our publications.

! VISITORS TO NAPIER—
MAKE A "BEELINE"FOR

THE TROCADERO TEAROOMS
In

BRYANT'S IBUILDINGS.
It i&> famed far and widepior the
excellence of

'
its cuisine aiiid cour-

teous service* and one feelslat home
directly one steps inside.

Open from 8 a.m. to 7 p.m. daily.

THE TROCADERO, NAPIER.

WHERE TO STAY
G.F.S. LODGE,

5, Seaview Terrace,
NAPIER.

ExcellentAccommodation for Women
and Girls.

Moderate Terms.
Apply—
MISS C. MARIS CLARK,

Matron m Charge.

QUEENSLAND INSURANCE CO.,
Ltd.

FIRE
—

MARINE
—

ACCIDENT

A.M.P. BUILDINGS,
Hastings Street,NAPIER.

(Ground Floor.)

H. STEELE, Manager
For Hawke's Bay and Poverty Bay.

HARVEY'S,

The Noted House for Quality
, Goods and Keenest Values m
HARDWARE AND CROCKERY.

L.J. HARVEY— -:Rusieil Street,
HASTINGS.

Girls' Friendly Society
Hostel

Wellington

FOR WOMEN AND GIRLS.

Single Bedrooms, ,;
Six Bathrooms, H. Ss C.

TARIFF:27/6 pw Week Visitprs,
5/6 pe^Day Visitors;22/6 per
|Veek Permanent; 3/6 Bed and
Breakfast.
Apply—

23 VivianStreet, Welinigton.
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