
Spbakino at Strabane recently, Mr. T. P. O'Connor, M.P. for
Galway, in the courseof a long andeloquentspeech said :Who, and
what gave you the Land Act? Was it Gladstone? wasit Bright?
wasit Hartington,orBuckshot Foster ? (Groans.) You know very
well what names should be on the back of thebill. Iwill tell you
the names that should be on the backof it. First ofall Michael
Davitt(cheers);secondly, Charles StewartParnell (cheers);thirdly,
John Dillon (cheers):and Itell you whatitis, theUlster Liberal
members, the EnglishGovernment, the English Press, andtheEnglish
people know as well as Ido thatit was these three mengot youa
Land Bill. (Cheers.) And it was not the leaders alone thatgot
you this LandBill

—
it was the courage, the constancy, thefidelity, it

was the principle animating the Irish tenant-farmers. (Cheers.)
Well,don'tyou think you could get a littlemore if you would try?

A Voice:Yes, through you.
Mr.O'Connor: Don't,say throughme. Youmust doit through

yourselves. You aregettinga chance to-day. (Cheers.) You have
no right to expect us to waste the bestyears of our lives in your
service if you are not willing to show your appreciationby being
true to your country and yourown interests. Now about this Land
Bill. Englishmen arevery much disgusted with the Irishmembers—
Imean what they call the Parnallite lot. They say, "How

different are these men from the former Irish members. Why,
twenty or thirty years ago we had IrishgentlemeninParliament,
but now we have nothing but Parnallites, Obstructionists,and the
like." Well nowabout twenty yearsago there was what is called a
respectableIrish party in theHouseof Commons. They didnot give
the Governmentany trouble;theydidnot make125 speeches against
the CoercionBill, they didnot wantnight sittings, they did nothing
that was not in the mildest language— they were a thoroughly
genteel party. Oue was JohnSadlier and the other JamesSadlier,
and the third Edmond O"Flaherty, and the|fourth William K>ogh.
(Groans.) Thone wer« the days when they had Irishgentlemen in
Parliament truly. (Laughter.) John Sadlier first committed forgery
aDd then poisoned himself. James Sadlie'1 forged and had tobe
kicked out of the House of Cammons. Edmond O'Flaherty robbed,
and then fled to the Unite'l State?. William Keogh (groans) was
nearly as bad as the rest,and being a

" respectable"gentlemen the
Government placed him on the bench. (Groans.) j don't know
whether you would like to goback to thatstate of things. (Never.)
Idon't know whether you want a respectableor gentlemanly party
of suicide forgers, or robbers, or wish rather to put up with those
'■blackguards

"
likeParnell, Healy andmyself. (Cheers for Parnell.)

MASSACRE OF MISSIONARIES.

(From theDundee Advertiser.')
There is, at least, one industry which,in these times of general
dulness, is prosperous in a degree never reached before in times of
general prosperity—

we mean ship-building on the Clyde. The most
casual passenger onariver steameron the Clyde cannot fail to mark
the unusual stir in the yards along its banks, while statistics show
that the launches of the first fivemonth* of 1873— the highest year
hitherto— have already been exceeded by the first five months of
1881 to the extent of thirteen thousand tons, and there are indica-
tions that before the close of the year the proportionin fa\ our of
this year will be evengreater. The causes whichhavebrought about
such anoutburst of activity in theship-building trade are certainly
worth investigating. Undoubtedly chief of all the causes of the
present large ship-bnilding is the American trade. Almost every
great company engaged in the carrying trade to America isgetting
built on the Clyde or elsewhere vessels of aclass which they never
possessed before. The gigantic, yet most graceful, Servia, now
approaching completion in the dock adjoining Messrs. Thomsons
yarl at Dalmuir, shows the scale at which the Cunard Company,
have measured the reqnirements of the future but she, though the
largest, is onlyoneof several vessels, all larger thananythey possess-
ed before, that arenow buildingfor the Atlantic tragic. The Inman
Line have replied to the challenge of the Cunard Lineby the City of
Rome, which, thoughnotbuilt on the Clyde,may be mentionedhere,
asshe certainly could not havebeendesigned onso large a scale but
for thework done on theClyde. The Allan Linehave already con-
tributediheir quota this year to the list of immense ocean steamers
built oti the Clyde by theParisian, which has already proved herself
fastest, as she is the finest, of steamers crossing the Atlantic to
Canada; and her success has induced the rivalDominionLine to
contract for a steameron the Clyde of 5,700 tons whichmay be ex-
pected toholdher own with the Parisian. The North GermanLine,
which, but a few years ago, remodelled their line withsteamers
which were then thought theneplvsultra of speedand accommo-
dation,arenow back againon the Clyde with the same purpose,for
they, too. find that their fleet must consistof steamersot over5,000
tons. The Serviaand City of Rome will find a worthy rivalin the
Alaska, of the Guion Line, of 6,400 tons, whose beautiful propor-
tions, as she sits in the stocks of the yard of Elder & Co., attract
attention from all passers-by.

And while such preparationsare beiogmade for thehuman,not
less gigantic is the scale on which vessels are beingpreparedfor
bovine passengers. Steamers of a tonnage that would not havebeen
dreamed of forany servce twenty yearsago are being builtfor the
cattle-carrying trade, and there aremany indications that in future
theorders for this class of vessels will be onascale even larger still.
And the American trade, though theprincipal, is not the only enter-
prise which is calling for steamers ofthe largest class. Two steamers
of over 5,000 tons— theRome and the Carthage— are almost ready at
Greenock for the Peninsula andOriental Company ;whiletheir great
rivals to Australia, the Orient Line, are followingup their success
with the Orient bybuilding for Australia a steamereven larger and
faster thanit;and for the UnionLine to the Cape the largest vessels
they have yet possessed are under construction at presenton the
Clyde. In" whatever way we may explain the present largely in-
creaped activity of ship-building on the Clyde, it certainly indicates
that ship owners are alive to the requirementsof the time,and that,
whenever the expansionof trads may call for additional facilities of
transport,they will be ready on the most extensive scale. When we
compare our positionwith that of Americaon the onehand, where
theship-building enterprise that once seemed likely torival thatof
our own country is utterly dead, and with France on the other,
where attempts are beingmade by a system of bounties to fostera
sickly life, we may well be proud of ourhardy home-bredship-
buildeng enterprise.

Itis stated,on the authority of Mr.W. H. Shrubsole, F.G.S.,of
Sheerness, that a canary bird, belonging to a shepherd named
Mungeam, living at Pcraps Gate, near Sheerness, is able to ntter
words andsentences so as to be readily understood. Sometimes the
bird interpolates phrases in the middle of a song, butitis heard to
better advantage when it speaks,as it often does, without singing.
So far as can be ascertained,there is norecord of a similar ornitho-
logicalaccomplishment.

The experimentmade sosuccessfully in England on the 9thJuly,
■when some 50,000 volunteers were conveyed to »nd from Windsor,
from different parts of thecountry, has led to the suggestion that a
further exparimentphouldbe made,by transporting,say.a divisionin
a state totake the field from Aldershot toa pointon thesouth coast.
Tais ideaof railway drillis a goodone.

We have waited a considerable time for additional information in
reference to themassacreof Protestant missionaries and their wives
in New Guinea, the intelligence of which reached London in May
last.

Itappears thatfour members of theLondon Missionary Society
weie,on the occasion to which we refer,killed by the natives at
Kato, in the district of PortMoresby, Hulu.

While regretting as deeply as any thefate of theseunhappy men,
we seeno harm in seeking for the fullest particularsinconnection
with thissad event; our experienceof the habitual conduct of Pro-
testantmissionaries jnstifies such an inquiry, while, at the same time,
if they shall be proved to haveacted morelike hostile invaders than
preachersofthe Gospel, their terrible fate will serveas a warning to
othersnot altogetherunnecessary.

Leaving out (for want of information) all reference to the
massacreof May last, it cannotbe denied that the missioner who is
sent out to the heathen,by the vaiious sects of Protestantism in
America, GermanyandEngland, acts,almost without exception,more
as a colonist,a speculator,amoney-maker, thanas the bearerof erood
tidings to those who sit in the darkness of idolatry. Frequently he
takes up the position of hostility, and showshimself more familiar
with the Martini rifle than with the contents of his much-boasted
Bib'e. A

Of couree,nosooner doesheact so thanhe sinks downat once to
the rank of a pirate,and takeshis chauce as such, either by enriching
himself with ill-gottenbooty or paying for his temerity withhis life.
Butunder no conceivable aspect of his case can the fate of such a
manbe esteemed martyrdom. The question would be too absurd
evento propound.

State papers and other official formal reports have long ago
provedthemischief effectedamong thesavage tribeß by the missionary
agents of heresy. The heathen is exceedingly shrewd in his own
way— he Foon learns the difference between the Catholic priest with
his portable altar and cross and the

"gentlemanin black
"

with his
eight-chamber revolver;andhe acts accordingly.

Inthe Times of March 3rd appeared the report of the Blnntyre
Mission,upon which the commissioner appointed gave evidence as
follows:"Thereal gravamen of all that had been alleged against the
missionaries was excessive severity in punishment of the natives

—
cruelty appeared in two distinct cases. ... In the latter ease
the mandied (from being flogged) the same day. Therecall was
recommended of theRev. Duff Macdonald. ... Mr Chirnside's
pamphlet was,unhappily, morenearly a statementof facts than they
had hoped to find It. Mr. Chirnside had written in a sensational
manner,but as to the executionof onemanand the floggings inflicted,
they regrettedto sayhe was,in their opinion,substantially correct."

We all remember the Rev.Mr. Brown who,in 187S,bagged his
New Britons withasmuch gusto as anEnglish sportsman counts his
deadgrouse.

A contemporary, speakingupon thi9 subject, tells the storyof a
Protestant colonial prelate who, thanking bis congregation for the
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T.P.O'CONNOR,M.P.,ON"IRISHBLACKGUARDS." present »f a new rifle,remarkedthat" in the last affair with the

natives,Ifired someninety rounds, andIdon'tbelieTeImissed one."
Very well then,all pointe considered—namely, the general bad

conductof themissioned, theirntter incapacitytoconvertthe savage
natureof those inthe midst of whom they venture asany merchant
or speculator might— these things taken altogether,it will surprise
noone thatoccasionally a disaster such as thatannounced lately from
New Guineawill occur from time to time.

Let the Protestant missioner stay at home. He does not aspire
tomartyrdom, andtogo for less thau that is nothingbetter than a
fool's errand. To die to save souls is worth the oost, but to !»"
tomahawked over a question concerning nails, yam*, blanketsand
tobacco is a veryunequal, unsupernatural, and unsatisfactory affair
indeed.

Itis certain,from all that one reads upon the subject, that the
people of the various savage tribes have formed a tolerably correct
estimate of themen who visit the*m with Bibles and with blunder-
busses.

—
Umverte.

SHIPBUILDING ON THE CLYDE.
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