
AooODstoryof Mr. Justin M'Carthy is told in theBoston Herald
by Joseph Hatton, the special Londoncorrespondent of thatnews-
paper. The correspondent was interviewing Mr. Andrew Chatto
of the publishing firmof Chattoand Windus, when the following
conversation ensued :—:

—"Ihavebeard there is a goodstory behind the publication of
Mr. Justin McCarthy's 'History of Our OwnTimes.' Will you tell
me whatitis?"

11Yes," he replied;" Mr. M'Carthyconceivedtheidea of writing
abookentitled 'The Victorian Era,' which was to be an historical
narrative. Introduced toa well-known firm of publishers,he entered
intoanarrangement with them tosell them the work for £600 (4,000
dolfl). After a little, the publishers, learning that Mr. M'Oarthy was
aHumpRuler,if not a Parnellite— they did not evenknow, it ap-
pears, thathe wasan Irishman— a9ked to be allowed to withdraw
from the contract. Mr. M'Carthy, who was greatly annoyed at the
suggestion thathe might mutilate history to suit his own private or
political views, demanded compensation,and the publishersreferred
thesettlement to thefriend whohad introduced the author to them.
Then Mr. M'Carthy came tome, andIat once agreed topublishthe
workfor him onabasis of mulnnl profits. Isuggested,however, that
insteadof 'The Victorian Era,'be should call thebook « The History
of Our Own Times.' In theit.tervai, theotherpublishersreconsidered
the situation,andasked tobeallowed to revive the lapsed contracts.
Itwas too late. The woik wasin myhands, which,as it turned out,
wasagood thing for the author,as well as for me. Ihave paidMr.
M'Carthy, up to the present time, over £5,000 (25,000d015.) on
account ofhis profitson fTne History of Our Own Times.'

"

A BRAVE FELLOW.

GOOD FOR SOMETHING.

New Yobk,July 8.
—

Awrongsignal or anengineer'smistake led to
a fatal collision betweena drill engine and apassenger train at the
east end of the tunnel of the New York, West Shore aad Buffaio
Railroad, at Weehawken, N.J., yesterday. The passenger train,
drawnby engine No.75, wasleaving the tunnel for the depot asdrill
engineNo. 92 waß backing down to run to the roundhouse atNew
Durham. The engineer of the drill locomotive claims that the signal
wasshownindicating that the tracks through the tunnel were clear.
He was running his engine over the freight tracks which join the
two tracks running through the cutat the mouth of the tunnel. He
wasrunningat a rapid rate whenthe engine of the passenger train
shot from the tunnel. The drill engine wasonly a few feet away,
and although the engineer reversed themachinery ifc was too late to
stop.

On the frontplatform of the first passenger car of the train was
PatrickMahan,a car inspector. He saw a collision could not be
averted, and while he might havesavedhis own life by jumping he
hoped to lessen the force of the collision andseized the brake. He
was turning itwhen the tender of the drill engine telescoped the
passenger car. The unfortunate car inspector was buried in the
debris. When the wrecking train arrived the horribly mutilated
remainsof Mahan werediscoveredpressedbetween the rear of the
tender and the stout timbers of the car. The drill engine wasbadly
damaged and the tender was broken. The railroad officials claim
thatnoneof thepassengers wereinjured, although it wasrumoured
that several had been hurt by the flying fragments of the wreck.
Mahan was agel twenty-two years, and lived at No.201 Willow
street,Hoboken. ___
We are toldbyDr.Baines that having asked an old priest in the
north of England to whathe was toattribute the great influx of
Protestantsinto the Church,he was answered thus :—:

—
"UuderGod, to the cholera and to the calumnies spreadabroad

by theBritishRefo-raatiouSociety and- other associations of a like
infamous character. The lies promulgatedby the societies set men
reading,and then (with the honest) the result is inevitable;but the
cholera Bets men thinking, whichis as good, or perhapsbetter."

Many a fine young Italian,with goodCatholic parents, has lost
the practice of his faith, and is called aFreethinker;but the faith
is in his heart still, anditis such guestsas the plagueand thecholera
that rouse up such a man toweigh well the question, What shallI
takein exchangefor my soul? We cannothelp thinking that agood
severedose of cholera will tend to make the priest quite popular
again in Italy,and will shutupaltogether the schools wherebudding
Mazzinians and aspirants to the red-shirb are inoculated with the
elements of assassination, andare trained to the high duty of sup-
porting thepopularemeute.

—
London Universe.

(Sydney Herald,September 9.)
Very early yesterday morning the bells of St. Mary's Cathedral
wereringing outa series of merry peals inhonour of the expected
arrivalof thenew Archbishop, Dr. Moran. Ithad beenarrangedby
the agents of theOrient line that iheir fine steamer Lignria, which
had brought the Archbishop fromEurope,should arrivehere early
in. the forenoon, and,very fortunately, the weather was sofavourable
thatall ihe arrangements were carried outto the letter. Longbefore
thehour at which itwas expected the steamer would arrive there
w<?re immense throngs of people wending their way from all direc-
tions towards the Circular Quay, and before the lauding took place
itis estimated that there must havebeen over20,000 people present.
Atevery window andonevery balcony ia the vicinity, and evenon
many of the roofs, people were packed as closely as they could
possibly be, andeventhe masts and rigging of the vessels around
were crowdedby peopleanxious to obtaina better view. There was
astrong for^eofpolice, underMr.Inspector Anderson, inattendance,
who had all their work to doin restraining the c lthusiasm of the
crowd, andkeeping a passive clear. All the jetties were thronged
by eager onlookers,who watched withcurious interest the flag-decked
steamboats ana their bright-sashed occupants. The members of
various societies were present in largenumbers, and theirbrilliant
regaliahada veryattractive appearance as they took their placesin
lines on the decks of the steamera. About10 o'clock theMary left
the quay, bearing the VeryRev. the Administrator, Dr. Sheridan,
and a largenumber of the clergy.

Dr. SneridanproceeaedonbjarJ the Liguria by asteam launch
placed at bis disposalby the authorities, andmet Archbishop Moran,
bidding him a hearty welcome tohi3newsphere of labour. Shortly
afterwards the Mary arrived, when the clergy, anda deputationof
laity whoproceededby her went on board the mail steamer, and
wereintroducedbyDr.Sheridan to theArchbishop. The proceedings
werepurely of an informal- character. After exchanging greetings
the passengersreturned on board tin Alary, and Archbishop Moran,
togetherwithhischaplain,Dr.O'Haran,accompaniedbyDr. Sheridan,
disembarked onboard theMary, which then shaped her course for
the city. The Princeof Wales followed soon after the Mary, with
more clergymea andother friends,andinquick succession one boat
afteranother lefther mooriogs audsteamed,down the harbour, each
crowdei with members of organised societies, or of the general
public. A little flotilla soon formed round thestern of the Liguria,
which wasstanding head to the north, andas thedark hulls loomed
through thebuff-coloured smoke, and a bright redfl igshowed itself
here and there, andgreen and purple between the group of vessels,
with the greatoceansteamerat thehead,itmadea really interesting
spectacle,set off by the clear, bright landscape and the glittering
water. Presently moresteamersjoinedthe fleet, their peoplecheering
as they came,and when theArchbishop's steamer, the Mary, left the
Liguria, overadozen boats were in waiting. As the Mary moved
out towards Watson's Bay, and turned p^st the bow of the Liguria,
up theharbour, the steamers took their placesinthe wake andbegan
to form a procession. The people on board the steamera cheered
lustily and waved theirhats andhandkerchiefs, whilebandsof music
played lively Irish melodies. A few moreboats thenmet theproces-
sion, andas each cameup andpassedon to takeits placein therank
ahearty cheergreeted theclergy and their new leader, who cordially
bowed his acknowledgments. Oa the way up the harbour fresh
additions weremade to the flotillauntilat least20 steamers were in
the procession, all filled with animated crowds, which included a
largeproportion of ladies. The Nea, with the committee, and the
Prince of Wales, with the clergy, ran close by the Mary, and the
other steamers were arranged in two main divisions. The whole-
scene wasvery lively,and affordeda spectaclerarely, if everbefore,
seenin Sydney Harbour. The musicians on the variousboats played
Irish songs andpatriotic melodies inan agreeable style, and the run
up to the Quay was verypleasant. On approaching Fort Macquarie
the massesof peoplelining the water's edge andcovering the green
gavesomeidea of thepublic interest in the event. Bound the east
side of the Quay thousands of people were gathered all along the
wharfs andcrowding on the decks of the vessels, while the shrouds
and yards of shipping were also taken possession of. The crowd
became larger and moredense along the south of the quay, and in
the vicinity of the Prince's Steps, where the lauding was to take
place. Theships closest to thelanding jettywerecompletely covered
by persons eager to take advantage of every point, and in every
warehouse, door,anl window, in every balcony and upper storey
within sight of the jetty,people were waitiugon the tiptoe of expec-
tancy, to catch a glimpse of the new Archbishop. On the street
thery wasa strong force of police,and all their energy was required
to keepclear the space required for the movements of the clerical
party. As the flotilla entered the basin roundFort Macquarie, the
excitement increased,andrepeatedcheers were given as the -Mary
approached the jetty. Some littletime wasthenoccupiedinpreparing
£>r the receptionof the Archbishop. Thestepswerelaid withcarpet,
aidapassage wasformed to the carriage outside. Then the steamer
drew up to thesteps at12 precisely, and amid cheersand reverences,
Archbishop Moran set his foot on theBoil of his new field.

TheArcabishopwasmetonlandingatPrince's StairsbySir Patrick
Jenningsaud otherleading laymen,and_Captain Loftus, A.D.U., who
was present representing his Excellency the Governor, and who
presented the Archbishop with a letter from his Excellency,
congratulatinghim uponhis safe arrival,and placinghis carriage at
the Archbishops service. Archbishop Moran, having expressedhis
grateful thanka, proceeded to the vehicle,which wasin waiting, and
tookhis seat therein,hisappearancebeing greeted with enthusiastic
cheering from the assembledthousands; the R'ght Rev. Dr.Murray,
the VeryRev. Dr. Sheridan, and Doctor O'Harau occupying seatsin
the vehicle. At this time theremust havebeen about 20,000 people
on theQuay, and in the approachesopening toit. The procession
then commenceditsprogress towardsSt. Mary'sCathedral inthefol-
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Oh,how refreshing,palatableand reviving is a draught of cool
waterwithHopBitters init, to a feverpati.nt. See.

The St. John, N.8., Globe says that MissHazen,now a resident
in England, formerly of Bt. John, has joined theRoman Catholic
Church.

InSt. Patrick's IrishCatholic colonyinSc )ttCounty,Minnesota,
there is no saloon, andall tho young menunder 16 years of age are
members of a total abstinence society.

Read this.
—

In consequence cf the Dissolution of Partnership,
onSeptember 2, weare compelled to raise a large sum almost im-
mediately, and weshall offer the whole of our Stock at CostPrice
for a few weeks,including all the New Goods which we have just
openedup. Itwill pay you to call during our <i'reat Dissolution
Sale. Carter and Co.,Ready-MoneyDrapers and Direct Importers,
60 and62 GeorgeStreet. Note.

—
DressmakingbyMrs. Carter. Best

in thecity. Lowest charges.— [Advt.]


