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New Zealand Coat of Arms, No. 2.

AN OPPONENT’S SUGGESTION FOR A COAT OF ARMS FOR A SOUTHERN MINISTER.

Quarterly.lst Vert: A sheep suspended, helpless, emaciated, shorn, vulned and bleeding. 2nd Azure: A British colonial possession verdant, surcharged
with a white elephant’s head and trunk. Motto: Festina lente—hasten slowly. 2nd Motto: Nil desperandutn—Never say die. 3rd Sable: A figure of justice,

surreptitiously regarding her balance, whereon two ballot boxes, so arranged that the smaller outweighs the larger. Motto: Two blacks equal one while. 4th

Or: Two pouches of filthy lucre, below a hand sinister in act of seizing them urgent. Motto: Let not thy right hand know what thy left hand doeth. Crest:

A barnyard rooster, in act of dishonestly breaking and eating an egg. Supporters: Dexter, a workman blatant, gratified by an increase in emolument by a de-

cision of the Arbitration Court. Sinister: A member of the House of Representatives untrue to his trust., carrying a bag, the price of his support. Motto

for the whole: “When in doubt tell the truth.”



People Talked About

Fiji’s Governor.

The faet that Sir Henry M. Jackson,

the new Governor of the Fiji Islands,

is a Roman Catholic seems to have given
offence to some of those connected with

the Mission Board at Sydney. At their

recent conference they passed a resolu-

tion deploring the action of the British

Government in appointing a man of his

religion as Governor over a community
where Wesleyanism is, so to speak, the

established church among the natives.

This drew from the leading people of

Suva a memorial expressing the most

complete satisfaction at the manner

in which His Excellency discharged his

duties. Then came an explanation irom

the mission people to the effect that
they did not object to the Governor per-
sonally. but because the fact of the

highest person in the land being of the

Romish Church was used improperly hy
the missionaries connected with that

body in the group. Thus the matter

stands. His Excellency and Lady Jack-

son have made themselves very popular
in the Islands, and everything seemed to

point to Fiji having a resp.te from “the

Governor question,” which was the one

absorbing topic for a very long time be-

fore the arrival of the present holder

of the office. Now. however, comes this

new feature to disturb the calm which
bid fair to settle on these beautiful

islands. His Excellency was appointed
Governor of Fiji on May 16. 1902, and

arrived in Suva on September 10. 1902.

His official career previous to his pre-

sent appointment included the following
positions: Commandant of Sierra Leone

Police. 1880; Commissioner for Turks,
and Caicos Islands. 1885 - 90; Colonial

Secretary. Bahamas. 1890-93: Colonial

Secretary. Gibraltar. 1894-1901.

o O o o o

The Pope's Monument.

It has been decided to erect on the

laiteran Square a grand monument

commemorating the papal jubilee. At

flu- express desire of the Pope, bronze

tablets inscribed with the text of the

three encyclicals written by His Holi-

ness on Christian Socialism will be

added. The Pope wishes to be known

to posterity as the protector of the

labouring classes. Many Roman

Catholics are largely contributing to-

wards the monument, to the erection

of which the Italian Government rais-

es no objection.

Mr. John R. Mott.

We are glad to be able to present our

readers with a portrait of Mr John R.

Mott. General Secretary of the World’s

Student Christian Federation, who is

now visiting New Zealand. It will be

of interest to students to know that

Mr Mott holds the degrees of Bachelor

of Philosophy from Cornell University,
and the degree of Master of Arts from

Yale. Mr Mott was offered, but de-

clined. a Fellowship in Philosophy, and

also onein History and Political Science.

Still later he has been offered profes-

sorships in two of the principal univer-

sities of the United States. These

high distinctions have been declined by

him, as his life work has appeared to

him to be the organisation of the Chris

tian forces of the student world. The

success which has attended Mr Mott’s

efforts in this direction are well known

to all. It is largely due to his genius
for organisation that the World’s Stu-

dent Christian Federation, which unites

all the national and internation 1 stu

dent movements of the world, with a

total membership of over 82.000 stu

dents, has become an accomplished fact.

Altogether he has visited at least 800

different universities, t-olleges. and

other institutions of higher learning,
many of them several times. Among
the universities to which the most ex-

tended visits have been made are: Ox-

ford. Cambridge, Edinburgh. Paris.

Berlin, Halle. Leiden. Utr-eat < open

hagen, Upsala, Christiania. Harvard

Yale. Princeton, McGill. Toronto, Cal

eutta. Madras, Bombay. Tokyo, Kyoto,
and Peking. Students of seven years

ago will well remember his former visit
to Australasia, when our own union was

formed under Ids wise guidance. All
will look forward with the deepest in-

terest and highest hopes to the visit
now at hand.

Mr Mott’s dates forvarioiis university
centres are as follows: Auckland, April
20: Wellington. April 22; S.udent Con
ference at Christchurch. A] ril 2i> - 28;
Canterbury College. April 29: Otago.
May 3.

o o o o o

Mr Russell Sage, the patriarchal
millionaire, who has just recovered

from a severe illness, finds rest very
hard work. Therefore he has applied
himself to his labours again by way of

holiday and recuperation.

Miss Tborneyeroft Fowler.

A pleasant, gossipy article in the

"Girl’s Realm” is a paper entitled "How

I Began”: a ehat with Miss Ellen

Thorneycroft Fowler. It seems she be

gan early to make stories before she

could write, and from thirteen was per

petrating parodies upon Poe’s poems

There must, however, be a double dose

of original sin in a girl of thirteen who

could parody “Annabel Lee.” Miss

Fowler was never a “tomboyish” kind
of girl—in fact, she disliked boys and

their games. She loved lessons that
would make a story, but hate 1 geo-

graphy and arithmetic- with such pur-
pose that when she went to school she

had to have a class in arithmetic for

herself, she was so backward. Her fa

vourite heroine was Mary Queen of
Scots, and her greatest joy was to rep
resent a vestal virgin and worship Diana
in a wood at the bottom of the garden
When she left school she began writing
short stories for magazines, and was

very successful. Her first boo'; was

published in 891, and “Isabel Carnaby”
came out in 1898. She wrote "Isabe'

Carnaby” in four months. She seldom
writes more than two hours a day. She
likes women better than men. but she
thinks men really take a broader, big
ger. truer view of life than women.

O O O -Q o

One of the Old School.

For ten years Mr Richard Monk serv-

ed his northern constituents faithfully
in the House of Representatives. Pos-

sibly no memberhas tried so hard to ful-

fil the duties he assumed when ehosen

of the people to represent them in Par-

liament. This was widely recognised by
those he represented, and they showed

their appreciation last week by making
him a presentation at Warkworth, the

gathering being marked by much enthu-

siasm. Mr Monk is distinctly one of

the old school. He has high ideals and

tries to live up to them, and it is im-

possible to know him without having a

great respect for him as a politician and

affection for him as a friend. He is a

charming conversationalist. Well read,
observant, and with a keen sense of the

humorous, he can converse as few men

can in these times, when the art of con-

versation is rapidly falling into the

things that were. He was probably one

of the most effective speakers in the

House on some subjects. Patriotism,

for instance, was always sure to bring
to his feet the member for Waitemata,
and he would deliver an impassioned
oration that could not fail to rouse the

House. He used beautiful language at
such times, and you would always re-

member it if you saw his keen blue eye

Hash, watched his animated face and

heard his thin eager voice as he dwelt

on the glories of the country to which

we belong. Mr Monk is a splendid
sample for young New Zealand to fol-

low. The more men there are like him

the better the world will be.

SIR HENRY M. JACKSON.

MR JOHN R. MOTT, M.A., Ph.B.

MR. RICHARD MONK.
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France’s President.

Emile Loubet, President of the

French Republic, has expressed the hope
that great things will result from the
visit of King Edward VII. to the French
capital. There is .certainly room for

improvement in the relations which ex-

ist between the neighbours whose shores
are washed by the English Channel.
President Loubet is well past the prime
pf life—he will be 65 on the last day of
the present year—but he still retains

the vigour of mind by which he won his

way to the first position in Republican
France. He has always been what is

called a bucheur. Up at six o’clock in

the morning, he never goes to bed before

11 p.m. His life has been devoid of ex-

traordinary events, which sometimes
have a habit of dogging the steps of the

great. His father was a simple peasant
who lived by the sweat of his brow at
Marsanne. Loubet pere is dead, but

his mother—"that good and respectable
peasant woman his mother”—is still

alive, hale and hearty at 86. They
are careful livers, the Loubets, and

possess that inestimable gift—bon sante.

The great president is very fond of sa

there mere, and they tell a pretty little

story about theway he showed it. On the

day he first entered his native town as

president he caught sight of his mother
seated on one of the tribunes watch-

ling the procession. Disregarding all

the pomp by which he was surrounded,
and without waiting till the ceremonie-
were over, got out of his carriage and

ran over to the old lady to give her a

kiss—an incident which was celebrated

in a famous Paris tavern called The

Black Cat (where they sing about all

the public and well-known men) by a

ballad which had for its refrain, “Lou-

bet . . . oh, how much he loved his

mother!” M. Loubet is a well-read

man in his own language, and familiar

with both modern and ancient litera-

ture. He is fond of music, and an ad-

mirer of painting. It was is 1867 when
M. Loubet was a rising young barrister
that he wooed and won Mademoiselle
Denis, who is now the first lady in
France. She is a charming woman, and

a fitting help for a man who has such
onerous duties to fulfil.

o o o o o

The French Press.

Probably no age or country, however

degenerate, has ever produced so eoarse

and violent a press as that which now

holds the ear of the French (writes
Herbert Vivian, in the “Sovereign’).
Henri Rochefort, a man of high family
and low mind, who has been sentenced

to death and transported to a penal
settlement for offences which the charit-

able pass over as political, is the leader
of the school. His idea of political con-

troversy is to heap abusive epithets of

the vilest kind upon his political oppo-

nents and accuse them of every imag-
inable enormity without the least regard
to the truth of his charges. A physical
defect is peculiarly welcome to him as

an occasion for a torrent of vulgar ridi-

cule. Did a supporter of Dreyfus suffer

from the infirmity of a crooked bac':,
he would continue, day in and day out,
to pillory him as a monkey, dwarf,
gnome, homunculus, hunchback, abor-

tion. miscarriage.; “boule-de-Juif,” etc.

Is a Minister rubicund of countenance

he is never mentioned, but as this toper
sot. bar loafer, habitual drunkard,

winebag, brandy barrel, and “piedsdev
ant;” whenever he appears in public, he

is represented as reeking with alcohol;
if he walks to the tribune of the Cham-

ber. he is said to stagger, stumble or

reel: if he makes a speech, we are told

that he stammers, hiccoughs, or vomits

his words. Nor is this slander the mere

eccentricity of one degraded demagogue.
The Marquis de Rochefort has an enor-

mous following, which buys many thou-

sand copies of his paper, the “Intron-

sigeant.” simply and solely to gloat over

his foul epithets. And at least half

the press of the country mimies his

methods of controversy. Clericals are

loaded with such synonyms as thurifers,
Jesuits. scarlatinas, red-tails, confes-

sional-box bugs, vestry rats, and boudi-

cusard, a parody of the word drey-
fusard. Jews enjoy the epithets bat-foot,
hooknosed. circumcised (raccoureis).
usurers, youpins. poutres. dust-bins,
snatch-farthings, carrotiers (skin-flints),
carrion, scum of the ghetto, and others
which do not bear repetition.

Mr. Dooley on Andrew Carnegie.

Mr Dooley has been moved to humor-
ous protest in the "New York Journal”
by Mr t arnegie’s munificence. “ ’Has

Andrhew Carnaygie given ye a librv
yet?’ asked Mr Dooley. ’Not that I
know iv,’ said Mr Hennessy. He will,
said Air Dooley. ’Ye’ll not escape him.

Befure he dies he hopes to crowd a librv
on ivry man. woman, an’ child in th’
counthry. He’s given thim to cities,
towns, villages, an’ whistlin’ stations.
They’re tearin’ down gas-houses an’

poor-houses to put up libries. Befure
another year ivry house in Pittsburg
that ain’t a blast furnace will be a Car-
naygie libry. In some places all th’

buildin’s is libries: If we write him f’r

anautygraft he sinds ye a libry.’ ” You

do not stimulate authorship, according
to Mr Dooley, by erecting libraries.

“Libries niver encouraged lithraehoor

anny more than tombstones encourage
livin’. No one iver wrote annything be
cause he was tol’ that a hundred years
fr’m now his boks might be taken down
fr’in a shelf in a granite sepulcher an’
some wan wild write ’Good’ or ‘This

man is crazy,’ in th’ margin. What lit

rachoor needs is fillin' good. If Andh-
rew wud put a kitehen in th’ libries.

an’ build some bunks, or aven swing a
few hammocks where livin’ authors cud

erawl in at night an’ sleep while watt-
in f’r this enlightened nation to wake
up an’ discover th’ Shakespeares now

on th’ turf, he wud be givin' a rale
boost to lithraehoor.” The idea of a

literary “dosshouse” is excellent, pro
vided that no writers of novels were

admitted.
PRESIDENT LOUBET.

MADAME LOUBET.
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Touching
That

Loan.

It

seems
necessary
to

repeat
that,
so

far
as

the
New

Zealand
Government
was

concerned,
there

was
no

“failure”
in

the

raising
of

the

loan.

I

Our
artist

concludes
from
the

above
par

that
it

is

only
a

matter
of

time,
but
as

time
is

not

altogether
a

thing
to

be

laughed
at,

suggests
the

above
picture
would
be
a

good
way

of

filling
it

in.]

1124 ltiE NEW ZEALAND GRAPHIC. Saturday. April 25, 19'»3



Atom Club Page.
The Editor of THE ATOM QUARTERLY, having received many requests from friends and admirers of the little Magazine for a more frequent issue
of the same, has now to announcethat arrangements have been made with the proprietors of the “ N.Z. Graphic" whereby the Magazine will be
incorporated with that journal and henceforward a page or more of the “Graphic” will be devoted to contributions from members of the Atom Club.
It may be explained for the benefit of those who have not yet met with “The Atom Quarterly,” that that magazine has been successfully carried on

under the editorship of Miss Moor, with the idea of encouraging a taste for literature and art amongst the girls of New Zealand, and for providing
an outlet for amateur talent in this direction. Stories, poems, drawings, essays, answers to correspondents, and articles by New Zealand girls will
be received and published as heretofore, and should be addressed “Editor of the Atom Club Page, Graphic Office, Auckland." New members of the

Atom Club will be heartily welcomed, and it is hoped that with the vastly increased publicity and the acceleration of issues by means of the

“Graphic” the scope and usefulness of the Club will be much extended.

Atom Club Rules and Regulations.

Study for Session 190.3— “ Emerson’s Essays.”
I. “Self-Reliance.”

RULES.
1. Club fee for each member, 2s 6d per session.
2. Each member to read “ Emerson” three hours a

week (or six half-hours).
3. Ail MS. to be sent in to Editor of A.C. page,

“Graphic” Office, Auckland, accompanied by stamps
for return.

4. Fees to be paid in advance.

REGULATIONS.

1. Session lasts from March co December.

2. Each member will be presented with a badge on

entrance into Club.

3. All articles, essays, etc., written by members will
be returned corrected and advised, if desired, when not
published in A.C. page.

4. Answers to “Who Knows” must lie sent into
office with full name and nom de plume on Monday-
following issue of “Graphic.”

WHO KNOWS?

Ignoramus.—Will someonetell me the origin of the

figure Britannia?

REPLIES.

Spider.—“lt is a white thorn, and is remarkable

for flowering always on Christmas Day. The legend is

that it originally sprang from the walking stick of

Joseph of Arimathea, who planted his staff on the site
of the old Abbey at Glastonbury, England.

Photography

fyja A$ made such strides in the

latter half of the nine-

teenth century, that the

JnfiSri ' possibility of taking
anc' manipulating "sun

'

pictures” is now within

the reach of all—even

lazy fo’k.

As it is very likely that some of my girl
readers have not taken up this fascinating art,
it is to them I particularly intend to address

my remarks. The girl who cultivates some

hobby, such as photography, drawing, ento-

mology-, and a thousand and one other things,
which may be classed as personal recreation,
has always something within her reach which
makes her quite independent of the outside

world and its amusements.

In purchasing a camera, several things have

to be taken into consideration, but I would

obtain, if possible, the advice of a professional
on that point, as there are so many different
makers to choose from. Personally, I have a

great predilection for the hand camera, carry-

ing twelve quarter plates, providing the lens

is extra good. The lens is the most important
of all the apparatus in photography.

The cost of the camera is by no means all

that will be incurred, if you wish to obtain

the greatest amount of pleasure possible out

of it. There are developing dishes, red lamp,
scales, chemicals, etc., but these are compara-

tively reasonable to purchase.
Before using the camera it is advisable to

familiarize one’s self with all the workingparts,
finding out the whys and wherefore of each

separate movement, and thus be in a better

position to make use of them before filling
and "pressing the button." At the outset, do

not hurriedly expose all your plates; use them

judiciousiv and suitably, always remembering
that one satisfactory view is worth twelve

poor ones. When you arrive at this stage,
friends and relations give one plenty of en-

couragement, providing they are not the vic-

tims of your efforts, so do not let your enthu-

siasm run away with you and lure you into

portrait taking thus early.
There is a great longing as progress is made

to turn out bigger pictures, and that opens
another source of interest towards enlarging,
which may be taken up later on.

When the plates have been exposed, the

science of development begins, anil I recom-

mend every one to do their own.

It is inexpensive and intensely fascinating.
The bath-room may be used at night, lighted
by a red lamp, if no proper "dark room" is

at hand. There are many developers to select

from. After "going the rounds" I have set-

tled down to “pyro," but for those to whom

stained fingers are a consideration, I suggest
hydroquinone. As you gently rock the de-

veloping dish and experience the joy of seeing
your view gradually grow out of the plate, do

not allow your feelings to get the better of

you and omit the alum bath, thereby finding,
to your horror, the films quietly floating off

while being washed. This will surely happen
if it be summer time.

After thorough washing comes the fixing
with “hypo,” that bugbear of beginners, which

must be treated with all the respect such an

insinuating chemical demands.

Then the final wash reveals the beauty anil

detail of the negative from which you are to

obtain future prints. The art of printing is

readily acquired, whether by the sun, a lamp, or

match Every packet of paper for printing
on contains minute particulars respecting ton-

ing, fixing, etc. Failures may be expected,
but that need not discourage, as there is no

royal road to any art, much less photography.
Eleanor Brown, A C.

A Holiday Resort.

(Continued.)

The first port of call is Waitangi, near the

mouth of the Maungatukarewa River, and

from there the boat generally visits the

larger sheep runs round the north of the is-

land, and finally returns to Waitangi before

returning to New Zealand, for her mail and

passengers.

The first thing that strikes a visitor on near-

ing the islands is how very low-lying they are,

the larger island especially ; in fact, the highest
elevation hardly exceeds 900 feet. As you

steam up the harbour, hugging the shore called

Te Ngaio, you are delighted with the pictur-

esque scenery, for widely scattered homesteads

are dotted amongst the bush along the coast,

and as we get still nearer our destination the

scene changes to precipitous red cliff's, sur-

mounted with a crown of vivid green grass,
and clumps of the native ake-ake, so called
from its durability.

On going inland we pass through dense

bush, not .'■itch bush as one sees in the North
Island, as the trees here never attain a very
great height, but still it is beautiful of its kind.

Here are noble karaka, or kopi. trees, with
their shiny leaves and luscious-looking yellow
berries, and matipos with lovely purple berries,
and overhead graceful festoons of karewas

(supple-jacks). Ever and anon one hears the

twitterings of jolly little fantails and the mel-

low note of the tui. Our old friend the black-

bird calls us "pretty dears" in a most persist-
ent manner, and then flies off to attack some

poor victim’s strawberries. If we proceed and
leave the bush, we gain what the shepherds
call a “clear." You must keep to the track,
for roads there are none, and the bogs (which
evenexcel those of Ireland in their bogginess 1

are very dangerous. What a land of lakes ’
\\ ater, water everywhere, but. contrary to the

poet, there is plenty to drink. However, one

large expanse of water, comprising more than

a third of Chatham Island, or about 40.000

acres of brackish lagoon, which has an outlet

into the ocean at the Awapatiki ( from awa. a

river, and patiki. flounder).
To reach some parts of the island (for in-

stance, Kaingaroa, the far-off settlement) this

lake has to be forded, and in winter weather

it is no small undertaking to ride with your

poor hoiho breast high through four and a-halt

miles of bitterly cold water ; but it is thought
nothing of by some of the hardy natives.

These islands are an ideal holiday re-

sort to my way of thinking, a perfect Para-

dise for conchologists, anil those who wish to

get far from the madding crowd. And then

sportsmen would be in their glory here, what

with cattle-stalking, pig-hunting, fishing, and

shooting. The waters around the islands sim-

ply teem with fish of all kinds, the most sought
for being hapotika, cod. terakihi, and crawfish,

and as for game, the lakes abound with duck,

geese, and swan. The plaintive cry of the sea-

gull is always in one’s ears, and saucy little

Jackies, with their brilliant red legs and pretty
black and white plumage, are very much in

evidence.

A remarkable sight is to be seen off the

south coast. Basaltic columns from five to

seven hundred feet high go sheer down into

the sea. and again at ()uiera. near Whangaroa.
there is a miniature Giant's Causeway ; the only
difference in the construction of the columns

is that those in Ireland are hexagons, while

those in question are five-sided. Another

place of interest is north of W hangaroa, where,

since before the memory of any living person,

peat has been, and is still, burning.
I think I have told you enough, dear reader,

to give you an idea of those very interesting
islands, and I have written this in hopes that

some who may chance to see it will take ad-

vantage of the summer weather and holiday
time to pay a visit to that quiet retreat, the

Chatham Islands.

Ethel J. Florance.
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LOOKING ACROSS LAKE TAUPO TO TONGAKIKO AND RUAPEHU.

Cbe Scenic Masterpiece of nature t

The Wonderland of the World ! The Sanatorium of the Earth I The Home of the MaoriI

The Deerstalkers’ Delight! The Anglers’ Paradise ! The Tourists’ Elysium !

VISIT THIS WONDROUS LAND OF THERMAL ACTIVITY.

VISIT
TE AROHA. Enjoy its hot baths and drink its health-giving mineral waters. Visit ROTORUA, the Sanatorium

of the World. Its natural hot mineral waters they cure Rheumatism, Sciatica, Gout, Obesity, Liver Troubles, Uterine

Complaints, Nervous Disorders, Skin Diseases, and other kindred ailments. Rotorua is a thousand feet above sea level.

It has a splendid climate, fine drainage, a pure water supply, electric light, excellent hotels and boarding houses, and

Government Baths. Visit the Thermal Wonders of Tikitere, Whakarewarewa, Tarawera, Rotomahana. Waiotapu,
Wairakei, Taupo, etc., etc. See WAIMANGU, the greatest geyser on earth.

Visit the Wanganui River. Its loveliness is beyond compare. Visit the famous Buller and Otira Gorges.
Visit Hanmer Hot Springs, (Government Baths and Accommodation House).

VISIT NEW ZEALAND.
See its lovely, Picturesque Lakes, its Magnificent Waterfalls and Rivers. Visit its great Fiords and Sounds. Climb its Towering Mountains, majestic

in their immensity, and hoary with perpetual snow. Visit the Government “Hermitage Hotel,” Mount Cook, under the shadow of the cloud piercing
Aorangi, 12349 feet. (Thos. Cook A Son’s Coupons accepted.)

The home of the Tattooed Maori Warriors and their handsome, dusky daughters. Visit this wonderful country with its endless variety of beautiful
and magnificent scenery which charms the senses, inspires the imagination and challenges comparison.

Stalk its thousands of Wild Deer and Fallow Buck. Whip its rippling streams, teeming with Rainbow, Loch Leven and Brown Trout.

For Pure Air, Pure Water, and a Temperate Climate.

The Holiday Resort for the brain- weary and jaded man of business.

The Ideal Home for the man of leisure. Four days from Australia. Seventeen days from San Francisco. Twenty-six days from London.

Trains. Coaches, Steamers everywhere.
———. , Comfortable Hotels. Cheap Tariffs. Full In. I -Pb* ""A

""* "

formation regarding NEW ZEALAND supplied I . w Ai

Lffree at the Head Office of the Tourist and .
’’

' Health Resorts Department. Brandon Street, ■
‘ ' « Wellington, or at the Branch Offices at Auck- VQagg

i land, Rotorua, Christchurch. Dunedin and

s--. • S. >1 nvercargill.
gjHtffi?ii£>- k *» e a x \ Visitors may

have their Correspondence

1 '“’
'Hi

addressed co. the Tourist Offices as above

IKfeSfifr ’ nCJ Free use of Directories. Telegraphic Code
A "71

Jj . ■ . Vv Books, and Writing Facilities. Photographic I
V 'A Dark Room provided free at the Head Office. MHH

r- Wellington.
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A Modern St. Elizabeth
By NETTA SYRETT.

CHAPTER I.

The Church elock at the end of the

street was striking five as Christopher
Power reached the doorstep of No. 5

Mulberry Row.
Mulberry Row is one of the fast van-

ishing old-world streets to be found in

London. Sandwiched between rows

of stucco houses and brand new

stores, it yet preserves for a little its

ancient dignity. The rooks still build

in the gardens behind its decorous eigh-
teenth century houses, and in leafy June,

when the horror of plate-glass windows

and cheap red bricks is .obscured by
great elms, it is still possible to sit in

a green garden, and dream that the

world is two hundred years younger
than its present age.

Into one of these pleasant old-fash-
ioned gardens Christopher Power pre

sently followed the maid who admitted

him.

The way led through a narrow pan-

elled hall on to a Hight of steps whose

balustrades were hung with wistaria,

down to a smooth shaven lawn, where

in the midst of a deferential group of

people stood Miss Golightly.
Miss Golightly was giving a garde-

party, and her guests were trying to

appear as though they were enjoying
it. Power suppressed a smile as he

walked across the grass towards bis

hostess and put out his hand.

“You are late, Christopher!” was hei

greeting.
The crowd dropped back a few paces

and watched proceedings with bated

breath. Relief that attention was for

the time withdrawn from them, and

that for the moment at least they were

safe, was visible on most faces.

And yet it was a very little lady who,
somewhat in the tone of a schoolmas-

ter addressing a truant pupil, had ut-

tered this entirely disconcerting re-

mark. She was very small in reality,
and yet there were people to whose

mental vision Miss Golightly appeared
as a sort of female grenadier. Her

step was firm and decided, her head al-

ways aggressively thrown back, her
dresses were rich, and rustled with a

thoroughly dogmatic and self-assertive

sweep. When she entered a room one

felt impelled to rise and make obeisance.

A curtsey was the mental attitude of

most people towards Miss Golightly.
It was a trying moment for the young

man. The remark so brief, so trenchant,
so embarrassing, required an answer.

To Miss Golightly. the offence of arriv-

ing late at a garden party was as fl:',

grant as that of not being in time for

Chureh. He paused a moment and then

did the best possible thing by replying
in a few words of serious explanation.

Miss Golightly seemed a little molli-

fied. “I am glad to find that you do

not prevaricate, Christopher,” she said,
“but another time please to remember

that when I say four o’clock I mean

four o’clock.”
Then “Wait a moment,” she added

still in a perfectly audible tone: “Eliza-

beth. make haste when you hear me

calling, my dear,” she exclaimed imperi
ously as a young girl came across the

lawn towards her. “I want to introduc ■

Mr Power to you.” They both Lowed,
but Miss Golightly was not satisfied.

"Nonsense.” she said, “shake hands.’

The young man smiled, and the girl
glancing up at him from under hei

shady hat held out her hand with a

shy movement and smiled too.

"I have already met your mother. Mr

Power,” she observed.

"Now go and talk,” said their hostess
as though dismissing two toddling babes

with the command to go and play.
“Give him some tea. Elizabeth.” she

railed, “not strong, mind; 1 don’t ap

prove of strong tea for young people.
In spite of a pretence at desultory

conversation the bystanders had listened

to the whole conversation with breath-

less interest; and as Power and his com-

panion walked away they drew once

more together, to address wavering re-

marks to their hostess, always uncertain
as to whether they would be received
in embarrassing silence or with a no less

embarrassing snub.

Once out of ear-shot Power relieved
his feelings by an involuntary laugh.
T hen he checked himself and looked at
his companion, who was walking demure-

ly by his side.
“I am afraid I am very rude,” he be-

gan gravely, “but the strain has been

great.”
The girl smiled, but faintly. and

Christopher felt he had been tlippant.
They had reached the table where tea
and coffee was served.

“Will you have sugar?” she said, hand-

ing him a eup of tea after obediently
tempering it with hot water.

Power looked at her as she raised her
eyes. Till that moment he had not no-

ticed she was pretty. Her figure was

very slight. Her face was pale, with a

clear, transparent paleness. It was a

finely cut face with delicate features.
Her dark brown hair grew low on the
forehead in waves crisped to the roots,
and spread out in a rippling mass undet
her broad-brimme.’ hat. Under the dark

cloudiness of her hair, her eyes looked
singularly large and clear and innocent.

There was a sort of gentleness about
them, a certain appealing expression
which Power thought very charming.
As she lowered them when she passed
him the cup he noticed that her eye-
lashes were long, upeurled at the tips
like a baby’s, and very dark against the

paleness of her skin. She was simply
dressed in white. There were white
frills at her sleeves, and she wore a

fichu crossed in front and tied in a loose
knot behind at her waist. The severity of
the dress suited her.

Looking at her face again Power

thought it anything but an easy one to
read. There was a certain inscrutable-

ness about its very quiet: an air of

rather pronounced ealm which interest-

ed him.

He drank his tea hurriedly, feeling
that there was an implied reproach for

his tardy arrival in the girl’s grave sil-

ence.

"Nou are staying in the house, I
think?” he asked as they moved away
from the table.

“Yes, I am acting as Miss Golightly’s
secretary.”

"Secretary!” exclaimed Power. "Why,
what is the latest—l mean why does
Miss Golightly need a secretary? Is she

writing a book?” he asked, smiling.
"Oh, no,” she returned, seriously,

"that is not useful, and Miss Golightly
says it is a sign of weakness and stupid-
ity to rush into print.” She paused a

moment.

"Haven’t you really heard about the
Scheme?” she inquired in a tone of sur-

prise.
"No. What Scheme?”

"The Scheme—MissGolightly’s Scheme
for the rescue of the undeserving poor,
you know: the submerged—”

"Oh. but surely that is rather an

ancient idea?” suggested Power, smiling.
"I seem to remember that Booth—”

"Oh. but Miss Golightly never believed
in Booth’s plan, you see. She says a

work like that can only be undertaken

by a woman. Women are better organ-
izers, you know, at least she is. for her

Scheme is on a much smaller scale than

General Booth’s, and she is going to ask

for three times as much money. She
will manage it all herself, of course, but

it is to be associated with the Church.

The clergy will work under her direction.

. . . . but Miss Golightly is talking
about it to some of them now. Wouldn’t
you like to go and listen? If you walk

quietly you can joint the circle without

disturbing her.”

Power looked at the girl attentively,
but there was not the faintest trace of

sarcasm in her face. She spoke quite
simply as though what she sa-- 1 was so

obvious as to ensure immediate concur-

rence on the part of her hearer.

"Shall we sit down here?” he asked,
rather bewildered. They had been

walking slowly up a shady path, at the

end of which was a garden seat under

a lime tree.

They sat down and for a moment
there was silence. Elizabeth’s white

hands were folded on her lap: she leant

back aud looked up into the delicate
green canopy overnead. Light shad-

ows dickered on her upturned face.

Power glanced at her wiin a puzzled
expression. There was quite a long sil-
ence. Aliy other gill would have fidget
ed or loosed emuarrasseu. n.- reneeteu.
this girl <iiu none of the..- tumgs. site

seemed to nave torgoiteu lus existence,

while she sat perfectly still, tier eyes
fixed on the sun-lit green leaves.

At last Power made a halt impatient
movement.

"1 don't understand —” he began in a

voice in which there was the slightest
touch of exasperation.

She turned towards him at once, and
looked at him quietly, as he continued.

"Surely you don’t believe all that?”

"Believe what?” she asked.

"Why, what you said about, about—-

well about women being better organ-
izers—and all that kind of thing—” He

stopped abruptly. It was veiy annoy
ing, but it was difficult to tain to this

girl without putting everything very

lamely. He felt the more irritated, in

that he had usually no difficulty in say-
ing what he wanted to say, in a clear

and sufficiently rational manner.

Elizabeth continued to look at him fot

a moment, then she dropped her eyes
and began playing with tne frills on hei
fichu, a little nervously.

”I—didn’t say 1 thought so,” she an-

swered softly. ”1 said, or I meant tc
sav—Miss Golightly thought so.”

Power felt relieved. Strangely too,
the constraint he had experienced a mo-

ment before in the face of her calm in-

scrutability seemed to be evaporating.
He spoke in a light tone now.

"I am glad. Do you know 1 was

afraid you were going to turn out

etrong-minded after all!” he said gaily,
Elizabeth glanced at him shyly. “I’m

afraid I never shall be,” she eonfesseil
despondingly. “Miss Golightly must be

very disappointed in me, and I’m so

sorry. But what is the use of people
who are not clever being strong mind-

ed? Miss Golightly is clever enough
for it. you see.—but I—” she finished
the sentence with another deprecatory
glance at her companion. She was more

charming than ever in her prettv humil-
it v.

“Clever!” he exclaimed—“Who wants
women to be clever? I don’t know-
much about it. Miss Trevor.—l mean I
have not studied the Woman question,
but from a man’s point of view, and
after all—”

“That is the most imp irtant—” mur-

mured Elizabeth, with a glance over her
shoulder as if to make sure that the

admission was not overheard.
“Well—since you put it so—” laughed

Power. “From a man’s point of view
you know, as long as a woman is charm
ing and sweet, and—and companionable
that is all that is necessarv.”
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For what?” enquired the girl gently.
Power looked a trifle confused. “Well,

for a man to like her and approve of

her, 1 suppose,” he said.

“Yes,” she answered. “I always
thought so.”

They had been quite undisturbed in
their quiet corner so far, but now there
was a murmur of voices, and between
the trees on the lawn they saw people
pass and stop to exchange greetings.

“The conference is over I suppose.”
said Elizabeth. “I had better go and
see if Miss Golightly wants me.”

She half rose as she spoke, turning in

a hesitating way to Power, who also got
up.

There was in her manner since the lit-
tle explanation about her own views or

want of views on the “Woman ques-

tion,” a suggestion of timidity and diffi-

dence far from unpleasing to the young
man’s vanity.

“Don’t tire yourself,” he 'said. “It
is a great deal too hot for you to be
running about.”

Then, as she made no reply, he added:
“This is not exclusively a frivolous

garden party I see?”

“Miss Golightly thought it would be
a good opportunity to bring a great
many people together, chiefly clergymen
of course, to talk over the Scheme,” she
replied. “Ah! there she is calling me.

I must not keep her a minute. You
will excuse me I know?” she added
hurriedly.

She walked quickly away, but the

smi'e with which she left him tempered
Power’s annoyance. He watched her a

great deal all the rest of the afternoon.
He was introduced and bidden to talk

to a great many people, and he bowed
and talked, and was politely bored, ex-

cept when he caught sight of the flutter
of a white dress amongst the trees, as

Elizabeth flitted from one group of

people to another.

Only once more during the afternoon

did he get an opportunity of speaking
to her.

“I believe you have had no tea your-
self,” he said as she passed him.

“I thought not. Sit there till I come

back,” and he left her seated under one

of the gnarled hawthorn trees.

To his annoyance, on his return he

found the chair next her occupied.
A stout lady, curiously arrayed in a

somewhat brief skirt which afforded a

glimpse of very large elastic-sided boots,
was talking to her. and after giving her

the cup of tea he was obliged to turn

away.
As he leant against a tree, at a little

distance, he overheard some of the con-

versation.

“You have been staying in Wales,
Miss Golightly tells me,” remarked the

stout lady in a voice which was some-

what suggestive of melted butter. “Oh!

then you must have met a great many
Dissenters, poor things?”

“Dissent is very bad there of course,

and I’m afraid it’s spreading,” she con-

tinued. It sounded a little like measles,

but Elizabeth’s face was as gently com-

posed as ever. Power noticed.

“Not that we are the least intolerant
of course,” pursued the lady; “and I

have met some really very nice Welsh
people. You remember the people next

door to us at Barmouth last year, dear?”
This to a little daughter who had join-
ed them.

“The dissenting people you wouldn’t
call on, do you mean, Mamma?”

“Nonsense, Alice!” answered her moth-

er hastily. “You know how broad-mind-

ed dear papa is! Why he used often

to talk to them, and I think he was

right, don’t you. Miss Trevor? One nev-

er knows what good a word in season

may do. Of course you are a Chureh-

woman?” she added delicately.
Elizabeth hesitated almost impercep-

tibly for a second.

“My sympathies are rather with the

Dissenters,” she said, raising her soft

grave eyes for a moment.

“Oh!” remarked the lady blankly.
"Well, of course, there are excellent
people even amongst the Dissenters.

Alice, dear, it is time for us to say good-
bye to Miss Golightly,” and she rose

abruptly.
Power also bethought himself that it

was time to go; but it was sometime
before the deferential crowd around his

hostess had thinned sufficiently for him
to approach her without running the

risk of any embarrassing publicity of
farewell.

“Ah!” she exclaimed when he at last

eame forward, “I’ve had no opportunity
of conversation with you, Christopher,
and there are many things I want to

know. But you are to come again. I

wish you to play lawn tennis with

Elizabeth. I intend Elizabeth to take
more physical exercise. Of course you

play at lawn tennis?”

Power admitted that this was the case.

“Now what day has she free?” ob-

served Miss Golightly, rummaging in the

capacious pocket of her rustling gown

and producing a note book and pencil.
“Thursday, the 20th. Where is you poc-
ket book. jslte inquired
severelv.

Power was weak enough to make a

feint of searching in his waistcoat poc-
ket.

"I am afraid ” he began—“but 1

need only make a mental note of what

will be a great pleasure. Miss Golight
Iv.” he added, in his best manner.

“Nonsense!” she returned, sharply.
“Nothing can excuse the carelessness of

being without a notebook of any kind.

Put it down on this leaf, please.” she

commanded, peremptorily, tearing a

piece of paper from her own notebook.

"Now—tennis—s. Mulberry Row.

Thursday. 20th. 4 p.m.” Power gravely
did as he was bid.

"Good-bye,” said his hostess, giving
him her hand in a stately fashion.

“Don’t stand about any longer, for it’s
getting late. And be punctual on

Thursday, for Elizabeth is due at a

meeting at 5.30.”

CHAPTER 11.

Christopher Power, by profession a

church evehitect, was judged one of the

cleverest of the younger men in his

profession, and there were those who

also thought very highly of his work

as a painter. On the death of his fa-

ther, which happened soon after he left

Oxford, he had settled with his mother

at Chelsea in one of the small houses
near the river. They shared a modest

income, to which in spite of hard work
and increasing reputation Power was

able to add but slowly and by degrees.
His mother, who adored him. was.

however, more than satisfied with the

promise of coming fame for her son.

On the afternoon of the garden party
to which, in response to her half play-
ful pleading. Christopher, a grumbling
martyr, had betaken himself, Mrs Pow

er sat propped up with cushions in her

chair writing to a friend of her girl-
hood.

Her son was the theme of the letter
“Poor boy. he has just started, with

a resigned expression, for one of Miss

Golightly’s terrible garden parties,” she

wrote. “You. too. suffered from Miss
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Golightly when we were both girls in

the old days at Carehester. She is

even more awe-inspiring now that she

is an old lady. The parish trembles

at her nod, I believe, and bishops,
vicars, and curates bow the knee. And

yet she isn't a bad old thing!
I’nfc really rather fond of her. You
see she approves of Kit. He has ad-

mirable manners, you must know,
and even strong-minded old lad-

ies are not insensible to consideration

from a rather good-looking young
man.

“Now, I’m going to confess to you
why 1 have prevailed upon Kit to go

to Miss Golightly’s ecclesiastical garden
party this afternoon, and you may put
me down as a shameless schemer if you
please. There is a girl in the ease—a

girl 1 want Christopher to meet. And

It was Miss Golightly who brought her

to see me, and Miss Golightly who in

her own mind has already arranged the

marriage!

“Strange as it may seem, I should not

be displeased, though from the worldly

point of view I am acting as foolishly
—well, as I always have acted you

know. The girl, who, poor little soul,
is at present Miss Golightly’s secretary,
is penniless. Her father, who is long
since dead, was once a friend of Miss

Golightly’s. (Isn't it strange to imag-
ine a time when Miss Golightly did not

look upon a man as her natural ene-

my?) Miss Trevor it seems has been

brought up by two of her father's sis-

ters, and, I am afraid, has had any-

thing but a happy life. Miss Golightly
brought her to call some time ago, and

since then, for she seems to have taken

a fancy to me, I have seen a good deal

r>f her. Kit has been away nearly two

months, working in that Suffolk church,
of which I told you, so he and Miss

Trevor meet this afternoon for the

first time. Now lam waiting for him

to come back, and wondering what he

will say about her. I need not tell

you that, in the character of the

scheming mother. I have not even men-

tioned her name to him!

"But do you know-, Mary, I believe

she is the right wife for him, and I

want to see Kit married before I go.
You see I haven’t long to live, though
the poor boy doesn’t guess this. He

thinks I am better. We have been so

much to each other—but I needn't tell

you that. Only if I eould see him hap-
pily married I think I eould depart in

peace. I may be wrong, it is a matter
upon which one is generally wrong I

own, but I feel that he will be attract-
ed as I am by Elizabeth Trevor. She is

pretty, gentle, refined—and no fool, if
lam any judge of character. Kit is

fastidious, oh, horribly fastidious. He
has much to learn about women. I

fancy this girl, for all her demureness,
might teach him ”

The pen dropped from her hand and
the smile crept rftund her lips at the
sound of a step on the stairs outside. A

moment later the door opened and

Power came in.

“What! another new cap, oh, vainest
of women!” ht. exclaimed.

His mother laughed. “Do you like
it?” she said, turning her head like a

girl to look at herself approvingly in the
glass. “I made it this afternoon and

put it on for a surprise, to reward you
for going to the garden party like a dear
boy.”

Power sank into an armchair opposite
with a groan.

“It will take several caps to make up
to me for this afternoon’s torture,” he

declared.
“Poor boy! So bad as that!” re-

turned Mrs Power, nestling against her

cushions with an air of great amuse-

ment. “Do begin now and tell me all

about it. What did she say?”

“What didn’t she say, rather.” observ-

ed Christopher, savagely. “Look here,
mother! It’s all very well for you to

nit there comfortably with that wicked
twinkle in your eyes—you have escaped.
What I’ve been asking myself all the

way home is why in the name of all
that’s peaceful did you ever know the

woman, nnd why, having once made such

a fatal mistake, didn't you drop her like
a red hot coal directly you found out

how she—burnt—in fact!”

“Drop Miss Golightly!” echoed his
mother. “Now, Kit,” she broke off, her

eyes dancing—“confess! She asked you
where your pocket book was, and you

instantly began to search for it, and to

try nnd look astonished that it wasn’t
there!

Her son laughed and looked a trifle
confused.

*

“How did you know? Y'ou inhuman
woman!”

“It's hereditary, my child! I’ve done

it myself often and often! Drop Miss

Golightly, indeed! I ask you, Kit, is

she a person that any human being
would care to drop?*

“Did I ever tell you how I first came

to know her? It was very awful! We

lived in the same town, you know. We,

my mother that is, didn’t know her

people at all. but everyone knew and

laughed at "the eccentric Miss Golightly.’
One day* she called. She asked to see

me. I came, I saw, I trembled.-

“Shc said, ‘Good afternoon,’ ‘sit down’
(in my own house, you know), but it

seemed quite natural, and I sank feebly
into the nearest chair. Then she went

on, you know her voice—?”

Christopher uttered another faint

yrroan.
“ ‘I hear you are rather a clever, in-

telligent woman.’ I murmured faintly
that I hardly considered myself a wo-

man. I was only eighteen.
“‘Eighteen!’ she exclaimed in a seath-

ing tone. ‘lf at eighteen you are not

enough of a woman to help forward the

great cause of womanhood you never

will be!’

“I felt like a crushed worm. I bad
never known before that woman had a

cause, so to speak, but I didn’t say so;

I was afraid. Then she went on:
“

*1 am organising a Woman’s Society
for Physical, Mental and Moral Improve-

ment, and I want you to join. Here is

a list of books to Ire read. This is

where you sign your name as a member.'

Then she gave me a pen.”
•‘And you signed?” asked her son,

throwing back his head and laughing.
“Poor little mother!”

“My child, I was paralysed!” cried

Mrs Power, her eyes shining with merri-

ment, the pretty colour in her cheeks

coining and going with the excitement of

talking.
“Well, that wasn’t half of it. She

next brought out a paper already half

filled with signatures, so I wasn’t the

only coward, as I tried to comfort my-

self by reflecting afterwards. ‘Now,’
she said, ‘of course, being an intelligent

human being, you will at once sign this

declaration of refusal to marry, until

that iniquitous clause in the marriage

service which compels you to swear to

love, honour and obey a man, is swept

away for ever!”

"Here she again put the pen into my
hand—”

Power was onee more overcome.

“I was engaged to your father, my

child—but I signed, and' I dared not tell

her anything about the engagement! ’
gasped Mrs Power.

“Afterwards, of course, I suffered

agonies, and your father wouldn’t un-

derstand how it was—he said he couldn’t

think how I could have been so foolish!

But vou can. Kit, can’t you —you know

Miss Golightly!”
“It is onlv too true,” Power observed.
“Oh, but’ really,” urged his mother,

“she is at heart a very good old thing,

she has been kind to me very often

since I was married. I should not like

to offend her by refusing any of her in-

vitations—that is what I can accept by

proxy,” she added mischievously.
“But you haven’t told me anything

about it yet,”' as Christopher made a

ferocious gesture. “What was it like?

and who was there?”

Christopher was looking out at the

fading sky.
“There was a girl,” he began slowly—-

“a Miss Trevor.”
Mrs Power’s hand shook a little.

“Only one?” she inquired gently, dis-

guising her nervousness. “My poor

boy.”
He smiled in answer to her tone.

“Oh, there were some more, I think;
I did not notice much.”

"Did this maiden so completely
eclipse the rest then?”

"Eclipse isn't the right word. There
was nothing brilliant about her. By
the way, mother, she said she had met

you?”
“Miss Trevor?” repeated Mrs Power

mendaciously. “Oh. yes, I believe Miss
Golightly brought her here to call. I

thought her a charming girl,” she added
lightly. “Isn’t she Miss Golighty’s
secretary, poor little soul?”

“Yes, but I don’t think she realises
that she is to be pitied. She has a deep
reverence for Miss Golightly’s mental
and moral qualities. I liked her,” he

went on, still looking out of the win-

dow as he spoke, “she is different from
other girls—and much nicer.”

His mothgr loked at him a mooicut

before she smiled. “Poor girls,” she

exclaimed teasingly, “to come under the

rod of my lord’s displeasure.”
Christopher flushed a little. “I sup-

pose it sounds priggish, but it is true,
I don’t like many of the girls one meets;
either they talk slang and are vulgar,
or they are so horribly clever—”

“My dear Kit,” interrupted his moth-

er, gently. “You are very young, there

is time for yon to modify your ideas

about women. We don’t live in the age
of chivalry any longer, you know. 1

mean that the virtues which were sup-

posed to be womanly virtues then, are

out of fashion now- —”

“The more is the pity,” interrupted
Power, “but,” with a change. of tone,
“I dare say you are right. Women

do not interest me much any way,’’ he

added indifferently.
His mother disguised a smile as he

turned to her.

“What a lovely sky—look.” he said.
“No more of this kind of thing for me

yet a while, dear lady, 1 have not done

a stroke of work to-day. Shall I ring
for your supper tray? I envy Miss

Golightly her garden.” lie went on, with
his hand on the bell, “it is perfect. I

want to make a sketch. Perhaps I shall

get an opportunity on the 20th.”
“The 20th'?”

“I am going to play tennis then with

Miss Trevor—the secretary.”
“Ah, it was on the occasion of your

being commanded to play tennis with

Miss Trevor, that you hunted for your
pocket-book then?”

Power laughed.
“I should like to make a sketch of

the girl too,” he said presently, leaning
against the low mantelpiece, and looking
down at his mother, “She has just the

face for my Saint Elizabeth.”

“St Elizabeth playing tennis? Well,
it is an age of progress.”

The servant came in with the limp,
and Power stooped to pick up a shawl

which had slipped from the -ouch. He

put it round his mother’s shoulders with

a touch as gentle as a woman’s and ar-

ranged her cushions and settled her com-

fortably on the lounge before he left

her. ’ ®.
Late that night Power was still sit-

ting at the open window upstairs, smok-

ing while ho looked out over the swiftly
flowing river.

Every now and then the moon sailing
free for a moment of the scudding
clouds, threw a faint tremulous gleam
over the dark water. The air was elose

and oppressive as though a storm was

gathering.
Some books lay on the window-sill in

the mellow light of the lamp.
Presently he took up one of them, a

volume of Browning, and began to turn

the leaves as if in search of something.
Then he held the page to the light. His

mother would have smiled eould she

have read the lines over his shoulder.

If one could have that little head of hers

Painted upon a background of pale gold.

Such as the Tuscan’s early art prefers:
Xo shade encroaching on the matchless

movld
Of those two lips, which should be open-

ing soft 1 *

In the pure profile: not as when she laughs,
For that sitoils all.

“There you are wrong, iny dear fel-

low.” thought Power, smiling as he put
down the book and turned from the

window, “though from the standpoint of

Saint Elizabeth perhaps—Still she has a

very pretty laugh. I wonder if I eould

get her to sit to me? If there was any

probability of that, 1 eould take an

afternoon off to go to the tennis party
with a dear conscience.”

CHAPTER 111.

Warned by previous experience, Power

took care to be in time for his tennis

appointment on the 20th of the month.

He was rewarded by a gracious smile

from his hostess, who rose front her bur-

eau in one corner of the shady drawing-
room. pen in hand.

“We are only waiting for Jane
Brown.” she observed, “who is invariably
unpunctual and slovenly in her habits.

And now, my dear Christopher, I want

to speak to you about your mother.
You must impress upon her that it is

her duty to exert her will power, and

to make an effort. An invalid, you

say? nonsense. Why need she be an in-

valid? It is nothing but lack of deter-

mination. Look at me. Five years ago
the doctors, who are a pack of noodle.,
told me I hadn’t six months to live.
Suppose I had believed them, whore

should I have been by this time? In

my grave, of .course. But 1 refused to

believe them!” She rose and brought
her plump clenched fist down upon the

mantelpiece with vigour. “And here I

am to-day, strong and well, the origin-
ator of a great scheme, the—now why
are Elizabeth and Mr Frazer coming in.

1 should like to know? I gave them in-

structions to stay iu the garden till

you and Jane Brown arrived.”
She strode across the room, her full

skirts rustling and billowing, and called

to the delinquents from the open win-

dow. “Elizabeth, my dear. I thought
I told you to wait in the garden? No,”
as Elizabeth paused on the first step
of the staircase leading to the drawing-

room, “do not come upstairs. I am still
engaged with Mr Power.”

Elizabeth turned away like an obed-

ient child, followed by the man who

accompanied her, and Power suppressed
a smile.

This man. who was a stranger to him.

was of the conventional handsome type
of Englishman; tall, broad, and fair in

spite of a bronzed face. He wore a long,
drooping moustache, bleached by the

sun, and there was something indolent,
though not unvraceful. about his walk.

Power watched him for a moment as

he strolled across the grass with Eliza-

beth. He was evidently not talking, but

from the occasional 'side-long glance
which he la-stowed upon the girl, it was

plain that ho was listening to her. and

watching her with interested amuse-

ment.

"I don't think I have met Air Frazer,'
he deferentially remarked.

“Probably not,” returned Miss Go

lightly with a sniff. “He is a new ac

quaintasice, with more money than

brains. I am trying to put a little sense

into his head and take a little money
out of his pockets, on behalf of my
Scheme.”

She glanced at the clock. "VVo must

begin without Jane Brown," she said,
“or the afternoon’s work will be dis-

organised.”

Flinging open the glass door, she de-

scended the narrow flight of steps, her

skirts held high with both hands, while

Christopher followed with a face of ex-

emplary gravity.
“We are partners, I hope?” he heard

the enviably rich Mr Frazer saying to
Elizabeth.

"I don't know. I expect Miss Go-

light ly will arrange,” returned Eliza-
beth. looking at the points of her shoes.

Her companion smiled slightly, and pull-
ed his fair moustache as the girl went

demurely forward to shake hands with

Power.
“Now. my dears,” called Miss Go-

lightly, “why are you hanging about
and wasting time like this? You could

have begun. Mr Frazer—Mr Power.

Now take your racquets.”
“Jeanie Brown has not yet come. Miss

Golightly,” said Elizabeth gently.
“What is that you say. Elizabeth?

My dear child, speak out! Now I in-
sist upon your repeating that remark
in a clear distinct voice. Say after me,

Jane Brown, not Jeanie please; no wo-

man should descend to the triviality of

a pet name. Jane Brown hasn’t come.”
Elizabeth quietly repeated the remark

with the required alteration in the

Christian name, while the two men

turned away and began to examine their

racquets simultaneously, and with great
care.

“And why hasn’t Jane Brown come,

may I ask?” she enquired, when the sig-
nificance of the proposition apart from
its value as a lesson in elocution had
occurred to her. “Ah, here she is, I see.

Jane Brown, you are exactly seven

minutes late.” was her severe greeting
to tile trembling and blushing girl, who

had been running all the way for fear
of this very catastrophe.

“I am so sorry. Miss Golightly,” she

panted, “our clocks ”

“Don’t trouble to invent excuses, my
dear. Now play. Christopher, you will

take Miss Brown; Elizabeth, go on Mr
Frazer's side. Now you have exactly
an hour and a half before you.”

They had a severe game, for Mis’
Golightly walked the gravel path by the

side of the lawn as though it were a

quarter deck, from which she from time

to time issued abrupt commands or com-

ments.

“Carelessness, Elizabeth!” ns she miss-
ed a ball. “Pure carelessness!”

“Ah! that's better. Apply your will

tn it. my child. Mr Frazer, pick up that,

bill, please. There! close to your feet.
Move a little more quickly! Jane

Brown, arc you asleep?” Poor Jane
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half imagined she was, and that this
■Was a terrible nightmare.

Elizabeth alone was perfectly com-

posed. Power looked at her admiringly
as he handed her a couple oi balls over

the net. She glanced at him with a

faint smile, and his thoughts recurred
to his picture of Saint Elizabeth.

"If she suffers martyrdom like this
often,” he thought, “she has an excel-
lent training as a model!”

At last the final stroke was made, and

the players dropped their racquets
simultaneously.

Miss Golightly took out her watch.
“That will do,” she said. “Elizabeth,
we have just half an hour more before
we must start; go and talk to Air Power.
Mr Frazer, 1 can give you a few mo-

ments now, to discuss the matter you
mentioned. You must go, Jane

Brown? Now, my child, why must you
go? Boes your mother want you? No?

Then what is your reason?”

Poor Jane, confused and flushed, was

racking her brains for an intelligent re-

ply, when Elizabeth quietly came to
the rescue.

“Miss Brown is working for a» exam-

ination,” she said gently. “I think she
feels she cannot spare any mere time.”

The girl looked at her with a gratitude
that was almost pathetic.

“Then why couldn’t you have said so

before, my dear?” enquired Miss Go-
lightly. “By all means go, n tmii is tire
case. Elizabeth, give Jane Brown some

tea. It's in the drawing-room. Chris-

topher, go in too. Now, Mr Frazer!”
and she turned away with the latter.

Power watched Elizabeth as she calm-

ed the fluttering and unhappy Jane

with a gentleness and tact which he

noted approvingly. When the girl at

last took her departure he turned Io

Elizabeth. “Shall we go out again, and

sit under the trees?” he asked.

She assented. There was something
about the dove grey ribbons she wore

that reminded him of the conversation

he had overheard at the garden party.
“I wonder if she is a Quakeress?” he

thought. “I hope not. She might ob-

ject to sit for the picture of a saint.

But she’d make a sweet Quaker ss,” he

concluded, looking at her again critic-

ally.
They were sitting under the big

hawthorn tree now, aud every minute

or two Miss Golightly and her compan-
ion, who were pacing up and down the
path on the opposite side of the lawn,

passed opposite to them.

“A new friend of Miss Golightly’s,”
Power began tentatively, looking at

the newcomer’s erect figure with an ex-

pression of rather active dislike. His

mother had often laughed at him for

what she called his “violent antipath-
ies,’’ and indeed he had not been strong-
ly drawn to the indolent looking young
man, who was now sauntering beside

Miss Golightly. The little lady, with

her erect, portly figure, made a ridicul-
ous contrast to her companion. To

Power’s eyes, as he watched them, he
seemed to be paying an exaggerated at-

tention to what she was so emphatic-
ally explaining. There was something
of the burlesque about his air of super-
natural gravity as he listened to her

eloquence.
“Yes,” said Elizabeth, “he seems very

interested in the Scheme. Miss Go-
lightly is explaining it to him now, and

I have been trying to tell him a little

about it this afternoon before you
came. But I can’t explain things proper-
ly,” she confessed with a desponding
glance at him. “Miss Golightly talks

so well ’

“And so much,” was Power's unutter-

ed comment.
“He is very rich,” Elizabeth contin-

ue 1, “and he has lived all his life

abroad,'* he says.
“You seem to have had a great deal

of conversation with him,” obserxed
Power, frowning.

Elizabeth looked at him a moment

with a wondering expression. She was

▼cry charming when she looked like
that. There was an almost childlike
air about the utter absence of coquetry.
Another girl, Power reflected, would

have striven to improve the occasion

by a flippant rejoinder.
“Yes,” she answered, simply. “I have

been talking to him a long time. Miss
Golightly wished it. He is very rich, and
it is so nice that he is interested in the
Scheme.

Power smiled. “That sounds a little
Jesuitical,” ho declared, looking amaz-

•d.

"Oh, I hope not,” she protested. “I
didn’t mean to bo anything so horrible

as that.” Her expression was so sweet-

ly serious that Power wondered whe-
ther he might venture at once upon
a request that she would sit to him

for his Saint Elizabeth, but finally de-
cided to temporise by asking when she

was coming to call upon his mother.

Elizabeth was afraid there would be

no time until after the following week.

“Perhaps then, if Miss Golightly could

spare her one afternoon.”
Power grasped eagerly at the sugges-

tion. “Anything,” he was beginning to

think,

“If only I can get that little head of

hers

Painted upon a background of pale
gold.”

The lines were running in his head all
the time he was talking to her, and he

started with annoyance when Miss Go-

lightly came bustling towards them.

“Elizabeth, my dear,” she observed,
“say good-bye at once, we haven’t a

moment to lose.”

The girl rose and held out her hand

to Mr Frazer.

“Good-bye,” he said, in the low, lazy
voice that Power already hated. “Miss

Golightly has kindly asked me to eoine

and play tennis some other day. I

hope we may be as successful as we

have been this afternoon, Miss Trevor.”

His eyes rested on her a moment as

he shook hands, and in his glance Chris-
topher thought there was approval, car-

ried to the verge of insolence. Cer-

tainly this was developing into one of
the “violent antipathies.”

CHAPTER IV.

It was late in the afternoon of a bril-

liant day in mid July before the doctors
left. Hastily summoned in the morning,
they had been with Miss Golightly all
day. Before leaving they had sent for

Elizabeth. “Nothing can be done,” said
one of them in response to Elizabeth’s
frightened questions. “It is a matter of
time, a few Lours, perhaps; possibly even

a day or two. In the meantime she asks
to see you, Miss Trevor.”

The girl opened the door of the darken-
ed room and entered softly, with a kind

of awe. it was so strange to think of
this little, indefatigable woman lying
there helpless and still, never to bustle or

work, or frighten anyone again.
And yet never before had Elizabeth ap-

proached her with a beating heart. For
the first time since they had met, she

was afraid.
How xvould she look? How would she

take her sentence?
The curtain was drawn on the side of

the bed nearest the door. It seemed
quite a journey to cross the room and
stand on the other side of the bed.

“Sit down, my dear, sit down. No, not

on that chair, take the higher one. Move
the other out of the way first! My dear

Elizabeth, you must learn to have a little
more common sense.”

The -relief was so great that the girl
could almost have smiled. It was the
same peremptory voice, a little weak,
perhaps, but otherwise unaltered. Surely
the doctors were wrong, she could not be
so ill as . Then she looked at her face,
and the thought vanished . In reality she
was very little "hanged, yet the unmis-

takable, indescribable look of death was

there.

Involuntarily the girl put out her hand
with a quick rush of pity and sympathy
for the lonely dying woman, and Miss Go-
lightly took it, looked at her fixedly a mo-

ment, and Elizabeth saw that her eyes

grew dim.

“I am glad I knew you, my dear, be-
fore—l sent for you to give you this,
Elizabeth,” she continue ’ with a relapse
into a more ordinary tone, as she fum-

bled with cne hand under the bolster.

“Let me get it,” said Elizabeth, helping
her to take a letter from under the pile
of pillows.

“It is for you to read when I am gone,”
said Miss Golightly, her mouth twitch-
ing into a sort of grim smile as she add-

ed. “Life is full of surprises, Elizabeth, it
will seem strange to you to read my love

story, won’t it?”

“Dear Miss Golightly!” murmured
Elizabeth.

“I would not leave it to anyone, but

you. my dear,” whispered the old woman

weakly, “and you will burn it directly
you have read it?”

Elizabeth nodded her head. She could
not speak for tears.

“You will find that I have left my
money to you, my child,” she went on.

“The letter will explain one of my rea-

sons for doing so, but I may say now,

my dear girl, that I leave it with pleas-
ure. You are a good child,” she added
in a voice that Elizabeth had never heard
from her before. “In spite of the fact
that you are perhaps deficient in will

poxver. Money has always seemed to me

a poor sort of thing, yet as *t is the only
gift I have, I leave it to you willingly
and gladly.” Elizabeth broke into a lit-

tle cry.
“Miss Golightly, don’t,” she gasped.

“You are mistaken in me, I—will you let
me tell you?” She had risen from her

seat—her face was white, and her lips
trembled.

“Sit down, my dear,” commanded Miss

Golightly. “You must learn not to in-
terrupt in that way, nor—nor to contra-

dict.” Her voice trailed off into an in-

coherent murmur. Suddenly she closed
her eyes, and Elizabeth saw a change pass
over her face. She ran to the bell, and
then back again to the bedside. Miss
Golightly lay still. On the face of the
little, imperious lady was stamped the

meekness of death.

A few hours later Elizabeth, standing
in her own room, with trembling hands
broke the seal of the dead woman’s let-
ter.

“My dear Elizabeth,” she read.

In a few days, no doubt, the lawyers
will tell you that you are practically a

rich woman. I feel, hoxvever, that some

explanation of my will is due to you.
I am dying, the doctors say, and this
time I believe them. The moment has
come, therefore, to tell you my love
story. It is something of a comfort to
me to think that you are not likely to
be amused by it. You are not flippant
and vulgar like most of the modern
girls. It is thirty years ago since I had,
or thought I had, a lover. His name

was Charles Trevor—your father. He
was some years my junior, and everyone
xvas much amused, I believe, for I was

known even then as ‘the eccentric Miss

Golightly,’ and the ‘blue stocking.’ It is
a long time to look back, and, of course,
it doesn’t matter, but I would give much

noxv to know that he never laughed.
Women, even strong-minded "women, are

fools, my dear, and I ought to have
guessed at first that it xvas my money,
not me, he xvanted. I did discover it
in time, fortunately, and a year after
I broke my engagement he married an

actress—your mother. By this step, as

you knoxv, he alienated his family, who
were much opposed to the marriage. Of

course, I ought to have forgotten him.
But I did not. The bitterest day of my
life was the day of his death, and for

years I have been half determined to
leave my money to Charles Trevor’s
child. I found that he had left you
penniless, and that after your mother’s
death his two eldest sisters had taken
you to their home and brought you up.
For years I had been longing to see you,
but I dreaded—but never mind xvha't I
dreaded, it is enough to say that I did
send for you at last, with the determin-
ation that if you pleased me you should
be my heiress. Everyone I knoxv ex-

pects that I shall leave my money in
trust for the furtherance of the Scheme.
Everyone will be disappointed then. For

you have pleased me, my dear, you are

a good, gentle, truthful girl, though you
are your father’s daughter, and I leave
my worldly goods to Charles Trevor’s
child with more pleasure than I had
hoped to experience again in this life.
There remains one other point to be ex-

plained. You will find to all intents
and purposes my money goes to you ana

you only at the expiration of eighteen
months. When that time has elapsed
my half-brother, Valentine Golightly,
xvill have been twenty years away from
home. He was a boy of fifteen when
he went to sea, and from that day to
this he has gone out of my life. I
haven’t forgotten him though. You will
admit that my memory is excellent. I
had an odd sort of affection for the
boy, and blood is thicker than water
after all, so that for fear of doing him
an injustice I have insisted upon this
clause to my will. Practically, hoxvever,
the money is yours. My lawyers have
advertised and done all that is possible
a score of times during the past ten

years, and they look upon this stipula-
tion of mine as a piece of eccentricity.
It may be—but I prefer to give the boy
a full txventy years’ chance, though no

doubt he has long been in his grave.

“Good-bye, my dear girl, you have
done much to sweeten the end of an old
woman’s life. May you have greater
happiness than she has knoxvn!

“Yours, with much affection,
“Martha Golightly.”

(To be continued.)
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No matter where her ships may be,

Her flag will fly in every clime.

Foremost till the end of time,

Her hardy sailor loves to roam

Upon the wave he calls his home,
While from the cold he Is secure,
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Tragedies
of the
Night

By

Edgar
Pickering.

IV.

THE TRAGEDY OF THE GRANGE

BALL.

Right and left of him men were fall-
ing quickly under the hot fire from the

distant kopje; the hiss of bullets, thick
as hail almost, was in his ears, as across

the bare, exposed ground Mark Eversley
led his company to the attack, with a

grim, defiant look in his eyes, as if he

scorned death. There was a grim sur-

prise in his heart, too, which amounted
well-nigh to regret that he had escaped
so far from being wounded or killed, for

it would be better far to have done with

life as so many others had

with their face to the foe,
than to see England again. And
amid the wild excitement of the engage-
ment Mark’s mind was occupied in go-
ing over again the announcement he

had read in the newspaper, which was

dated two months ago, but had only
reached the station an hour since.

The paragraph in the paper which
seemed to have burnt itself into his

brain, announced the engagement of

Freyda Graham to Leslie Streatham,
was worded in the conventional style,
and absolutely uninteresting to every-
one in the world excepting Captain
Mark Eversley. The assembly had
sounded as he stood gazing at the print-
ed words, and he had gone out from

his little ragged tent into the hot glare,
to join in the deadly brush with the foe,
thinking nothing but of those curt

words which told him that the woman

who had vowed constancy to him had
been faithless.

“It will be better for her—better for

me, if I get a bullet through by heart,”
went his thoughts, “than to go home.

There’ll be some sharp fighting when we

get within grips of those beggars yon-

der, and it may come then;” and he gave

a quick look at one of his men who had

pitched comically forward reddening the

parched veldt under his broad chest.

Then the company had left the dead
man a hundred yards to the rear, and

Captain Eversley’s thoughts went back
to the paragraph in the newspaper, as

he and the others eame hand to hand
with the enemv at last.

But neither bullet nor sword had

touched him, and out of the butchery
Mark Eversley returned to his quarters,
having performed a bit of work which
would make him a V.C. presently, yet
he had but the faintest recollection of
it. Freyda Graham seemed to have got
between him and death. That was the

strangeness of the thing, and he laughed
mirthlessly at the thought.

Three months later, and he was in
London again, his share in the South

African war being done. He had only
returned yesterday, and it was nearly
two years since he said good-bye to

Freyda Graham; there was a host of

friends who would welcome him—yet
Mark Eversley thought of but one. She
had been different from his other friends,
for he and she were to have been made

man and wife; but something had hap-
pened to prevent their marriage, and
for the thousandth time the weary se-

quence of the events of the past two

years passed through his brain. They
had haunted him from the moment
when he read the announcement in the
paper—all throu b % journey to Cape

Town, and the voyage home, until every
other thought had been driven from his

mind except that of meeting Freyda
once more.

He was going down to Cranworth that

evening. He had decided upon doing
that. What might happen after, eon-

fused him to imagine. “She can scarcely
refuse to see me,” mused Mark. “No

one else need know of my coming to her

mother’s house—best that no one should
know,” and he got up from his chair,

going to a battered old leather case

which held a pair of revolvers. He took
one of these out, examining the lock

carefully, thinking of the bearded face
that had confronted the weapon for a

moment at Colenso before disappearing
in a mist of blood-stained smoke.

Mark found himself balancing the re-

volver in his hand, and then he flung it

to the further end of the room. “I shall
begin to think I’m going mad," he mut-

tered. “That was a hateful thought
which came to me just now—it seemed

to blind me for the moment.”

His servant entered the room at that

instant andMark twisted round sharply,
noticing a card in the man’s hand. “I
can see no one,” he said. “Tell them

I’m ill, or engaged. Say I’m dead and

buried,” and he gave a barking laugh.
The man nodded stolidly. His master

was only a little stranger in his manner

than usual, but there was a different
look in the eyes from that of yesterday.

The Grange, Cranworth, was brilliant
with light and merriment that night
when Mark Eversley arrived at the lodge,
for Mrs Graham gave a ball to which

half the county had gathered, and the
sound of music came faintly through
the darkness as he stood listening.

It was Freyda’s birthday, and the
dance had been given in honour of the
occasion. It would be the last event of

her happy, careless life of girlhood, for

she and Leslie Streatham were to be
married in a month’s time. Everybody
congratulated her mother and herself, for
Streatham was one of the wealthiest

commoners in England, and Captain
Eversley had been a comparatively poor
man. Freyda was very sensible, said
her friends, in throwing him over; but it
had not been an easy task. How fondly
Mark had loved her—how strong and
tender his worship! and amid the gaiety
surrounding her, there came a pang of
regret that their lives were for ever

sundered. She was wondering what the
effect of her letter, that had never reach-
ed him, might have been, and in what
manner she was to meet him. as meet

they certainly would next season!

“You are wonderfully thoughtful,
Freyda.” It was Leslie Streatham, who
was looking at her, as she sat out one

of the dances. “What are you thinking
about?”

She glanced up smilingly. “Would you
really like to know?” she answered CO-

quettishly, and he smiled back.
“I was thinking of something that

happened three years ago. Of somebody
who was walking with me across a moor

—someonewhom I shall never see again,
perhaps;” the last words coming almost

unconsciously, and her piquant face
grew serious. “I want you to let me off
the next dance, Leslie. I’m tired—l’d
like to sit hero alone, just for a few
moments, where I can look out across

the park. I shan’t see the dear old
home again very often, remember.”

He humoured her, as he always did

every whim or wish of the war ward tri:!,
and Freyda, seated in the deeply-recessed
window, gazed out upon the night. 1 e

merry stir of the guests, the wailing
waltz tune, the light and joyousness,
seemed to have all drifted away as she

looked; and there came a flood of mem-

ories which carried her back to days
forgotten until then.

Suddenly Freyda started to her feet,
for a solitary figure had stepped out

from the gloom into the light cast by
the brilliant ballroom through ths long
casement upon the terrace, blanching the
face that confronted her, and a hand

was beckoning. So silent and motionless
stood the form that it might have been

an unearthly visitant, but for her instant
recognition of it. Mark Eversley was

mutely calling—Mark Eversley waited
there: he who loved her, and she who

had vowed to be faithful to him, were

face to face once more. Then she had

opened the casement and stepped out,
shutting it softly, and silencing the mur-

mur and merriment of the dancers, so

that it was as if a quietude, deep and
profound as death, had closed around

her. There was a strange mingling of
keenest joy and expectation in her mind
—an unspeakable happiness; an unspeak-
able despair.

There was no greeting between them,
and they moved out of the beam of
light side by side, yet apart, into the

dark grounds.
“I didn’t care about coming into the

house,” he was saying eare’essly. “I

only reached the Grange half an hour
ago.”

“I did not know you were in Eng-
land,” she responded, as if defending her-
self, but he did not heed.

“I don’t suppose we shall see each

other after to-night, Freyda,” he con-

tinued. “You will not be missed for

ten minutes, perhaps. Will you walk

as far as the old bridge? That’s not

very much to ask, and I’ve a fancy for
going there. It was the spot where wc

said good-bye to each other when I was

ordered to the front. You remember?”
Remember! His farewell kisses were

burning her brow and lips again, as they
had done then. Her heart was throb-

bing as it had throbbed that day. Would
she ever forget?

They walked on silently, each occu-

pied by their own thoughts, and ga-int
and black rose the old bridge across the

sullen river. They were standing against
the low parapet before Eversley sp.ko
again.
“I remember our parting, Freyda—it

was something to think of when we were

thousands of miles from each other. It

was something to think of moreover, of
what sort our meeting again would be—-

the happiness of seeing you; of holding
you in my arms; of hearing your voice-

can you imagine what real happiness
that was?”

She had bent her head downwards, or

even in the darkness he might have seen

her teal’s.

“I’m not here to blame you, dear,” he

went on. “There may be some reason of
which I don’t know, for what has hap-
pened, but it doesn’t matter now. I

think you’re crying, Freyda, and that’s

foolish. Who will care for your tears?
People’s hearts and souls may be tor-

tured, yet there’s not a single person
who’ll mind. That’s the way of the

world. One has to go their own way—-
to fight,, and love, to conquer or fail,
quite alone.”

“Mark!” and Freyda’s outstretched

hand found his. "If you only guessed
half the misery that’s in my heart you’d
forgive me. I was mad I think when I

broke my promise to you—you don’t
know that I was almost forced to give
you up; I know now that I love you
more than ever I did in the old days—-
you only, Mark.”

There was a passionate ring in the

words That caused him to come beside
her, and his arm was round her waist.

“Yes, yes, I know,” he replied, hoarse-

ly. “They thought of the money when
you were persuaded to accept Streatham.
But I’ve come in time to save vou. Frey-
da.”

"Never to be parted again, dear
Mark!”

“Nevdr—never to be parted again,
dearest one,” and his grip tightened
round her.

Hark! Through the darkness came a

voice calling her. Freyda! Freyda! Les-
lie Streatham’s voice, mingling with the

merry dance music that floated out

through an opened casement.

"What shall I do? What shall I do?”
she whispered affrightedly. “Mark,
they mustn’t find me here with yon—to
morrow I will speak to my mother and

Mr Streatham. Let me go now,” but he

only held her eloser to him. feeling her

quickly throbbing heart against his own,

and below muttered the black river.

“Let me hear you tell me once again
that you love me, sweetheart. Let me

feel once more your kisses on my face,”
he murmured. “It’s for the last time,
dearest—the last time.”

She put her arras round his neck, for-
getful of aught else but the love she bore

him. Overmastered by the mighty
strength of it, her lips were on his, their

lingering kiss a very heaven of bliss.

“Swear that you love me,” he whisper-
ed.

“Only you, dear, dear Mark,” cams

the words. “Come what may—only you,
for ever and ever.”

She was in his arms, powerless to re-

lease herself, and then a quick spasm of

deadliest fear struck her.

“Let me go! Let me go!” she cried

“You hurt me.”

“They meant to rob me of yon, dear-

est,” he answered very tenderly. “To

part us; but that can never bo. Come.”

Though she struggled with all the

strength of fear to escape, it was in
vain, for clasping her in his arms Mark

Eversley stood upon the edge of the

crumbling parapet. One 100k—a last
look of unutterable love upon the face

upheld to his—one last kiss upon those

marble lips, and then, locked in his em-

brace, she and he were in the black, icy
flood, borne swiftly downward together
to death.

“Freyda!” “Freyda!” came the cry

never to be answered.

“Brandy and Soda” Is all very well

To drive a bad headache away.

But it won't cure a cough, as many ear

tell,

Who have tried the right stuff and

say;

The only thing they have found any use

When colds they have had to endure.
Is that which soon sends such ills to the

deuce.
Some

WOODS’ GREAT PEPPERMINT CURE.

''New Rival” and “Repeater”

WINCHESTER
Shotgun Cartridges
“New Rival” loaded with Black powder, and “Repeater”

loaded with Smokeless powders. When buying, always

insist upon having them, take no others, and you will get

the best Cartridges for the price that money can buy.

NO TROUBLE TO GET, ALL DEALERS KEEP THEM.
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Here and There.

So far no reply has been received from
the Premier to the invitation to visit tire

North, which was extended by the public
meeting held recently at the Harbour-

Board offices under the auspices of the
Railway League.

Eton is, in point of members, the larg-
est of English public schools. There is

accommodation for 1000 boys. Harrow

takes 600, Marlborough 590, and Rugby
580.

A United States Blue Book gives the

number of deaths last year from lightn-
ing in the United States as 563, and the

persons injured 820; 4251 heads of live

stock are killed.

Our Wainku correspondent states

that Miss Boon, a young lady visitor at

Mr Barribnll’s met with a painful acci-

dent last week. She was driving to a

picnic- when her horse stumbled, and she

jumped from the buggy and fell, break-

ing her leg. Dr. Clouston was quickly
in attendance.

Breathless Would-be Passenger: “Sta-

tionmaster, when does the half-past
five train leave!” Stationmaster: "5.30.”

Passenger: “Well the new church clock
is twenty-five minutes past, the post
office dock is twenty-seven minutes past.
Now, in the name of goodness, which

clock am I to go by?” Stationmaster:

“You can go by any clock you like, but

the train’s gone.”

The Women's Christian Temperance
Union held a special meeting to

welcome home Mrs. and Miss Dewar,
who went as delegates to the Conven-

tion at Dunedin from the Auckland and

Onehunga Unions respectively. There

was a good attendance, and a hearty
vote of thanks was accorded Mrs

Dewar for her very : interesting and
clear report. Afternoon tea was served.

Great excitement was caused in Johan-

nesburg recently by a baboon breaking
loose and scampering about the town.
Children enraged it by throwing stones,
until it attacked two ladies and severely
bit them. Then it sprang at a small boy;
and after mauling him badly was finally
killed bv a revolver shot.

During the hearing of an action in the

County Court at Middlesbrough. England,
a short while ago, a, fight took place be-

tween two of the witnesses, and it took

two policemen and all- the court officials

to separate the combatants. One of the

fighters was sent to gaol for seven days.

While H-?rry Prather was escorting his

young bride at a fair in Ashland, Ken-

tucky, an aeronautoffered to take up in

his balloon any young woman who was

not afraid to make the ascent. Mrs. Pra-

ther made two ascents with him early in

the day. In the afternoon she went up a

third time, but failed to come down. Pra-

ther declares she has eloped.

The following story is told. Lord

Salisbury was —walking one day in St.

James’ Park with one of his secretaries

when a gentleman passed them with, a

polite acknowledgement. Lord Salis-

bury turned and asked, "Who was that

nice looking gentleman with the fresh
complexion who raised his hat just
now!” "That, my lord,” replied the
secretary, “was Mr Long, one of your
lordship's Cabinet.” “Ah,” said Lord

Salisbury, “I thought I'd seen his face

before.” . . -

An eminent scientist has come to the

conclusion that the tendency of too

much education or intellectual develop-
ment in women i, to make them lose

their beauty. He instances Zaro women

of India. They are supreme. They woo

the men, control the affairs of the house
and the nation, transmit property, and
leave the men nothing to <lo. The re-

sult is, says the scientist, that they
arc the ugliest women on earth.

.

There are in the United Kingdom 51

recognised musical institutions which

cost, in round figures, £84,000 per an-

num for bare maintenance, exclusive

of professors' fees. At these establish-
ments an average of 17,500 pupils, at

an individual cost of training amount-

ing to at least £35 each, are pronounc-
ed finished vocalists, and drift into the

profession. This is exclusive of pupils
trained by such special masters in the

art as Garcia and others, or by any

of the 5600 professors of music who

are established for the purpose of

teaching singing in London alone.

Not all visitors to the country are as

ignorant of the farmer's surroundings
as the farmers sometimes suppose.
‘Brownings Magazine” gives this in-

stance: “Wai.” said Farmer Wilkins to

his city boarder, who was up early and
looking round, “ben out to hear the

haycock crow, I s’pose?” and he winked

at his hired man. “No,” replied the

city boarder, “I've been out tying a

knot in a cord of wood.” Fanner Wil-
kins scowled at the lured man. and

wanted to know why he wasn't getting
to work at milking those cows.

The servant problem is acute out here,
but it has not quite reached the point
where the servant expects the would-be
mistress to wait on her. The following
advertisements are taken verbatim from

the “Brooklyn Eagle,” a leading Ameri-

can daily. They are typical of scores:

Wanted, situation as cook and laundress,
or cook ilone, in small American family;
has good city reference. Please call at

494, Atlantic avenue; two, bells; no pos-
tal cards answered. Wanted, situationas

a chambermaid and waitress in a private
family by a young girl: seven years' re-

ference from last employer. Call for two

days at SOO A, Halsey street; no cards.

Surely the most peculiar trade of mo-

dern times is to buy up people’s cast-off
molars. Here is a genuine advertise-
ment. clipped from a Liverpool paper:
-—Many ladies and gentlemen have old

or disused false teeth which might as

well be turned into money. Messrs R.

D. and J. B. Fraser, Ltd., of Princes-

street, Ipswich (established 1833), buy
old false teeth. If you send your teeth

to them they will remit by return the

utmost value, or make you the best of-

for, and hold the teeth over for your
reply.

Melbourne boasts of 1057 hotels, and

not 50 of that number are hotels of ae-

ciAnniodation or food-supplying hos-

tclries. The retail liquor trade is prin-
cipally in the hands of women licensees,
the number being 505 males and 552 fe-

males. In addition about 2000 bar-

maids are engage!! in dispensing drink.

Averaging a woman’s connection with

the trade at five years, we must reckon
that in 30 years some 15,000 wives and

mothers in the community have passed
through the severe drdeal of dispensing
drink.

A curiously prophetic account of the

submarine occurs in Ben Jonson’s dra-

ma. “The Staple of News,” published in

1625:—
They write here one Cornelius’ Son

Hath made the Hollanders an invisible

eel.

To swim tne haven at Dunkirk and sink

all

The shipping there.
It is an Automa, runs under water,
With a snug nose and has a nimble tail

Made like an augre (auger), with which
tail she wriggles

Betwixt the costs* (ribs) of a ship, and
sinks it straight.

Jones saw Tomkins coming towards
him. and he noticed that his counten-

ance looked as though it had been

through a very bad time indeed. “I say,
old ehap,” he said, with alarm, “what-
ever is the matter with your face?”

“Well,” replied Tomkins, “I was walk-

ing down the street yesterday, reading a

letter—foolish thing to do, of course—-

but I was punished for it. A work-

man coming the opposite way lurched up

against me, hit me in the mouth with

a pickaxe, and knocked a tooth out!”

“Oil! that was quite a dental operation,
wasn’t it?” commented Jones, who must

have his little joke. “Well, no! He said

it was an axe-i-dental operation!” “Oh.

that’s too thin!” “Not exactly, it was

tooth out!” . •

Ventriloquism is common among the

members of the feathered family, as

many birds form their sounds without
opening their bills. The “Liverpool
Daily Post” gives the following exam-

ples: The cooing of the pigeon can be

distinctly heard, though it does not

open its bill. The eall is formed inter-

nally in the throat and chest, and is

only rendered audible by resonance.

Similar ways may be observed in many
birds and other animals. The clear,
loud call of the cuckoo, according to
one naturalist, is the resonance of a

note formed in the bird. The whirring
of the snipe, which betrays the ap-
proach of the bird to the hunter, is an
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act of ventriloquism. Even the night-
ingale has certain notes which are pro-
duced internally, and which are aud-

ible while the bill is closed.

The secretary of the Auckland North

Island Main Trunk Railway League (Mr.
R. R. Hunt) has received the following
report from the commissioner, north of

Auckland: “I have beer, out to the rail-

way near Berne station; the ballasting is

now finished, from where they left off

last September, to the railway station at

Ahuros, hut th: engineer says that it
will have another layer put on, and the

Bleepers packed, before the train can run.

The framework is ready to begin board-
ing for passenger station and goods shed.

There are about 80 men on the work now,
and they are making headway at the tun-

nel between Ahuroc, and Mahurangi sta-

tion. The progress is steady, and we

hope it will be maintained. We must not

forget to fight hard this session for the

£ 100.000 appropriation, according to the

resolutions passed at two public meetings
of the league, held in Auckland.”

During the recent hearing of the en-

quiry at Liverpool taking evidence in

connection with the “weeding out” of

hotels that is now going on at Home

some amazing figures about drinking
among women was given. Superintend-
ent Tomlinson remarked that a lot of

drinking was done in a certain house,
especially by women. The police had
watched the house for a total of nine

and a half hours during three days, and

in that time they saw 118 men, 719 wo-

men, and 25 boys and girls leaving the

place with liquor. They considered that

the place was not suitable for the large
amount of drinking that went on there.

The neighbourhood in which the house

was situated was a very low one.

A Victorian party (wires our Welling-
ton correspondent) consisting of Messrs

A. R. Robinsoil, financial editor of the

“Age” newspaper, J. H. and O. Symes,
sons of the proprietor of the “Age,” and
R. Crawford, a committeeman of the

Victorian Racing Club, have arrived in

Wellington after an enjoyable journey by
coach and train from Christchurch to

Nelson, via the West Coast. The party
speaks in high terms of praise of the
drive through the Otira and Buller

Gorges, and they say that each gorge has

beauties pecularly its own. The party
does not speak too highly of the ac-

commodation provided along the route.

Mr Donne, Superintendent of the Tour-

ist Department, has recently completed
the same journey, so that he will doubt-
less have noted the shortcomings men-

tioned by the visitors, and a change for
the better mar be cbnfidentlv anticipat-
ed.

‘
'

A sharp shock of earthquake, accom-

panied by a rumbling noise, was exper-
ienced in Dunedin at a-quarter to eleven

o’clock on Thursday morning. It was

severely felt at Cromwell, where crock-

ery and bottles on shelves were shifted.
The following are the quantities re-

quired by the Sydney naval station, for

which the Admiralty is calling for ten-

ders:-—20,0001 b coffee, IIO.OOOIb jams
and marmalade, 50,0001 b condensed milk,
60001 b preserved and dried vegetables.
Forms of tender and conditions of con-

tract have been received at the head
office of the Industries and Commerce
Department. If New Zealand manu-

facturers'' show any disposition to ten-
der the Department "will. endeavour to

arrange witli the victualling store officer
for an extension of time for receivin''
tenders.

Many instances might be related of
the extraordinary skill and address in
matters pertaining to social usage dis-
played by Mrs Roosevelt,' the wife of the
President of the United States of Ameri-

ca, and of these few are more amusing
than the adroitness with which she

quietly set aside one of America's singu-
larly stupid customs. The national hand
grip has become synonymous with actual
distress and discomfort, when inflicted
upon our chief magistrates and their
wives by the long lines of citizens who
avail themselves of the opportunity of
viewing greatness at the public recep-
tions which are regarded as an indispens-
able feature of our democratic institu-
tions. Mrs Roosevelt very properly pro-
nounced this well-established custom to
be a relic of barbarism, and determined
that her hand should not be at the dis-

posal of the cordial hundreds. Ac-
cordingly, at her first official reception

in Albany she met each of her guesfs
with so charming a greeting that few

observed that both of her slender hands
were entirely occupied in holding a big
bouquet.

The '’Sunday Magazine” publishes an

article under the title, “Favourite Texts
of Famous People.” Sir Henry Irving
writes: lhe passage which has always
appealed most strongly to me is this:
“And the greatest of these is charity”
(I. Cor. xiii. 13). Mr. Alfred Austin’s

favourite text is: “Let there be light”
(Genesis i. 3). Mr. Rider Haggard’s is:
“In your patience possess ye your souls”

(Luke xxi. 19). Madame Patti (the Bar-

oness Cedersfrom) writes that her fa-

vourite text is: “Be thou faithful unto

death, and I will give thee a crown of
life” (Rev. ii. 10). President Roosevelt

gladly responds that one of his favourite

Scriptural passages is: ““Be ye doers of

the word, not hearers only” (James L

22).

A Home paper recently took a new re-

porter on trial. He went out to hunt

items, and after being away all day re’-

turned with the following, which was the
best he could do: “Yesterday, we saw a

sight which froze one’s muscles with
horror. A hackman, driving down Col-

lege street at a rapid pace, eaine verjt
near running over a nurse and two chil-

dren. There would have been one of the
most heartrending ever re-

corded had not the nurse, with wonder-
ful forethought, left the children at home

before she went out, and providentially
stepped into a drugstore just before the'

hack passed. Then, too, the hackman’,

just before reaching the crossing® thought
of something he had forgotten, and, turn-
ing about, drove in the opposite direc-
tion. Had it not been for this wonderful
occurrenceof favourable circumstances, a

doting father and affectionate mother
would have been plunged into the deepest
woe and most unutterable funeral ex-

penses.” The new reporter will be re-

tained.

“The man who doesn’t advertise is

lost” is an axiom in which a certain seeds-
man has evidently a profound belief. This

gentleman, if not absolutely mean, is ter-
ribly close in his habits, but when asked
by some ladies who were arranging a'

flower service at a local place of worship
to contribute some blooms for decorative
purposes, he, rather to their surprise, re-

plied that he would be very pleased td
give them on condition that the scheme
of arrangement was left to himself. To

this the ladies willingly agreed, and left
the key of the church with the seedsman,
who promised to cut and arrange the
flowers on the Sunday morning. He kept
his word. His were by far the best
blooms in the church. But the text he
had chosen was, in the opinion of the
worshippers generally, and of the beg-
ging ladies in particular, hardly- so ap-
propriate to the place and occasion as if

might have been. In white roses on a
scarlet geranium background were th<
words: 'Try- Penny- Seed Packets.”

The work of Father Rouillac (just now

recuperating in Canterbury) in the can-
nibal islands of the' South Seas is weft
known. During the trying period when
the Eclipse was spitted on a jagged
reef at Guadaleanar, he suffered great
privation, sometimes being face to face
with starvation. But just at the sever-

est pinch he and his native boys were

discovered by the Melanesian Mission,
who came to their assistance. This mis-
sion is established in Norfolk Island and
the New Hebrides, besides Guadaleanar,
and Is conducted by clergymen of the
Church of England. The .niissioners
sent boys to help in the work of refloat-
ing the stranded Eclipse, and it was due
to their efforts that she was successfully-
wrenched from the reef. Owing to a
severe injury received to his foot while
liberating his craft, Father Rouillac has
since been taking a rest in the Solomon
Islands, and has used whatever remedies
were at hand to bring relief. In addi-
tion, the long weeks of work waist-higH
in water have not agreed with him, and
hence he has come to New Zealand for
a rest.

Tn connection with modern life assur-

ance there is one really funny storv,
which, perhaps, will be new to many.
The yarn is told of a famous revivalist
preacher who never lost an opportunity
of “improving the occasion” by a refer-
ence to spiritual matters, and who
sometimes mingled religion with busi-

ness with what to some might seem un-

desirable freedom. This worthy, being
a prudent person, had called at the of-
fice of a leading life assurance society
for the purpose of taking out a policy,
and had just completed the necessary
formalities. Unwilling to let the occa-

sion pass without an attempt to incul-
cate some high moral lesson, he accost-
ed a smart clerk in the “front office”
with the impressive observation,
'Young man, I have just insured my
life. But can you tell me how I am to

insure my immortal soul?” Whether
that smart clerk wished to be smartly
rude, or whether he was a little deaf,
and only partly understood the remark
made to him, may- be left to the read-
er s decision. But his reply was. at any
rate, prompt and startling: "The Fire
Department is on the first floor, sir!”

“Gentleman of means desirous of pur-
chasing the title of Viscount write con-

fidentially to Don Juan, 61 Rua ,
Lisbon, Portugal.”

lhe above advertisement, which ap-
peared in a recent issue of the “Times,”
affords a glorious opportunity to a well-
to-do member of the great Smith family
to blossom out as a nobleman without
the drudgery attending the capture of
a home-made title. A London corres-

pondent, whose curiosity was fired bv
the advertisement, app'lied to Lisbon
for particulars, and received the follow-
ing quaint reply, which he lias forward-
ed to the “Express”:—-

Dear Sir.—M ill you please let me

know whether you would be willing to
reside in Portugal for a short time

every- year, and also some particulars
of your position, etc.

You may understand that this matter
must be delicately approached. In ail
probability the sum required would be
about £l2OO, exclusive of fee for bear-

ing arms (annual).
I am the confidential agent of the

seder. You can take any name not
already appropriated by the nobiljtv
of this country, and could have your
arms prepared in England.

A recommendation from a marquis or

a duke will be necessary, and I could
doubtless procure that.

If you decide to purchase the afore-
said title, please furnish me speedily
with all particulars, and remit prelimi-
nary and inquiry expenses of £2O. Mv
friend is the Marquiza de S —. Yours
faithfully,

Our correspondent asks if the “pre-
liminary expenses of £2O” cover the re-

commendation from the marquis or the
duke, and if the seller sinks his identity
after the bargain.

A man sends this in tl«e desperate

hope of clearing his character:—

The other Sunday evening 1 went t«

church to escape the awful gloom
that settles over towns on the Day of
Rust. When the plate arrived at me 1

dived into my waistcoat top pocket, and

from amongst some loose silver I passed
out sixpence. When tlse service was

over (it passed all too quickly, for I

shared the hvmn book of the girl next

to me, and she was an awfully nice girl),
and I had got outside the -acred pre-
mises. the thought struck me with stag-
gering force that 1 had put a half-sov.

into the plate instead of sixpence. In-

vestigation proved my fears only too
well grounded. After a severe mental

struggle I decided to try to recover the

9/6. Inside the church I found the minis-
ter and wardens busy counting the

boodle. I explained. No gold coin was

found in the cash. Then I investigated
again, and found the half-sov. in my
pocket. My abject apology was received
coldly, even suspiciously, and I retired
discomfited—it being evident from the

lofty snorts of. the good men that I
stood condemned as a sacrilegious con-

fidence person whose scheme to take
them down for 9/6 on the off-chance of
there being half-a-sov. in the collection
had been glaringly exposed.

"I calculate I couldn't drive a trade

with you to-day!” said a true specimen
of a Yankee pedlar, at the door of a

merchant in St. Louis. “I calculate you

calculate about right. for you
cannot,” was the sneering
reply. “Wall. I guess you need-
n’t get huffy about it. Now. here’s a

dozen real, genuine razor strops, worth
two dollars and a half; you may have
’em at two dollars.” “I tell you 1 don’t
want any of tour trash, so you had let-
ter bo going.” “Wall, now, I declare.
I’ll het you five dollars if you make me

an offer for them are strops, we’ll have,

a trade yet. ” "Done!” replied the mer-

chant, placing the money in the hands of
a bystander. The Yankee deposited the

like sum. when the merchant offered him

couple of cents, for his strops. “They're
yourn,” said the Yankee, as he pocketed
the stakes. But he added with apparent
honesty. “I calculate a joke is a joke,
and if you don’t want them strops I’ll
trade back.” The merchant’s counte-

nance brightened tip as he

replied. “You’re not such a

bad chap after all. Here are

the strops—give me the money.” “There
it is,’ said the Yankee, as he received
the strops, and passed over the couple
of cents. “A trade’s a trade, and now

The enduring and reliable qualities of the Oldsmobile were

recently proven in a long distance run held in America between
New York and Boston— 500 miles.

It was the only machine in the 1,000 pounds class that made the
run without a penalized stop, winning the highest award.

It is made to run ana does it. The motor is of simplest construc-
tion, the result of 17 years’ experience in building of Gas Engines
and Automobiles. Starts at will from seat and’is always under
instant control of the operator.
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you’re wide awake in earnest. I guess
the next time you trade you’ll do a little

better than buy razor strops.” And

away he went with his strops and his

wager, amid the shouts of the laughing
crowd.

A North Country farmer who has

reached a good old age states that his

second crop of hair, which has come

sifter a period of baldness, is due to the

application of nettles as a hair restorer.
When a young man the fanner was

anxious to grow a beard, and hit upon
the expedient of experimenting with the

nettles. Every night before going to

bed he applied a stinging nettle to his

chin. Next morning his face was red
and swollen; but the application of a

little sour milk soon remedied that. And

the beard grew quickly. On becoming
bald the farmer recollected the treat-

ment of his young days, and s.ept for

several nights in a nightcap filled with
nettles. The sensation was at first pain-
ful. but after a time the nettles appear-
ed to induce sleep, and a plentiful crop
of hair was the result.

A distinguished lawyer and politician
was travelling on a tram when an

Irishwoman came into the car with a

basket, bundle, etc. She paid her fare,
but the conductor passed by the poli-
tician without collecting anything. The

good woman thereupon said to the po-

litician, “An’ faith, an’ why is it that

the conductor takes the money off a

poor woman, an’ don’t ask ye, who seem

to be a rich man, for anything?” The

politician, who had a pass, replied: “My
dear madame, I’m travelling on my
beauty.” The woman looked at him
for a moment, and then quickly answer-

ed : “An’ is that so ? Then ye must be

very near yer journey’s end.”

Mensa, a native African, who accom-

panied Mr R. A. Freeman, the explorer,
on his journey through Ashanti and

Jaman, seemed to regard all the hard-

ships and discomforts the party encoun-

tered as a joke. He had once been a

labourer on a steamer, and was very
fond of personating a ship to the amuse-

ment of the other carriers. Mr Freeman
describes this dusky Mark Tapley as fol-

lows: —“As he sat on the ground devour-

ing a plantain he would inform the as-

sembled company that he was taking in
cargo; then he would sit for a while and

get up steam, and when the bugle sound-
ed the advance he would rise and take

up his load and start himself with a

great ringing of imaginary
bells and loudly spoken orders
to go full speed ahead, and finally
trudge off with his machinery clanking
and his propeller thumping an imagin-
ary sea. When we waded across the
streams he usually took soundings with
his feet, and announced the depth by
shouting in genuine nautical style, ‘And
a half-five,’ or whatever he considered
the depth to be; and once when he slip-
ed over head and ears into a swamp he

emerged dripping and grinning, bawling,
‘No soundings!’”

Although the present day Greek is a

very different specimen from the Greek
of Homer he is not insensible to the
glorious heritage bequeathed to him by
his ancestors, whose deeds still shine in

song and story. This is proved by the

fact that the work of restoring the
Pantheon—that perfect specimen of

Greek architecture —has within the past
few' weeks been brought to a successful

conclusion. The Pantheon is a magical
name, whose mention awakens in the
mind of the Philo-Hellenist a train of

thought and association of ideas as

brilliant as the Milky Way in the

autumn skies. There is something very
fine in knowing that after all these ages

hero-worship in its truest sense is not

dead, and that this sacred place, around
which linger the ghosts of a mighty na-

tion, has been rescued from the hands
of decay and destruction. The work

cost £12,000, which was contributed by
the Greek Government and several
wealthy foreigners. When the restorers

had finished their labours, the only
thing lacking was one of the caryatides
which formerly decorated the facade and
was taken away some years ago and
added to the Elgin collection at the

British Museum, the vacant space left

having been filled in by a statue in terra
cotta. This precious piece of sculpture
is to be given back to reck Govern-
ment, and is now on its way to Athens.

Imperfectly cultivated people are

prone to regard poetry as a special de-
light, reserved, as Lowell said of Chau-

cer, for themselves and a few friends.
An experience which a writer in the

American paper the “Atlantic Monthly”
relates in a paper called “The Book in
the Tenement,” shows how greatly they
are mistaken. One summer many of the

workers in a slum “settlement” were

reading Kipling. The people of the

neighbourhood caught the prevailing
taste. One little girl thought the “real-
est” of Kipling’s verse was this stanza:

Small mirth was in the making. Now
I lift the cloth that cloaks the clay,
And wearied at thy feet I lay
My wares ere I go forth to sell.
The long bazaar will praise—but thou —

Heart of my heart, have I done well?

“Why do you like it?” the teacher
asked. “Because it makes me want to

do my work well.” One day a girl was

saying that she liked the poem:

Another preferred:

Roll on, thou deep and dark blue ocean,

roll!

Break, break, break,
On thy cold, grey stones, O sea!

A boy was silent. “Don’t you say

either of those poems when you are at

the seashore?” “No,” he replied, “I
don’t. But there is one I always think

of.” Then he repeated Kipling’s poem:

“The Injlan Ocean sets an’ smiles

So soft, so bright, so bloomin’ bine.”

“I like it better than them other tw*

oceanpoems. It’s so friendly like with

everything.” When President McKinley
was shot they were talking it over in the

settlement. “Yes,” said one boy, “all

day a poem in your little red book (Kip-
pling’s “Recessional”) goes over and

over in my head. The man who did this

thing is a Pole, and lam a Pole. It

hurts hard. This piece cries out in my
.head:

“For heathen heart that puts her trust

In reeking tube and iron shard—

All valiant dust that builds on dust,
And guarding calls not Thee to guard.

For frantic boast and foolish word.

Thy mercy on Thy people, Lord.”

Here is a “fragment” from the auto-

biography ol Rosa Bonheur. The follow-

ing passage relates to her early days:
“Our studio was a confusion of all sorts

of odds and ends, and you would never

guess how my father took advantage of
that disorder. When he received money

for his work he would take a handful and
throw it at random about the room, and
then, when we had not a farthing left at

home, we searched in all the corners of
the room, and sometimes found a five-

franc piece, which saved us from starva-

tion. To perfect myself in the study of

nature, I spent whole days in the Roule
slaughter-house. One must be greatly
devoted to art to stand the sight of such

horrors, in the midst of the coarsest peo-

ple. They wondered at seeing a young
woman taking interest in their work, and
made themselves as disagreeable to me as

they possibly eould. But when our aims
our right we always find help. Provi-
dence sent me a protector in the good
Monsieur Emile, a butcher of great physi-
cal strength. He declared that whoever
failed to be polite to me would have to

reckon with him. I was thus enabled to
work undisturbed. His occupation was to
boil and trim calves’ heads. Having no-

ticed how frugalmy meals were, he some-

times offered to let me share his own. I
then went to his house, where his wife,
as kind as he was, made room for me at

their table, and gave me a good dinner.
And what a sight the place was, with all
the curious implements of his calling! At

last Fortune smiled on me. ... Of

course, I mean that I sold my pictures at
a good price!”

Think not, young man, that, because

you are gay and bright and vital to-day,
you will find the path of life throughout
as smooth and easy as you find it now at

the very start or outset of your appoint-
ed pilgrimage. Those juicy fruits that

stretch so temptingly by the bosky way-

side—those golden apples of the Hesper-
ides {Eat hang so lusciously from the

bending boughs—those cool draughts
that spring so pellucid from yon welling
fountain—those fair nymphs that bid you
loiter so often among the roses and eg-

lantines of yon shady bowers—all, all,
though they smile so innocent and so at-
tractive, are but deceitful allurements to
delay your feet and intoxicate your

senses, toils to lead you aside from the

straight but thorny road of right and
duty into the brighter but deadly track

of fatal self-indulgence. Yet, above all
things, if you would be wise, O youth!
shun that sparkling beaker, which the
cunning tempter, like Comus in the
masque, holds out to you too enticingly
to quench ardent thirst; quaff it not,
though it dance and glitter so merrily
in the sunlight, for there is death in the

cup; it leads you on slowly and surely to

the dishonoured grave; it loses you, one

after another, health, wealth and youth,
and friends, and children; it covers you
■with shame, disgrace, and humiliation,
and in the end this, this, this is the
miserable plight to which it finally re-

duces what may once have been a man of
birth, of learning, of genius, and of repu-

tation.—Grant Allen.

Shamrock HI., Sir Thomas Lipton’s
new craft, with which he hopes to take

back the America Cup to England will

be fully three minutes faster tlyrn the
last boat, and will be the speediest
yacht that has ever crossed the Atlan-
tic. Some very important discoveries

have been made by Mr William Fife as

a result of the many experiments which
have been carried out, and the result

will ba a glorified Shamrock 1., with

finer lines and easier bilge to drive her

over and through the water with in-

creased speed. Shamrock 1., designed
by Mr Fife, was faster in rough water

than Shamrock 11., designed by Mr
Watson, but was slower in a smooth

sea. In the new boat Mr Fife has

achieved an important compromise be-

tween the two, and he will give Cap-
tain Wringe, Sir Thomas Lipton’s skip-
per, a vessel embracing the best points
of both the previous racers. The chal-

lenger will have an even roundness of

keel, and her construction will be

lighter, and her appearance will gain
in graceful lines thereby. An import-
ant alteration will be made in her

sails, which will consist of some thou-
sands of feet more canvas, the fullest
possible area being covered with the

new spread. The challenger will be

longer by several feet than Shamrock
I. and about the same length as the

last boat, but with a little more beam.

“The builders get their idea of increas-
ed speed,” says a well-informed yachts-
man, “from the trial of Shamrock L, 11.
and HL in tanks. Of course, tank trials

are not wholly reliable, and the defend-
ers have something of a start in hav-

ing the actual race water, with all its

peculiarities, at hand for experiments.
But the lines of the new boat have been

eased all round, and with a fine bow,
and she represents the net result of
the former racing experience.” Here
are some of the new points in the 1903

racers:—

DEFENDER. CHALLENGER.

Lower in the water. Normal
Slightly blunter in the

bow. Finer bow.
Increased sail. Increased sail.
Increased beam. Increased beam.
Greater length. Greater length.

The chief difference will be seen to

be that of a fine bow, well out of the
water, and a lower and rounder bow,
both of which are attempts to get
clean driving with the increase of speed
which both will have.

Dainty footwear should be evry wo-

man’s desire, but high heels—smart and
suitable as they are for short women

with short, widish feet—are not beauti-

fiers, but the very reverse, in the case

of the tall woman with a slender foot,
who too frequently persist in wearing
them. There is no doubt that the Louis

XV. heel of portentious height, worn for

walking about the town, gives a pecking,
picking, hen-like gait that is not too

bad in a small woman, but quite unen-

durable in her tall sister. Also, a long,
slight foot tilted up on a high heel loses
its own special advantages, which are

much more apparent when a low heel—-

a really low one—is worn, permitting a

springy, easy gait, and displaying the

natural arch of the instep. A short
woman generally has a short foot, wide
for its length. She and her foot both

gain by the high, smart heel, which adds

to the wearer’s height and makes the

foot look dainty. It is not comfortable,
of course; it creates corns and other

troubles by forcing the whole weight of
the body into the pinched toe of the

shoe; but what would you? Who con-

siders comfort where smartness is in
question? As for the tall thin footed
woman, she has her own troubles. The

average bootmaker knows only two

patrons—the high heeled, pointed shoe
and the low heeled, square toed one. The
low heeled, arch soled, narrow, but not

over narrow toed shoe or boot is hard
to get, and generally dear when got, as

all good things are. It should be found,
however, and when found made a nota
of by any tall woman who has a reason-

able care for her appearance.

■■ ,

It’s an easy job for the barber to

part the hair on a head like this.

It’s just as easy to preventbaldness

ifyou only do the right thing.
Baldness is almost always a sure

sign of neglect; it is the story of neg-
lected dandruff.

Dandruff is untidy, unnecessary, and

unhealthy.

Ayer’s Hair Vigor
cures dandruff and prevents baldness.
You save your hair and you are spared
the annoyance of untidy clothing.

It also stops falling of the hair, and
makes the hair grow thick and long.

Do not be deceived by cheap imita-

tions which will only disappoint you.
Make sure that you get the genuine
Ayer's Hair Vigor.

Prepared byDr J.C. Ayer & Co.. Lowell. Man., U.S.A.

G. Zinzan Harris,
SURGEON DENTIST,

Wyndham Street, Auckland.
THREE DOORS FROM NATIONAL BANK OF NEW ZEALAND.

The Treatment of Decayed Teeth by the most approved prin-
v ciples ofPreservation.

■ Tooth Crowning and Gold Filling, etc.

The Treatment and Utilisation of Decayed Roots.
OBJECT For the Adjustment of Artificial Teeth without Plates, thus

avoiding Extractions.

•» The Adjustment of Artificial Teeth by Suction.
° The Painless Extraction of Teeth by the aid of all the latest

Anaesthetics.

NO FEES FOR CONSULTATION. FEES CHEAPEST IN TOWN.
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After Dinner Gossip
amid

Echoes of the Week.

The Oreetneee of LittleThings.

The real greatness and importance of

what some people would consider the

little things of life, has been frequently

pointed out by far wiser men and

abler pens than mine, but the continen-

tal tour of the King once more and

very clearly demonstrates the truth of

the dictum that it is “the little things
that matter.’ For instance, it was

surely a very minor occurrence that

British warships should have been sent

over to Algiers to honour President

Loubet. It was one of those small

courtesies which, if it'*had not been

extended, would have aroused no re-

mark or comment. But having been
done so gracefully, who will deny that

it may not be pregnantwith consequences
of the utmost importance? The French

greatly pleased us by their thoughtful
silence over the suicide of Sir Hector

Macdonald (all the French newspapers
having abstained from mentioning the

lamentable affair till the news had been
published in England). Here there is

another instance, that too was a “small

matter,” yet just imagine what might
■have been the feeling aroused had the

Paris journals come out with a series of

lurid, and perhaps obscene articles, as

has happened before now, when oppor-

tunities offered. But the exercise of a

generous feeling and a self-control,
which it is to be regretted was not

shown by the American press in Paris,
resulted in engendering a feeling of

friendliness, and even gratitude, per-
haps rather beyond its cause, but which

is very real and very sincere neverthe-
less, and which paved the way for the

international greetings and courtesies

now being exchanged. Wars often have

their commencement in very insignifi-
cant causes. Everybody will recollect

how bellicose the States became several

years ago over the Venezuelan affair,
but as a fact the irritation of the manin

the street was far more on account of

the charges brought by >Lord Dunraven
in connection with the race for the

American cup. "Tom, Dick and Harry,”
who are absolute monarchs in “the

greatest country on “airth,” thought
little and probably cared less about a

mere quarrel over a boundary, but when

their countrymen were accused of dirty
cheating, and that without proper evi-

dence, by an indiscreet British noble-
man, their fighting blood was aroused in
real earnest, and that most foolish of
episodes might have created such bad

blood that the first decent excuse for a

quarrel would have been taken, and ex-

tremities proceeded to. Happily there
came forward a sportsman who could
take a beating with a good grace, and
absurd as it may seem to the untravell-

ed, that tact and good temper of Sir

Thomas Lipton has unquestionably
done more than any other single thing
to increase the popularity of England in
the States.

With England desperately unpopular
with the German populace (for the

moment) a re-establishment of friend-
liness with the Parisian crowd
is certainluy not amiss. It is the easiest
possible thing to either please or offend
a Frenchman, and especially a Parisian,
and probably the thoughtful little act
of the King may entirely restore that

goodwill and good feeling which has
been too long absent between France
and England.

* * +

That Picnic.

There is no doubt the great Parliamen-
tary spree to the islands is going to land

all who participate therein in for an

amount of chaff and criticism scarcely
contemplated by the originators of the
somewhat quaint function, and the exclu-
sion of the press is not likely to diminish
the same. Exactly why a reasonable pro-
portion of free and unmuzzled pressmen

were not invited would scarcely seem

clear, and it is rather strange to spend
the public’s money, without allowing the

public to hear how it was done, and what

was the precise nature of the “value re-

ceived.” Naturally the unregenerate
wink the other eye and put forward the

scandalous theory that there are likely to

be “such goings on” that a reporter,
whose copy was not liable to be censored,
would be a very inconvenient and tire-

some person to have onboard.

Of course, you and Iwould never dream

of hinting that the proceedings will be

anything other than even a Sunday-
school teacher might approve of, but
there are so many ill-natured people in

the world that I really think the Cabinet

has made somewhat of a mistake in giv-
ing the idea there was something not fit

for publication in the jaunt. As for the

public, it takes the picnic very philoso-
phically and good-naturedly. It has be-

come inured to members collaring an ex-

tra rise for themselves and shouting
themselves trips to Picton or Nelson or

Gisborne during the session, and an ex-

tra thousand or so makes little difference.
One of “Old Dick’s” games, they say, for

you will notice that even his opponents
in politics speak of the Premier as King
Dick or Old Dick nowadays. He is no

longer a mere man; he is an institution,
and really and truly I believe many of
those who are hottest against him and
all bis works have that half-secret de-

light in his (as they consider) enormities,
that we used to have in our schooldays
when the bad boy of the school achieved

some more than usually daring and

showy feat of wickedness. There is the

same half-awed, half-admiring feeling of

“what will he do next ” which audacity of
any sort arouses amongst the weaker
spirits. Personally the Premier is, unto

me, “a perpetual feast;” the personality
of the man and his persistent pushful-
ness and manner of achieving his ends

paralyses criticism or comment. I can

but gaze and say “Ah!” at each new feat,
as one does at a circus, which, by the

way. New Zealand politics somewhat re-

semble. But I get on dangerous ground
for after-dinner discussion; let us change
the subject.

Are Women or Mon the More

Modest?

It was not to be expected that my (to
most minds, I suppose) blasphemous
opinion expressed last week, that women

are less innately modest than men, would

pass without challenge, and I have seve-

ral letters, some of them distinctly acri-

monious, before me. It is a pity the

average woman cannot keep her temper
over a discussion of this sort; or in fact

over anything where her superiority is

called in question. That is why, I sup-
pose, we exclude them from the after-
dinner chat of the smoke-room, where,
contrary to feminine opinion, conversa-

tion does not descend to the telling of

more or less cerulean stories. The ma-

jority of ladies who have favoured me

with their views start off to denounce

me for daring to suggest that the sex is
immodest, and continue to pour forth

abuse without bringing forward a single
argument. But they overlook the point
that I never said the sex was immodest.
Who am I that I should utter heretical

untruths? I asserted my belief, which I

stick to, that, contrary to received
theories, woman is less innately modest,
and, let me add, less shy than man. I
have seen men grow pink all over at plays
where women have sat absolutely un-
moved. I have heard them discuss mat-
ters in mixed company which no man I
ever met could approach without the

most obvious discomfort, and I have
seen them openly reading books which
the mere male would have hidden in the
uttermost recesses of his sanctum. As

for smoke-room stories, as they are often
called, I only know that the men who

make a practice of telling yarns usually
described as “blue” are regarded ns un-

mitigated nuisances by the majority of

their fellow creatures, and I do not know
that stories of the more or less objection-
able type are any more common in a

crowded smoke-room than in an equally
tenanted boudoir.

Prevention of Cruelty to Children.

The fact that the Auckland branch

of that most admirable of all societies,

that for the Prevention of Cruelty to

Children, held its meeting last week,

gives me an opportunity to again ap-

proach a subject on which some readers

will perchance think I am somewhat of

a crank. I mean cases of cruelty to

children. One’s blood, and the blood of

every one of you, must have boiled the

other day on reading of a female fiend,
who for the most shocking cruelties to a

child—an infant sister—was awarded

the disgraceful sentence of seven days.
How can society hope to stamp out this

most hateful and unnatural of crimes
if magistrates and those in authority
practically condone it by awarding ab-

surdly inadequate sentences? The pun-
ishment of the woman Drake was lenient

enough in all conscience, but though this

child did not—unfortunately for itself

perhaps—die, the infliction of a paltry
seven days is simply a crying scandal.
As I

*

have pointed out be-

fore, it is so difficult to

sheet the offence home to the

cowardly perpetrators, that when one

can be brought to book the punishment
meted out should be of no ordinary
order, but by a salutary severity suffi-

cient to give pause to even the most

passionate and uncontrollable bully of

either sex or age. Children will accept

almost any treatment from those plac-

ed in authority over them without mak-

ing that public complaint which would

facilitate the discovery of cases of gross

cruelty. Poor mites! they come to look

upon it as a part of the ordinary order

of things, and take it with the strange

dogged philosophy which is one of the

most, painful characteristics of suffering

childhood. The society has done good
work, but I do honestly believe it can

yet do more. The few cases brought
into Court show that even here there

must be many, many sad instances

where, if they could be discovered, its

intervention is necessary. And, further-

more, it can work up public opinion so

that when one of these wretched crea-

tures is convicted the sentence shall be of

exceptional severity.
* 4- *

Educated Inanity.

Some of the cries perpetrated by the

Southern University students at the re-

cent tournament here remind one how

ineffably silly some forms of humour

are, forms which provoke the laughter

not merely of the “groundlings.” but

of educated men and women. For in-

stance, when we tell you that one of

the cries of Victoria College, Wellington,

was “Banana, banana, potato, potato,

what ho! what ho!” you will probably
think that the representatives of our

newest college must be very childish.

Yet there was evidently to those,

concerned something very amusing

in this nonsensical cry, delivered with

the full strength of many undergraduate
voices, with an indefinite amount of

emphasis on the “What ho!” Another

wild cry of Victoria College was “No

coffee, no coffee, no cocoa, no cocoa,

no tea, no tea, no tea!” which is also

very silly in substance, but very
striking in effect. No body of

people enjoy themselves quite
so much as undergraduates, and

their boisterous and happy manner

makes m,any of their doings most

laughable when they are really only

silly. After all, humour is quite a mat-

ter of taste. There are people, and

many of them, whose sense of humour

is very keen, but who can’t see any
humour in the inimitable Dooley, or in

those most amusing yarns of W. W.
Jacobs. One can only feel pity for them

—pity at what they are losing. Fancy

a person who eould not see the humour
of “Politics is n man’s game, and

women, children and prohibitionists
would do well to keep clear of it,” or

“The boat was hoisted under the able

profanity of the mate!”

SICK MADE WELL

WEAK MADE STRONG.

Marvellous Elixir of Life Discovered

by Famous Doctor-Scientist That

Cures Every Known Ailment.

Wonderful Cures are Effected That

Seem Like Miracles Performed—

The Secret of Long Life of

Olden Times Revived.

The Remedy is Free to All Who Send

Name and Address.

After years ofpatient study, and delvinginto

the dusty records of the past, aswellasfollowing
modern experiments in the realms of medical

science, Dr. James W. Kidd, 49.5 First National
Bank - building, Fort Wayne. Ind.. U. B. A.,

DR. JAMES WILLIAM KIDD.

makes the startling announcement that he
has surely discovered the elixir of life. That
ho is able with the aid of a mysterious com-

pound, known only to himself, produced as a

result of tho years he has spent in searching
for this precious life-giving boon, to cure any
and every disease that is known to the human

body. There is no doubt of the doctor’s earnest-

ness in making his claim and the remark-

able cures that he is daily effecting seems to

bear him out very strongly. His theory which

he advances is one of reason and based
on

sound experience in a medical practice of many

years. It costs nothing to try his remarkable
‘‘Elixir of Life,” as be calls it, for he send*
it free, to anyonewhois a sufferer, in sufficient
quantitiesto convince of its ability to cure, so
there is absolutely no risk to run. Some of
the cures cited are very remarkable, and but
forreliable witnesseswould hardly be credited.

The lame have thrown away crutches find
walked about after two or three trials of the

remedy. The sick, given up by home doctors,
have beenrestored to their families and friends
in, perfect health. Rheumatism, neuralgia,
stomach, heart, liver, kidney, blood and skin
diseases and bladder troubles disappear as
by magic. Headaches, backaches, nervousness,

fevers, consumption, coughs, colds, asthma,
catarrh, bronchitis and all affections of the

throat, lungs or any vital organs are easily
overcome in a space of time that is simply
marvellous.

Partial paralysis, locomotor ataxia, dropsy,
gout, scrofula and piles are quickly and per-

manently removed. It purifies the entire

system, blood and tissues, restores normal

nerve power, circulation and a state of perfect
health is produced at once. To the doctor all

systems are alike and equally affected by this

great “ Elixir of Life.” Bend for the remedy

to-day. It Is freeto every sufferer. State what

you want to be cured of and the sure remedy
forit will be sent

youfree by return mail.

Remember, a letter to America requires 2 Ad.

postage. ' V< rite your name very plain, and be

sure to give your full address, so there can be

no mistake in delivery.

C. BRANDAUER & Co.’s, Ltd. |hese scr’ es

_ .
of Pens neither

Circular Pointed scratch nor spurt

They glide over

PenS the roughest
"

paper with the

Soven ease of a soft

Prize Module, lead pencil.

Ask your Storekeeper for an

Workai Blrmlng;ham, England. assorted Sample Box.
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TURF GOSSIP

TURF FIXTURES.

April 22. 23—South Canterbury J.C.
April 23 and 25 — Wellington R.C. Autumn

Apill 25—Waive rapa Hack Guineas (1904)
April 25 and 29 —Avondale J.C. Autumn
April 29 aud 30—Manawntu R.C. Autumn
May G and 7 —Egmont R.C. Winter

May 9—Christchurch R.C. Autumn

May 14 and 15—Ashburton County R.C.
May 1G and 20—Takapuna J.C. Winter
May 21 and 22—Wanganui J.C. Winter
June 3 and G—Dunedin J.C. Winter
June 10 and 11—North Otago J.C. Winter

ANSWERS TO CORRESPONDENTS.

‘ Dispute,” Auckland.—Renown 2.35 2-sths,
Advance 2.34*4. These are the official

times registered for the Wellington Cup ty
the horses named.

TURF NOTES.

Wait-a-Bit. after a season at the stud,

has been again put in training in Victoria

Special trains will run to the Avonda’e

Jockey Club’s meeting on both days.
A jockey named R. Trewartha, at a re-

cent Westralia race meeting, secured 13

firsts in 17 starts.

Royal Conqueror got cast in his box last

week, and injured himself somewhat severe-

There is a little betting going on over the
Avondale Cup and Railway Handicap
double.

Sid. Hodge, a capable trainer aud horse-

man, is going to Fiji this week by the
Moura.

The ex-hack Governess was sent back to
Mr Rathbone, her breeder, to Hawke’s Bay
after the Feilding meeting.

Rustique, by Recluse from the Maxim
mare Motto, won a double at the Patca
meeting.

<lingo, whilst working at Elkislio, was

making a noise, andit was thought that h's
wind was affected.

Inglewood, who won a race at Patca on
Easter Monday and next day won a race at

Feilding, is by Sylvia Park, son of St. Leger.

Nominations close on Friday next for the

winter meeting of the Takapuna Jockey
Club.

Mr. F. Leslie has purchased the pony
Sonica. by Soult from Dolly, dam of Solo,
for £3OO.

Mr Monte Mills, of New i iymouth, owns
a coming two-year-old half-brother to Orloff
by Gipsy Grand.

Mr. Morse, of Wanganui, has been ap-
pointed custodian of the Egmont Racing
Club’s course at Ilawera.

Mr Foley has purchased a grey pony
gelding by Country Boy from Mr. Quin-
liven, of Palmerston North.

Surely a poorer lot has seldom contested
a £lgu hurdle race than those lert in the

opening jumping event at Avondale.

Mr E. Greville, whoso death was reported
last week in Wellington, had a few horses
racing a short time ago, and Sensation was

one of his purchases.

Scrip, a double winner at tlv» Wairnrapa
meeting, is a half-brother by %u Revoir to
Rebellion, Revoke, aud Resolution, from

that once useful marc Mischief.

Mr Fred Duval, well-known in the turf
world, loaves on May Bth for America, and

will be accompanied there by Mr Abe Moss,
the Dunedin bookmaker, owner oi Canteen.

Symphony, by Perkin Warbeck—Lady of
the Lake, died recently. Her colt foal, by
St. < ’yr, is being handfed by Mr. J. A.
Goodson, of Ilawera, who owned the marc.

Among the well known performers offered
at auction Jn Sydney this week were Se-

quence, The Persian, Patto.iago, aud Fitz-
aoy.

An American offer < f £15,093 for the Eng-
lish Derby winner Ard Patrick ell-lted the

reply from his owner that he was nut fur
sale under £30,000.

Good Spec (Good-bye -Spec). who com-

peted successfully nt the Reiffton meeting
last mouth, broke one of his legs on Wed-
nesday week, ami was destroyed.

The Federal Fust master G(moral has an-

nounced that tin? postal law prohibiting
•’Tntt.’s” sweeps wilt not be extended tu

church lot terb s, eight hour sweep, etc.

Betting over the Thompson Haitdlcnp and

Railway Handicap at the Wellingto’i Rac-
ing Club’s meeting, commencing on Thurs-
day, hat; been slow locally, though several
horses have been supported straight out for

the mile race, Shrapnel and Ostiak being of
the number left In. Orloff found a few

supporter* before th“ acceptancei*

Vladimir was priced recently by Mr J.
Ellis. The figure asked was £750, but. the
trainer would not go beyond £so*3, and a

winning contingency, so no deal resulted.

ShrapneH, son of Catesby- and Element,
therefore full brother to Fakir, was about
the best horse that competed at the Feild-
ing meeting.

A couple of veterans that performed well

at Feilding were Chasseur, who showed a lot
of his old dash, and Legion of Honour, who
has a partiality for the Feilding course.

Plain Bill, the ’chaser, was in evidence
at the Feilding meeting—not. however, rac-
ing. but ns the starter’s hack, and it Is evi-
dent he ip, not to be raced this winter.

Old Gun. a good jumper who Pas won .•*

number of hack hurdle races, and Artisan, a

Wanganui hack, wort? sold during the pro-

gress of the Feilding races for Sogs ana

36gs respectively.

Deerstalker, a colt that I fully expected
might some day make a good horse, was

one of those that succumbed to the exig-
encies of racing in Riccarton, and has

probably said good-bye to the turf.

Tim appeal case, Walters v. the Auckland
Racing Club, will come before the judges
appointed by the conference on Wednesday
at Wellington. Major I’itt will represent,
the A.R.C.

No threc-year-old pony has ever ju T.ped
so quickly into prominence from a weight-
increasing point of view as the Soult pony

Sonica, the treble winner at the A.R.C .
autumn meeting.

Acceptances for the first day’s racing at

the Avondale Jockey Club’s autumn meet-

ing, which opens on Saturday next, were
received last night. Most ot the events

have filied satisfactorily.

An important stud purchase ha.: been ef-
fected by Mr Hugo Friedlander, of Ashbur-
ton. who has secured the highly successful
stud horse Pilgrim's Progress as leading
sire for his stud.

The price reported as having been paid for

Sceptre, £2O,<W, is far and away the

higest sum ever given for a mare. Far

larger sums have been given for stallions

for stud purposes.

A private cablegram received on Saturday

from Melbourne states that the stallion

Pilgrim’s Progress has been purchased by
Mr“ Hugo Friedlander for L'elburn Lodge
Stud at Ashburton.

The eomniittee of tiie A.J
t
U. has finally

decided to include a Sires’ Pvoduce Stak(-s

in future programmes for /the racing sea-

son, but it has been found inadvisable to

begin with one before 1905.

Sir George Clifford’s horses were in great
form at the autumn meeting of the Can-

terbury Jockey Club. Treadmill, by Bill

of Portland, ran like one that is likely to

develop into a Derby colt.

The Auckland Trotting Cl.ub’s. autumn

meeting is to commence on May 2nd. Nom-

inations, taken •-ir Friday «ight. are almost

entirely of local horses, but there is su’ i-

cient material for a good meeting. -

Many Aucklanders will remember the

light-weight H. E. Meyers (’"Kaiser”) when
riding for the late Jas. Kean. “Kaiser”

had a ride at the Feilding meeting, but is
not often seen in the saddle.

Ora. the Seaton -. Delaval—Tamora filly,
leased for some time by a patron of Pros-

ser’s at I’orirua, was sent home iccently to

her owner, and won a race for him at Patca
on Easter Monday.

Mr W. C. Phillips, of Ilawera, lust Ills
brood mare Patience the other day. She
was by Somnus, aud was the dam of Kid-

brock, Silver Star, raid Pereeverat.ee. She
also has left a couple of untried ones by
Sylvia Park.

Santoi. the erratic colt, who was well

fancied for some of the big Australian

handicaps last season, is being given a

trial over hurdles. His full brother, Re-

peater, was very successful over the short
st leks.

It was currently ••(‘ported that Mr Price
intended to take Ribbonwood to America,
bet the fact that the? little pacer is to be

shipped to Melbourne shortly, would seem

to show that the Christchurch sportsman
has no such intention.

The fat is in the lire over one of the

races run fur. on the last day of the
A.R.C. autumn meeting. A wrong one

won. and cerraln people who were taking
liberties have had to pay the penalty for

so doing.

Two Caulfield jockeys were endeavouring
to solve the Intricacies of the income tax

papers. ”1 wonder if they make us part
(Hi fees for losing mounts?’* said one, who is

reputed to exercise a very powerful wrist,

•’You bet,” was the terse rejoinder. ‘‘Well,
which o’ these blooming headings do they
come under?” said the first speaker. It is

friend sinHod and replied, “I think you’d
bo quite safe. Rill. In putting most of your
losing mounts under the head of ‘lncome
from Personal Exertion*l”

Wallace, Carbine’s best son In Australia,
had two good two-year-olds in F.J.A. and
Emir to represent him at the A.J.C. Easter

Meeting. The last-named coveted a mile in

1.39 3-s—a record go for a two-year-old.
A good deal of interest is being taken

in the approaching winter meeting of the

Egmont Racing Club. There is a large
number of hacks in training at Ilawera
alone, and local nominations are expects
to be good.

Though beaten in a maiden hick race at
the Wairnrapa meeting, Mr Colter’s two-

yenr-old filly St. Alba, by St. Leger fiom

Cuiralba, ran fairly well, and would h?ve

been closer to Scrip, the winner, had she
nut stumbled at the turn.

The lion. J. Carrol, who was present at

the Wairnrapa Racing Club’s autumn meet-

ing, had a nomination in the Maiden Hack

Race in Mauawaru, a two-year-old filly by
Mahaki from The Brook. She did not start,
however.

Gothic, by Gipsy King from a Morpheus
mare, a hunter who finished second in the

llangitikel Poiiit-to-Point Steeplechase, was
sold io Mr AlisU'f Clark during the week,
and shortly goes to Melbourne. Mr O Rorke
acted for Mr Clark in the purchase.

Katciina, who has W6ii a number of races

recently in the Wairarapa district. Is by
liandso.T.c Jack from Evelyn, a Dlcmedes
marc that won races over country ajout 13

years aga. Evelyn was seen by the writer

during the week doing duty with a com-

panion in a drag plying to the races.

It would have an educational effect were

stewards of some of our Auckland out-coun-

try clubs to travel and witness country

meetings In the more favoured Neith Island
districts between Taranaki aud Wellington,
where most of the clubs are up-to-date' in
the way of racecourse appointments.

Cha.xavpot (Martini Henry--Miss Kalparat
who raced for a long time in Sydney, has

been purchased by Mr J. Gove, and goe»

to India. Chassepot, judging by the fact

of his winning one race, and running sec-

ond in Another at Sunbury last week, is In

fair form, again.

An American exchange says that the

pastor of the W.V. Methodist Episcopal

Church at Wheeling, W.V., resigned re-

cently, stating that he fell from grace by
winning £lOOO gambling, and buying prop-
erty with the proceeds. He resigned, but

still holds ihe property.

Painp>ei’o was somewhat backward in

condition at the C’.J.C. autumn meeting.

Vladimir ran sour, and Red Gauntlet wore

a jaded appearance. Blazer, who was giv-

en away by his owner Ao his trainer on

condition that ho would not race him

again, looked likely to improve.

Achilles has now won a dozen races iri

succession, his earnings in stakes totalling

well over £3OOO, a good return for the IGO

guineas for which he was oriithialiy pur-

chased. A full brother to Achilles was in-

cluded in. the yearlings submitted by Mr

Clibborh hi N.S.W. this week.

Nonette was taking his ease In Frank

McMaiicmin’s paddock, near the racecourse,

while the Autuftm Meeting was proceeding.

Scores of racegoers mounted the wall to

pay their respects to the champion, who

is now apparently again as sound as ever,

his log showing no signs of disorder.

The Wellington Racing Club’s solicitor

having advised that neither the lease nor

the regulations framed by the trustees of

the course make It permissible to issue

’’.censes to bookmakers, the Racing Club

nave decided not to issue any licenses to

bet at their forthcoming meeting.

Tamora, dam of Nestor, died recently
down Taranaki way. This mate, in. a tripl
at Ellerslie, when trained by G. Wright,

ran the fastest mile and tbrecquarter gal-

lop in private that it has even been my lot
to witness, viz., 3m lt would be con-

sidered a big gallop even to-day. though
horses are rarely tried so far now.

A Charters Towers racing starter was re-

cently fined £7 7/, cost of new set of teeth,
10/6 dentist’s fee, £1 for lost time, and

costs, for dealing out stouch to a racing

patron who boohooed over a bad start or

something of the kind. They always wore

more lively than dignified up north.—“Bul-

letin.**

Ono of the best of the Queensland trot-

ting horses, The Chief, a handsome grey,
by Chieftain,a son of Child” Harold,changed
hands last week, being sold by Mr W. Hill,
for 150 guineas, to go to South Africa. The

Chief is snid to have a private record for

Ihe mile of something considerably pndcr
2.30.

Full Cry. who ran with success at Taka-

puna and Taranaki, was taken to Feilding
To run at that meeting, on the ev • of which,
however, he knuckled over, and his owner

fearing that he might go altogether, wisely
elected to rest him a week, and then take
him to the sea-side at Taranaki and swim

him, in the hop? of being able to race him
next month.

Never in the history of racing has an

owner won any particular event ten tlinps
in succession, as the record shows Mr Stead
to have done, that gentlemen’s horses hav-
ing accounted for the Canterbury Champion
Stakes t«n times in successive years. Sir

George CliHOrd’s colt Treadmill, by beating
Machine Gun, prevented the Yaldfiurst
stable adding one more to the long list.

Percy Martin was playing bowls on Eas-
ter Saturday and Mondny at Featherston
and Miistvrton, on which days the Waira-

rapa race meeting was in full swing. Think-

ing that the long-time trainer was on his

way to the race meeting, a friend suggested
that he had come a long way for his sport.

Marlin stated that he had not attended n

meeting on the Tnuherenlknu incecourse

since the memorable year when Korari and
Fishhook competed there.

fF’HE SOUTH BRITISH EIRE AND

MARINE INSURANCE COMPANY

OF NEW ZEALAND.

*Ad T itciim Dividend of 2/G per share for

the Half year ended 28th February, 190.;,

is now payable. Shareholders can obtain

Warrants on application at the Company’s

Office.

: By order of the Boaid.

JAMES KIRK ER,

General Manager.
Auckland, 7th April. 1903.

VEW ZEALAND RAILWAYS.

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF

SLEEPERS.

Railway Depart meat,
(Head Office) Wellington.

14th April, 1903.

Written offers will be received at this
Office up to noon of MONDAY,'IBth May,

19H3, f<»r the Supply and Delivery of Pu-

ri ri and Totara Sleepers, in lots of 250

or more, at any Railway Station or Sid-

ing on
the Auckland -Section. - v

Conditions under which offers are to be
made can be obtained at the District En-

gineer’s Office, Railway Station, Auck-

land; or Railway Storekeeper’s Office. New-
market; or may be seen posted up at the

Railway Stations, and the Post Offices at

Rawene, Kohukbhu, Opononi, and at the
Stationmaster’s Offices at Opua, Whan-

garei, and Dargaville.
Offers to be addressed to the General

Manager, New Zealand Railways. Welling-
ton. and marked outside ’’Tender for

Sleepers.”
Offers will also be received at the Office

of the Railway Storekeeper, Newmarket,

up to the date mentioned.

General Managet.

9. W. ALLSOP, A.R.1.8.A.

(Associate of the Royal Institute of

British Architects),

ARCHITECT
213. VICTORIA ARCADE.

**************************
*

I I
| Here’s

a. Sign s

T of good cheer in the Pure Amber

Beer that gives vigour, and pleasure.
and joy. A perfect brew. Uncx- $
celled for table use, and highly

J. recommended for the weak and con- 4?
valescent. Palatable, wholesome and

nutritious. HANCOCK’S LAGER

BEER is the standard of quality.

| HANCOCK & CO. 3
BREWERS, |

AUCKLAND.

| Telephone 771. |
* *

£
*

**************************

WHEN “RHEUMO” GOES IN

RHEUMATICS GO OUT.

riMIAT tells the story of “Rheumo.” It

is si solvent of ssrlc acid, and Nature’s

mode of solution. It is the excess uric acid
in the system that causes Rlieuiuatisni,

Sciatica, Gout, Gravel, nnd kindred com-

plaints, and Rheumo Is the medicine that

cures. In diseases dependent upon a uric acid

diathesis, it is a remedy of extraordinary
potency. Rheumo is n medicine—not a

liniment. Rheumo is a liquid—not a pill
Rheumo acts promptly and effectively.
“Rheumo Conquers Rheumatism.” Stocked

in Auckland by H. Klug, Chemist, Queen-
si.; J. M. Jefferson. Chemist. Queen st.

and Upper Symondsst.; J. W. Robluson,
Chemist, Paruell; Graves Alekin, Chemist,

Queen-st.; aud sold by all Chemists

•nd stores at 2/0 aud -1/0 per bottle.
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Fakir, the Catosby—Element gelding,who
has inn some fair races on the flat, includ-

ing a Napier Park Cup, made his debut over

hardies ou the second Gay of the Feildlng

meeting, and it was a creditable one, as he

fenced well and only just got beaten by

Light, who ran one of his best rntes. Fakir

is rather on the small side for jumping, and

will never carry a great deal of weight.

The report published in a Dunedin paper

that Ribbonwood had been sold to Mr Par-

kinson for 12U0gs is contradicted by Mr

Price. Several offers have been imide for

the horse, including one from an Austra-

lian, not Mr Buckland: but so far no

business has resulted. Mr Price is anxious

to take the horse to America, but ways and

menus are a great obstacle.

The owner of Black Reynard fully intend-

ed taking him to the Wellington meeting,

and bad engaged accommodation for h m

at the 11utt, but in the last race at Feild-

Jug. which Shrapnell won. and which locked

to some people a fair thing for the Tara-

naki gelding on his form on the opening

ilav. he got galloped ou and cut about, and

So’ Mr Elliott had to cancel his arrange-

ments.

A nice rain fell on Sunday morning, the

first since before the Easter meeting. The

Avondale meetings have become proverbial
for bad weather, but it is hoped that the

coming meeting will be attended with bet-

ter luck than some of its predecessors. The

course and grounds and the whole property
there are looking at their best for the n.e t-

ing which is to commence on .Saturday.

A long way the best of the hurdle horses

competing at the Wairarapa meeting was

Juryman, by Lethe, from a Danebury mare.

He is owned by Mr J. Orr, who has had a

number of would-be purchasers after the
horse, but. has no intention of selling. The
Dauber, a son of The Artist, was dead cr:t
of sorts, having a bad cold, but he is pro-

bably not nearly so good as many appear
to have thought uim.

Thora, one of the best American three
year olds that ever looked through a bridle,

lias thrown the winners of over £50,000

She herself was out of Susan Ann, who

won at all distances up to four miles.

Thorn’s offspring are Sir Francis, the mat-

ron winner: Dobbins. Domino’s rival of

’93. winner of the Realisation and sire of

Jenuico, a very smart two year old in

England last year, and Yorkville Belle, win-

ner of 21 races of over £17,400 and dam of

throe stake winners.

Inchcape, when racing at Takapuna,
burst a blood vessel, and was pulled up. but
burst a blood vessel, ami was pulledup, but

within a few weeks went round the coun-

try racing with success. On the opening
day of the A.R.C. autumn meeting he again

bled nt the nose, but the trouble was net
considered serious, and he ran ou the sec-

ond day. with the result that his legs
filled afterwards, and he will probably not
be able to race again for a time. This is
unfortunate in the present dearth of
jumpers in Auckland.

In America the California stewards have
caused considerable talk by their rulings
in regard to disqualified horses. They de-

cided that Yellow Tail, who finished first

in a race, was entitled to third position
because he bumped Canard, who in turn

bumped Gold Van. At all other tracks a

disqualified horse is always placed last,
but the California stewards say that such
treatment is in some cases entirely too

severe, in view of the money wagered by
the public on a favourite, who, perhaps, is

technically or accidentally guilty of a foul.

Though Wairiki did not run up to the high
estimate foimed of him by the public in the

Easter Handicap, there were other mem-

bers of the Soult family who did themselves
credit. A b'raco finished first and second in
the Eden Handicap in Marshal Soult and
Green and Gold. The colt has long been
known to be pretty smart, and Lis win was

quite expected. The defeat of Green and

Gold by Marshal Soult should not cause

those who have voted her a most, useful

mare to think any less of her. In the Pony
Race a three-year-old filly In Sculca from

Solo’s dam Dolly, also by Soult, won. Others

by the imported sire ran well.

When Cavaliero pulled up sore on the

Saturday prior to the Auckland Racing

Club’s autumn meeting, it was thought that

the fine son of Cuirassier and Clio would

not see the post for the hurdle race on the

opeuinx day of the meeting. However, he

was working again on the Monday morning,

and continued on, and ran ou the Satur-

day, but again puiled up lame after run-

ning third This indicates n recurrence of

the trouble, and Mr. L. Harris' gay old

geldingwill again have to be given a spell,

and may not be racing during the coming

campaign.

A.8.N.. winner of the Feildlng Cup, is a

shapely gelding sou of Craeksliot anil Moon-

stone, by Leouata. from May Moon, once

owned by Mr O. C. McGee. Tile letters are

the initials of Mr A. B. Newman, who bred

the gelding. The Stud Book says that after

producing a filly called Cbibrouk in 1802, no

other produce of Moonstone lived, and the

mare died in 1898. There is evidently some

mistake either in returning A.B.N. as a sou

of Moonshine, or in stat’ng that no other

than her foal of 1892 lived. A.B.N. is a

useful ssrt of gelding, and ought io make a

hurdler.

Light batten hurdles lead to fast travel

ling. Riders go at them with plenty of

dash, horses strike them and keep on rac-

ing, whereas when hurdles arc like the old-

time hurdles, stout ami strong, horsemen

steady their horses more, and the horses

that strike them have their powers diminish-

ed accordingly. The clean jumper gets a

chaiieeon such occasions. I noticed that a

lot of pace was mustered up in the Feildlng
hurdle events, in one of which Rags finished

absolutely last, through jumping too high,

dwelling, and losing ground. Next day he

fenced better, and won. creating surprise,
which led loan Inquiry, the owner and rider

after being examined being exonerated.

A rather good sort of gelding was run-

ning at the Feildlng meeting in Otairi, by

the Nordeufeldt horse Kempenfeldt from

Priscilla, a mare got by Premier. Oiairl

has run successfully in hack company, mid

finished third in the open hurdle race at

the meeting referred to, and there was

some disappointment when, after being ac-

cepted for the second day’s event, he

did not appear. It was reported that ho

was not altogether himself when the morn-

ing came, and he is not to be a competitor
at the Wellington meeting. It is to be

hoped that nothing serious is the matter

with him, and that he will be got ready
for the May meeting of the Wanganui

Jockey Club.

An idea of the cost of racing in South

Africa man be gathered by studying the

account of the second day of the recent

meeting of the South African Turf Club.

The clitef event was the Suburban Handi-

cap, of 350sovs, out of which the second
horse received SOsovs. and in addition to

the nomination fee of ssovs there was an

acceptance; of £l2 10/. The entrance for the

Claremont Purse, Tosovs, was osovs; for

the Flying Handicap, lOOsovs to the winner,

entrance and acceptance fees totalled £8:
and for the Newmarket Handicap, tO isovs,
entrance .fee Tsovs, and so on. so that it is

not a poor man’s place. There wore eight

races, of which the English jockey, Board-

man, won six.

There was a deluge at Mentone races on

Saturday, says “Javelin.” which one lucky
believer in association of ideas as indicating
results turned to advantage. As he but-
toned up his mackintosh, and prepared to

leave the stand, as the horses were going
out for the last race, a friend said: “Surely
you’re not going out in that rain’. Why,
man. you’ll be soaked through!” My
troubles about that,” responded the venture-
some punter, “‘De Wet’s the straight tip
for Kruger, and I’m going to have a pound
on unless I get drowned.” He weathered

the spruits which ran over the paddock,
got ft to 1, and now’ considers Baracclil a

second rater compared with himself as an

authority on weather Indications.

The great American trotter. Creseeus.
Is out of Mabel, who only cost £5O, and
was mated with Robert McGregor when
that horse .had arrived at old age. As a
foal, Cresceus was weakly and insignifi-
cant. and when, as a yearling, he gashed
his throat so badly that his windpipe was

exposed, his owner ordered that he should
be killed. The groom neglected to carry

out the order at the time, however, and

It was subsequently repealed. Cresceus has

always been owned, trained, and driven

by the sane* man, Geo. W. Ketchum, and

commenced his raving carver u& a three

year old. He now retires lu the stud with

tiie stallion recurd of 2.2J.

I hiring the past fourteen years or there-

about <l. Wright has trained horses for

Messrs L. I>. and N. A. Nathan, and for the

greater part of that time has confined his

attentions almost exclusively to the pre-
paration of horses owned by the brothers,
who iiave been liberal supporters of the

sport during recent years. A fair measure
of success has been theirs, and Wright's
ability as a trainer has been fully borne

out by results. Readers will, 1 am sure,
learn with regret that a disagreement be-
tween his masters and himself has led to

the whole of the Messrs sathan’s string
of eight horses being handed over to an-

other trainer, and on Friday they were all
removed from Wright’s stables to those
occupied bv Kos Heaton. Joe Gallagher has
been placed in charge, and will have the
future care of the team.

Horsemen and horsemanship formed the
subject in an expert discussion recently hi

a company whose members were all ex-

perienced ami practical authorities. Num-
bers of famous riders of the past had been

discussed, when a light of other days
said, with unmistakable earnestness and

admiration. “Well, I reckon the most ar-

tistic thing 1 over saw in all my experi-
ence was poor old Jack Roper (that wasn't
the name) on a dead’un. Talk about a welt

Timed run, ns the papers call it: why. I’ve

seen the crowd cheer old Jack for his ‘til •(
effort’ more than the winner—an’ Jack

wasn’t trying, not a yard. Ho never made

his run soon enough to got into trouble
when he wasn’t on It. an’ his equal at

timin’ a losin’ finish never lived. Poor old

Jack. Ho was a great horseman.” “Lea-
der.”

Drumcree, who won this year’s grand
National Steeplechase at Liverpool, is no

stranger Io the Aintree course, as he has

started three times prior to this in the
groat cross country event. Last year ho
and Inquisitor were equal favourites, but

he finished out of a place; and in 1901.
he was just beaten by the winner. Gru-
<lon. The (op weight. Manifesto, win gained
third position, is now 15 years old, and

has tak,r n part in more Grand Nationals at

Liverpool than any other horse living. Ho

has won twice in 1897 and 1899—and whs
third three times in 1900. 1902. .ami 1903.

His Majesty has experienced bail luck with
Ambush IL. who fell at the last hurdle.
At Kempton Park, early in February.
Ambush 11. overjumped and slightly in-
jured himself at the water Jump in the

Steward* j” Steeplechase, when looking Jill
over a winner.

The fact of Cressy, Ine Soult—Crossina
gelding, running into third place at Hie

Australian Jockey Club’s AuLunn Meeting
in the big field of 31 runners, has to be not-

ed. Cressy was one of the most nervous

colts I have seen, and it took months of
caieful handling before ho was got into
shape . y Frank Macmanemiu, and ho show-
ed up well in several events at Ellerslie,
but had only one win to his ere lit. out of a

dozen starts. It mn.v be said that he was
far from a nice horse to have the manage-

ment of. for when he became frightened it
took a good man to control him. Many a

time be caused a bit of excili’ig diversion

at headquarters by boiling as if ’n dread of

his own tall. Mark Ryan and Sam Fergus
can take some credit for their patient hr-nd-
llng of the colt, for there wore few knowing
his disposition who would have taken the
contract of riding him at all. Cressy comes
of the same family ns Wairiki. their sire

being Soult and their dams half-sisters.

Strategist. Cressy's own brother, has won

races in South Africa.

A suggestion was made last week that an

effort should be made to get Fritz. Hie Aus-
tralian champion trotter, and Kibbouwood.
the Australasian champion pacer, together
at the Auckland trotting meeting. This was

done by Mr Mark, but it. was found hat Mr

Buckland was returning home after the
New Zeanaud Trotting <’bib’s meeting,
which concluded on Saturday. One of the

owneis of Ribbonwood telegraphed that Mr
Price was willing io send the champion
North ami give exhibitions on each day of
the Tueciing: but the sum naked was eon

siderod rather much, ami nt latest advices

nothing hud been done. The disqualification
of D. J. Price, trainer and driver mid part

owner of the champion pacer Ribbonwo<»d
f

In connection with another horse vLicit

competed on Saturday at the N« w Zealand

Metroi»<»Utau Meeting, right on top of bln
HUCveasea with Ribbonwood, would in any

case stop business.

It seldom happens in this eotimry that a

horse wins two races within 24 hours <n»

racecourses nearly a bundrvil ndies apa

as the Sylvia I’ark gelding !ugl<*w<o>d diw

last week, but that is what happened. After

winning on Easter Monday afternoon at

Patca. Inglewood was sent on to Wanganui

the same night and next morning taken to

Feildlng. wheie he won. after a hard race

against Dick Turpin. By the way, Ingle-
wood at one stage of his career was locked

up in a stable without food or water for

several days, owing to the neglect of a
groom, who was prosecuted by Ihe Society
for the Prevention of Cruelly to Animals,
and scut to gaol for a term. It was though!
that the gelding was permanentiy injured
as a result of the neglect, but it does not

appear so; in fact, he is a why. tough cus-
tomer, ami showed groat gumeness in win

uing at Feilding when ho was re/eiving 251b
from Dr. Paget’s old gelding, who ran one
of his best races.

Lady Lillian, by winning the Canterluuy
Jockey Chib’s Easter ami Autumn Handi-
caps. has thus followed in the footsteps <»f
her dam. Lady Zetland, who won both these
races in 1894. She is probably a better
inare than her dam was al the same nge.

At the C..LC. Spring Meeting put up a

very line performance over six furlongs,
when she won the Cressy Welter Handicap,
carrying 1(».3, in 1.15 4-ssC‘c. The Utile marc

some time ago, it is said, got a nail in her

foot, and an interruption in her training
followed, and she has pot been seen right
at her best iu any race since until she won

<>n Monday and Tuesday, when It mist be

admitted that she was being presento<l with

a very liberal allowance h* weight from Mr

Stead’s throe yenr-okl gchllng OilolT, who

failed to concede her 2llbs in tin? mile

event. A penalty of lllbs, bringing her

weight to 8.12 in the Autumn Handicap, did
not stop her from boating the opposition in

that race. Her victory will serve l<» bring
into j dice her sire. Phaothon, vh<» is a son

of Tro..ton and Sapphire.

Inquliies were made by cable from West

Australia, prior to the weights appearing,
as to what performances a hoi sc eall<*d

Maori Chief had in this colony. The Olka-

pariuga ofiicials won* informed that no such
horse was known in the colony as a per-

former. The pedigree given by (he gehlhcj

was by To Kootl from Rotorua. To Kooti,
the Southern’chaser, was got by Apromoitt
ami kept entire, ami has stock, but s • far
ns is known none of his gets have raced yet.
Rotorua, if such a mare exists, is not a stud
book matron. Il is supposetl th.u E\cuing
Wonder.who was purchased by Mr Tenn int.

of Invercargill, is identical with Maori

Chief: henre the action taken by the olli-

vials of the <hikaparinga Club in declaring
all b<»ts on the horse named off for their

big slei'ple<*hase event. The inquiry is to

b<; fuither gone on with on Thursday. Even-

ing Wonder did not start, and I question
much whoth»*r he would have successfnlly
negotiated the country, which lias been of

a most formidable kind: for. though a good
horse over hurdles ami small fences, lie was

not a big jumper by any nnmns. The Gry-

phon. his full brother, is not so f ist, but he

is a rare goud fencer.

Mr Hugo Friedlander, who lias durlag re-

cent years been a liberal purchase? nf flood

stock, ami who has gone Into racing in a no

half-hearted manner, has at list been suc-

cessful iu landing one of our best classic

races, lb? Auckland Racing Club’s Northern

Champagne Stakes of 50Usovs, u ilb his .»

ton Delaval — Waltemata filly Kamo, fid!

sister to I’orhua. who won last year. The

victory was generally anticipated, and many

expected to see the stable run first :.ml sec-

ond, Rose Shield having shown more than

one good gallop prior to the meeting. J.

Thorpe had both fillies in g<MMI form, and he
must have felt extremely nleas <i at .he re-

sult. By the way, Kamo equalled (he best

previous record for the race, and it should
lieie be mentioned that the Sylvia Park sire

Seaton Delmhl claims five sivcosslvi* win-

ners, which equals Apreniont’s lecord for
the Canterbury Jockey Chib’s Welcome

Stakes. Stepnluk comes next <•» (his pair
with four winners of the hisLinentloned

event. Had King Log no( failed tn sec re
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tn that race, the records mentioned would

have been equalled by the sou of Norden-

feldt. Ropa and Melodeon, respectively
second and third In the Champagne, are set*

vlceablc sorts, and will demonstrate their

usefulness In handicap company. Kamo re-

presents quite the best filly foim In the

North, and Is entitled to be classed in the

game division with Sir Georgc CPfford’s filly

To-morrow, who since winning the Wel-

come Stakes has been In retirement.

A country clod some time ago got into the
company of a couple of racegoers commonly
known as guessers. They succeeded in tell-

ing him a tale which ended in him giving
one of the number £3 to invest on a dead

sure thing. In due course the horse won

and paid a good dividend, and the country

bumpkin was r ated. Supposing his m rey
to have been invested, he met one ol me

sharps and expressed his great pleasure,
and talked of making his advisers a decent

present, when Sharp No. 2 arrived on the

acene and intimated that he bad the best

of good things for the next race, and sug-

gested that lie should collect the dividend
and put the lot on. To this the clod read-

ily agreed. Much to the evident surprise of
the confederates, the second good thing won

and paid a bigger dividend than the first,
and the lump of clay was rejoiced beyond
measure. Then the guessers came to him
and assured him they had a still better

thing for the next i ace, and intended plank-
ing all the money down on

it. The country
lad took a lot of persuading, lie reckoned

thatbe would have a pretty good start with
his winnings. “I think we had bet.v not
go again,** he said. “1 shall have eit u hto

buy a smal fa m when yon colfedt.**

• What’s the good of a farm?” replied one of
the sharps. “Be a squatter: go for a sta-
tion—it’s a cert.” Th » man from the coun-

try yielded. The “cert.” finished amongst
the also staited, and visions of a small farm
and a station vanished into thin air. The
guessers had nt last managed to pick a loser,
and they reckoned they had never earned
ihi ty shil ings e ch harder.

The sudden death of Mr F. F. Dakin,
tabled from Australia on Monday, removes
from the lacing world a prominent figure,
one who has been identified with the sport
actively for about a third of a century ns
owner trainer, and for a considerable time
as handicapper; indeed, at the time of his
death and for some years past he has acted

as weight-adjuster for the premier turf in-

stitution of the State, the Victoria Racing
Club, anu many of the country and subur-
ban clulis about Melbourne. The deceased
trained Ix» Loup for Mr Stead when be sent
Le Loup from New Zea la ml to Victoria, and
he also trained Wakawhai, Tranter. Es-
cutcheon, aad other horses for the Auckland
syndicate of which the Hon. E. Mitchelson
was the head. Darriwell. winner of the

Melbourne Cup of 1879, was tislued by him.
and he owned and trained Darebin. who
won the V.R.C. Derby in 188* Though
generally credited with being a wvere

task-

master as a trainer, yet he was looked upon
as a capable man in that profession, and

his judgment in racing and bis' impartiality
as a handicapper was universally admitted.
Mr Dakin rendered valuable assistance in
the coippilntion of the Australian Stud

Kook, and was altogether a man whose place
it will be hard to fill; indeed. Ids loss will
be much felt by the Victorian Racing Club

and the raclpg community generally. He

died in harness, for lu* was during th* day
attending the Australian Jockey C.'ub’s
Autumn Meeting.

There is sometning pathetic in the

breakdown if a favourite racehorse, and
on all hands the collapse of Advance, one

of the most brilliant, all-round horses this

colony has ever known, on the Riccarton
racecourse. while running for the Chal-
lenge Stakes, drew forth expres-
sions of sincere regret for the “black
demon.’ was a great favourite, and. in the

opinion of many, absolutely the best horse

ever raced in the • •olony. which is saying

a great deal. Some of his achievements
stand out as remarkable ones- -indeed, his
Auckland Racing Chin Autumn and Wel-

lington Cup victories being pointed to as

evidence of weight-carrying ami racing
ability, but to my mind the truest tests of
merit to which the gay son of Vanguard
ami Lauret was subjected was when he

went to Australia and was pitted against
horses of his own calibre at all distances
from six furlongs to three miles. It was

then that h- showed what an astonishing-

ly good horse he really was, for he then

met flyers specially prepared for the short

races and the stayers engaged in the long-
er ones, and ns there were a lot of good
horses out at the time. Advance was sub-

jected to the severest possible tests, and

came out of them with credit, for though
defeated in most of his engagements, most

rapable of Australian racin,; mon with

w.'.oiu I have couversed on the subject
gave II as their opinions that it would be
hard to point to any bygone cracks that

could have put up better showings under

similar conditions than the gallant black

New Zealander.

The victory of Golden Hose In the Auck-

land Racing Club’s Easter Handicap, which
was anticipated by the writer, is one which
Mr J. Lynch, owner of the marc, and Kos

Heaton, her trainer, can fairly be con-

gratulated upon. That she is a very useful

mart' goes without saying. That site was

looking more robust and better than I re-

member to have seen her before f<»r some

time prior to the meeting I stated when

dealing with the case. The time registered
by the daughter of St. Lcger and Bangle,
viz.. 1.41. <onstitutes n record for the

event. Seeing that the mare won com-

fortably. those who expected '’'sirlki, the
rrnclr colt of Auckland, Io pull off the prize,
and backed him down to two to one with

the bookmakers, mid to such an extent In
the machine that they would only have
received n fifty shilling dividend, thus tak-
ing fl to 4 for a win, must, upon calm reflec-

tion, bought of experience, admit that they
were looking for a great effort from a

young horse. They argued that Advance
had remped home with 9.6, that Nonette
won l« at ■year with 9.11, and that Wulrikl,
who is probably as good over a mile as

Nonette, should, with 9.7, have done the

same. Excuses will likely enough be offer-
ed for the defeated colt, but with the form

of Golden Rose before them, thoae who are

close students of the game must come to
the conclusion that the weight (9.7) for a

colt nut quite at the top of his class, was

really what stopped the son of Soult. Not

only should the result serve as a lesson to

those who lost their money, but to a multi-
tude of others who would have gone In
bald headed to back Achilles, who was
awarded the little impost of 10.5, or just
121 b more than Wairiki, had the son of
Medallion continued his engagement. Could
AchiHeo have won with so muci weight?
1 leave my readers to draw their own con-
clusions.

In the February number of ‘'Bally's Mag-
azine’’ there is an article on th» subject of

racing in ath Africa. South Africa is be-
coming of liiteiest to Australians with tho-

roughbreds io sell. The leading horse-sales-
men uf Australia state that they have orders
to get horses for South Africa which they
cannot tulfil. Owners with a horse not

worth £3l*o in Australia talk double or
treble rhe money when they get wind that
their horse is wanted for South Africa.
('hesney may fairly be said to have created
the South African demand for “Walers.”

Previously the few horses sent from here

were comparative failures That this should
be so when the Walers did so wel’ in India
seemed strange; but so it was. Forward,
by Gang Forward, was a fairly good two-

year-old in an average year, but he did not

achieve much distinction when sent to

South Africa. Probably the selections made
prior to Chesney wore unfortunateor the
horses did badly in their new home. Chos-

ncy, however, established the fact that the

Waler, all going well, is as serviceable as a
racer in South Africa as he has proved him-

self to be in India and England. But for

Mr George Gray, who bought Chesney from

Mr Redfearn, going out of racing as sud-
denly as he went into it, Chesney might
have won our Derbys. As a two-year-old
he was certainly the equal of anything of
his age. Mr Hawkins bought Cnesney at

Mr (hay’s sale, but quickly re-sold him at
a big profit to go to England. On the voy-

age home the horse was wrecked near the

Capo, and, although he fought his way to
the shore, he was considerably knocked
about. After a short career in England, Mr
Abe Bailey took him to South Africa, and

he soon proved himself stones above other

horses in that country. Naturally, Chesney
convinced spoilsmen out there that there

must be others of his kind in Australia, and

a valued corresnondent, writing from Jo-

hannesburg lately, tells that a New Zea-

land pony, not to be mentioned in the s-une

breath with the New South Wales crack
Minerva, sold for £7OO. The price paid for
Klnglock cannot be stated with certainty,
but it Is quite possible that the paper which
set it down at £l5OO was verv near the

mark. For obvious reasons, however, it is
not safe for a newspaper to give the price
paid for a horse when it is sold privately.
If the buyer intends to pass the horse on to

a rich client, the higher the price is stated
the better for him. The racing clubs io

South Africa give rich etakes, and there is
more money to be won on a big handicap at
Johannesburg than can now be won over a

Melbourne Cup. The stable had the cream

of the market over Revenue for the Mel-

iMiurnc Cup. ami it was stated the day
after the commission was done that £17.000

had l**en secured shout the Trenton geld-
ing. This amount was, wo believe, con-

siderably overstated, but there seems no

doul-t that the owner of Lovematch secured

£30,000 himself about his mare when she
won the principal handicap at Johannes-
burg this year. Gallpways and ponies pro-
mise to be as valuable in South Africa as

they are in India. There is a great amount

of pony racing of the bettor class. The

nriucs are ■worth winning, apart from the
betting. Altogether there seems nothing
more certain than that South Africa is to
be a great racing country, and the wealthy
owners will naturally look towards Austra-

lia for more horses of tin' Chesnee typo. Th<‘

difficulty now is to persuade owners to sell
at even twice the Australian value.

The Easter meetings held at Fell ding.
Wairarapa, Batea, and VVaipukurau in each
Instance, it is generally concede J, were at-

tend'd more largely than any meetings held

in previous years by these particular clubs,

and fortunately in exceedingly fine weather.
Ah a rule increased attendances ami fine
wealher mean an increase of speculation,
for most people who go a-racing do not go

with empty pockets. The totahsator in-

vestments at <‘a<-h of the meetings referred
to were record ones, from which it can be

conchnh'd that theie is plenty of money for

racing in the several districts referred to.

Dairying and flaxmilling, good markets for
meat and produ<*e, and a succession of most

favourable seasonshave helped to make the

country p»‘ople more prosperous than over,

and it is probable that more were travelling
ou our railways between Taranaki and Wel-

lington during Easter week than at any

corresponding period in the history of the
country, the majority taking advantage of
< heap excursion rates a nd Increased facili-
ties for getting about. Only those who at-

tend such meetings as those held at Feild-
Ing and at Tauherenlkan, In the Waira-
rapa, can have a true eomeption of what

racing is really like In some of the country
dlstrh-ts of New Zealand. It Is over a quar-
ter of a century Rlnce I attended my first

meeting at the last inentlonrd place. At
that time the stand, which was a primitive
one. ami enclosures were on the opposite
Ride of the present enurse. Now there Is a

large and well appointed grandstand, a neat
and np-to date RtewardH* stand, and press-

room, a commodious totalhmtnr house, said
to be the largest In the colony, tea-rooms.

cloak-rooms, stabling, large well-kept lawn
and paudock enclosures, beautified in many
ways. A miniature lake with swans and
ducks of different species is one of the strik-
ing features, but its beautiful background
of bush, towering stately kahikatea,
tawa, titokl, and other native
trees of a distinctively ornamental kind,
and the long drive theie through to the
members’ carriage enclosure, gives the Tau-
herenikau racecourse a charm foreign to

any other in the world. Money has done a

great deal in setting off these natural ad-
vantages, but there is everywhere evidence
that it has been judiciously spent, and mem-
bers, old and now, who have brought it to
its present state of perfection are justly
proud, as they should be, of th eh? favourite
racing resort. There were a tew distin-
guished visitors in the persons of Mr See,
son of tiie Premier of New South Wales;
Mr Holders, of the firm of A. Hordern and
Son, of Sydney; and the Hon. Jas. Carroll.
What impressed me greatly was the large
number of vehicles and horses in the sepa-
rate enclosures set apart for them. Pro-

bably as many as 1500 persons came to the
meeting on wheels from all parts of the sur-

rounding districts, and though there was a

very large assemblage for a country meet-

ing I was assured that the midsummer
meeting is the meeting of the year. Turn-

ing to Feikllng, there was au estimated at-
tendance of between five and six thousand
people there, and the course and its ap-
pointments have no superior outside a few
of the leading metropolitan courses of the

colony. The management Is worthy of all
praise, and the club is deseivedly a popular
one. The close proximity to the railway
line and township Is one of the great ad-
vantages the course enjoys. The officials
are all good workers, and include some keen

judges f the sport, and as caterers for the

racing community the Feildlng Club are

hard to beat. The horses running at the

meetings referred to generally speaking
were r.oi. high though they afforded
plenty of entertainment.

TUBE TALK FROM THE

SOUTH.

(By Telegraph.—Own Correspondent.)

CHRISTCHURCH, Wednesday.

Mr G. P. Wood has resigned his position
of secretary to the South Canterbury Jockey
Club.

Mr S. J. Flewellen, a steward of the Nel-
son J.C., intends to become landlord of the
Clarendon Hotel, Christchurch.

Rumours are current that a change is
pending in an important South Island

stable, and that a new trainer will pro-

bably be placed in charge shortly.
The Dunedin juniper Pipi, who is now’

at Riccarton, is going on to Wanganui for ’
theWanganui Steeplechase.

Poor old Blazer did not show a glimpse
of his former brilliancy in the Great Easter

Handicap. He and his stable companion,
Battler, have been presented to their
trainer, on the understanding that Blaser
never runs again.

King’s Guest, a yearling brother to the
Russley Stakes winner Quarryman, and
Signalman, a yearling brother to Cannie
Cbiel, have arrived at Riccarton and joined
Cutts’ team.

Sir George Clifford has bestowed the
name of sunstroke on ills yearling colt by
Phoebus Apollo—Cuiralba.

Gladsome has been turned out for a

spell.

CHRISTCHURCH, Saturday.
The local sporting world is suffering a

recovery after its Easter excitement. The
sparkle of anticipation has given place to
the flatness of reflections—mostly unplea-
sant. Most of us are wondeitng why we
didn’t back Lady Lillian for both her vic-
tories: the few’ who had realised the full
extent of Treadmill’s impror’T.<-nt are be-
wailing the fact they didn’t piofit by their
knowledge, and the greater bulk are con-
templating diminished banking accounts.'
1 should imagine that there were few’ big
winners over the meeting, and while the
two-dividend system must always reduce
the total of losses, that the number of back-

ers who got the worst of the battle was ne

smaller than usual. On all sides, however,
the meetlug is voted a successful one. The

interesting trotting match attracted large
numbers of visitors to Chrlstchvr h, and as

most of them stayed at any rate over Easter

Monday both the attendance and totalisator

receipts were a great deal the ave-

rage. As theracing has already been touch-
ed in your columns, I should only be cover-

ing old ground if I referred to it here. I
may say, however, that there is a consensus

of opinion among the critics that Treadmill
is an exceptionally smart colt and joy in
the ranks of the public that such a good
and persevering sportsman ao Sir George
Clifford has at length got hold of something
likely to bring renown to his popular col-
ours. Some of your readers may have noted
certain unrecorded features of the meeting.
For instance theie was the success achieved
by the progeny of Maxim mares. Treadmill
of course is out of a daughter of Maxim,
and so Is Windwhistle; while Cannie Chiel
and Terrapin, who respectively finished sec-
ond and third In the Great Autumn Handi-
cap, are not only out of Maxim mares, but
are full brothers in Again, Tread-

mill, the hero, and Lady Lillian, the hero-
ine, of themeeting are both descended from
stud mates. The maternal granddams of

both were imported from England together
by the late Mr Carter and bequeathed by
him, I understand, to Mr E. Gates. rhe
latter bred both Lady Zetland, the dam of
Lady Lillian, and Catherine Wheel. Tread-
mill's dam; but whereas he retained Lady
Zetland until her death, he sold Catherine
Wheel. First of all, however, ae leased her

to Mr Stead for racing purposes. At Yald-

hurst she was a contemporary of Binefire,
and I believe that in their early rough-ups
she more than held her own with the bill-

liant daughter of Sapphire. Unfortunately
sh- failed to stand training long enough tQ

get to the post. When she fell Into Sir

George Clifford’s hands she was sent, in

company with Goldleaf, across to Australia

on a visit to Bill of Portland and her com-

panion to Wallace. Goldleaf missed, but

Catherine Wheel held, and as she produced
Treadmill she more than paid fci the cost
of her companion’s fruitless journey. Men-

tion of Treadmill reminds mo that he is

under orders to fulfil his at
the WeP'Mgton Racing Club’s Autumn

Meeting.
At the sales on Wednesday Calibre chan-

ged hands at 54gs, Muscovite at 40gs, Re-
doubt at 19gs. and Lady Babble at 20gs,
R;bbonwood still remaining unsold.

CHRISTCHURCH, Tuesday.

Most of the local horses with engage-

ments at the Wellington autumn meeting,
have departed for the Hutt. My tip for
the Thompson Handicap is Soylla. Tread-
mill will give Achilles a good race in the
North Island Challenge Stakes.

My selections for the South Canterbury
meeting (which opens to-morrow (Wednes-
day) are:—Maiden Plate: Firebrand. Cup:
Lady Lillian. Stewards’ Welter Handicap:
Clanburn and Calotype. Flying Handicap:
Hypnotist.

Advance was too lame to return home
with his stable companions. He will re-

main at Riccarton until his injured leg is

sound enough to stand the journey. Ilia
racing days are, of course, over.

Bombardo went amiss just before the
Canterbury Jockey Club’s autumn meeting,
andwill need a spell, so also will

who is now under veterinary treatment, and

is to spend next season at the stud.

Deerstalker is anotherwho is on the un-

sound list, and no further effort will be

made to train this fine colt.

Sporting folk here are much delighted at
the purchase by Mr Friedlander of the stal-

lion Pilgrim's Progress. There are many
mares

in this part of the country who ought
to make admirable mates for the son of
laonomy.

During the last few days Mr Stead has
sold King Log and Evelyn Wood to go to
South Africa. The latter’s sister, San

Patricia, is already in that part of the
world to which her brother Is going.

On Saturday Ribbonwood capped his vic-

tory over Fritz by further reducing his Aus-
tralasian record for a mile to 2.9. The
little pacer was not fully extended, so most
people declare, and he might have knocked
another half second off. He will now retire
to the stud for a season. For his owner

a
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the Bweets of his horse’s recent success were

embittered on Saturday by the disqualifica-
tion of himself for six months for the man-

ner in which he drove Felony in the Pro-

gressive Handicap. Price has appealed
against the verdict in the meanwhile. Ow-

ing to his disqualification a match between

Victory 11. and St. Simon, .which had been

arranged for yesterday, had to be abandon-
ed, as Price was unable to drive the former.

Victory 11. has since been sold to Mr A. W.

Rutherford, who will use him as a trap
horse.

Coral Hue, who won the Juvenile Stakes
at the New Zealand Trotting Club s

recent

meeting, has changed hands at £l5O.

Mr Buckland has sold Franz, the brother

to Fritz. With the exception of Fritz and

Valour, all the three horses which he

brought over to New Zealand will be left

here.

© ® ®

WELLINGTON RACING CLUBS

AUTUMN MEETING.

WELLINGTON, Saturday.

The following acceptances have been re-

ceived for events to be run at the Welling-
tonautumn meeting on Wednesday next:—

Waiwetu Handicap of lOOsovs, seven fur-
longs.—St. Denis 9.3, Tsaritza 8.13, Shackle
7.9, General Symons 7.8, Exmoor 7.8, Somer-
led 7.7, Narcotic 7.6, Tikarawa 7.3, Pure
Silver 6.9, Livonia 6.7.

Silverstream Hack 11amii ap of SOsovs,
one mile.—Lavalette 9.0, The Guesser 8.12,
Heritas 8.9, Tercelet 8.8, Cumulus 7.12.

Hamua 7.10, Wind 7.10, Betsy 7.9, Hydrant
7.7, Mauserine 6.10.

Thomson Handicap, lOOsovs, 1 mile —Pallas

8.12, Pampero 8.6, Ostiak 8.6, Scylla 8.5,
Cannie Chiel 8.1, Shrapnel 7.12, Terrapin
7.10, Hinekoa 7.10, Porirua 7.9, Golden Vein

7.8, Shrapnel Shell 7.5, Shackle 7.3, Ring-
man 7.3, General Symons 7.3, Baliyneety
6.10,

First Hurdle Handicap of 150sovs, one

mile and three-quarters.—Waiwera 12.5,
Bellman 11.3, Kohunui 10.13, Light 10.0,
Mourner 9.9, Smithy 9.9, Boko 9.0, Aide-e-
Camp 9.0, Lady Bell 9.0.

Heretaunga Handicap of lOOsovs, nine

furlongs.—Porirua 9.3, Benefactor S.ll,
Tikarawa 8.4, Kelburn 8.4, Lavalette 8.4,
Pure Silver 8.0, Rubin 8.0.

Tinakorl Hack Handicap of SOsovs, six

furlongs.—Nell Gwynne 8.9, Ballarat 8.6,
Valima 8.6, Matuku 8.3, Wind 8.0, Catherine

Gordon 7.13, Position 7.10, Coveily 7.10, Hat-

ley 7.10, Stage Whisper 7.10, Catspaw 7.9,
Waltoti 7.7, Ixia 7.7, Capulet 7.G, Walpai
6.18, Australasia 6.10, Linklock 6.10, Step-
son 6.9, Sergius 6.7, Fairwater 6.7, Royal
Blue 6.7, Bowfield 6.7.

Railway Handicap of loOsovs, six fur-

longs.—St. Denis 9.5, Ostiak 9.2, Tsaritza
9.0, Petrovna 8.13, Windwhistle 8.8, Red
Gauntlet 8.6, Exmoor 7.9, Someried 7.8,
Lolah 7.4, Pure Silver 6.12, Turepo 6.7,
Gladisla 6.7, Livonia 6.7.

® ® ®

AVONDALE JOCKEY CLUB’S AUTUMN

MEETING.

ACCEPTANCES FOR FIRST DAY’S

RACING.

The following acceptances have been re-

ceived in connection with the above meet-

ing, which opens on Saturday next:—

AVONDALE HANDICAP of 200sovs. One
mile and a quarter.

st lb st lb

Mais 8 9 N’thumberland 7 8
Vai Rosa .... 8 0 Miss Lettie

.. 7 6

Landlock .... 712 Mjtitamatahara-
Paul Seaton.. 7 9 keke 7 4

Jewellery .... 7 9 Durable 7 3
The Needle .. 7 8 Annoyed .... 7 2

First Pony Handicap of oOsovs; 6 fur-
longs.—Sonica 10.10, Annoyed J0.2, Girton
Girl 9.5, Miami 8.12, Irish Boy 8.10, Vulpine
8.9, Sentinel 8.7, The Dodger 8.2, inspira-
tion 7.10, First Whisper 7.7, Forth 7.6,
Gladys Rose 7.4, Sandow 7.0, Cuisine 7.0,
Sweet Marie 7.0.

First Hack Handicap of oOsovs; 6 furlongs
—Apparition 8.7, Pukaki 7.10, Cannonier
7.7, Bobs 7.4, Queen Anne7.4, Kilkenny 7.0,
Irish 7.0, Lavadel 7.0, lan 7.0.

Hurdle Race of lOOsovs; 2 miles.—lnch-
cape 10.0, Llngard 10.0, The Rioter 9.10,
Hippowai 9.5, Mokomoko 9.0, Sudden 9.0.

Juvenile Handicap of SOsovs; 5 furlongs.—
Ropa 9.6, Alba Rose 8.4, Delauia 8.4, Des-

demona 7.10, Matamu 7.9, Lady Annie 7.9,
Stibbington 7.7, Lady Rose 7.3, Agrapus 7.0,
Lady Bobs 7.0, Simple Simon 6.7.

Maiden Plate of OOsovs; 6 furlongs.—
Green and Gold 9.9, Bastion 8.13, Musker-
dale 8.10, Hlnetauparlki 8.7, Glasgow 8.6,
Swagsman 7.12, Seatonia 7.5, Bobs 7.4, liish
7.4, Aurega 7.2, lan 7.0, Loo Delaval 610,
Millie 6.7.

Railway Handicap of lOOsovs; 7 furlongs.
—Roseila 9.5, Scotty 9.0. Marshal Soult 8.11.
Formula 8.10, St. Olga 8.8, Green and Gold

8.7, The Needle 8.5, Paul Seaton 7.13, Ca-
mille 7.5, Dolores 7.0, Grey Seaton 7.0, Soult-
fish 6.12.

® ® W

SALE OF GREAT SCOT. -

SYDNEY, April 15. .
The reported sale of the racehorse Great

Scot to Mr R. McKenna for shipment to

India is confirmed. The horse has been

scratched for all remaining engagements at

the A.J.C. autumn meting, and has been
handed over to his new owner. The price
stated to have been paid for Great Scot Is
£2OOO.
It transpires that Great Scot's new owner

is Mr Apcar, of Calcutta. He gave Mr Mc-
Kenna an unlimited commission to purchase
a horse good enough to win the Viceroy**
Cup, to be run In December.

MANAWATU RACING CLUB’S AUTUMN

MEETING.

WELLINGTON, Friday.
The following handicaps have been de-

clared by Mr llenrys for the Autumn Meet-

ing of Manawatu Racing Club:—

Flying Handicap, 6 furlongs.—Field Bat-

tery 9.5, Chasseur 8.13, Shiapnel Shell 8.12,
Shackle 8.10, Full Cry 8.3, Good Intent 7.7,

Warwick 7.3, Laureate 7.0, Mongolia! 6.12,
Livonia 6.11, Sunfish 6.10, Derringshot 6.7.

Hack Hurdles, 1} mile. — Ilawera 11.2,
Waitoti 10.11, Rags 10.9, Hinekura 9.13,
Ogle 9.13, Otaio 9.13, Ranui 9.12, Raema

9.0, Front Rank 9.0, Whakahauhau 9.0.

Manawatu Handicap, lj mile. — Cannie
Chiel 8.13, Windwhistle 8.5, Motor 8.3, I*lai-
die 8.3, Battleaxe 8.2, Ringman 8.0, Oingo
8.0, Tradewind 7.9, Benefactor 7.5, Baliy-
neety 7.4, Float 7.3, Volley 7.2, Gold Dust

6.13, Menura 6.12, Tupara 6.11, Gold Seal

6.7, Legion of Honour 6.7, St. Lyra 6.7, Toa

6.7, Lifebelt 6.7.

First Handicap Hurdles, 2 miles.—Awa-

hurl 12.8, Kohunui 11.2, Light 10.9, Kaiwha-
karoa 10.3, Mourner 9.13, Cobra 9.7. Midia
9.7, Smithy 9.3, The Gryphon 9.0, Boko 9.0,
Nea 9.0, Old Gun 9.0, Jack-o’-Lantern 9.0.

Hack Welter, 1 mile. — Tercelet 10.13,
Dick Turpin 10.6, Blackwing 10.2, Waireka
9.9, Inglewood 9.9, Muralo 9.8, Andree 9.5,
Sandy 9.3,Wairenga 9.2, Roseshoot 9.2,Kate-
rina 9.0, Toledo 8.13, In the Van 8.12. Sea-
weed S.ll. Aratnmahu S.ll, Nat Gould 8.9,
Bellinite 8.7, Raparapa 8.7, First Foot 8.7,
The Leader 8.7, Sylvric 8.7. Omapere 8.7.

Borough Handicap, 1 mile. -Field Battery
9.3, Queen's Guard 8.11, Shackle 8.9, Baliy-
neety 8.9, Float 8.5, Tradewind 8.3, Tupara
7.12, Gold Dust 7.11, Rebel 7.7, Perfection
7.7, St. Lyra 7.5, Mussell 7.4. Good Intent

7.3, Warwick 7.3, Miuerve 7.2, Livonia 6.9,
Romanoff 6.7, Becky 6.7, Wairere 6.7, and

Smithy 6.7. -

Hack Flying, J-mile.—Glory 9.2, Valima
8.9, Taura 8.9, Blackwing 8.9, Ballarat 8.4,
Heritas 8.4, Kowliete 8.3, Maluku 8.3. Hat-

ley 7.13. Waireka 7.13. Gold Purse 7.11, Re-
pulse 7.10, Endeavour 7.9, Sandy 7.9. Rouble

7.8, La Torpedo 7.7, Little Turk 7.7. Silver
Star 7.7, Waitoti 7.6, Catspaw 7.3, Indiana

6.13, Matamau 6.10, Stepson 6.10, Detonator
6.7, Contingent 6.7, Koingo 6.7, Silkiock 6.7,
Black Squall 6.7. Sergius 6.7, Athol Brose
6.7, Marionette 6.7.

News of the Week

There is a slight reappearance of

small-pox in several London parishes.

Thirty-three per eent. of the immi-

grants arriving in America are Italians,

and 27 per cent. Austro-Hungarians.

A gold reef has been struck in the

Cloverfield mine at the Rand at a depth
of 2997ft.

The Rand native labour supply has

greatly improved, and there is a pros-
pect of recruiting labour in Madagat-
car.

A man named Newviggin, a coachman,

while suffering from insomnia, murdered

his wife and four daughters, and then

committed suicide at Dues, Berwickshire.

The Belgian Socialists in Congress re-

solved to abolish the sale of alcoholic

liquors at the Labour Party’s Co-opera-
tive Stores.

The Socialist Congress at Bordeaux, by
a narrow majority, declined to expel M.

Mileraud, one of the leaders of the party,

on account of his alleged opportunism.

St. Petersburg newspapers consider

the rapprochement bet ween Britain and

France, upheld by King Edward’s visit,

is a sure guarantee of the peace of

Europe.

Japan has undertaken to prohibit the

emigration of Japanese to Canada ex-

cepting in cases where they are resi-

dents of Canada and bona fide mer-

chants and students.

Owing to a largely increased Ameri-

can demand for American cotton a mo .1-

ment is progressing in Lancashire io

encourage cotton-growing within the

Empire, especially in West Africa.

The Earl of Dunraven estimates that

even under the most favourable circum-
stances the Irish landlords must lose

£109,000 annually as a result of the

new Land Bill.

The Transvaal Government, after the

beginning of June, will cease supplying
burghers with rations, implements and

stock on credit. The destitute will le
offered employment on public works.

The Indian newspapers are protesting
against the report once again current of
the intended appointment of Mr. Brod-

riek, the Minister for War, as Viceroy of
India.

Extensive claim-pegging has taken

place at Heidelberg, Wilgepoort and

Klerksdorp, in the Transvaal. Many
thousands participated, but the proceed-
ings were orderly.

Before the end of 1903 Russia will have

increased her Far Eastern squadron to

nine battleships, 11 large and eight small
cruisera and 41 torpedo vessels, with
three admirals. 823 officers and 15,571
men.

Mr. R. L. Nash, financial editor of the

“Sydney Daily Telegraph,” in a column

letter published in the “Times,” says

Australia’s ability to carry her debt is

undoubted, and there is no likelihood of
a crisis, though depression is in store.

At Germany’s instance, Jessel Hel-

umth, a lieutenant in the Germany In-
telligence Department, has been arrested

at San Remo, Northern Italy, for sell-

ing to France plans of the German forti-

fications.

The battleships Prince George, Ju-
piter, Magnificent, and Mars, under

Rear-Admiral the Hon. Curzon Howe,
C.8., G.M.G.. received a cordial welcome

on their arrival off the coast of Algeria,
where they were sent to take part in
the reception of President Loubet.

A representative conference at Dublin
resolved, on the motion of the Lord
Mayor, to form an institute of com-

merce and industry, representing the
manufacturing and trading interests of
four provinces of Ireland. The confer-
ence also affirmed the desirability of
holding an international exhibition at
Dublin.

Ex-President Giover Cleveland, speak-
ing at New York, attacked President
Roosevelt’s negro policy and advocated

the domination of whites in the South.

He declared that the denial of social

equality to the negroes was not the out-

come of prejudice, but of racial instinct.
The whites in the South were entitled

to the utmost consideration and sym-

pathetic fellowship of the North.

The International Agricultural (on-

gress has been opened in Rome, 2,500

delegates attending. A motion advo.

eating the imposition of differential dut-

ies by European Powers on products of
the United States and all extra Euro-

pean countries was postponed till next

Congress to allow closer study of the

question. The German delegates ap-

proved of the motion, while the Italian

and French delegates opposed the differ-
entiation.

GENERAL CABLES.

UNHAPPY FINLAND.

General Xabrieoff has been made ab-

solute dictator over Finland for a

period of three years. He has been em-

powered by the Czar to close factories,
offices or shops at discretion, and to as-

sign recalcitrants to residence in various
places within the Russian empire.

WHITAKER WRIGHT’S CASE.

The bearing of the case against Whit-

aker Wright was resumed in New York.

An agent of the British Government

gave evidence that an unsigned message

was sent from Wormley, Surrey, a

place close to the Wright residence, to

the effect that Mrs Wright wanted her

husband, who was then at Havre, and
that things were looking bad it was

also shown that the prisoner telegraphed
his wife to “give Florence £ 500.”

SHAMROCK DISMASTED.

A storm caught Shamrock 111., Sir

Thomas Lipton’s new yacht, built to

compete for the America Cup, off Wey-
mouth. The yacht was dismasted, and

was towed to port a mere hulk. Sir

Thomas Lipton was injured, but not

seriously. One of the sailors was drown-

ed and others of the crew were badly
injured.

TUBERCULOSIS.

The investigations of Professor Ham-

ilton and Mr Young, of Aberdeen Uni-
versity, with a view to testing Dr

Koch’s theory, have proved that human

tuberculosis is communicable to cattle.

[The nim of British scientists has been
to confute Dr. Koch's partial renunciation
of the mutual interchange of tubercles be-
tween cattle and the human subject.]

STORM AT MARSEILLES.

A great storm has been experienced
at Marseilles.

Many vessels broke adrift from their

moorings, and several vessels foundered.

Work at the quays had to be suspend-
ed for some considerable time.

The embarkation of the Australian

mail was delayed.

THE SEA GIVES UP ITS DEAD.

The Spanish flagship Reina Christian,
which with other vessels of the Spanisn
navy was sunk in Manila Harboui dur-

ing Admiral Dewey’s attack iu 1898,
has been refloated. The skeletons of 80

of the crew were discovered. It was

found that though the hull was pene-
trated by 15 shells the vessel had evi-

dently been scuttled before being aban-
doned.

VENEZUELAN REVOLUTION.
A Reuter’s telegram from Caracas

says that 3000 revolutionists under

General Riero for ten days evaded pur-
suit.

At last the Republican forces came up
with them and a desperate struggle en-

sued.
Three thousand of the revolutionists

were absolutely annihilated. General*
Ortega and Martinez were both captnr-
ed.

The third payment under the protocol
has been effected.
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( ANADIAN FINANCE.
The Canadian Budget shows a sur-

plus of 13,350,000 dollars, enabling the

liquidation of all capital expenditure
and a reduction of debits by 5,650,000
dollars.

Mr Fielding, Minister for Finance, lias
announced that since negotiations have

failed to induce Germany to treat Can-

adian products fairly, a surtax, one-

third additional to the present duty,
Would be levied on German goods.

BLOW AT THE TRUSTS.

News has been received that Alub-

yarafa. with two hundred Moorish

troops, lied for refuge to Algeria.
•French sphoirs, or sharp-shooters, have

been sent to the Algerian frontier ow-

ing to the approach of the Moorish pre-
tender’s army.

Large masses of stocks have been

thrown on the New York market owing
to the recent decision of the High Court,

forbidding the merging of the Northern
Railway Companies as contravening the.

principles of the recent legislation
against monopolies.

HUSH LAND BILL.

Mr John Redmond has been elected
president of the Nationalist Conven-
tion sitting at Dublin. There are 2500

representatives present.
Mr William O’Brien moved the accept-

ance of the principal features of the new

Irish Land Bill, though he and Air Red-

mond insisted that radical and sweeping
amendments would be required.

Mr P. White, a member of the House

of Commons, moved an amendment in
favour of the unconditional rejection of

the ‘.‘ill.

The amendment found only one sup-

porter, and Mr C'Brien’s motion was

thus carried almost unanimously, with
enthusiasm.

AIR MORLEY’S VIEWS.

Mr John Morley, M.P., speaking at

Mont rose, protested against the cost of

militarism as spendthrift and demoral-
ising. The extravagance of the Govern-
ment was extraordinary.

The new Irish Land Bill was a confes-

sion that the resolute government of

Ireland had resulted in failure. He
agreed with Mr Redmond that the set-

tlement of the land question would be
an enormous step towards Home Rule.

SOMALILAND.

The Paris journal “Le Petit Bless”
alleges that before the Dreyfus trial at

Rennes Helmuth sold France the Aus-

trian official list of international spies,
and that Helmuth added Dreyfus’ name

thereto. This contributed tc the second
condemnation of Dreyfus.

Three hundred Yaos tribesmen, under
British officers, defeated a large force of

Somalis at Walwal on April 3, killing £0

and capt uring 600 camels and 5000 sheep.
The enemy repeatedly tried to rush the
British square. Pursuit was found to ba
impossible.

Colonel Ccbbe on the sth surprised and

dispersed a large party west of Galkan,
killing 10 and capturing 1500 camels and

6000 sheep. There were no British casu-

alties.
The Mullah has retreated to Haradget.

FRANCE AND ENGLAND.

Pre-ideut Loubet had a great recep-
tion at Algiers. The British, Russian.

Spanish and Italian squadrons saluted,
and the bands on the British warships
played the "Marseillaise,” the French
cruiser Jeanne d’Are responding with

"God Save the King.” President Lou-

bet decorated the British commanders.
Speaking at a banquet in his honour

President Loubet declared lie was very
.sensible of King Edward’s delicate at-

tention in sending four of the finest

specimens of the mighty British navy

to lake part in his reception, thereoy
showing the good feeling and esteem felt

towards France. He added: "I think

King Edward will be satisfied with the

reception Paris is preparing for him.”

SAMOA.

The German natives of Upolu and

Savaii claim land at Tutuiia. The

American Secretary of Native Affairs

caused the arrest of several Tutuilans,
who proposed to murder the Upolu
claimants. Germany has appointed a

Commission consisting of German and

British representatives to deal with the

Samoan land disputes. The Americans
have done nothing in the matter.

[The greater portion of the Samoan
group belong to Germany, but America
owns tlie island of Tutuiia, and several

adjacent islets. A number of chiefs have
removed from German io American Samoa
and vice versa since the division of the
group was made, and as a result disputes
as to the ownership have arisen, as in
tile present instance. The disputes are
of no great moment, ami in most cases

have not been heard of outside official

circles.]

THE CHINESE QUESTION.

A hundred d. anken German an I Aus-

trian soldiers fought with bricks, knives

and chibs in a street in Pekin in the'
presence of crowds of Chinese until the
patrols separated them and confined

the rioters to their barracks.
Reuter’s Agency at Pekin reports that

the Russians explain that the evacuation
of Neuehwang is delayed owing to a

desire to establish an international sani-

tary commission to prevent bubonic
plague.

Prince Ching has succeeded Yung-Lu
as Grand Secretary.

Au edict issued by the Dowager Em-

press of China repeals the stamp tax

imposed by Yuanshikai’s officials in the

hope.thereby to paralyse his scheme and

secure the honest t-ollecTion of taxes.

The Dowager reviewed 7000 superior
troops at I’aotingfu.

THE MOROCCO RISING.

News has been reeetvfed "from Mor-
occo that the rebels have’captured Fra-
jana. They exploded a mine, destroying
the chief tower, then stormed the fort,
Forly-one. of the garrison were killed
and 2-1 wounded. Part of the garrison
took refuge at Alelilla.

The pretender now controls the. whole
of the Riff district. "

The Sultan of Morocco is dismissing
most .of bis European officials excepting
Sir Harry MaeLean, the chief of his

bodyguard. This step is taken with a

view .to propitiating his subjects, owing
to lheir danger';, s disapproval of his ef-

forts to bring the country into line with

European civilisation.
The Spanish Government has refused

to allow the Sultan of Morocco to send
troops to the Riff country via Melilla,
the fortified convict .settlement belonging
to Spain, on the North coast of Moroc-
co.

As it is impossible to disembark the
Moorish forces elsewhere, the Sultan
is left in somewhat of a quandary in the

matter of meeting the forces of the Pro-

tender. .

A FRENCH SCANDAL.
la connection with AL RevolPs resig-

nation of the Governorship of Algeria,
the newspaper "Petite Daupliinois,”
owned by M. Baragnos, HI. Revoil’s
uncle, alleged that AL Edgar Combes,
the Premier’s son, offered to obtain the

authorisation of the Carthusians under

the Religious Associations Act for a mil-
lion fra nes.

This allegation was indignantly denied
uncle, alleged that M. Edgar Combes,
voil, the latter of whom denied that

he was associated therewith. M. Re-

voil’s resignation was due to Al.

Combes’ refusal to hear him on the sub-

ject. and declining to sign his promotion
to the Legion of Honour on the occa-

sion of President Loubet’s forthcoming
visit to North Africa.

A leading Chartreuse monk informed

the newspaper “Gaulois” that a person
professing to represent a political group
in the Chamber of Deputies offered the

Prior of the Order in February to obtain

authorisation for the Order under the

Religious Associations Act if they would
pay £‘ 12,000 down and contribute £ 80,-
000 to the electoral fund. The offer was

refused.

ANTARCTIC EXPJ X)RATlON.

The steamer Stassfurt has brought
to Sydney from Kergulen Islands four
of the German scientific party sent there
in connection with the German Antarc-

tic! expedition. The party originally
consisted of five, but one died during
their 18 months’ residence. The sur-

vivors are very reticent, but it is un-

derstood that they suffered great hard-
ships. The leader is ill, and was remov-

ed to the hospital upon arrival.
The directors of the German Society

of Geological Science at Berlin deeply
regret the failure of the German Ker-

guelen scientific station, the members

of which returned to Sydney yesterday.
The German scientist who died at

the station on Kerguelen Island was Dr

Euzensperger, and the one invalided to

Sydney is Dr Werth. Tlie future move-

ments of the expedition arc Uncertain.
So far as Kerguelen is concerned they
have completed their work, which was

purely scientific, and was espee’ally oc-

cupied with wind and temperature ob-

servations and geographical research.

When the Strtsspovt arrived at the
island it was decided to leave the ex-

pedition’s' jinused provisions for the
benefit of possible castaways, and a no-

tice to that effect was conspicuously
posted. The only fresh food obtainable

on the island was rabbits, which swarm

there, the' rate of increase being only
regulated by the scarcity of herbage.

The German Government proposes to
despatch another South Polar expedition
in December to pick up thS party on the

steamer Gauss, which when they left

Germany last year intended to stay till
next year. A sailing vessel will prob-

ably be secured and will start from Cape-
town. If the Gauss is not picked up the

expedition will replenish the food depots
in the ice regions.

KING’S TOUR.

Klug Edward’s yacht, escorted by
six cruisers, passed within ten miles of
Algiers, whose batteries and battle-

ships saluted with 101 guns. The foreign
warships in the harbour hoisted the

British ensign and fired salutes of 21

guns.
King Edward, on arrival at Malta,

was welcomed with immense enthusiasm.

The forts and vessels saluted and the

churches rang joy bells.

Replying to an address of welcome the

King stated that his early visit since be

had become King was due to his great
personal interest in the beautiful his-

toric island, one of his most precious
possessions.

The warships in the babrour and the

King’s yacht were superbly illuminated.

King Edward reviewed 8000 troops at

Malta. It was a brilliant function, but

had to be curtailed owing to a sand-

storm. An army versus navy polo
match was held in the afternoon.

The King will attend a review at Vin-

cennes (a suburb of Paris) on the morn-

ing of May 2, and a special race meet-

ing at Longchamps on the afternoon of
the same day.

The naval review at Alalia was aban-

doned owing to the. storm, which had

already had the effect of interrupting
similar military events.

The King’s drive through the poorest
parts of the town caused intense grati-
fication.

AAIERICAN AND BRITISH AVORK-
AIEN.

The report of the Labour Commission
under Air Alfred Aloseley, which recent-

ly visited the United States and in-

quired into the labour conditions there,
states that employers in America offer

their workmen inducements to extra

effort. Employers in England regard

machinery as entitling them to reduce

wages when the earnings are high, while
a contrary view is taken in Americ.?.
The report pronounces the extreme spe-
cialisation of labour a great drawback,

causing a train and shortening tho

lives of Americans, whose hours are

slightly longer than the British. The
workmen of Britain are declared to be

in advance of the American in tho mat-

ter of technical education, but the
American workman is more energetic
and sober and less addicted to sport.

[Mr Alfred Moseley last year undertook
the whole expense of two very interesting

commissions, with the idea of -arousing
British trade to be "up and doing,'’and for-

mulated the plan of showing picked men

in the confidence of their fellows the ways

in which their commercial rivals are progres-

sing. After visiting the States, Mr Moseley
found that while we were inclined to rest
on our oars, the American studied, and in-

vestigated with an almost feverish restless-
ness. And he decided that education was

at the root of the difference. These are

some of the points to which Mr Moseley
drew the attention of his first commission,
which consisted of chosen representatives of
tlie trades unions. This is the commission
which has now reported. The second dele-

gation is to study the education question

both on the Continent am', in the States,
especially with reference to commercial and
industrial organisation.]
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TROUBLE IN THE BALKANS.

The role of the Bulgarian as the in-

nocent victim of Turkish outrage and

massacre is somewhat upset hy the au-

thenticated. report of the destruction

by Bulgarians of an exclusively Mussul-
man village.

The murderous fury of the attacking
party, inspired as they were by the in-

flammatory doctrines of the Macedonian
Committees, led to a series of horrors,
for which the blackest of the Armenian
outrages would alone be a match.

Not content with the massacre of 165

persons in eold blood, those ghouls pro-

ceeded to the most frightful mutila-
tions and nameless acts of violence.
Women with children were hacked by
their weapons. One woman was impal-
ed.

Nothing but heroic patience can pre-
vent the Turk from retaliating on such

diabolical outrages, and a serious de-

velopment may be expected at any mo-

ment.

Hussein Tlilnii Pasha, Governor-Gene-
ral of the Macedonian valayets, has as-

sured a London “Times” interviewer

that the Porte considered the Albanian
question settled. Only a small and ignor-
ant faction were concerned in the revolt.

Twenty thousand troops were now

massed round Mitrovitza, and were able

to overcome the malcontents. He hoped
to show within three months the pro-
posed reforms in progress.

Foreign diplomats, however, consider
that Hilmi is too optimistic, and hold

that the only solution of the trouble

will be the complete disarmament and

military occupation of Albania.
The Vienna “Freie Press” says that

Russia demands £4BOO as compensation
for the murder of M. Stehenbino, who

died through wounds received in the

action at Mitrovitza on April 2.

The Czar’s Government further de-

mands the despatch of 20,000 Anatolia a

troops from Old Servia to permanently
repress the Albanians.

The third demand is for the erection
of a chapel on the scene of Stehenbino’s
murder.

Well-founded reports state that mur-

ders, pillage incendiarism ami atrocities
of every description are occurring daily
on the Balkan Peninsula, and that these

outrages are committed alike by Alban-

ians, Turks, Bulgarians and citizens and
soldiers.

The Russian Black Sea volunteer fleet
has been ordered to refuse cargoes, and

prepare to mobolise.

The Suez Canal has been blocked since

Monday week owing to a Russian cruiser
sinking a barque in the water-way. The

mail steamer Orizaba, homeward bound,
was consequently delayed.

Later advices state that the canal is

again open for traffic.
The Sultan’s second peace mission, un-

der Sedik Pasha, has been received at

Djakooitza.
The party was previously warned that

if they went there they would be treat-

ed like Mehcmet Ali Pasha, who was

murdered by Albanian rioters at Ipok, on

September, 1878.

Eight battalions of Turkish troops
are concentrated between Mitrdvitza

and Uskule.

Ibrahim, the murderer of M. Stehen-

bino. the Russian Consul, has been sent-
enced io death at Mitrovitza, in accord-

ance with the demand of the Czar’s Go-

vernment that he should either suffer

death or be released.

With the view of uniting to resist the

reforms the Albanians have declared a

tinee as regards intertribal squabbles.
The Macedonian internal organisation

has resolved to abandon the general in-

surrection for 1903, owing to Turkey's
overwhelming military strength and the

improbability of outside aid, and to con-

iine operations to guerilla warfare.

A traitor informed the European Con-
suls at Salonika of the Bulgarian Re-

volutionary Committee’s methods, and
stated that the inhabitants of Mace-

donia were under pain of death compel-
led to accept the committee’s bonds, re-

payable after Macedonia had been liber-

ated u"om Turkish rule.

It is alleged that women carried re-

volutionary correspondence across the

frontier; also that ISO Bulgarian officers

disguised as pilgrims are now’ operating
in Macedonia.

One hundred and twenty thousand

rifles and large quantities of cartridge.',
bombs and dynamite have been imported
under guise of holy relies, the Customs

officers conniving at the importation.
It is expected that the rebellion will

begin at the time of the Greek Easter

holidays, when the railway bridges and

tunnels will be dynamited, accompanied
by wholesale incendiarism and a carnival

of massacre and pillage.
The “Tinies” is responsible for the

statement, which was founded on reports

current in Sofia, to the effect that the

leaders of the Macedonian internal or-

ganisation had decided to abandon their

general insurrection.

BAGDAD RAILWAY.

The Imperial Ottoman Bagdad lla’l-

way Company has been constituted .'I.

Constantinople with a capital of 15 mil-

lion francs. Herr Gwinner, manager of

the Deutsche Bank, of Berlin, acts as

president of the company.
The “Novo Vrentya” states that the

German promoters have retained only.

20 per i-eni. of the capital of the Bag-
dad railway, while they induced French

capitalists io take 40 per eent., and

vainly applied to the Russians and
Americans to furnish the remainder. It

was only then that they trier! to raise
the money in England.

The “Times” says that if the manage-

ment of the Bagdad railway is purely
German then the British capitalists had

better abstain from participating.
The British newspapers suggest that

Great Britain should insist as a con-

dition of co-operation in the Bagdad
railway on the option of purchase of all
the German shares before they are offcr-

ed to any other nation, lest they should

be transferred to Russia.

The Kaiser has sent German officials
to study the Bagdad railway problem,
and to investigate American methods
of colonising along the great railway
tracks. It is understood that, these in-

vestigations are being made with a view

to German colonisation along the Bag-
dad line.
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AUSTRALIA.

The annual report of the administra-

tion of New Guinea shows that the new

federal territory does not cost more to

govern than the £20,000 voted. There

have been no special demands for land

grants. The goldfield has not increased

to any material extent.

The Arbitration Court has reserved
its decision in connection with the ap-
plication of the Wharf Labourers* Union
that the Union Company’s Island-trading
steamers should be subjected to deep sea

conditions. The company contend they
should be controlled by inter-State con-

ditions.

IMPERIALISM.

Speaking at the Australian -Natives’

Asuociation banquet, Sir Edmund liar-

ton believed that the feeling was grow-
ing, and must grow, that the citizens in

this part of the Empire were beginning
to realise that they were in a sense part-
ners not only in the portion of the Em-

pire wherein they happened to be, but

in the whole of the rest as well. In ths

modern acceptation of the word Empire
had none of the significance of absolut-

ism and despotism once associated with

if. It was nothing but the cohesion of

self-governing bodies, determined to hold

together as treasurers of their history,
as well as of their territory. He re-

iterated his advocacy of the proposed
naval agreement, and the preference for

a distinct Australian squadron. Tho

Premiers of New South M ales, A ictorla

and other leaders made _ speeches with

regard to the main Imperial questions.

THE BLEACHING PROCESS.

As a step towards a “White Aus-

tralia,” the largest camel proprietor in

the western district, lias replaced the

whole of his Afghan drivers by whites.

The employment of camels in the far-

interior for the last few years, espec-

ially since the reign of the drought, has

greatly increased, largely superseding
the other methods of carriage.

The Rt. Hon. C. C. Kingston, Federal
Minister of Customs, speaking at

Cairns, said he had no sympathy with
the Kanakas, never had, and never

would. Could not tho gentlemen em-

ployed in the sugar industry do it ;te
well as any nigger in the world? “Yes,”
he said, “and much better.” What

sort of descendants of the British were

they, he asked, if it could not be teld
them that sooner than submit to en-

courage the yellow agony or the black
curse, if there was any industry which

required the countenancing of that

agony or that curse, that then they
should sweep it off the face of Aus-

tralia? “Let us no longer allow them

to continue in this land, which is, and

should forever be, preserved as a white
man’s land.”

GENERAL NEWS.

Near Adelaide, splendid large peaches

sell for 4/ for 501bs. In Auckland the

same class of peach sells at 2d. a peach.

The limit for the Wairarapa Council’s

overdraft for the ensuing year has been

fixed at £3,500, which was the amount

alowed during the year just closed.

A Nelson “Musician” who recently
brought an action against a man who

fatally ill-treated his concertina showed
he averaged £3 to £3 10/ a week, and
that he had made £5 2/9 in a single day.

Blue cod, whieh is supposed to be a

South Island fish, is sometimes caught
off the Barrier, though rarely. It is the

choicest fish caught in New Zealand wat-

ers, and quantities are sent over to Aus-

tralia, where it is much sought after.

The purchase of Ripon Lea, the resi-
dence of the late Sir Frederick Sargood,
as a State Government House is being
considered by members of the Victorian
Ministry. It is reported that Ripon Lea

is valued for probate purposes at £22,-
500.

“£130,000 worth of gold was buried
within 20 miles of Leydsdorp by a Boer

named Munik, during the war; it has

never been taken away yet, but we can-

not locate the spot.” (Extract from a

letter written to a friend in Auckland
from Leydsdorp, March 11).

The experiment of employing Jews for

Sunday duty is about to be made in the
London Post Office. In this way it is

hoped that Sabbath-breaking among

both Jews and Gentiles will be obviated.
This idea was expounded by Samuel

Gordon in his Jewish novel, “"Sons of
the Covenant,” published about two

years ago.

Raisins in South Australia are dried
thus: The grapes (white muscatels) are

put into buckets perforated with small
holes, which are dipped quickly into

boiling caustic soda and water and turn-

ed out again. The fruit is then spread
on wooded trays and dried in the sun

for a week, and is then ready for the
market.

The residents of Remneva may not

know the reason of the many turns and
twists of the Remuera-road out as far

as St. John’s College. It exactly fol-
lows the old cart track made by the
early settlers out about Tamaki and Pan-

mure over 60 years ago, and has not

altered its circuitous course in any par-

ticular since; the whole distance through
Remuera was then covered with thick

bush, down to the very water’s edge.
Forty-eight marriages took place on

Easter Monday in Wellington.

This is an extract from a letter re-

ceived in Auckland, dated March 11,
Leydsdorp: “Five inches of rain have

fallen here in two years, and that fell

last Christmas; since then we have not

had a drop. . . For weeks together
the thermometer goes up to over 105

every day. . . . The mealies are now

totally ruined, starvation is coming, and

if rain does not come now, in a few

months thousands of Kaffirs will die. It

won’t affect the white people except all
prices for food will go up.”

Picton has experienced a wonderful
visitation of fish. The harbour is simp-
ly teeming with herrings, which impede
the steamers and oil launches in their
progress (writes our own correspon-
dent). The phenomenon is not unusual.
Several times the same thing has occur-

red, and the beach is strewn with dead

herring washed ashore by tho tide, some-

times to a depth of several feet. Some-

times one sees the fish springing ashore

to escape death by suffocation, only to

meet it by another means. The Borough
Council employed men to bury the dead
fish, but it is waste of time and money,
others come ashore as fast as the first

ones are cleared away. The seagulls are

reaping a goodly harvest.

There have been numerous instances

of foreign substances such as needles

being extracted from the human body
after wandering round for lengthy per-
iods, but it is decidedly uncommon to
hear of a person going about for years
with a foreign substance in his ear. A

case occurred in Auckland this week. A

young man went suddenly deaf in one

ear after getting some water in it. He
consulted Dr. de Clive Lowe, who, after

an examination, extracted a cascara

tabloid. The young man had felt some

hard substance in the ear for several

years past, but never dreamed it was

what it proved to be, and did not bother
about it as it gave him no pain till he
went suddenly deaf. The tabloid, which

was about a quarter of an inch in diam-

eter, was intact except for the sugar
coating, which had apparently dissolved.

How it got in the ear is a mystery.

The Auckland branch of the New Zea-
land Institute of Journalists held its an-

nual meeting on Friday afternoon in the

social hall at the Y.M.C.A. rooms. There
was a large attendance of members. Mr.

R- M. Hackett, president of the branch,
occupied the chair. The secretary, Mr.
J. Birch, submitted a satisfactory annual
report, showing a membership of 30. Mr.

A. E. Greenslade, hon. treasurer, sub-
mitted the financial statement, which
gave a credit balance of £lO 0/3. On the
motion of the chairman the report and
balance-sheet were adopted. Messrs. N.
D. Merrick, Charles E. Wheeler, N. Mc-
Munn were elected members, Mr. H.

Hanby was admitted on transfer, and

Mr. G. L. Sheehan was elected as junior
associate. Officers were elected for the
ensuing year as follows: President, Mr.
E. W. G. Rathbone; secretary, Mr. J.
Birch; treasurer, Mr. A. E. Greenslade;
and Messrs. A. Lowrie and R. M. Hackett
were chosen to act as a committee in con-

junction with the officers.

The Chilian warship General Banque-
dano, which has been engaged on an ex-

tensive cruise round the Pacific Islands

and in the Australasian colonies, took

her final departure for Chili from this
port at ten o’clock on Monday. A s

the vessel proceeded down the harbour

she signalled from her masthead H.P2.
—“Good bye.” The American Govern-

-r.ient vessel Wheeling, being the only
warship in port, returned the compli-
ment, hoisting the flags X.O.R.—“Thank
you”— and T.D.S.—“Wish you pleasant
voyage.” 'When the two vessels were

abrea.st of one another the crew of the

Chilian clambered into the rigging and

cheered the Americans lustily, which the

latter returned spiritedly. An amusing
scene occurred on the wharf about this

time. Three Chilian sailors who had
been up town effecting purchases came

on the scene, and when they perceived
that their boat had started on her voy-

age showed considerable concern. The

only available launch had a few minutes
previously conveyed an officer off to the

warship. The voyage to Tal-

cahuna, the first port the

vessel will touch at in Chili, usu-

ally occupies forty-five days, but the

captain will make an effort to get across

in thirty days. Should this be accom-

plished the performance will be all the

more creditable as the service regula-
tions make it imperative that before us-

ing steam there must be two days’ calm,

the object being to ensure that the

young officers on board are properly
trained in handling a vessel. It is pos-
sible that the General Banquedano after

refitting in Chiliwill return to New Zea-

land with an entirely fresh crew, but

nothing definite has been fixed.

THE PARLIAMENTARY EXCURSION.

The Southern members of the Parlia-

mentary party which visit the Islands

arrived from the South by the Union

Company’s steamer Mapourika on Sat-

urday evening at half-past five o’clock,

the steamer’s arrival having been delay-
ed by some hours owing to meeting with

contrary winds during the passage. As-

sembled on the Queen-street Wharf

were a number of friends of the mem-

bers, who welcomed them to Auckland.

Immediately after the steamer had

berthed extra supplies were taken on

board. The Mapourika has been fitted

up in a thoroughly efficient manner, and

her exterior is painted according to the
Government service regulations.

The following is a complete list of the

party on board: —Messrs. E. G. Allen,
J. Allen, J. F. Arnold, W. H. P. Barber,

G. Fisher, F. R. Flatman, G. Fowlds, W.
Fraser, J. A. Hanan, R. M. Houston, F.

Lawry, T. Mackenzie, C. E. Major, Hon.

C. H. Mills, Messrs. E. G. B. Moss, J.

O’Meara, T. Parata, J. C. Thomson, J. W.
Thomson, J. Vile, A. D. Willis, W. T.
Wood, Sir W. J. Steward, Mr A. Baldey,
Hons. W. M. Bolt, C. C. Bowen, B. Har-

ris, W. F. C. Carncross, J. G. Jenkin-

son, D. Pinkerton, J. Bigg, T. Thompson,
James Marshall, Messrs. James Black,
E. McCarthy, W. M. McLaughlin, G.
R-eed, G. Hicks, H. Winkelman, A. J.
Wilkin, G. Wolrond. T. W. Kirk, Zachu-

riah. The Hon. C. H. Mills is in.charge.
At three o’clock on Sunday morning

the Mapourika took her departure for

the Islands. The first port of call will
be Rarotonga, in the Cook Group. A

number of the islands in the group will
be visited. The steamer then proceeds
to Tahiti, Samoa, Tonga, Fiji, and the
Kermadecs, and is due buck in Auck-
land about six weeks hence.

A SOOTHING, HEALING,
STIMULATING OINTMENT

Particularly recommended for Ulcerated
Legs, Piles, Fistula, and all long-standing

and painful Wounds.
A Household Remedy for all Burns, Cuts,

Scalds, Boils. Bruises, Kicks, Sores, etc.
It should be found on every Dressing
Table as a very effective Salve for
Pimples. Eczema, Redness and Roughness
of the Skin. Inflamed Eyes, and all Skin

Affections.

IT HEALS QUICKLY AND
GIVES IMMEDIATE RELIEF.

Prices, in Pots, 1/14 and 2/9.

Solo Makers: BEACH and BARNICOTT

(Ltd.), Brldport. England.

'CHEADACHE. INDIGESTION?
<CONSTIPAT!ON, BILE. J

liiiiir<ri?nwMMr
,

TO BN OBTAINND FROM

SHARLAND & CO., Ltd.

Gerebos Salt.
Used at table and in cooking, Cerebos Salt is

not only dainty and economical, but it makes all

the food more strengthening; because it con-

tains the Bran Phosphates (absent from White

Bread) out of which Nature forms Nerve and

Brain, Bones and Teeth, and Healthy Body.
From Grocers and Stores

Wholesale Agents :—L.. D. Nathan & Co., Auckland.

A. G. JARRETT,
Shorthand Writer and Typist.

(AUTHORISED SUPREME COURT REPORTER.)

Address - - SWANSON STREET.

ARTICLED PUPILS receive thorough instruction in Shorthand, Typewriting,
and Office Training (including Book-keeping) every day (Saturdays excepted) from
10 to 4, for six months, £5 ss. Fifty-live Situations obtained by pupils last year.
Over 100 pupils at present occupying situations.

Typewi’iters—YOST and REMINGTON (new models).
Typewriter Repairs and Supplies.

Typewriter Bureau—SWANSON STREET.
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After over twenty years in the ser-

vice of the Wellington Education Board,
Miss Keeling, of the Infant School, Mas-
terton, has resigned her position. She
was presented with a silver-mounted
biseuit barrel from the members of the
School Committee, with a silver cake

dish from the teaching staff. Mr Hogg,
M.H.R., made the presentation.

Among tourists who arc doing Wel-

lington are: Miss D’Arcy (New York,
U.S.A.), F. Thornton, G. Burgess, G.

Herlett (London), T. Johnston (Liver-

pool), Herr Carl Franke (Bremen, Ger-

many), Mr. and Mrs. Leonard St. Law-

rence (Channel Islands), M. B. Ramsay
(London), E. Melvin (Glasgow), C. Oli-
vier (Montreal), Mr. and Mrs. Appleton
(Neweastle-on-Tyne), Miss H. Meyer
(Berlin), Miss A. McLaren (Glasgow),
11. Gife-Combes and C. Gerardv (Isle of

Wight).

The Hon. Mr McGowan is fast gain-
ing on the Premier for quick travelling.
He left Wellington last Friday week
by train to New Plymouth, caught
the steamer for Manukau the same

night, and reached Onehunga on Satur-

day morning. Instead of proceed-
ing to Auckland he caught the Roto-
rua express at Penrose and reached'the
Lakes in due time. From Rotorua to

Tauranga, thence to Waihi, Thames

and Auckland in quick succession, hear-

ing lengthy deputations in Thames;
thence back to Wellington, and he has

promised to be in Whangarei at the end

of the month.

NOTABLE VISITORS.

Among the arrivals by ths R.M.s.

Sonoma on Friday were Dr. Lucien War-

ner, chairman of the International Com-

mittee of American Y.M.C.A.’s, and Mr
Richard C. Morse, M.A., general secre-

tary of American Y.M.C.A.’s. The visit-

ors are on a round the world tour, hav-

ing previously visited England, the Con-

tinent, India and Australia. They ar-

rived in Adelaide about the middle of
last month and visited Melbourne, Ho-

bart, Ballarat and Sydney, attending
the Conference of Y.M.C.A.’s at Ade-
laide. Dr. Warner, who has taken an

interest in the Y.M.C.A. movement for

the past twenty years, and the commit-
tee of which he is now chairman forms

the agency of supervision for the whole

of North America. Mr Morse has held
his position as general secretary for the

past thirty-three years. When he took

the office, practically at the time the

committee was formed, there were but
two supervisors, while now the number

totals over forty. Both gentlemen
naturally took a great interest in the
Y.M.C.A. in Australia, and Mr Morse
thinks that, considering the circumstan-

ces, the movement has progressed very

satisfactorily. He states that the won-

derful progress of the Association in

America is largely due to the careful

supervision exercised, a super-
vision which assisted the strong

as well as the weak. The co-

operation of the Y.M.C.A. with the

Students’ Association has also been an

important factor in the success of the
movement, and since the former Associa-

tion includes all sections of the com-

munity in its constitution, and the two

bodies have the same object, their com-

bination is of great service -to both. In

the colonies the institutions are not

conjoined. Dr. Warner and Mr Morse

left on Saturday morning for Roto-

rua, and after visiting Wairakei and

Taupo will proceed to Wellington and

thence to the South Island, returning in

time to catch the next mail steamer for
San Francisco.

The visitors were entertained at lun-

cheon on Friday last at Canning’s Cafa

by the Auckland Y.M.C.A. Mr C. E.

Button, president of the association,
occupied the chair, Dr. Warner and
Mr Morse being seated next him.
Among those present were the Revs.

J. J. Lewis, J. Benning and Gray
Dixon, Messrs F. Baume, M.H.R.,
G. Fowlds, M.H.R., C. H. Hemery,

hon. treasurer Y.M.C.A., J. Brakenrig,
secretary Y.M.C.A., G. Aicken, J. Burns,
J. Stewart, S. Vaile, R. Hobbs, A. Creag,
J. H. Smith, H. Edmiston and R. Wil-
son. Messrs J. Bridwater and R. B.
Shalders, who were members of the pa-

rent association in London, were also

present. In the forties Mr Shalders
founded the Auckland Association.

OUR ILLUSTRATIONS.

DEATH OF CAPTAIN MORRIS, M.L.C.

The many friends of the Hon. Capt.
Geo. Bentham Morris, M.L.C., will learn
with extreme regret of that gentleman’s
death as the result of the unfortunate

accident that occurred a fortnight
ago. The deceased gentleman led a very
active life until some eighteen years

ago, when a blow from a cricket ball in-

jured his left knee. A year later he was

seized with a paralytic stroke on the

right side, from which he has suffered
ever since. Up to six months ago he

was as active as a person suffering from
such a stroke could be, but he then got
an attack of pneumonia, which left him

very weak, and from which he never

fully recovered. A fortnight ago he

fell down in his room. In falling he in-

flicted a wound on his temple
which rendered him unconscious, am)
caused him to lose so much blood that

his constitution was not equal to sur-

viving the shock.
Captain Morris was a typical colon-

ist. Born in Victoria 63 years ago, he

subsequently went to Gloucester (Eng-
land), and entered the navy and became

a captain of marines. In 1870, being
then a married man, Captain Morris re-

tired from active service, and came out

to this colony, going first to the Wai-

kato. After a short stay there he re-

moved to the Bay of Plenty, and took

up a run, remaining there until about
eight years ago, when he came to Auck-
land and took up his residence at Ota-
huhu. Captain Morris gave a consid-

erable amount of time to public life,
being for years a member for the Bay
of Plenty, in the Auckland Provincial
Council. At the abolition of the

provinces Captain Morris was

returned to Parliament for the

Bay of Plenty, representing that dis-
trict for many years, and for a few

weeks occupied the position of Minister
of Justice under one of Sir Julius Vo-

gel’s short-lived Administrations. About
18 years ago Captain Morris was call-
ed to the Legislative Council. The de-

ceased gentleman leaves five sons by

his first wife, two of whom are resident
in Auckland, Mr G. C. W. Morris and
Mr P. B. Morris. lie also leaves a

widow and one son about one year
old. Captain Morris, during his long
public career, earned the character of
being an upright, honourable gentle-
man. In his private life he made many

firm friends, who will deeply regret his

death under such sad circumstances.

AUCKLAND WIN THE TENANT

The final for the Auckland Bowling As-

sociation's Pennant took place on Hit*

Remuera Green, between the representa-

tive teams from the Auckland and Dev

onport Clubs, these clubs having proved
the winners of their sections in the Easter

Tournament. The rinks were in first class
condition, but owing to the recent rains
were somewhat “dead” in the “draw,”
and this to a great extent spoilt what
should have been a fast and exciting game,

owing to the number of short bowls cov-

ering the “front.”
The teams took their positions as fol-

lows :—

Auckland—McCallum, Buttlp, Garland,
Dingle (skip) v. Devouport—Harvey, Miller,
McNeil, Knife (skip). Auckland — Men-
nle, Elliot, James. Ledlngbam (skip), v.

Devonport—Mitchell, Armstrong, Gardner,
Eagleton (skip).

Devonport were most fancied for the

match, owing to the marine suburb hav-
ing beaten Newmarket and Mt. Eden ra-
ther easily.

TO GihlE A COLD IN9NE DAY.
Take Laxative Bromo Quinine Tablets.
All Druggists refund the money if it fails

to cure. Is 6d. The genuine is stamped.
“L.B.Q. ”

Agents—SHARLAND & CO., Ltd.,
AUCKLAND AMD WELLINGTON.

References throughout Great Britain and Colonies.

a M taken from theSystem.
9 Kw Nothing remains which can

ffTa'wS' F BH EBDSm produce an attack. You can

eat, sleep andstand exposure without slightest return of

symptoms. Cured to stay cured, by elimination andre-

constructioa. Appetite improved; blood enriched; nerves

strengthened;wholesystem built up;life madeenjoyable.
Rsliefs, or change ofclimate no longerneeded. Wehave
treatedover 52,000 Asthmaand Hav Fever patients. Es-
tablished 1883. ExplanatoryBOOK 27c pc«tFREE.
Address: Dr. P. HAROLD HAYKS'ASIUMATIOIN6TITUTB»
Buffalo, N. Y., U. S. A.

SPECIAL LINES IN -v

BEDSTEADS
AND

LINOLEUMS
For a Few Days Only. Inspection Invited.

MONEY TO BE SAVED.

GOOD VALUE GIVEN.

EVERYBODY SATISFIED.

Tonson Garlick Co., Ltd.
“THE PEOPLE’S” FURNISHING WAREHOUSE,

Queen Street, Auckland
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Music and Drama.

Matlame Adelina Patti is <i() years vf

Dani. the tenor, who came through
New Zealand with Amy fast les. is new

*inging in New York.

On dit that Mr. J. C. Williamson’s next

<*oni]Minv to tour New Zealand will be the

Royal Comic Opera Company.

A new English etnnedy company open-
ed at the Palace. Sydney, on Sat linky
last in “Are You a Mason?" said to bo

remarkably funny.

Melba sailed for Ixmdon from Aus-

tralia last x\rek. There was a large
and enthusiastic crowd to bid her fare-
well.

Air. Charles I>. West ma cot t, who made

many friends when in New Zealand seme

three years ago with the Stanford Dra-

matic Company, is business manager of

the “Sweet Nell of Ohl Drury’’ Company.

Mrs. Howie i”Te Rangi Pai’) has been

touring England with a concert party, of

whh-h the other memltrrs were Miss Rosa

Bird. Mr. Barton McGuekin and Mr. Ar-

thur Walenn.

Mr. Bv» t Royle. Mr. J. ( . Williamson’s

representative in New Zealand, pro pcs<s
to locate himself permanently in Welling-
ton. He ha- just returned from a visit io

Australia.

If is stated that E. 11. Sothern and

Justin Huntly McCarthy, besides col-

laborating on a history of Francois
\ illon. are going to work together on

a wpipl to “If 1 Were King."

Mr. J«»hn F. Sheridan, who has he.n

phix ing a. season at the Criterion Theatre,
Sidney, was accorded a farewell demon-

-l ration last week, when he was present-
ed with a gold watch, suitably inscribed.

Mi Titdg«- had a leading part in

‘ A Married Woman." Mr Frederick

Fenn’s now play, which was produced
in February, at the Metropole Theatre,
('nmlnnwvvll. London. Ho appeared as

Geoffrey Kent. The “Daily Graphic”
speak- of “A Married Woman’’ as a

•■‘l'ital Pl»y- '

Madurae >u>anna the veteran

juti-to. who sang at the Coronalion of
Ihe late Queen Victoria. and y.iio train-

ed and introduced io London audiences

Ihe late Madame Patey. the world-fam-

ed contralto, says that Miss Ada Cro-s-

- b ;, v. ho visits the colonies shortly, is

the most perfect of Jiving contralto

Mr. Allan Hamilton, who has l»ceii
n ;<nagi’.ig Mr. Brough’s company during
a tour through < hina, expects to reach

Meiljournc next month. In a letter from
shanghai he announces his inten'ion <f

paying a visit to Air. L. 1. Ixihr, who Jias
given up business mauagenunt. and w’.-o

uov. resides .it Invcrloeh.

For pei-isting in smoking in the pit
of tie theatre in Napier rhe * the:* night
a i> .m was lined 5 without costs. The

Bench, while only i’dl’cting a lenient

p-i alty. -aid the public mi’.-1 be pro-
tectM. It was not fair to ladies pre-
sent and to others who objected to to-

ll. < o -moke. People who went to the

theatre ha.l a right to be protected.
’I here ’.vas too much annoyance of vari-

ous kinds al the theatre, and the Bench

\\a> determined to put it down.

Mi— May Beatty is so jtopular in the

ryes of the Piincws audiences that

ther. i-a general lament that the “For-

-1 me Teller” give* hrr -o poor a chance.
Fa elvoile watches for her. and hails her

nt last in the third act with great de-
monstrations of delight. "die pleases
the men with her gaiety, her plump fig-
ure. and her prettines®, she raptures
those of her own sex through her great,
taste in clothe®, her mischievous spirit
which never loses a certain refinement!
and delightful feet. If you have never

espied or particularly noted May
Beatty’s fret, do so when she next tri|H
on your board*, remarks a Melbourne
writer.

Many Aucklander* will be sorry that

the Gaiety Company at the City Hal! is

now one of the things that were. Sat-

urday night was the la*t occasion for

the genial P.R.D. to stand at the en-

trance door and watch the audience fil-

ing in to that place of amusement where

so many have whiled away a pleasant
hour. in future Mr Hix will confine

his attention to managing His Majesty’s
'"hcatre, of which he has secured a ten

rears' lease.

Sousa’s sixty musicians, who are com-

ing out to the colonies, are creating a

sensation ia London. They are consid-
ered the finest band of musicians in the

world, and have been twice commanded

to play before the King. The passage

money and expenses connected with

their travelling to and from Australia
will be considerably over £OO9O. They
will reach Australia in the latter part
of this year or the beginning of next

x ear.

A common trick with ladies who re-

move their headgear in the theatre is

to draw a feroeiotis-looking Gin hat pin
and jab their straw to the seat in

front. A smooth-faced person with

hair parted down the centre like the se-

cond son of the suburban butcher, and

wearing a "magpie suit, cried aloud in

I'.is agony in the stalls or Dunedin Prin-

cess on Saturday evening, when an in-

nocent lady in the seat behind him jab-
bed a big black hatpin through a small

"gem” hat into a broad black back, re-

marks "Otago Witness.”

Mr. Frank Thornton, who opened in

Sydnev at the t riterion in "< barley’s
Aunt” on Faster Saturday, describes
New Zealand as vastly overdone from a

theatrical standpoint. In his first week

in Wellington. a city of 45.UC0. he had

Madame Melba, Fitzgerald's circus, a

variety show and the Williamson Opera

t’ompany to contend with. Early in

March, within a radius of fifty miles,

there were five instinct dramatic com-

panies touring in the Taranaki districts.

Mark Hanibonrg, the famous pianist,
passed through Auckland by the Ventura

to take up hi* Australian tour with Mr.

John Lemnmne, the flautist. The com-

pany come to Now Zealand during the

coming winter, opening in Dnnedm on

•Tune 17. and concluding alwmt five weeks

later in Auckland. Besides Leminone,
who is a prime favourite with New Zea-

land audiences. Hambourg will lie sup-
ported by hi* brother Boris, a 'cellist of

repute, and Miss Mabel Bachelor, a so-

prano with a voice that i* said to b?

divine.

Having had a most profitable time in

Auckland, "The Worst Woman in Lon-

don” has reluctantly made way for "The

Mariners of England,” and. though I

would, be the la.-t to wish to speak dis-

respectfully of any lady half as popular
as - The Worst Woman,” it must be

confessed that "The Mariners” are more

to my taste. A* a fact, there are not

manv much better melodramas than Bu-

chanan's "Mariners of England.” and it is
exceedingly well staged. The iimane

<-osnie relief is an aggravation to the

llesli, and could and should be cut down

with a ruthless hand, for anything mote,

ho'ielcssly silly and wearisome has sel-

dom lieen sci-n even from the comic man.

who is almost always an unmitigated

be re. Father Christmas, in "The Silver

King.” is the onlv comic man to whom

•he writer cherishes any feeling* save

those of resentment.

The follow ing is an exact reprint of the

wording of a theatrical advertisement

which reaches u« all the way from Cairo:

"tine special night will take place in the

Egyptian Theatre, which i- situated at.

the lieginning of Abd-el-aziz-street. And

which will start showing some different

new and aueient plays on Friday, d

o’clock at night. <> February, and tl»*

said name Alsl-el-Ranof Hehny intends
to show the |>coplc all kinds of majecy
to lite iieople who would honour his

place. He also represent to sight a’l
that, new and ancient majecy and sports
which were used in Egyptian anciant

lsralight“ and Europeans, and all sorts

of congeraring and wonderfully plays

and gessing about ;lie idias and re-

turning the dead body ,o life which

shall of now don't surprise* every spec-

tator, and evcrvtliing ••a!. Ix» proved by
the sight seen.”

Ills MAJESTY'S SCH<M>L OF MUSIC.

The opening of the new music room

and concert hall in connection with Mr
J. F. Bennett’s His Majesty's School of

Musie, and the presentation of the sil-

ver medal and certificates of the Asso-

ciated Board of the R.A.M. and R.C.A:.,
London, won by the principal's pupiir
took place at His Majesty’s Arcade last

Thursday night. There was a very large
attendance. The concert halt

was greatly admired. It is

spa<-ious ami roomy, and will

accommodate a large number of

people. It has been mo-t elegantly fur-
nished and decorated. The windows are

covered with transparencies of notable

places, several large mirrors adorn the

walls, and the decorations are in perfect

ta*te. The’ seating accommodation con-

sists of luxurious swing theatre ehairs,
which are upholstered in crimson plush,
and there are four splendid pianos—one,
a Beeustein grand, for the use of the

students and the quartette classes. The

function was specially interesting, inas-

much as Aidlie. Dolores, the celebrated

French soprano, was present, and opened
the room and presented the medal and

certificates. The following were the

successful pupils:—Silver medal pre-

sented by the Associated Board, Loudon,
for second highest marks in New Zea-

land, Miss Helen A. Morris. Local Cen-
tre: Piano, Fourth Grade—Honours cer-

tificate, Miss 11. Morris; pass eertincate,
Miss 1. Bolous, Helen MeG. Huy, Birdie
.Morland. Local Centre: Theory of

Alusic—Miss Ella Afarv Browne. Aliss

Elsie E. C rowe. Mir ? Ellen M. Douglas,
Aliss Elsie Edmiston, Miss Leon Keyes,
Aliss U. Le Bailly, Aliss E. Macalistcr,
Aliss Daphne Slade, Aliss Alary R. Le

Baiily. Miss Jessie Le Bailly, Aliss Helen
Aforiis. Gold Aledal—Mr Bennett’s gold
medal was secured by Aliss Daphne
Slade. I.oeal School Examinations:

Piano and Theory—Higher Division: Dis-

tinction, pianoforte, 11. A. Alorris: pass,

pianoforte, E. G. Alacalister, E. M.

Crowe, D. AV. Slade. M. A. Gedde*, B. L.

Alorland. Al. E. Alorland. J. E. Alaxfield.

Lover Division: Distinction, pianoforte,
D. AV. Slade, E. Af. Browne; pass, piano-
forte, W. T. Chamber*. E, AV. Edmiston,

E. F. Crowe, E. J. Rvrie. E. M. Douglas,
11. A. Lamb. M. R. Le Bailly. J. S. Lc
Bailly. C. E. 1-e Bailiy, R. E. Mackenzie,
R. J. Best. Elementary Division: Pass,
pianoforte, R. M. Brewer. A. A. Gallery,
A. V. Chambers, J. Geddes, A. Geddes,
A. Seilev, 11. Seller, L. Selh v. Rudi-

ments of’Musie: Pa**, D. \V. Slade. E. W.
Edmiston, E. M. Crowe, 3.1. R. Le Bailly,
C. E. Le Bailly. J. S. Le Biillv. 11. A.

Morris, L. Chambers. A. A. Gallerv, E. G

Macalistcr, M. A. Geddes, R. B.st.

NEURALGIA.

Mben the long, hot, weary,- wearing
summer has thinned your blood and

shattered your nerves, the:i comes agonis-
ing Neuralgia with the first touch of
cold. Dr Williams’ Tink Pills actually
make new blood, soothe the nerves and

strengthen the spine—and that is why
they are the one sure, scientific cure for

Neuralgia.
"My nervous system was utterly un-

strung,” says Miss Gardner, of 74, Tuam-

street, Linwood. Christchurch. "The

poorness of my blood and general weak-

ness all tended to make me worse. Any
sudden noise startled me. At last, my
jangled nerves broke aown with the

shz-.-p, shooting pains of Neuralgia that

darted through my spine, head, legs and

arms. The agony down the backbone
was intense. It seemed as if long, red-
hot spikes were being continually passed
through and through my spinal column.
My’ limbs swelled terribly. I could
neither eat nor sleep. The want of

blood and rest brought on heart palpita-
tion, and the least little exertion sent

my heart hammering and beating until
it felt like the fluttering of wings inside

me. I continued faint and weak, and
suffered awful agonies from the Neu-
ralgia until I used Dr Williams’ Pink

Pills for Pale People. They are simply
a marvellous nerve tonic. The first box

started to enrich my blood and sooths

my nerves. Tire pain lessened greatly.
Two more boxes almest cured me. Fur-

ther perseverance with them made me

the strong, happy, healthy woman I am

to-day. Neuralgia never troubles me.

now—even in the coldest wind and wet

-—for my blood has been tborcmghly
enriched and my nerves completely
braced up by Dr Williams’ Pink Pills-

DR. WILLIAMS’ FINK PILLS.

EADY’S MUSIC WAREHOUSE A
112, Queen Street, Auckland,

HAS A CHEAP. LARGE, AXD VARIED SELECTION OF |rf
Music and Musical Instruments ik

ACCORD EONS—Gloria and Imperial, from 7s. 6d.
MOUTH-OROANS—Hohr.ers Is., Is. 6d., 25., 2s. 6d.upwards.
MANDOLINE3—ltalian, French, and American, from 80s. upwards. BKvfif
OUIT ARS—American and Spanish, 30*.. £2, etc.

VIOLINS from 12s. Cd., also by Celebrated Makers.

lIXC* JEROME THIBOUVILLE LAMY’B
BRASS BAND INSTRUMENTS.

Send for detailed Catalogues, and see what Bandmasters
M Ea >' their value and quality.

information regaiding Instruments and Formation
of Bands sent on application.

A. EADY CO.j 112
> Queen Street, Auckland

COLUMBIA DISC
AND TALKING MACHINES GENERALLY

r*. • are not a side line with
Disc Graphophones W

DEALEItS in the trade
in New Zealand.

COLUMBIA DISC RECORDS
outlast all others.

LATEST AND BEST.
in, i/k-lnst cat!of being scratchy

O a,|d mufllcfl. they are

K loud, smooth, and

CLEAR.

26 and 5/- each.

x - ra Loud Moulded
Cylinder Records,

26 each ; 25. - doz.

ILLUSTRATED CATALOGUE OF MACHINES AND LIST OF RECORDS POST FREE.

New Century Talking Machine Co.,
“THE TALKERIES" (next Opera House), WELLINGTON.
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The Camera in the North.

TOKATOKA, WAIROA RIVER.

MR. J. DENNING’S VINERY, WAIONGAPU.
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NGUNGURU
RIVER.

BARQUE
JESSIE

CRAIG,
LOADING

TIMBER,
DARGAVILLE.
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GIANT
KAURI
IN

FOREST
RESERVE,
KAIHU.

TRACK
IN

KAIHU
FOREST

RESERVE.
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PACKING PROVISIONS THROUGH THE BUSH.

SHIPBUILDING ON THE WAIROA.

WATERWAY OF THE NORTH—GOSFORD TOWING STOCK.

ARATAPU.

S HIPPING SHEEP, WAIROA RIVER.

TIMBER SHIP AT TE KOPURU.

AOROA, MITCHELSON & CO.’S TIMBER MILL.

CATTLE PUNT ON THE WAIROA RIVER.
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Naval Chilian Training Ship “General Banquedano.”

1. Captain Arturo Cuevas in his cabin. 2. A morning lesson. 3. Gun drill. 4. Splicing ropes, etc.
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Auckland
Horticultural
Society’s

Annual

Chrysanthemum
Show.

GENERAL
VIEW
OF

THE

EXHIBITS.

Walrond,
"Graphic"
photo.
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A FINE EXHIBIT OF MAIDEN-HAIR.

A FINE SHOW OF BLOOMS.

TWENTY-FOUR DISTINCT VARIETIES. Winner Mr Buckland

This also shows Prize Vase of Flowers.

CHAMPION TWELVE BLOOMS.

The Government Cruise to the Islands.

Schaef, Barony Studios, Wellington.

THE MAPOURIKA JUST BEFORE SHE LEFT THE PATENT SLIP, WELLINGTON, AFTER BEING ENTIRELY REPAINTED AND OVERHAULED.

Saturday, April 25, 1903.

Auckland Horticultural Society’s Annual Chrysanthemum Show
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A Day with a Fishing Excursion, Auckland Harbour.

A FISHING EXCURSION STEAMER.

NO BITES.

WHEN THE FISH ARE BITING.
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IN

FULL

SWING.

LITERARY
AND

NOT

PISCATORIAL
TASTES.

A

SHARK.
ONE
OF

THE

JOYS
OF

SCHNAPPER-FISHING.
Filing
a

barb
off
a

hook
in
a

man’s

finger.
RATHER

MIXED.

HER

FIRST
CATCH. CLEANING

FISH.

Saturday, April 25, 1903. THE NEW ZEALAND GRAPHIC. 1153

A

Day

with
a

Fishing
Excursion,

Auckland
Harbour.



Auckland Bowling Association’s Tournament.

AUCKLAND TEAM, WINNERS OF THE PENNANT MATCH.

Back Row.—Messrs. McCallum and Buttle.
Middle Row.—Messrs. Mennie. Elliot, James and Garland.
Front Row.—Messrs. Ledingham and Dingle (skips).

DEVONPORT TEAM, RUNNERS-UP IN THE PENNANT MATCH.

Back Row.—Messrs. Mitchell, Armstrong and Gardner.
Middle Row—Messrs D. Harvey, Miller, and McNeil.
Front Row.— Messrs. Ralfe and Eagleton (skips).

MR RANKIN (on the right) Winner of the Championship Singles, and

MR DINGWALL, Runner-up.

GENERAL VIEW OF THE PLAY.
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THE LATE CAPTAIN MORRIS, M.L.C. CAPT. GEORGE ROTT, OF THE NORTH GERMAN LLOYD STEAMER
RHEIN, AND HIS BRIDE, WHO WAS MISS ANNA M. SCHMIDT,

OF PONSONBY.

THE RECENT EASTER ENCAMPMENT AT AUCKLAND. THE CULINARY STAFF AT WORK.
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On the Upper Reaches of the Wanganui River.
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Views at the Wellington Tennis Tournament.

Schaef, Sarony Studios, Wellington.
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VIEW OF THE WELLINGTON COLLEGE LAWN. THE COLLEGE IN THE BACKGROUND.

Schaef, Sarony Studios, Wellington. THE COMMITTEE.

Saturday, April 25, 1903.

Views at the Wellington Tennis Tournament,
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Collegiate School Sports, Wanganui.

1. Spectators watching high jump. 2. Last round half-mile. 3. Start of 180yds. 4. Awaiting their events. 5. Spectators on the lawn.
6. Tug-of-war. 7. Near the end of half-mile handicap. 8. Start for 120yds.
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Easter Manoeuvres, Castor Oil Bay, Auckland.

THE MAXIM GUN IN ACTION.

GOING INTO ACTION.

AFTER THE FRAY—THE SURVIVORS.

HOMEWARD BOUND.

WANTED IN A HURRY.

BRINGING UP THE GUNS—TAKEN AT FULL GALEOP.

READY TO FIRE.

AWAITING THE ATTACK.
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Auckland’s
New

Technical
School.

A

COOKERY
DEMONSTRATION.

A

PRACTICAL
LESSON
IN

COOKERY.

GROUP
ON

THE

OPENING
DAY.

1162 THE NEW ZEALAND GRAPHIC. Saturday, April 25, 1903.



MACHINE CONSTRUCTION AND DRAWING.

THE PLUMBER’S WORKSHOP.

THE CARPENTERS’ SHOP.

Saturday, April 25, 1903. THE NEW ZEALAND GRAPHIC.
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Racing
at

Ellerslie,
Easter

Monday.

THE

LAWN'
AFTER
THE

BIG

RACE.

THE

PRESS
AND

STEWARDS’
STAND.

A

GENERAL
VIEW.

THE

GRANDSTAND
DURING
THE

HURDLE
RACE.
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TE ARO RAELWAY STATION, WELLINGTON.

Daroux, photo. PUBLIC LIBRARY AND TECHNICAL SCHOOL, WELLINGTON.
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How the Campanile Fell.

The fall of the Campanile must have

been an exciting thing to witness. The

huge mass crumbling to dust was like a

mountain- failing, T'neie Happened to

ue many witnesses, of the catastrophe,

and one of them, a young American giri

who was in Venice with her family, has

written a letter uescnbing the event. It

is printed in the “century Magazine -

Yes, she writes, we are all safe. The

tower did not fall on any of us, al-

though 1 suppose we shall never be

much nearer being buried alive than we

were this morning.
It came without any warning. We

were on our way to Cook’s, which is

on the side where the crack first ap-

peared. As we came down from the

hotel we noticed a small crowd of peo-

ple watching the tower, and some of

the piazza officials had placed a few

boards round it to keep people from

going up to it. But the crack was so

slight that we asked where it was.

We walked to the other side, under

the clock tower, and as we stood

there bricks began to fall out of the

crack, which grew wider every minute.

Some people thought that a corner of

the tower might go, but really there

was no one there excepting a few

tourists .and some shopkeepers*. We

went to Cook’s, where we could see if

anything did happen.
Cook’s men smiled at the Americans

who thought that a tower which had

seen a thousand years could fall without

any warning.
Suddenly, as we stood there, a huge

gap appeared from top to bottom, and

then the whole thing seemed to groan

and tremble, and, with apparently no

sound, sank in a heap where it stood.

Only the top poised itself a minute in

mid-air, tipped, and fell crashing to-

ward St. Mark’s. Pieces of the gilt
angel were picked up on the church

steps, otherwise nothing but a pile of

bricks and mortar was to be seen.

We all stood in the doorway, to<.

stunned to move. The people in the

square fled panic-stricken in every direc-
tion. Instantly what appeared to be a

solid wall of plaster and dirt rose from

the mass as high as the tower had been,
and spread in every direction.

I thought, of course, we should be

suffocated, and a rush followed for the

back of Cook’s office. Every one

screamed, “Shut the doors!” The dirt

entered like a thick fog, and you could

not distinguish your best friend. For-

tunately it cleared away in a minute

or so, enough to see where we were, and

all were safe. Not even one woman

fainted where we were, although the

Italians were calling on heaven and

earth.

The dust was about two inches deep;
huge stones lay against Cook’s building,
and I picked up a piece of one of the

bronze bells on the other side of the

square.
Venice went wild, of course, and the

square was soon crowded by hundreds
of mourning people. It was a very sad

sight. All shops closed at onee, and

everv one waited.

CROP OF RHUBARB, “THE PRIZETAKER,” grown by Mr. McFetridge, at Lake Takapuna. Many of the stalks measure

3ft in length, and from 10 to 12 inches in circumference. Some of the leaves measure from 8 to 9ft in circumference.

"WHILE THE BILLY BOILS.”

CREEK SCENE, OREWA.

Accessible to All.

It is no wonder the Emperor of Austria
is loved by his people. Here is a pretty
and democratic habit, to which Francis

Joseph adheres, amid all the changes of

fate and fortune: Twice a week he gives
audience to any of his subjects who may
wish to consult him. Their letters ask-

ing for an audience are sent in to the Em-

peror’s private secretary. Inquiries are

made as to the truth of their contents,
and, if satisfactory, tbe writer, of what-

ever rank he may happen to be, is grant-
ed an interview with his sovereign alone.

Nothing has done more to endear the

Emperor to his subjects than these in-

formal audiences, through which count-
less wrongs have been quickly redressed,
troubles smoothed away, assistance ren-

dered, as well as frank, soldierly advice,
and more distress relieved than the world

will ever hear of. There the patriarchal
system shows itself at its kindliest;
there the sorrow-stricken monarch can

for a while forget his griefs in the sym-

pathy they have taught him. Perhaps,
too, of all who come to him, and of all

the poor whose feet he has washed each

Eastertide, there is not one whom in his

heart of hearts this hapless, wearied man

does not enry.
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A

PICTURESQUE
NEW

ZEALAND
FARM.

MR.
F.
L.

WRIGHT'S
RECENTLY

IMPORTED
JERSEY

CATTLE.
1.

Mr.
F.

L.

Wright's
homestead.
“Raven
thorpe,”

Drury.
2.

"Cherry
Countess,”
“Jessie”
and

“Fury.”
3.

“Jessie.”
4.

“Cherry
Countess.”
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-A. DAIILY TK.E-A.T FOR EVERY HOUSEHOLD.

.

Guaranteed Full Weight of Tea.

ilW — EToa

■ i !
aa*=agg!!Sg%g| AUCKLAND.

All! TIGHT LEAD PACKET.

YOU EXPECT
Good Work from a Poor Machine, any more than you can from a poor workman.

Union Oil Engines i ,
E are BEST OF ALL —reliable, economical, cleanly, anil magnificently I

r
' *

E . designed. A cheap engine will cost you more for fuel, repairs, annoyance I! I
gMk and vexation in six months, than will run our engines for a lifetime. / ® \V X

UMmHBW Under patronage of the New Zealand Government, who employ “Unions”
T

f
«

from 9."> li.p. to .‘IJ li.p., both marine and stationary
'" r

J PRINCIPAL AGENTS—

I JMSrI W. A. RYAN &• Co., Ltd.,
2_.._. ..Ji ENGINEERS, AUCKLAND.

We have large works and skilled workmen, and we are engineers who know our work—not only machinery importers.
Estimates given on all classes of work.

The New Hat Pins • .CT/) » S/m Greenstone Pendants

Solid Silver Initials, Steel Pins. Any
letter you wish 2s. each. 9-ct. Gold

Bs. 6d 10s 6d 12s 6d
Hat Pins—the latest idea.—4s. 6d.,

7s. 6d., 10s. 6d.

Tts not what y° u P®y for a thlnR- but what y°" Ret for what y°u bay- Par flrklrl IWiifiP rlvoinc
little for an Inferior article, and its cheapness Is not economy. You will find quality UUKI 1U Uli vDdlllb
and good value in every item in this list. Our business is the biggest of its kind in

_. Australasia. Our prices are uniformly the lowest. The reason for the one explains .■ j r i i
~

.
Paorl Qoftltv Pine the other.

There 1S a dressy gracefulness about
* Cell 1 OdlClj r 1110 these long chains which is likely to

Our New Catalogue will Interest you. Post Free to any address. , ,
°

, , . . . .
< ,

keep them fashionable for years. 9-ct.
For Fastening Lace: 9-ct. Gold set Gold 50s 55s fin= 80s • 15-ct

with Fine Pearls, any initial, Qdd, £
-

£

"

£ ’ 10g '
78 6d each

Pie Servers
OO< w:<H>Ca>O<><>CBXO»XKBXKKBXK»

, ... ~.
.

... , „ ~ ti. , — .

Form a useful and uncommon Wedding Present. w e have two Patterns. illQlTi JYTI M RIHO’C!
One is a Shell Design, very pretty Price: Two Pieces in Silk Velvet CliiiUllll lllllgo

Ladies Gold Watches Hned case, 325. 6d.
. ...

uuuivo vavrxK •• uivnvij Every Lady likes to possess one or

Keyless, Fine Jewelled Movements,

strong 1 4 ct. Gold Cases Accurate ~

, »» . than here Our £5 ss. Half Hoop is

timekeepers. £l2 10s. vlOlCl rieariS a beauty. We can show them to

, ,
,

, , .
, ,

. you at £8 10s.. £l2 10s., £lB 10s.
A WATCH FOR A LIFETIME. We have dozens of new and pretty designs to select from. Plain and

to £llO
engraved, set with Pearls, Turquoises, 5s 6d ,7s 6d., Bs. 6d. Amethyst

Hearts nio,,htcd 9ct Gold
>

15s - fd ’ 17s- 6d
-’

22s - 6d -

Smelling Salls Bottles
Go|d Curb 8

Peart Brooches

Cut Glass, not an imitation, cut stop- . G the chaiming designs you can

pets solid silver mounts ss. 6d Without a doubt the most satisfactory Bangle made. Always looks well, imagine are here, and the prices you

’ -

«i in ci t rr ’ and stands more usage than the ordinary stiff Bangle. Ours have Gold will find, as usual, satisfactory. Prices
s> * > s. i . o

Padlocks and Safety Chains 9-ct. Gold, 305., 405., 505., 70s. 15-ct. Gold from 10s. 6d. to £2O.

00<h>000<hX».000.00.0.0.<h>'>OChXh>Q ’ ’ 00<HXw>0<XHX>00<yX>CHXH>OONX8Xi

Glove Button Hooks Hairpin Boxes

Made of Solid Silver, strong and just OpeCldCie LdStS Nothing causes so much worry as not

the size to fit into the purse. Your Chatelaine Spectacle Cases for hanging at the waist. No searching all over
a'’' e to Put your hand on Hair-

rhuirp of hilf-a dozen designs the house to find your Specs if you buy one of these. Finest quality Silver E!n? . they are wanted. Our
choice of half a dozen designs, y F J} 4 Hairpin Boxes faat Cufc Glagg

'«■ 6d. each.
14s 6d , 15g 6(J 21g

,
25g

Silver Tops, 4s. 6d., 55., 13s. 6d.
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Personal Paragraphs.
Mr Ttegear, Secretary to the Labour

Department, is in Auckland.
Miss Hamlin, of Napier, has been stay-

ing in Woodville and the Wairarapa.
Mr Evan O'Keefe has been spending

the holidays at Rotorua.

Dr. McGavin has taken up his resi-
dence in Oimondville, Hawke's Bay.

Mrs Fenwicke, of Hawke’s Bay, is

still in Auckland.

Mrs. Rankin Brown (Wellington) is
shortly going on a trip Home.

Miss Haise (Wellington) is visiting
Mrs Redman (Picton) for a week or so.

Mrs Marriott Watson (Ashburton)
has oeen visiting Wellington.

Mr George Norbury (Wellington) is
on a visit to England via Sydney.

The Hon. J. A. Tole arrived from the

South by the Takapuna on Saiurlay.
Dr. and Mrs Moir were passengers

for New Plymouth by the Takapuna on

Saturday.
Miss Goodall (Kaikoura) has arrived

in Picton to stay for a time with her

grandmother, Mrs Dunean.
Mr Thos. Wells has consented to no-

mination for the position of Mayor of
Cambridge.

Dr.'John Munro, some t ime surgeon at

the Timaru Hospital, died at his home
in Thurso, Scotland, in February last.

Mr W. Whitelaw, of Daimevirke, left

Auckland after a short visit for South
by the Takapuna.

Mr. A. R. Young, Government veter-

inary surgeon, has been stationed at

Taranaki, in succession to Mr. Edgar.
Mr John Manchester, Mayor of Wai-

mate, will stand for re-election to oilice
for next term.

Canon D. J. Garland, formerly of

Perth, has been appointed Archdeacon

of Townsville (Q.).
Viscount. Boringdon, who has been

“doing” the Hot Lakes, proceeded t >
Fiji by the Moura.

Miss Lily McCray is shortly going for

a stay of six months to Vancouver,
where her family reside.

Mr and. Mrs George Rhodes (Meadow-
bank) are staying at Elmwood, I’apa-
nui, for a few weeks.

Mrs and Miss Chotmoiideley (Christ-
church) are spending a short time at

Governor’s Bay.
Mr and Mrs Alex.Aitken and Miss L.

McCray spent a few days at Rotorua

during the Easter holidays.
Mr T. Y. Wardrop has returned to

Christchurch, via Australia, after a six

months’ trip to England.
Mrs. Thompson, of Fiji, is on a visit to

her mother, Mrs. Clapeoti, Ponsonby,
Auckland.

Miss Dorothy Loughnan (Opawa) has

gone on a visit to relations in Welling-
ton.

Mr MeDuff Boyd, formerly of Wel-
lington, has been elected conductor of
the Hastings Orchestral Society.

Mrs Harding (Wellington) has Intel,’
moved into her new- house in Hobson-
strect.

Mrs Mcßae (Rangitikii) is staying
in Wellington with her daughter, Mr,

Bob Levin.

The wedding of Mr Murdoch Ander-

son and Miss Nettie Seott took place
at Cambridge last week.

Rev. McWilliams and Miss McWilliams,
of Otaki, are visiting Auckland and Ro-

torua.

Mrs. Parsons, who has been visiting her

daughter, Mrs. Paton, of New Plymouth,
has returned to her home in Ponsonby.

Dr. arid Mrs. McDowell, who have been
visiting New Plymouth, have returned to

Auckland.

Mas Coates and Miss Ethel Coates
(Hamilton), who have been on a visit to

Australia, returned by the Zealandia.

The Rev. Robert'shawe, who was to

have left Danneyirko last week on a

three months’ holiday, was unfortunate-
ly prevented by an attack of influenza.

Mr Millington has returned from an

enjoyable trip to the Old Country, and

is staying in Picton with his daughter.
Mrs E. Kenny. ' Z’’ ■.

Mr A. E. Ridley, the well-known
Christ church cricketer, is about io visit
London to seek medical advice, as lie

has been in ill-health for some months.

Air and Mrs Howard (Blenheim) were

in Pieton for Easter with Airs Speed,
also Mr ami Mrs John Duncan, “The
Grove,” Queen Charlotte Sound.

Air and Mrs Aluir Douglas are stav-

ing for a few months at Dvvonport.
Their son. Mr W. Douglas, has just left

for Hawke’s Bay.

ATesars. Edward Tregear, John Young
anti Thomas Mason have been re-appoint-
ed governors of the New Zealand Insti-

tute by proclamation in the •‘Gazette.”

The Hon. C. J. Aloran, of West Aus-

tralia, accompanied the Premier on part
of his tour <»f the South, lie is now in

Christchurch.

Air 11. C. Seymour and Aliases E. ami

J. Seymour (Tynteslield) were in Pic-
ton for Easter, staving with Mrs Rid-

dell.

Airs Gilruth and her children, Afiss
Dora Heywood, Airs and Aiiss Ethel
Aliles, of Wellington, were amoiijg the
lou i c’s j>a>sciigers.

Air. P. Hislop, private secretary to Sir

Joseph Ward, is lying seriously ill at In-

vercargill. At latest advices he was re-

covering slowly.

Air and Mrs Kettle and Miss Kettle

(Napier) have b?en staying in Welling
ton. Miss Kettle is leaving shortly oil

a visit to England.

Amongst recent marriages at Danne-

virke wetv those of Air. J. Xeagle to Miss

Winifred Dickerson, of Auckland, and Air.

.1. 11. Woods to Miss A. Wells, of the
Thames.

Writing of the death of Air. Alfred
Boardman, which occurred in Auckland

a few days ago, the ‘’Post” says: “Th*

deceased was one of the smartest under-

writers in the colony.”

Sir Edward and Lady Osborne-Gibb-,
of Wellington, were passengers to Auck-

land by the Ngapuhi on Saturday. Mrs.

and Miss Aloss Davis also returned to

Auckland by the same boat.

Mrs 11. Horton accompanied Mr and

Airs Jamison (her sister) to Rotorua,
last week, where they made a stay of

a few days, having a very pleasant
visit.

Air Arthur Heather and Aiiss Beat-

rice Heather met with some bad wea-

ther on their trip Home. Aiiss Heather

may be, absent from Auckland for two

Mr Norman Banks is going to be

Master of the Waikato Hounds this

season, Air Wynn Brown acting as

.Deputy-Alastvr and Air Cam Selby as

Huntsman.

Air Alister Clark, of Alelbourne, ami

Air A. Hanna, of Auckland, are each

going to present for competition a tro-

phy of the value of £5 to the Auck-

land Golf Club.

Mrs IL Brett, Lake Takapuna, who

has been on an extended visit to Airs

Walcot Wood and Mrs P. Wood, at

Christchurch, returned to Auckland by
the Alararoa last Sunday.

Airs Bamford, of Renmera, and son,

arc at present staying in Cambridge, for

the latter's health. Air Bamford is

having his holidays, and will spend part
of the time with them in the Waikato.

Air and Mrs T. Cowlishaw and Air and

Airs W. Cowlishaw (Christchurch) loft

for the North by the Westralia last,
week, ami after Wellington will visit

Nelson and Blenheim.

Mr Lumsden, a Toronto (Canada)
journalist, is making a visit to the col-

ony, and is studying our conciliation,
arbitration and agricultural laws mean-

while.

Lord Alfred Milner, Governor of

Orange River and Transvaal, ami High
Commissioner in South Africa, will
spend August and September in Eng-
land.

Dr. Poinare is attending a mooting of

the leading chiefs at Rotorua, to discuss
the best ways of improving the working

of the Maori Councils and Maori Land

and Administration Acts.

Alisses N. Jenkins, G. Ruso, J. Tain-

blyn ami Aiarion Wilson (Wellington)
are to be eoiigratulateil on having obtain-
ed the ALA. degree at the recent New

Zealand University examinations.

One of the otlicers of the Chilian wai*-

ship recently in port rejoices in the

thoroughly Irish name of Percy O’Reilly,
but lie is Chilian born and .’;red. He

has Irish ancestry, however.

The first lieutenant, doctor ami B‘X

midshipmen from the Chilian warship.
General Baquedano paid a brief \isit to

Rotorua while the ship was in Auck-
land.

Air S. R. Neale, one of the Elinga-
mite sufferers, was a passenger for Syd-
ney last week by the Westralia. lie

has been ordered to take a rest by his
medical adviser.

Aiiss Rigg and her sister, who have

just severed their connection with the
choir of St. Joseph's R.C. Church, Wel-

lington, were each presented with a gold
and jewelled cross, and a gold locket.

Recent callers at the Tourist Depart-
ment include Alessrs J. B. Beale, Palmer-

ston North, B. W. White, Wellington,
R. E. Green, Christchurch, N.

Alelbourne, Rev. IL Sateward, Fiji.
Air J. R. Blair, of the Wellington Edu-

cation Board, has reconsidered bis inten-
tion of resigning, ami will ctmlimic Io

art until his term of membership ex-

pires.

Air. Justice Cooper arrived in Auck-
land by the Takapuna on Saturday, and

the same boat also returned Surgeon-
Captain King, who has been at Welling-

ton at a meeting of the Imperial Pen-

sions Board.

Air. G. L. Shaw, who has bee n attache !
to the press of tin? colony for some years,
ami latterly was occasionally on the stall’

of the “Otago Daily Times.’’ died on Sal

urday at ih<* Dunedin Hospital, death
being caused by pneumonia.

The Revs. R. O. Cook, jun., and Cyril
Bavin (son of the president of the New

South Wales Methodist (‘out’ercnce)
have joined the staff of Alrfhodmt mis-

sionaries in Fiji.
Dr. Chadwick, a recent arrival from

England, has bought the practice of Dr.

.Murray-Aynsley at. Ekt tahuna. Ihe lat-

te?* having decided to re-visit, the Ohl

Country.
Airs Brown (Wellington) is leaving

shortly on a visit to h< r relations in

England. During her absence Professor

Brown is going into lodgings, having
let the house to Air and Airs Arthur

Buchanan.

Lieutenant P. H. Mohr, conductor of

the Southland Battalion Band, was otter-

ed the couductorship of both the Pal

merston N«.eth ami Timaru Brass Bauds.

Il<‘ was formerly conductor of the latter

band.
The members of the Gisborne post

and telegraph staff presented a hand-
some book and pencil case to Mr A. «h

Robb, who is being transferred to Par

roa. Air Dale, acting-chief postmaster,
made the presentation.

Air. G. T. Robinson, second engineer of

the Takapuna, has been presented by the

oflicers w j.'i a silver-mounted oak salad

how l on t lie occasion of his marriage. Mr.

11. Swan, of the Omaporo, is relieving Mr.

Robinson, v ho is ashore* on holiday h*av<\

The Countess of Ranfurly, the Ladies

Constance and Eileen Knox ami suite
spent a week in Wellington on their

way from Timaru to Auckland, where

they will reside until the* session begins
in June. < .

The well-known tciiqieram e lecturer

Miss Florence Baigarnie. has lifeii ii

Wellington, staying with the* Chief Jiw

tice and Lady Stout. Miss Baigarnie
who is enthusiastic in her praise s of Nev

Zealand scenery, is on her way to Japan
via Australia, and thence to England.

Mr F. 11. Irwin has resigned the* posi-
tion of secretary to tin* Dunedin Stock

Exchange, ami intends Io settle in Wel-
lington. Before he left Dunedin the*
members of the Exchange pr< > nted him

f DISTRESSING HEADACHES |
■ arisingfrombiliousness,liver troubles, *
jfand disordered stomach are easily a

M and pleasantly dispelled by using the*
■ genuine and original California Syrup f
gof Figs. Whilst acting soothingly and £
> gently upon the liver, kidneys, and S

J bowels, {

CALIFORNIA®-
SYRUP OF HGS

{NATURE'S
PLEASANT LAXATIVE, »

is at the same time so agreeable to »

the palate that children enjoy it and

take it with permanent beneficial S
effects. It is an ideal family medicine. X

< Manufactured only by the California S
. Fig Syrup Co. Each package of the ®

i genuine bears their name and trade S

mark. Of Chemists everywhere, B

' . is. ijd. and is. gd. £

All sufferers I
SHOULD WRITE TO|

HERR RASSMUSSEN,!
The World-Famed Danish Herbalist, S
"

Discoverer and Proprietor of the Eg
AEfaline Herbal Remedies |

which are kotknown io have failed in g
a single case when given a fair trial. H

SpecialRemedies for onch Complaint. gg
BTRICTEST FRIVACX ASSURED.

Remedies Postedin Plain Cover. S
Write atonce fur Free Book nnd Advice, a

Herr Kagsmussen, g
91, Lambton Quay. WELLINGTON, g

Fre© to the

Ruptured
Dr. W. S. Rice, the Well Known London
Specialist. Sends a Tria! of his Famous

Method Free to All.

There are people who have been torturing
themselves for years with trusses. It is hoped
their attention will be drawn to Dr. Rice’s free

MR. ROBERT COOPER.

offer. An elderly and retired Gentleman. Mr.
Robert Cooper, LittleFlumstead. Norwich, Eng.,
is oneofthe hundredsattractedto this generous

announcement,and as a result he is now com-
pletely curedof a badrupture. Althoughss years
of age he had the courageanddeterminationto

try this new andnovel method, andnowhe lives
in peacte, contentmentand security. Mr. Cooper
looks back tothe old days ofcrude methods, and

in comparison hails the wonderful method of
Dr. Rice as a marvellous God-sendtothe present

By all means write atonce to Dr.
W. S. Rice tDept 118),8 and 0, Stonecutter Street,
London, Eng., and he will send you a free trial
of his remarkable homecure forrupture. There
is nopain, danger, operationor loss of time ; by
starting now youwillbe sound andwell by early
spring.

RELENTLESS FOES.

pUEUMATISM and Sciatica arc ruthless,
relentless foes, and revel in the writh-

Ings of their victims. The torment and tor-

ture of uric acid poisoning is known only
to those who suffer. But why suffer?

••Rhcuino Conquers Rheumatism.” Rheumo

strikes at the root of the ailment, and

strikes quickly. Rhcuino kills the pain, re

moves all swelling, and eliminates the uric

acid and phosphatic sediments. There Is

nothing to compare with Rhcuino for

prompt results and permanent benefit.

Rheumo is pleasant to take, and is free

from all harmful ingredients. Stocked In

Auckland by 11. King, Chemist, Queen st.;

J. M. Jefferson, Chemist, ' Qucen-st. and

Upper Symonds-st.; J. W. Robinson, Chem-

ist, Parnell; Graves Aiekln, Chemist,
Queens t.; and sold by all Chemists and

stores at 2/6 and 4/6 per bottle.

Clarke’s World-Famed Blood Mixture.—‘The
most searching Blood Cleanser that science and
medical skill have brought to light.’ Sufferers
fromScrofula, Scurvy. Kcrcma, Bad Legs, Skin
and Blood Diseases, Pimples and Sores of any
kind are solicited to give it a trial to test its

value. Thousands or wonderful cures have
been effected by it. Bottles 2s 9d each, sold

everywhere. Beware ef wortideeo imitation*

and substitutes.

HOW TO CURE AILMENTS OF CATTLE AND SHEEP.
- Eminent Veterinary Surgeons and Stock Breeders (see

book on bottle) strongly recommend Condy’S Fluid as a

Certain Cure for Hoove, Rinderpest, Foul in the Foot,
Wounds in Cattle, and Scab, Foot Rot, Fly in Sheep.

Condy’S Fluid is sold everywhereby all Chemistsand Stores.

All substitutes arc inferior. Insist on having “Condy’S Fluid."
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with a case of pipes and a silver match-
box.

Mr J. B. Heywood, secretary to the

Treasury, has been in bad health for

Some time past, and has gone to Ro-

torua for a month’s respite from official-
dom. Meanwhile Colonel Coilins as-

sistant secretary of the Department, will
act in his stead.

The Rev. F. W. Boreham, who short-

ly leaves on a trip Home, was present-
ed by tiie scholars of the Mosgicl

Baptist Church Sunday-school
With a Mosgiel rug, and by the Young
Menis Bible Class with a carrying strap
.With which to convey the rug.

Among the visitors at Sumner for the

Easter holidays were Mr and Mrs A. E.
G. Rhodes, Mrs and Miss Gebbie (Geb-
bie’s Valley). Mrs (Dr.) Jennings, Mr
and Mrs T. Garrard, Mr and Mrs J. H.
Marriner. Mr and Mrs Button, and Mr

and Mrs 1 i irschberg.
The Rev. W. C. Oliver (Wellington)

has just returned from a deer-stalking
expedition in the country surrounding
Dake Hawea, where he succeeded in

securing four heads. Mr Oliver was ac-

companied by Mr E. Hardcastle, of

Christchurch.

Mr. R. D. Webster (son of Mr. M. M.
Webster, of Nelson) and Mr. W. Stan-
ford (son of Mr. W. L. Stanford, S.M.)
have been transferred from Hongkong to

the Eastern Extension Company’s station

at Cocos Island. Both were trained at

Cable Bav.

Mr. T. M. Wilford, M.H.R., has con-

sulted Dr. Butlin, a celebrated London

specialist, and has been positively as-

sured that he is suffering, not from can-

cer, as was feared, but from a papilloma-
tous growth on his tongue, which can be
absolutely cured in a few months.

_\/s Goring, wife of Colonel Goring,
of Whangarei, was a passenger by the
Mararoa for Sydney, where she will be

the guest of the Governor-General (Lord

Tennyson). She is accompanied by Mr

Michael Tennyson, who is a relative of

the Governor-General.
Airs Birch, widow of the late Rev W.

L. Birch, D.D., who occupied the pulpit
of the Auckland Tabernacle for some

time, recently returned to England by
the Gothic. Before her departure from

Christchurch a social was tendered to

Mrs Bireh.

Mr P. Goyen, chief inspector of schools
for the Otago province, is at present in

Auckland inquiring into our technical
education. On Monday Mr Goyen, ac-

companied by Messrs E. K. Mulgan and

E. C. Purdie, inspectors of schools, in-

spected the principal school buildings
of the city and the new Onehunga
sei:o<d.

Miss Maggie Gordon, M.A., of Marton,
and Miss M. Sinclair, of Kaitangata, have

been accepted for work in the Canton
mission field. They are now at Dunedin,
and will probably leave for Canton in

Sep' amber. The Foreign Missions Com-
mittee of the Presbyterian Church of

New Zealand lias authorised Air. McNeur
to purchase a mission site at Canton up
to £5OO in cost.

Recent Australian visitors to Welling-
ton include: Frank 11. Turton, G. W.
Walker (Sydney), Mrs. M. Gibbs, Mrs. H.
Davies (Melbourne), R. and W. Bills

(Melbourne), Allan Baxter (Melbourne),
Misses Powell, Morton, Bruce, Strang, D.

and E. Haise (St. Vincent’s College, Syd-
ney).

The Rev 11. H. Roget, who has been in

charge of the Coromandel Methodist
Church for the past year, is leaving the

charge in order to pursue a course of

study, covering two years. Last Sunday
■week the town band turned out as a

mark of their esteem for him. The Rev.
Mr Perry succeeds him at Coromandel.

The Rev. T Eykyn was presented with
a book of New Zealand views by the

members of the Dcvonport Holy Trinity
Bunday-school. The volume contained

the signatures of every Sunday-school
teacher, and in making the presentation
their spokesman expressed the liveliest
appreciation of Mr. Eykyn’s good work.

Air Kinsella, Government Dairy Com-
missioner, has definitely accepted the of-
fer made him by the Transvaal authori-
ties. The question of his successor is

now under consideration by the Govern-

ment, who, it is thought, will likely fill
the vacancy with an expert outside New
Zealand.

Air and Airs Marcus Wm. Oldham, of
Victoria, left Auckland on Monday by
the s.s. Mararoa. Air Oldham is a mem-

ber of the Victorian Fisheries Board,
and honorarp Inspector of Fisheries for

Victoria. During his stay in Auckland he
Interviewed Air Rose, who is in charge
of fisheries here, and expressed himself

highly pleased with the New Zealand
fisheries regulations.

Bishop Nevill has received a letter
from Archdeacon Robinson, written from
off Fremantle, stating that he and Mrs

Robinson had both been very unwell in
Sydney, but now that they were out at

sea they were much better. The death

of their daughter (Airs Kempthorne)
affected the Archdeacon and his wife
so much that they had to take a holi-
day at onee.

Mr J. Harrison, Reuter’s agent at

Wellington, has left on a nine months’
holiday trip to England, where he will

join Mrs Harrison, who has been there
for nearly a year. Air George E. Baker,
of the London and Australian staffs of

Reuter’s, will take his place meanwhile.
Air and Airs Harrison will probably be

back in Wellington by next Christmas.

Among the passengers by the outward
’Frisco steamer was Air J. P. Hallahan,

manager of the Robinson Gold Alim s,

Kaiiowna. Westralia He is on his way
to England on a business visit, and will
be. aw: y about four months. He has been

paying his friends in the South a short

visit, and after his visit will return via

Africa to 1 ho Western State.

Mr F. D. Luekie and Miss Luckie, of

Hastings, are leaving there for a nine

months’ trip to England, and travel by
the Tongariro, which leaves Wellington
on the 23rd inst. Air C. L. Alack rsey
lias purchased All- Luckie’s property at-

Hastings. It is hoped tha the latte.'
will return from England much benefitel
in health by the change.

Aldlle. Antonia Dolores was, as usual,
the guest of Air. and Airs. Prouse,
“Crieklewood,” during her stay in Wel-

lington. The gifted singer, who is a

great favourite in private life as well as

on the concert platform, celebrated a

birthday while in Wellington, and was

the recipient of many beautiful presents
and hosts of congratulations.

The Rev. Harry Braddock has finish
ed his missionary work in Blenheim and

surrounding district for the present
and opened on April 4th in Picton. He

thinks of settling down in Picton for a

time, as that would be a central posi-
tion for his work, which will keep him

some time in New Zealand. His family
are at present in Melbourne.

The Rev. E. Al. Cowie, of St. Alark’s,
Te Aroha, has just handed over to the

Auckland Institute 48 volumes, many of

them standard works on the history of

India. These were the property of the
late Primate, who, on his deathbed, ex-

pressed the wish that they should be

handed over to the library of the Auck-
land Institute.

Air Felix McGuire, who has not as

yet quite recovered from an attack of

pleurisy, which he suffered from during
last session, which was not improved
by attending to the House while ill in

order to secure the passage of the

Hawera Hospital and other bills, has,
under medical advice, taken a trip to
Rotorua for a few’ weeks.

Air. Charles G. Henty, a son of the late

novelist, G. A. Henty, is paying a visit to

the colony, in the hope of recovering his

health, which a long course of South Af-
rican service has affected seriously. He

was, it will perhaps be remembered, men-

tioned twice in despatcb.es for valorous
conduct in command of a volunteer

troop.
Alessrs B. W. Black and G. A. Keys,

of the Dunedin telegraph staff, have re-

signed their positions to accept more

lucrative employment in the Pacific
Cable Company’s service. Both are

first-class operators, and will be miss-
ed from the Dunedin staff. Before leav-

ing, the opportunity was taken to pres-
ent them with suitable tokens of the
esteem in which they were held.

Air Richard Hudson, senior, the well-
known miller of Dunedin, whose death
was recently telegraphed, was locally
much respected. In the latter end of
last year the firm of which he was the
head sustained a heavy loss by a huge
fire, which consumed the whole biscuit
factory. The flour mill was untouched,
but the loss was so severe that it prob-
ably affected his health and hastened
his end.

Alias Athelberta Edwards (Welling-
ton) has succeeded in passing the second

section of her examination for Alaster
of Laws. Aliases Alice Griffiths, Zoe
Poynter, Alary Hales, Maud Rigg, Isabel
Robertson, Mabel Sea ger, Fanny Smith
and Frances Walter have passed the first

section of the B.A. degree, and blisses

Eva Lynch, Elizabeth Toonan and Bessie
Whyte were successful in passing the sec-

ond section.

Mr Perry, Assistant Librarian at the

Wellington Free Public Library, has just
been appointed to the charge of the
Newtown Library, his place being taken

by Mr Baillie. Air Baggett is in charge
of the Lending Library, with the assist-
ance of Mr Langford. Air Perry was

formerly connected with the old Athen-

aeum Library, which was closed ten

years ago. Since then he has been on

the staff of the Wellington Public Lib-
rary from its opening.

The many friends of Mr Jonathan

Winks will regret to learn that he is

at present confined to his house. For
some time past Mr Winks has been suf-
fering from a cataract in his eyes. The
trouble reached such an acute stage on

Saturday week that Air Winks’ medical

adviser decided to perform an operation.
This has since been done, and there is

every reason to believe will prove suc-

cessful, but in the meantime Air Winks
will be a prisoner indoors for about

three weeks.

Air. Morris Fox, who is leaving Welling-
ton on a holiday trip to England via
America, is actuary to the Government
Life Insurance Department, and while in

New York hewill represent the New Zea-

land Government at the International
Congress of Actuaries held in that city.
Air. Fox is vice-president of the New
Zealand Insurance Institute, and is a

very well-known figure in literary, musi-
cal and dramatic circles in Wellington.
Airs. Morris Fox accompanies her hus-
band on his tour.

The retirement of Aliss Whitelaw from
the position of reader to the Jobbing
Department of the “Star” and “Graphic,”
due to a breakdown in her health,
which her many friends will deeply de-

plore, was made the occasion of a very
pleasing ceremony. Aliss Whitelaw was

the recipient from her co-workers, and

those with whom her position in the es-

tablishment brought her in contact, of

a presentation in evidence of goodwill
and regret at parting. The mementoes

which Miss Whitelaw received of the
years in the offices are a handsome green
morocco dressing case, and glove box to
match.

The following is the Grand
Hotel visitors’ list for the past
week: —From London —Air F. Vert,
Air R. Boyle, Air D. H. Wood,
Mr T. Whitehead, Air W. B. Chamber-
lin, Miss Chamberlin, Air A. Karnviebe',
Air and Airs Courage, Air Weiner. Fra n

Lancaster (England)—Air and Airs
le’Aloore and child. From Edinburgh
(Scotland) —Air and Airs Jas. R. Ber-
tram. From Bridge-of-Allan (Scotland)
-—Dr. Haldane, Alias Haldane. From
Glasgow—Aliss Walker. From Belfast
(Ireland)—Air and Airs E. Robinson,

Alaster S. G. Robinson. From France —

Aldlle. Antonia Dolores, Aldlle. Zelee
Vandour. From Stockholm — Air W.
Boker. From Ceylon — Air J. Russell.
From South Africa—Air Harry Beyers.
From Fiji—Mr and Airs R. Al. Booth,
maid and family, Airs Leslie
Brown. From Los Angeles, Cali-

fornia — Dr. Vera Alullier From
New York—Dr. and Mrs L. Warren, Mr

and Airs R. Morse, Air J. R. Hartpence.
From Perth—Air R. Cecil Clifton, Dr.

and Airs Kenny. From Alelbourne—Air
Francis Stringer, Airs and Aliss Tucker.

From Sydney—Air W. AL Macfarlane,
Aliss Al. A. Terry, Aliss Al. C. Terry.
From Newstead (N.S.W.)—Air and Airs
Duncan Anderson. From Dunedin—Miss
J. Shand, Aliss Al. Shand, Air J. Nevin
Tait, Air Clarance Newell. From

Christchurch—Mr Cecil Perry, Air F. J.
Brothers. From Wellington—Mr Justice
Cooper, Aliss Cooper, Air and Airs Hasel-
den, Air R. F. Blair, Air and Airs T. G.
McCarthy, Aliss Fitzsimmons, Air W.
A. Fitzherbert, Aliases Fitzherbert, Air

G. Zedlito, Air H. J. Christopher. From
Waikato—Capt. and Airs Worsp, Aliss
Worsp, Aliss Blanche Worsp, Mr Mc-
Vitie. From Gisborne—Miss A. Barker,
Aliss B. A. Barker, Aliss L. Barker, Aliss
F. V. Barker, Air H. W. Barker, Air
Phillip E. Kenway. From Napier—Mr
Thos. J. Stuart, Air J. W. Dobbie.
From Thames—Dr. Lapraik. From
Karangahake—Air D. C. Thompson.

There was a very large number of visi-
tors at the Star Hotel last week, among
whom were: From Sydney, Aliss Hurley,
Aliss Robinson, Mr. and Airs. Esdaile and
family, F. L. Atkinson, Air. Arnot, Mr.
and Airs. Parkins, Air. and Airs. F. Cast-

uer, Air. L. E. Castuer, Miss L. Scott,

Aliss E. Scott, Mr. Alexander Sharp,
Aliss Amy Sharp, Air. and Airs. Davis,
Aliss Lees, Air. and Airs. Leslie Richard-
son, J. L. Adamson, Alartin Hewes, Mr.
and Airs. Fox, Aliss Fox, Aliss A. Pearson,
Air. and Mrs. Wilson; from Alelbourne,
Mr. and Airs. Atkinson, H. Blair, N. Nam-

ble, E. Goodhire, L. Kettlewell, C. Alarsh,
Air. and Mrs. P. Hunter, Aliss Bates, R. L.

Bennet, Mr. and Airs. Birch; from Wel-
lington, W. Honey, George Gore, A. A.
Bethune, Air. Black, Air. Rothschild, Air.

and Airs. H. Craike, Air. Neilson, Air. and
Mrs. Hinder, Alaster Hinder and nurse,
J. L. Alackay, Air. and Airs. P. Kelly, Miss
Alartin; from Western Australia, Air. and
Mrs. G. Barrend Leanard; from Adelaide,
Mr. and Afrs. Arthur, Aliss Alurphy; from
Brisbane, Air. and Mrs. Evans, Aliss S.
Evans; from Dunedin, Afrs. Beston, Air.
Goyn, Air. Shepherd, Air. and Airs. Bailie,
Aliss J. Bailie, Air. and Afrs. Tanner, J.

S. Stewart; from New Plymouth, AL

Mills, Air. and Afrs. Champion, Air. and

Airs. L. Jones; from Whangarei, Air. and
Airs. Alurdoeh, Mr. and Airs. Hastie, Aliss
AfePhail; from Hawera, Air. and Afrs. D.
Sullivan; from Christchurch, Air. E. Scott,
L. Scott, junr., Air. and Mrs. Davison,
Aliss Lena Davison, Aliss Parker, Air.

Blakey; from London, Air. and Airs.
Alack Jost, Air. and Airs. Litmbe, Aliss

Collard, lion. E. Walker, Harry E. Brad-

ley, Aliss Elsie Bradley; from Edinburgh,
L. E. McKenzie, Air. and Afrs. AlcCaush;
from Dublin, Arthur I. Inglis, Rev. H.
Hannigan; from Colombo, Frank E. Rey-
nolds; from Manila, Air. and Airs. L.
Royle, J. F. Rennie; from Naples, Air.
and Airs. Warren, L. Williams, Miss Pat-

terson; from Levien, Air. and Airs. Mc-
Donald, Aliss McDonald; from United
States, J. R. Alott, E. J. Withyeombe,
E. C. Jenkins, R. Turner, John L.
Brown, Aliss Ada Brown, Airs. W. E.

Dyer; from Hamburg, F. Grussner, Erie
Brand, Dr. Schwarzbach, Henri Schultz;
from Canada, Air. and Airs. James Far-

ran, Lewis Dalston, Air. and Airs. Wat-
son, Aliss Tibbs.

HYDATIDS.

Vitadatio

AGAIN VICTORIOUS.

Nestdn Cottage, Verdon-st.,

Williamstown, 29/4/02

MR S. A. PALMER.

Dear Sir.—

I have very great pleasure in

testifying to the value of VITADATIO as

a cure for Hydatids. I was taken very ill

towards the end of 1899, and found it neces-

sary to call in a doctor. He, after care-

fully examining me, stated that I had

Hydatids, gave me medicines to take which

did me no good, and at last I was inform-

ed that I would have to undergo an op-

eration before I could be cured. This I

was determined not to do, and decided to

Immediately commence a course of VITA-

DATIO. I commenced it in January, 1900,

and I was then in a very weak and low

state, and I am pleased to say that after

taking it “regularly” for three months I

was completely cured. I have not taken any

VITADATIO or other medicine since Ap-

ril of the same year. I hope that others,

by reading this testimonial, may profit by
it, and I would say to those who take it

that after taking eight bottles I felt much

worse than I had done for some time and

was advised to discontinue its use and

again call in a doctor, but I am thankful
that I continued with the VITADATIO,
and found after the eighth bottle, each one

I took made me feel much better, until

at last I was completely cured. You may,
make use of this letter if you wish.

Yours truly,
CATHARINE F. SMITH.

Witness—

WM. D. MORGAN, 132, Osborne-st., Wil-
liamstown

CHAS. G. CARTER, Speight-st., Newport

A. OSMOND, 18, Nelson Rd., Newport

For further particulars,

.
S. A. PALMER,

WAREHOUSE, WATERLOO QUAY
WELLINGTON.

Or, 350, QUEEN-ST., AUCKLAND.
Correspondence invited. Write for

Testimonials.

The price of Medicine Is 5/6 and 3/6 per
bottle
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FLORAL DESIGNS.

nVTISS UNA WATERS, Floral Artist, is

,

now prepared to receive and execute
orders for Floral Wreaths, Bouquets,
Shower Posies, Ladies’ Dress and Hair
Sprays, etc., etc. All Floral Work De-

signed in the Most Graceful Style. Choic-
est Flowers, Ferns, and Foliage used.
Telephone Orders Received. QUEEN-
STREET, opposite H.M. Theatre (front
portion of Mr Chas. Hesketh’s premises).

ENGAGEMENTS.

The engagement is announced of
Miss Lily Harper, only daughter of Mr

George Harper (Christchurch) and Dr.

Loughnan, of Victoria.
The engagement is announced of Miss

Thorpe, youngest daughter of the Vicar

of Sumner, and Mr Brown, electrical
engineer, of Christchurch.

Mr H. E. Vaile’s marriage to Miss
Ethel Mahon takes place at St. Mark’s

Church, Remuera, next Wednesday at

three o’clock.

ORANGE BLOSSOMS

SKEATES—CUNNINGHAM.

A quiet but pretty wedding was cele-
brated on Easter Monday, when Miss
Hilda Cunningham was married to Mr

Philip J. Skeates. The ceremony was

performed by the Rev. R. Eerguson, in

the Presbyterian Church, Devonport,
which had been prettily decorated for
the occasion by the girl friends cf the

bride. The service was attended by a

large number of people.
The bride, who was given away by

her step-father, was tastefully attired

in a handsome dress of white flowered
Bilk, richly trimmed with lace and

orange blossoms; the bodice had a

transparent yoke, long sleeves, trans-

parent from the elbow. The skirt was

trained and finished with numerous

flounces and insertion. The toilette

Was completed with a wreath of orange
blossom and handsome veil and beau-

tiful shower bouquet, the gift of the

bridegroom. The bride was attended

by four bridesmaids, the Misses Ivy and
Edith Cunningham (sisters of the bride)
and two little dots, Ethel and Dorothy
Skeates (nieces of the bridegroom); the

former wore very pretty dresses of
cream crepeline with silk spots, trim-

med with silk lace, large black chiffon
hats and pink roses. Each carried a

bouquet. The two little ones were at-

tired in white muslin, with insertion
and yellow slips, white silk hats and

yellow ribbon, and carried baskets of

yellow and white flowers. The bride-

groom was attended by Mr Edward

Skeates (best man) and Mr Reginald
Cunningham (groomsman).

After the ceremony the guests drove
to the residence of the bride’s parents,
"Opawa,” Calliope-road, where after-

noon tea was served. Mrs Cunningham
(mother of the bride) was gowned in a

handsome black silk dress, black velvet
hat and roses; Mrs Skeates (mother of
the bridegroom), magnilcent black silk

dress, black bonnet, relieved with pink;
Mrs Ernest Skeates, pretty white silk
blouse, black skirt, black hat; Mrs
Frank Wall, black Russian cloth,
silk strapping, black velvet hat, black
and white wings; Mrs Fred Cunninghom
(Wanganui), blue spot zebeline tailor-

made costume, blue velvet hat, birds and
lace; Mrs L. Cunningham, black voile
skirt, blue silk blouse, trimmed with

ecru insertion, large black hat with fea-

thers and pink roses; Mrs Rothwell,
grey costume and hat to match; Mrs E.

Brookes, cream tucked dress, black hat,
relieved with wiute uird; Miss Bailey,
black dress with handsome collarette;
Miss Robertson, black voile; Miss E.

Alexander, black dress, black hat; Miss
Wright, tussore silk blouse, blue skirt,
black hat; Miss Vena Cunningham,
cream corduroy, trimmed with Maltese
lace, cream silk hat; Miss Kathleen
McKinley, cream silk with accordion-

pleated hat.

The happy couple left for Kawau,
where the honeymoon is to be spent,
the bride’s travelling dre s being of a

lovely shade of violet cloth with folds
and Russian coat, black chiffon hat and
feathers. Some very handsome presents
were received.

On the previous Wednesday a social
was held in the Foresters’ Hall, Devon-
port, when Mrs Cunningham entertain-
ed a few friends in honour of the ap-
proaching wedding. Dancing and music

were indulged in, and vocal items were

rendered by Mrs Lees and Cunningham,
Miss Robertson, and Messrs Lees,
Skeates (2), ana Smith. The dance
music was supplied by Misses Bell, Cun-
ningham and Gribbin and Mr Cunning-
ham. About 60 guests were present, and

all spent a pleasant evening.

TURLEY—WALKER.

A pretty wedding was celebrated last

week in the Methodist Church, Tuakau,
the bride being Miss Blanche E. Walker,
daughter of an old Tuakau resident, and

the bridegroom Mr Walter George Tur-

ley, second son of Mr S. Turley, Tuakau.
The bride, tastefully attired in white
silk, trimmed with Parisian lace, was

given away by her father. She carried
a beautiful shower bouquet. The brides-

maids, Miss Mabel Walker (sister of

the bride) and Miss Louise Turley (sis-
ter of the bridegroom), wore handsome

W’hite silk dresses with black velvet pic-
ture hats. They carried bouquets and
wore gold brooches, the gift of the

brijdegrooni. Mr Alfred Walker, bro-
ther of the bride, acted as best man, and
Mr Thomas Turley as groomsman.
After the ceremony, at which the Rev.

C. Penney officiated, a reception was

held at the residence of the bride’s
father, and during the afternoon the

happy couple left for Rotorua. There
were a number of presents, and the

bride was the recipient of a gold bangle
from the bridegroom. On Sunday the
members of the Tuakau Methodist
Church presented Mr Turley with a

family Bible as a mark of esteem and

appreciation of his services as organist.

TOY—GREENWOOD.

Mr W. H. Toy, of the “New Zealand
Herald” staff, was married last week to

Miss Greenwood, of Mt. RoskiU. Mr

Toy’s colleagues made him a handsome

presentation on the eve of his marriage,
and the members of the Amateur

Sports Club presented him with a purse
of sovereigns. Mr Toy is the secretary
of that body, and his popularity in ath-
letic circles was fully demonstrated by
the cordial feeling which marked the
occasion when he received the club’s
gift from the hands of Mr C. Z. Clayton
the other evening in the club-room. The

honeymoon was spent at Te Aroha. Mr
and Mrs Toy intend to reside at Ml.
Roskill.

LAWRENCE—CARR.

A very daintily-arranged wedding was

celebrated at the picturesque little
ehurch of St. Andrew’s, Epsom, Auck-
land, on Wednesday, April 15, when Mr.

Archie Bernard Lawrence, second son of
Mr. Effingham Lawrence, Launceston,
Tasmania, was married to Miss Nora Is-

lay Kathleen Carr, eldest daughter of the
late Mr. John Carr, solicitor, Rood Lane,
London, and niece of Mr. R. Anthony
Carr, of Epsom, Auckland. The church
was prettily decorated for the occasion
by the many friends of the bride, and the
ceremony took place under an arch of
flowers, from which depended a beautiful
wedding bell. The Rev. F. W. Walker, of
Ellerslie, officiated. The bride, who was

given away by her uncle, looked most

charming in a stylish travelling gown of
cream serge, trimmed with handsome
white silk applique, and a white felt hot
with ostrich feathers. She carried a

lovely bouquet of white roses, jasmine
and ferns. Miss Airini Carr (cousin of
the bride) and Miss Gwendoline Law-
rence (sister of the bridegroom) attend-
ed the bride, and were attired in soft
white silk frocks, with Paris lace inser-
tion and picture hnts. The bridegroom
presented each with handsome pearl
brooches. The bridal couple and the

guests, who were confined to the rela-
tives of the family, were subsequently
entertained at afternoon tea at “Mal-
ware,” the residence of the bride's uncle.
After being showered with congratula-
tions and good wishes Mr. and Mis. Law-

rence departed amid showers of rice and

rose leaves on their honeymoon tour,
prior to taking up their residence at Dan-
nevirke, Hawke’s Bay. The bride wore a

stylish going-away tailor-made costume

of blue cloth, and a fawn hat. Mrs. R. A.

Carr (aunt of the bride) wore a pale blue

cloth, with touches of dark green velvet

and lace, and a dark green velvet hat.

The bride and bridegroom were the re

cipients of many handsome presents.

LEACH—KITCHENER.

A numerous congregation assembled

at the Wesleyan Church, Ormondville,
on Wednesday last, for the marriage of

Mr C. Leach, son of Mr C. R. Leach, of

Ormondville, with Miss E. Kitchener,
daughter of Mr Kitchener, of Danne-

virke. The chancel was beautifully de-

corated with tall palms and a profusion
of w’hite flowers. The bridal party met
at the ehurch soon after two o’clock,
and although the township is not a

large one, the sacred building was well
filled. The bride came with her eldest

brother, Mr F. Kitchener, who, in the

absence of her father, gave her away.
The bride looked charming in a travell-
ing dress of dark brown material, trim-

med with velvet of the same hue; and
she wore a hat to match. Behiml the

bride came Miss S. Kitchener and Miss

Lucy Leach, the former the sister of

the bride and the latter sister of the

bridegroom. Mr Ernest Leach, brother
of the bridegroom, acted as best man.

The Rev. J. Oliver officiated. Mr and
Mrs Leach, sen., invited numerous

guests for the wedding, and thither the

bridal party repaired after the cere-

mony. The house was tastefully decor-
ated with flowers, and the wedding pre-
sents were laid out for the inspection
of visitors. Between four and five
o’clock the newly-wedded couple start-
ed for their honeymoon.

NEAG LE—DICKENSON.
On the 14th inst., at St. Mary’s

Church, Meanee, was solemnised the
marriage of Mr James Neagle, of Tara-
dale, with Miss Winifred Dickenson, only
daughter of Mrs Dickenson, of Auck-
land. The bride, who was led to the
altar by Mr R. Neagle, sen., wore a

dress of white silk, trimmed with lace,
orange flowers in her hair, and a tulle
veil. She was attended by two brides-
maids, attired in white muslin, trim-

med with yellow silk and velvet, and
black hats ornamented with feathers
and velvet. The bridegroom presented
them with gold brooches. The bride-
groom’s best man was Mr D. Neagle.
The Rev. Father Cahill, of Carterton,
performed the nuptial rite. After the

ceremony the bridegroom’s mother wel-
comed the wedding party at her house,
and subsequently the bride and bride-

groom left for the South.

JOHNSTON—BALFOUR.

The marriage of Mr Charles E. John-
ston, of Napier, with Miss Katherine

Muriel Balfour, daughter of Mr T. W.
Balfour, of Cobden-road, Napier, was

celebrated recently at St. Augustine's
Church, Napier. The bride wore a plain
dark blue travelling dress, and her only
bridesmaid was Miss Nellie Cotterill.
The bridegroom was accompanied by
Mr J. Parker, as best man. The Rev.
C. G. Tuke performed the ceremony,
and the bride was given away by her

father. After the ceremony Mr and
Mrs Johnston left for Wanganui and
Taupo, where the honeymoon will be

spent. Amongst the numerous wed-

ding present were a purse of sovereigns,
presented by Mr Goudy, on behalf of
the firm and employees of Messrs Dal-
gety and Co., and also a hot water
kettle with spirit lamp and stand
from the bridegroom’s Spit friends. On
the day of the wedding flags were fly-
ing at the Spit in honour of the event.

BOCKETT—ORR.

At the residence of the bride’s par-
ents, Papakura, the marriage was cele-

brated on the 13th inst., between Ar-
thur Bockett, son of Captain Daniel
Bockett, of Waikato, and Marion Jane,
eldest daughter of John Orr, Esq., of
Papakura. The bride was attired in
rich white silk, trimmed with lace, and
haring n train; she wore a tulle veil
and wreath of orange blossoms; and
her bouquet was the gift of the bride-

groom. The two bridesmaids were

dressed in pale blue muslin, trimmed

with white silk and lace; they carried
baskets of roses and ferns; they wore

large hats trimmed with white. The

bride was given away by her father,
and the marriage ceremony was per-

formed by the Rev. C. Connor. Mr

Oswald Orr acted as best man. After
the reception Mr and Mi’s A. Bockett

left for Wanganui. The bride's travell-
ing dress was of blue cloth, trimmed
with satin, and blue velvet hat with
feathers.

FITZGERALD—ISAACSON.

A quiet wedding took place on the

13th inst., at AH Saints’ Church, Pal-
merston—that of the Rev. Otho Fitz-
Gerald, Vicar of Waipiro, Poverty Bay,
and Miss Isaacson, sister of the Rev. C.

H. Isaacson, Vicar of Bulls. The clergy
who officiated were the Rev. C. C. Har-

per and the Rev. C. H. Isaacson. A re-

ception was held at the Empire Hotel
after the ceremony, and largely attend-

ed. Mr and Mrs FitzGerald then left
for their home at Waipiro.

WELLINGTON WEDDINGS.

Easter weddings at Wellington in-

cluded those of Mr Charles Haslam to
Miss Ada Phillips, daughter of the Rev.

J. Phillips, at Manaia; Mr James G.
Brechin, of Konini, Pahiatua, to Miss

Lillian M. Brown, daughter of Mr J.
Brown, Scarborough; Mr Alec Ander-
son, of the Wellington Woollen Com-

pany, and captain of the Petone Row-
ing Chib, to Miss Jennie Sylva, daugh-
ter of Mr and Mrs Sylva, Nelson-street,
Petone, Wellington; Mr Thomas Cole,
Karori, Wellington, to Miss Laura Lam-

berton Hall, daughter of Mr E. J. Hall,
Tinakori-road, Wellington; Mr Arnold
Atkinson, son of the late Sir Harry

£F L .r.2, BA L WORK.
U-. THE FINEST DISPLAY IN THE
CITY.—WEDDING BOUQUETS A SPE-
CIALTY-WREATHS, CROSSES, AND
FLORAL EMBLEMS OF EVERY DE-
SCRIPTION AT MODERATE PRICES —

CUT FLOWERS DAILY — POT PLANTS
ON HlRE.—Porcelain Wreaths, Crosses,
and other Designs in Glass Shades. — G. J.
MACKAY, Florist and Seedsman, 105,
QUEEN-ST.. 4 doors from Union Bank.

Telephone 344

By Special Appointment.

MRS WEBSTER,
FLORAL ARTIST,

Bridal Shower Bouquets, Sprays, Button-
holes, and Floral Baskets most artistically
arranged. Choice Cut Flowers always on
band. Funeral Emblems In great variety of

designs always on band.

OPPOSITE RAILWAY STATION,
89, QUEEN-ST., AUCKLAND.

Complete
Treatment

FOR EVERY

Humour
JUTICURA SOAP, to cleanse the skia

Of cruets and scales, and soften theth tok-
ened cuticle; CUTICURA OINTMENT,
to instantly allay itching, inflamma-

tion, and irritation, and sootheand heal;
end CUTICURA RESOLVENT PILLS,
to ccol and cleanse the blood. ASINGLE

SET of these great skin curatives 1b

often sufficient to cure the most tortur-

ing, disfiguring, itching, burning, bleed-

ing, crusted, scaly, and pimply skin,
scalp, and blood humours, with loss ofl

hair, when all else fails.

MILLIONS USE
Cuticura Soat, assisted by Cuticura

Ointment, for preserving, purifying, ard

beautifying the skin* for cleansing the scalp
Of crusts, scales, and dandruff, and the stop,
ping of falling hair, for softening, whitening,
and soothing red, rough, and sore hands, for

baby rashes, itchlngs, and chafings, and for

all the purposes of tho toilet, bath, and nurs-

ery. MillionsofWomen useCuticura Soat

In the form o£ baths forannoying Irritations,

inflammations, and excoriations, or too free

or offensive perspiration, la the form of

washes for ulcerative weaknesses, and for

many sanative, antiseptic purposes which

readily suggest themselves to women.

Cuttcura Resolvent Pills (Chocolate
Coated) aroa new, tasteless, odourless, eco

Domical substitute for the celebrated liquid
Cuticura Resolvent, as well as for all

Other blood purifiers and humour cures. In

•crew-cap vials, contalulng 60 doses.

Bold throughout the world. AuafraUaa Depot i B.
Tow rr A Co., Sydney. British Depott ST M, Charter-

houte Hq .London. French Depot: 5 Rue de la I'alE,
Paris. roniiDiye a-mjbCuxm. Coar., bole Proper
Bwivu, U. •• A.
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!Atkiii«<>n, to Mies Hurst hou«c, Welling-
ton; Mr Douglas Jackson, Wellington,
to Miss Elsie J). Slater, Wellington; Mr

G. A. Lloyd, Sydney, to -Miss Elorenee
Gardner, daughter of Mr Robert Gard-
ner, of the Government Valuation De-

partment at Palmerston North; Mr
Olaf Lund, Marima, to Miss Isabella M.
Osborn, 'Wellington; and of the Rev.
Otho FitzGerald, son of the late Mr J.
E. Fitz Gerald, C.M.G., Auditor-General
and Controller in New Zealand, to Miss

Gertrude Catharine Isaacson, second

daughter of the Rev. S. Isaacson,
Rector of Ilardingham, Norfolk, Eng-
land.

MOIR—HAVEN.

A very pretty wedding was celebrated
at. the residence of the bride's parents,
Curran-street, Ponsonby, on Thursday,
April Kith, when Miss Laura K. Haven,
eldest daughter of Mr J. E. Haven, was

married to Dr. Peter Moir, of Wairoa,
Hawke's Bay, and eldest son of Dr.
James Moir, of Syinonds-street. Tire
ceremony took place in the drawing-
room, which was artistically deeorated
■with Howers arid greenery, the Rev. Dr.
Egan being the officiating clergyman.
The bride, who was given away by her

father, looked charming in her wedding
robe, a,nd was attended by her sister,
Miss May Haven, and Miss Lillie. Moir,
sister of the bridegroom. Mr Wm.

Anderson, of Stratford, acted as best
man. After the ceremony the guests
were entertained at a wedding repast,
when the usual toasts were, proposed
end duly honoured. The presents were

numerous and beautiful. After being
showered with congratulations and good
wishes the happy couple departed for

the South, where the honeymoon will
be spent.

COATES—OBERLIN-BROWN.

St. Barnabas’ Chur-b, Mt. Eden,
Auckland, was the centre of much in-
terest on Wednesday, April 15, the oc-

casion being the marriage of Miss Ruby
Oberlin-Brown, eldest daughter of Mr.
11. Oberlin-Brown, " I'e Rawhiti,” Mt.

Eden, to Mr William Martin Felton
Coates, eldest son of Dr. Coates. “East

Dean.” Mt. Eden. The church was

tastefully decorated, a special feature

being a large floral bell, under which
symbol the. bridal couple stood during
f he service. The ceremony was per-
formed by the Rev. E. .1. McFarland.

The bride, who was given away by her

father, looked very winsome in a soft,

white Indian embroidered silk. The

overskirt, which was tucked, and point-
ed in front and short at the back, fell

over a deep silk embroidered flounce.

The bridal veil was arranged in soft
folds over a spray of orange blossoms,
and she earned a lovely bouquet of

gilder roses and maidenhair fern. The

bridegroom’s gift to the bride was a

gold hoop ring set with pearls. The

youthful maid of honour was Miss Dor-

is Oberlin-Brown (sister of the bride),
who was daintily froeked in soft white

silk, and a Dutch bonnet covered with
lace, and she carried a spray bouquet.
Mr Eustace Coates officiated as best
man, and Master Bertie Oberlin-Brown
as groomsman. After the ceremony
the Rev. E. J. McFarland presented

the bride with the Prayer-book from
which the marriage service had been
read. Many beautiful presents were

received, and after congratulations and

a wedding breakfast the happy couple
left amid a shower of rice for their

honeymoon trip, the bride wearing a

navy tailor-made costume and a corn-

flower blue tucked chiffon hat. Mr and

Mrs Coates will take up their residence
at Roto-o-rangi, Waikato. Mrs Ober-
lin-Brown (mother of the bride) wore a

navy' silk, with Maltese laee; Mrs

Coates was in a rich black Ottoman
silk skirt and heliotrope silk blouse,
with Iloniton laee, and a black hat with

touches of pink; Mrs Batty, cream sat-

in blouse, black voile skirt, beaver hat

with cream; Miss Oberlin-Brown, vio-
let skirt and silk blouse, black and

white hat; Mrs Leslie Mair, navy serge
tailor-made costume, bright blue hat

with grey birds; Miss Mabel Coates,
brown costume, brown felt hat; Mrs

Heather, handsome black silk, black hat

with ostrich feathers; Mrs Riee, black
silk voile, with Paris laee insertion;
Mrs Chatfield, black silk, black toque;
Airs W. Heather, blue coat and skirt,
black hat, with green silk and black
pansies; Misses Rice (3), Browne, Mr

and Mrs Marriner, Mr and Mis A. Ait-

kin, "and Mrs and the Misses Dawson.

A SPOTLESS COMPLEXION.

—
IMAN is al-

6 ways syin-
7 bolieal of

' the most

beautiful in

Nature. One

Jof tlie most

impor ,t a n t

factors in

w o man’s
beauty’ is her

complex! o n.

Many are

the adver-

tised skin
beautifi er s

and artificial

aids to com-

plexion, but

no amount
of powders,
creams or

other washes will permanently
create a good complexion. When
a woman has sallow skin, with
pimples, blackheads, or other disfigura-
tions, it is a sure sign that her internal
organs are not performing their proper
functions. It is necessary to expel all
waste matter from the system, in order

to keep the various duets or. passages
in good working order. If this is. not
done they become clogged, and evil ef-
fects are sure to follow. A general de-

rangement of the system, which is ap-
parent in the face, gives a bad colour
to the skin, bringing blotches and other
disfigurements to the surface. Bile

■Beans, by reason of their mild action,
are eminently! adapted to correct these

faults in women. They eject all waste

matter in a gentle yet beneficial man-

ner, and restore the system to a good
healthy state. When this is done, a

dear, healthy’ skin soon follows, and

tha t charm of a New Zealand girl,
•a good complexion, becomes once more

her glory.

Society Gossip
AUCKLAND.

Dear Bee, April 21.

The second day of the

AUCKLAND RACING CLUB'S

MEETING

took place on Easter Monday in the

presence of a very large number of

spectators. A few light showers fell in

the early’ morning, but it cleared up
fine and eleai' during the day, with a

pleasant cool breeze blowing. Mrs Wil-

liamson, blaek; Miss Williamson, peri-
winkle blue frieze, black hat; Miss Wal-

ler, pretty cicl blue surah, with infini-

tesimal tuckings, blaek picture hat

with plumes; Mrs Jervis, black silk,

with bands of ecru lace, blaek toque
with ecru laee; Mrs Colbeek, navy

serge, with ecru lace collarette, white

felt hat; Miss Thorne-George, brown

silk, black hat; Miss F. Thorne-George,

grey voile, black hat with plumes; Mrs

Duthie, navy gown, pink felt hat with

brighter pink roses; Misses Thompson

(2), white silks, hats with flowers; Mrs

Ranson, very pretty greeny blue silk,

with bands of lace insertion, white chif-

fon ruffle, white toque with carna-

tions; Miss Decamp (America), black,
with ecru lace, black hat; Mrs H. 0.

Nolan, black silk gown, pink poppy,
boa, toque en suite; Miss Percival,
black voile, blue collarette veiled in

fawn lace, black hat; Miss Edith Per-
cival, blaek; Mrs Lawrence, white tuck-

ed silk, blaek hat, with plumes; Mrs

Wright, grey voile, black hat; Miss

Davis, navy serge, black hat; Misses

Moss-Davis (2), white silks, black hats;
Mrs E. Moss-Davis, oyster grey voile,
black hat with plumes; Mrs Dennis

O’Rorke, navy zibeline, trimmed with

embroidery, pouched bodice, with a col-
lar and small vest of white silk, and

was ornamented with embroidery, ■ black
toque; Mrs Alister Clarke (Melbourne),

bright navy bengaline, with Lincoln

green embroidery, and motifs of velvet
cord passementerie, navy toque; Mrs

Ralph, blaek silk, with ecru lace, black

hat; Miss Gorrie, blaek skirt, white
blouse, black toque, with white bird

and wing; Miss Gwen Gorrie, black
skirt, white blouse, red toque; Mrs
Thomas Morrin, rich black silk, with

pouched bodice, a collar and small vest
of white silk, the costume was orna-

mented with embroidery, blaek toque,
with blue; Miss Morrin, eiel blue crepe
de chine, white hat with blue bows;
Miss —. Morrin, white silk, coequelicot
red hat, with scarlet berries; Mrs Bag-

ley, black; Miss Basley, periwinkle blue,
with ecru laee, hat swathed with Nil

green; and her sister, mauve frieze,
blaek hat, with plumes; Mrs Edmiston,
lavender frieze, with tuckings on hips,
lavender toque en suite; Mrs Rosen-

thral, navy costume, white let in at

neck, white felt hat with wings; Mrs
Fred. Yonge, blue dress, with fawn

laee; Miss Yonge, white skirt, blue
flowered blouse, red hat with scarlet

berries; Mrs Alison, agapanthus blue
figured foulard, blaek hat; Miss Alison,

sky blue voile, with fawn laee, black
hat; Mrs Worsp, black silk, with eeru

lace, blaek toque en suite; Miss Worsp,
tobacco brown cloth costume, the skirt
was a flounced one, blaek hat; and her

sister wore a pink crepe de chine,
with eeru lace, pink hat with flowers,
and black velvet streamers; Miss Mc-
Laughlin, fawn voile, with bands of

ecru laee, black velvet hat, with wreath
of mauve flowers; Mrs Kelly, black

skirt, white tucked silk blouse, white
hat; Mrs Crowe, electriquc blue cos-

tume; Miss Horne, fawn coat and skirt,
with strappings, heliotrope vest, helio-
trope flowers in toque; Mrs Dillingham,
navy- serge, black toque; Mrs E, Firth,

white surah, with tuckings, black hat,
enveloped with gossamer veil; Mrs

Benjamin, blaek silk, eeru laee vest,
blaek hat; Mrs Ernest Bloomfield, terra
frieze eoat and skirt, black hat with
ostrich plumes; Mrs Lucas Bloomfield,
blaek gown, hat with red flowers; Mrs

William Bloomfield, white silk, with

tuckings and ruckings, large black" vel-

vet hat; Mrs Duncan Clerk, Royal blue,
ornamented with chenille embroidery,
the skirt was tucked, cream hat with
flowers; Mrs Buller, blaek; Miss Buller,

navy; Mrs Owen, blaek; Mrs Owen (Mt.
Eden), periwinkle blue serge, eream hat;
Mrs. Hanley, fawn costume, toque en

suite; Miss Heywood, fawn tussore silk,
hat with scarlet; Miss Walnutt, grey
bolero and skirt; and her sister wore a

rosewood frieze, blaek hat; Mrs. Keogh,
maize silk, veiled in blaek net, black
toque with yellow flowers; Miss Keogh,
blue and white plaid, brown hat; Mrs.

Martyn, black silk; Miss Nichol, blaek
skirt, white blouse, black hat with red
flowers; Mrs. McCormick, brown dress
and hat; Mrs. Nichol, brown skirt, velvet

blouse, brown toque; Miss Gorrie, rich

roy’al blue bengaline, ornamented with
pattes of embroidery, pouched vest, black
toque with black sequins; Mrs. Cohen,
wood violet serge, large blaek velvet hat,
with feathers; Miss White, white cos-

tume, black hat, with flowers; Miss Gil-

lies, brown figured tweed, with pouched
body, bl own toque; Miss Hay, grey voile,
with white silk let in at the neck, white
hat; Mrs. McCloud, royal blue bengaline,
blaek hat; Miss Chapman, grey costume,
blaek velvet bolero, blaek hat; and her

sister wore a terracotta costume; an-

other sister wore periwinkle blue; Miss
Dawson, the latest style of coat and

skirt in grey frieze, flat blaek hat with
purple velvet; Miss M. Dawson, black
voile, with white let in at neck, blaek
hat with yellow roses; Miss Lennox,
white silk, blaek hat; Mrs. Hamlin, blaek
brocade, with mauve vest, mauve floral
toque; Mrs. A. P. Wilson, black frieze,
with white toque with green; Miss Bush,
black skirt, white blouse, white hat: Mrs.
Bodie, cream silk, with tuckings, cream

toque with violets; Miss Binney, black

gown, with white embroidery, blaek hat;
and her sister wore royal blue; Mrs.

Coyle, black silk; Mrs. Shannan, pale
grey voile, with ecru laee, grey hat, with
ostrich plumes en suite; Mrs. W. Ralph,
fawn; Mrs. Dufaur, black, with eeru

lace, blaek hat; Mrs. Markham, white

serge, black toque; Mrs. Stuart Reid,
mourning costume; Miss Firth, white

silk, green toque; Mrs. Hume, navy serge,
cream sailor hat with black; Miss Davy,
navy; Mrs. Farrell, black; Miss Kemp-
thorne, periwinkle blue gown, blaek hat;
and her sister wore a white Indian silk,
blaek hat; Mrs. Jones, blaek; Miss

Jones, fawn silk; Mrs. Ching, blaek silk,
white let in at neck, black toque with
white lace; Miss Ching, white Liberty,
silk, with wide tucks all round, white
hat with one mass of flowers; Mrs. R.
Lusk, black silk, with twine-coloured
lace, pink straw hat with blaek velvet;
Miss Ring, black silk costume, black hat;
Mrs. Keesing, grey tweed, trimmed with
black, black hat; Mrs. Clement Dixon

(South Africa), black voile, black hat;
Mrs. Passmore, fawn skirt, pink figured
silk blouse, white hat with bird wings;
Mrs. Thompson (Fiji), black silk, with
twine-coloured lace, blaek hat; Mrs.

Sutherland (Fiji), black skirt, rich grey

cloth coat, ornamented with applications
of blaek velvet, rich motifs of grey silk

cord passementerie, with hanging tassels

down both fronts, black hat; Mrs. Geo.
Dunnett. rich blaek silk, handsomely or-

namented with eeru embroidery, black

toque swathed with the same; Miss Diin-
nett, grey voile, with tuckings and ecru

laee, black hat; Mrs. A. Bull, pretty pink
crepou.-jvith ecru lace, blaek picture hat;
Mrs. IL Bull wore hydrangea erepon, with
ecru laee and tuckings, black hat with os-

trich plumes; Miss D. Stevenson, forget-

Though the cost of making

finest toilet soaps has nearly

doubled, the retail price, ingre=

dients, and superior quality of

Vinolia Soap remain unchanged.

For the complexion.

The toreador company,
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FLOWERS AND CONFECTIONERY
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Scotland; and J. D. Webster. Auckland.
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Oldest, Safest, and only Reliable Remedy

for all Ladles’ Ailments extant.

Quickly correct all Irregularities, remove

an Obstructions, and Relieve the Distress-

ing Symptoms so prevalent with the So.
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me-not blue erepon, with ecru lace, black
hat; Miss Cotter, blaek trained skirt,
whiteblouse, black bolero, green felt hat;
Airs. Ansenne, blaek skirt, scarlet silk

bodice, veiled in blr.ck lace, blaek hat,
withred berries; Miss Shayle-George .blaek
costume, white vest, blaek picture velvet,

hat; Mrs. Leonard Marshall, cream silk,
veiled in white embroidered net, blaek hat

with plumes; Miss Thorpe, pale helio-

trope, linen gown, blaek hat; Mrs. Geo.

Roberts, black; Miss Walker, navy serge,
red hat, swathed with poppies; Miss

Simpson, pale pink crepe de chine, hat

with pink; Mrs. Simpson, blaek; Mrs.

Henry Walker, eleetrique green gown,
while vest, blaek hat; Mrs. (Colonel)
Dawson, grey voile, grey hat; Mrs. Cot-

tle, blaek silk, with white lace; Mrs.

Parsons, blaek; Miss Eve Smith, white

silk, with cent lace, while hat with

blaek veil; Miss Witehell, black skirt,

green blouse, hat with green; Miss

Kaynes, iris blue poplin; Mrs. Kingswell,
blaek silk, with bead passementerie; Mrs.
Goodhue, black and white figured foulard,
blaek hat; Mrs. Dargaville, blaek silk,
with ecru laee. blaek toque; Mrs. Friend,

grey frieze costume, with ecru laee. black

hat; and her daughter wore dark skirt,
while blouse.

The race meeting was brought to a

<Boso last Easter Tuesday, and once

again the weather conditions left noth-

ing to be desired, while the attendance

was about up to the. usual number for

an off day. Mrs Davy, blaek; Miss

.Davy, fawn gown, cream hat; Mrs

Owen, black silk, blaek hat; Mrs Angus
Gordon, blaek skirt, blue blouse, black

toque; Miss Whitney, black skirt, white

blouse, black toque; Mrs Windsor, blaek

gown, black hat: Mrs Cat.tanacli, blue

foulard, blaek hat ; Mrs Devereux, blaek
gown, toque with pearl bead garniture;
Mrs Hickson, blaek costume, blaek bon-

net; Miss Hickson, lavender gown; Mrs

Keogh, maize silk veiled in blaek. blaek

hat; Miss Wallnutt, grey voile bolero
and skirl, and sister briek-eoloured;
Mrs Fred Yonge, fawn silk costume,
eream hat; Miss Yonge, white gown,

red hat; Mrs Abbott, reseda green with

fawn laee. blaek hat; Mrs Fritter. navy

tucked voile, black toque; Miss Frater,

white; Miss Keogh, black skirt, blue

silk blouse, blaek hat; Mis MacCormick,
brown cloth gown, brown felt hat; Airs

Nichol, brown gown, blaek cape, black

hat; Aliss Dawson, brown coat and

skirt, blaek hat; Miss Bush, blaek skirt,
white blouse, black hat; Mrs Otway,
white tucked silk, white hat with os-

trich feathers: Airs Au. enne, paon line;
green costume, blue felt hat; Aliss Cot-

ter, blaek bengaline with ecru lace at

neck, green felt hat with green ribbons;
Aliss Stevenson, white silk, hat with

pink rambler roses, blue ribbons Airs
Ching, black silk with ecru lace at neck,

toque on suite; Aliss Ching, grey coat

and skirt, white felt hat with flowers

beneath brim and white ribbons at back

of crown; Alisses Binney (2), black

gowns, relieved with ecru laee, blaek

hats; Airs Stuart Heid, mourning cos-

tume; Aliss Firth, white silk gown, red

plaid toque; Airs Alarkliani, white cos-

tume, black toque; Airs Hume, white

silk with 1 lickings and lace insertion,
hat with spring green; Airs Farrell,
black; Airs Geo. Dunnett, biscuit-col-

oured silk, finished with blaek velvet

and black ribbons, black toque with

eeru lace; Aliss Dunnett, green and

black plaid, blaek hat; Mrs Leo Mar-

shall, pale oyster grey voile, grey
toque en suite with ostrich plumes, grey

boa; Miss .Shayle-George, black; Aliss

Seymour Thorne George, white silk

gown, heliotrope hat; Aliss Malker,

navy serge, toque with poppies; Airs

Bagnall, navy voile, blaek hat; Aliss

Bagnall, Egypt red frieze, black hat:

Airs Hankiii Reid, China blue figured
foulard, blaek hat; Airs Lewis, pretty

pink linen gown, the skirt had wide

tucks all round, pink hat; Airs Dennis

O’Rorke. bronze nioyan doth gown, the

jacket was made with a long basque,

short white vest, black toque: Mrs Alis-

tcr Clark (Melbourne), reseda green

costume, blaek toque; Aliss Shepherd,
blaek skirt, mauve brocaded blouse,
black toque with ereani roses: Airs Ale-

Donald, black silk: Miss McDouall,

periwinkle blue cloth gown, black hal :
Mrs Dignari, azure blue ereponette, black

hat with pink flowers; Mrs .Hdrich,

blaek silk with twine ■ coloured lace,

blaek bonnet ; Airs Dllfaur. blaek silk,

white vest, black hat; Airs M . Ralph,
brown; Mrs Lawrence, navy blue serge,

white vest, black hat : Aliss Edith Per-

cival, black; Ahs Thompson (Fiji), blaek

silk with fawn laee. white hat with blue;

Aliss Moss Davis, white serge, pink Hop

bat: Airs McLaughlin, blr.ck silk with

white silk cape, veiled in blaek laee;

Airs Ralph, blaek silk with twinc-col-

oured laee, black hat: Miss Gorr.e, dark

costume, black toque; Aliss Gwen Gor-

rie, black skirt, white blouse, red hat:
Aliss Morrin, while silk costume, burnt

straw hat wreathed with forget-me-

nots; Air- Basley, Wack; Aliss Basley.
black silk with ecru laee, white felt

hat, swathed with Nil green: Miss

AVorsp, grev voile, large flop hat; her

sister wore an Egypt pink foulard with

white spots, made with bolero, bat with

pink flowers and blaek velvet stream-

ers: Mrs Ernest Bloomfield, eiel bine

erepon with eeru laee at neck, blaek hat :
Airs Dunean Clerk, white silk with

much tucking, white bat with pink
flowers: Airs McLoud, royal blue benga-

line, blaek hat: Mrs Wright, grey tweed,

trimmed with grey poplin and blaek

velvet: Airs SehertT. black silk, white

muslin at. neck, bonnet composed of

green leaves and white aigrette; Alis.

Schertf, dark skirt, grey fancy tweed

jacket, black hat; Airs Geo. Roberts,

black: Airs Cottle, black silk gown,
black bonnet: Airs Henry Walker, elee-

trique green cloth, gown, white vest,

black toque; Aliss —. Taylor (Bar
dowie), dark skirt, light blouse, sailor
hat; Airs Williamson, black; Miss Wil-

liamson, periwinkle blue frieze, blaek

hat; Miss Waller, white serge with Rus

siaii jacket,White bat with flowers;
Airs Colbeek, oyster grey voile, black

hat; Miss Tl.orne George, white silk
costume with tuckings and lace inser-

tion, burnt straw Victorian bonnet with

ostrich plumes; Aliases Thompson (2),
white silks, white hats with flowers;
Aliss Decamp, brown coat and skirl,
black hat; Airs Ranson, black foularl

with white spots, trimmed with ecru

lace, white toque with earnations; Mrs

Kingswell, black silk with ecru lace at.

neck, blaek hat with pink flowers; Mrs

Sharman, white frieze with black braid
ing, black velvet bolero, white felt

toque with green ribbons and mauve

flowers; Mrs Clem Lawford, fawn gown
with twine-coloured laee, white toque
with petunia flowers; Mrs Edward Firth,
bright navy tailor-made gown, white

collarette and rovers, black hat; Mrs

Thomas Morrin. fawn-coloured voile

with bolero front and sous munches of
satin, black hat with flowers; Mrs A.

Hanna, pretty ecru tinted bengaline
with white spots, the dress was finished

with twine-coloured lace ami black vel-

vet, black hat, wreathed with mauve

Howers; Aliss Gorrie, royal blue Vienna

cloth, trimmed with coloured embroi-

dery. white lace cape at neck, white

toque, swathed with black jetted tulle;
Miss Koberts, black; Miss Olive Buck-
land, white silk, hat with white; Miss

Tribley, dark skirt, pink silk blouse,

black hat; her sister wore white silk:
Miss Moss Davis, white serge with bl.ick
hat: Airs Hope Lewis, navy.

The Eden and Epsom Tennis and

Croquet Lawns closed for this season

last Saturday afternoon. The weather

was beautifully fine and the attendance

was very large. The prizes won during
the past season were presented by the

wife of the president (Mi A. Heather).

Key. Ah- .McFarland made a most ap-
propriate speech, congratulating the

prize winners. The final. Ladies’ Com-

bined Doublet of the intcr-l'niversiiy
championships was played olf on Satur-

day, Misses Pearl Gorrie and Aletcalfe

beating Misses Blades and Hull.

Afternoon tea was provided by the

members, the tables being decorated
with cactus dahlias of various hues. Mrs

Heather, black muslin over blaek skirt;
the skirt was corded in vandykes and

had narrow flounces at hem; the bodice

was tucked: while vest, black feather

boa, black toque turned oil’ the face

v it h paste ornament. blaek ostrich plume;
Airs 11. Heather, grey coloured cloth

skirt and coat, the neat, very plain
belted eoat was ornamented with chen-

ille embroidery, black toque with black

feathers; Mrs Oldham, black skirt,
galois grey silk blouse with cordings.
black toque; Mrs Haultain, black voile

with satin strappings, ecru lace (ape

collar, -lack toque; Airs Hooper, grey-

skirt wi.'h blaek strappings, while

blouse, black hat: and her mother wore

a blaek gown, blaek bonnet with violets;
Airs Moginie, blaek skirt, white blouse,
blaek hut with plumes; Mrs Oberlin

Brown, navy foulard, black hat: Miss

Oberlin Brown, holland skirt, while

blon-e. white muslin frame lint with

black velvet belie ribbon velvet; Mrs

Batty, blaek skirt, white blouse, grey

jacket, fur toque relieved with white:
Aliss B. Blonzard-Brown grey striped
foulard, burnt straw hat: Aliss Little,
black skirt, pink muslin blouse. Panama

hat: Mrs Vdy, navy; Airs Watkins,

navy cambric, black hat : Aliss Slonian,
fawn skirl, pink blouse, black hat relies*-
cd with white: Mrs Fenton, cream silk

with tuekings mid embroidery, blaek

hat: Airs Billings, black skirt, while silk
blouse witli tuckings and laee insertion,

black hat with ostrich plumes; Aliss

Bramwell, pink cambric skirt, while silk

blouse. Panama hat ; Aliss llesketh. navy

serge skirl, navy silk ecru lace eip. l
collar, white hat; Miss Paton, black

skirt, figured blouse, blaek hat: Miss

Hall, navy serge skirt, white blouse,

white hat; Aliss Hull, bright blue linen

skirt, white blouse, white hat: Mrs duo.

Dawson, blaek skirt, fawn silk blouse,

black toque: Aliss Dawson, white muslin

with embroidery, white hat; Aliss Gittos,

white muslin, white hat; Aliss Caldwell,
holland skirt, white blouse, cream hat

with (lowers; Miss Blades, blaek skirt,

white blouse, sailor hat; Miss Aletealie,
white muslin gown, white hal: Miss

Towle, blue and white striped cambric,

sailor bat; and her friend wore white;
Airs Cooke, navy silk with white spots,

toque en suite: Mrs Mair, brown holland

with white braiding. Panama hat; Aliss

Stewart, white muslin; her sister wore

n brown holland skirt, white blouse,

white hat ; Mrs Rice, blaek silk costume,

black bonnet, relieved with white: Aliss

D. Rice, holland skirt, white blouse,
white muslin hal with blaek velvet ;

Miss Stella Itiee. brown holland: Miss D.

Inly, navy skirt, white blouse, sailor

bat; Aliss M. Rice, holland cost nine:

Aliss I’dv. holland skirt, blue blouse,
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Panama hat; Miss Garland, black skirt,
del blue blouse, white hat; and her

sister wore a navy foulard, white hat;
Mrs Beale, black skirt, white blouse,
black hat swathed with drake’s neck

green silk; Mrs Hoskins, navy gown,
with white embroidery, black toque;
Miss Cooke, white pique skirt, silk

blouse, white hat; Miss Trevithick,
white embroidered muslin skirt, silk
blouse, sailor hat; Miss Gor.ie, blue

skirt, white blouse, white hat; Miss

Pearl Gorrie, holland skirt, white blouse,
white hat; Miss . Gwen Gorrie, black

skirt, white blouse, white muslin hat

edged with black velvet; Mrs Turner,
black skirt, blue blouse, black hat; Miss
Heid, black skirt, violet foulard blouse,
black hat; Miss Hardie, white muslin

with blue rosette, black hat.

Mrs. Oldham, of Mount Eden, Auck-

land, gave a young people’s euchre party
on Friday evening last. The function
was undoubtedly a great success.

The Wapiti Hockey Club intend to

open their season next Saturday on the

Remuera grounds, near the station.

My Cambridge correspondent writes:

Dear Bee,—There has not been much to

write about lately, partly on account of
its being Lent. On Easter Monday the

Waikato Mounted Rifles. No. 3 Com-

pany, held a gymkhana out at “Bar-

dowie,” but the day was not favourable

for outdoor sports, and rather marred
the pleasure of those attending. On

Friday afternoon the annual Chrysan-
themum Show was opened by the presi-
den (Dr- Roberts), who spoke of the

succees of the previous shows and the

grand display of blooms at the present
one. The root show was combined with

the flower show in a tent adjoining, and

proved a great source of attraction to

the farmers. Afternoon tea was dis-

pensed in a third tent, and notwith-

standing it was in an out of the way

position made a record take of a 12 for
the two days. The first day it was pre-
sided over by Mrs James Hally, and the

second day by Mrs Wells, ably assisted

on both days by bevies of young ladies,
who looked well after the wants of
everyone. The takings at the door

amounted to £67, the total amount-

ing to over £BO for the two days. The

Cambridge Orchestra, under their able
conductor (Mr Edwards), played selec-

tions during the afternoon and evening,
and gave great pleasure to those pre-
sent. Mrs J. R. S. Richardson carried

off the prize for the best bloom in the
show. Mr Buckland, as usual, was the
winner of a great many prizes, both for

flowers and roots; his show of flowering
begonias was beautiful. A very pretty
feature of the show was the collection
of pot plants, for which Mr Hartley
carried off t he Ist prize and Mrs Wells
the 2nd. There were more than usual

competing for the table decorations, in

which .Miss Richardson was Ist. Hers

was very lovely, carried out entirely
with tea roses and maidenhair ferns.

The Misses Willis were 2nd. theirs being
shades of mauve with autumn leaves.
Miss Wells was successful in gaining
the prize for an afternoon tea table

arranged for three. Hers was very
dainty. A special prize was given by
the president for the best decorated bi-
cycle or go-cart, for which Miss C*. Willis
was the winner, her bicycle being decor-

ated with lycopodium and yellow chry-
santhemums. Amongst such crowds as

were present it was almost impossible
to see much of the dresses, but of the
few I got a peep at I noticed Mrs Rob-
erts, tussore silk, trimmed with some

beautiful silk, Maltese lace, brown hat,
trimmed with pale blue and forget-me-
nots; Mrs Willis, broehe silk, black bon-

net trimmed with sequins; Mrs John

Hally, black silik, black toque, relieved

with buttercups; Mis Wells, black
broehe silk, grey and white bonnet; Mrs

Buckland, grey broehe, black mantle,
black bonnet with crimson roses; Mrs

James Hally, heliotrope silk, trimmed

with darker shade of velvet, black pic-
ture hat; Mrs Bamford (Remuera), pea-
cock blue gown, trimmed with black
and white applique, black and cream

toque; Mrs Brewis (Hamilton), black

costume, hat to match; Mrs Graham,
black and white silk gown,black hat;Mrs
R. Gwynne (Hamilton), grey and white

costume, hat to match; Mrs J. R. 8.
Richardson, tussore silk, blaek picture
hat; Mrs C. Hunter, black silk, relieved
with white, black hat; Mrs Martyn,
green coat and skirt, black and white

hat; Mrs Brooks, black silk dress and

jacket, black bonnet with pink roses;
Mrs Ross, blaek gown, relieved with
white, black and white boa, black and
white toque; Mrs R. Roberts, black

eoat and skirt, hat to match; Miss Cave,
blue silk voile, black hat, trimmed with
cream and pale blue; Miss Wells,
drake’s neck cloth costume, relieved
with white, hat to match; Miss IT.

Wells, pink silk blouse, black voile
skirt, grey coat, white hat; Miss Willis,
blaek Eton coat and skirt, white hat;
Miss C. Willis, black silk blouse, black

skirt, black picture hat with pale blue;
Miss E. Willis, white silk blouse, blaek
skirt, grey eoat, white hat, trimm; 1

with pink; Miss Wright, white silk

frock, blaek picture hat; Miss Dunn,
blaek and white costume, hat to match;
Miss Taylor, heliotrope blouse, black

skirt, blaek toque with violets; Miss
Brooks, cream frock and hat to match;
Miss J. Brooks, green costume, white

hat; Miss Gwynneth, black silk blouse
with string-coloured lace cape, blaek

skirt, black and rosewood hat; Miss

Street, white silk frock, black picture
hat; Miss Young, blaek costume, reliev-
ed with white, hat to match; Miss Fer-

guson, white silk frock and white hat;
Miss Peterson, blue and white figured
costume, white hat; Miss Buckland,

green frock, blaek picture hat.

PHYLLIS BROUN.

NAPIER.

Dear Bee, April 17.

There was a good attendance on the

ground of the Hawke’s Bay Tennis Club
to witness the open tournament at Eas-

ter, and in the final of the ladies’ handi-

cap singles, Miss Wellwood (owe 5)
beat Miss Lamb (rec. 8) by 50 to 40.

Mr Ebbett has also successfully defend-
ed his position as a good player, beating
Air Levien in the handicap round by 60

to 40. In the ladies’ doubles Misses
Neville and McLean were beaten by the

Misses Hindmarsh. In the mixed doub-
les Miss B. Hindmarsh and Levien were

victorious against Miss Lamb and R.
Braithwaite by 60 to 42. There were also
the men’s handicap doubles, in which

Goldsmith and C. Balharry (rec. 30)
beat Fairley and Levien (rec. 20) by 60

to 40. Amongst those present on Satur-

day and Monday were: Mrs J. H. Cole-

man, who was attired in blaek and

white voile, with yoke of string-eoloured
lace, bonnet to match trimmed with

roses; Miss Coleman wore light fawn

cloth over a blouse of white silk, and
hat to harmonise; Mrs F. Baden-Powell
was very elegantly dressed in green
cloth with cream trimmings, and wore a

hat to match trimmed with black vel-
vet; Mrs Henley wore a dress of dark
blue material, with revers of the same

colour, and hat, to correspond; Mrs East

wore a grey dress, and hat trimmed with
bhwk; Mrs Bilton’s dress was of cream

material, with bodice outlined with lace

and trimmed with blaek velvet; Mrs

Hector Smith’s dark-hued dress was re-

lieved with a cream front, and a blue

rosette was becomingly arranged in her

hat; Mrs Nantes was in grass lawn

handsomely trimmed with lace, and
blaek hat relieved with eream; Miss Corn-
ford was also attired in grass lawn,
trimmed with white satin and guipure
lace, and blaek hat trimmed with feath-
ers; Miss N. Cotterill was dressed in

blaek; Miss Margoliouth wore a white

silk blouse, and a holland skirt; Miss T.
Margoliouth was in white, and she wore

a sailor hat; Miss Ella Burke wore a

long grey tweed coat over a dark blue
dress, and a deep cream hat; Mrs Wes-

tall wore a pretty white silk tueked

blouse, a black skirt, and a sailor hat;
Miss J. Heath was in pale green linen;
Miss M. Locking, white muslin dress,
blue chiffon boa, and blue hat; Miss Sim-

cox wore a white blouse, a green linen

skirt, and a straw hat; Mrs Cato also had

a light blouse and a dark skirt, her be-

coming hat was trimmed with feathers;
Miss D. Kennedy wore grey and white;
Mrs Pavitt nad a bright pink silk blouse

relieved with white lace, a blaek skirt,
and a blaek hat; Miss Myra Williams

looked well in a flowered silk blouse,
a fawn skirt, and a hat trimmed with,
blaek velvet; Mies Ella McVay was in
a stylish costume of black cloth, and a

dainty hat of pale blue; Miss Rawson

wore a slate grey dress prettily trimmed
with laee and silk, and a hat to match;
Miss Hetley had a blue blouse, and a

dark skirt; Miss Todd was in eream,
and a white linen hat; Miss Fannin had
a white dress; Miss Kathleen Hoadley,
white silk blouse, holland skirt, large hat

trimmed with red; Miss Wellwood wore

white relieved with pink, and her straw

hat was trimmed with pink silk; Mrs

Newbigin had a blaek cloth costume;
Mrs Bradley wore cream; Mrs R. B.
Smith had a white blouse, a blue drill
skirt, and a straw hat; Mrs Russell Dun-

ean wore blaek and white; Miss Hodges
was in white linen; Mrs Keesing looked
well in blaek; Mrs A. Kennedy had a

white blouse, a holland skirt, and a

straw hat.

The autumn flower show and table
decoration competition was held in the
Garrison Hall on the 15th and 16th inst.,
and was favoured with delightful wea-

ther, which prevailed throughout both
days. The judging had taken place in
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A large range of patterns to select from.

SPECIALTY ri

London and Parisian Fashions.

Queen Street, Auckland,
OPPOSITE BANK OF N.S.W.

BYCROFT, Limited
FLOUR Will. !

Manufacturers of TULIP and SNOWDRIFT Brands of FLOUR. WHEATMEAL, , -4
PORRIDGE MEAL. SELF-RAISING FLOUR, also all kinds Pl rVHfI

of PLAIN and FANCY BISCUITS.
OXXWX klollw OUVVU
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the morning, i id Miss Sutton obtained
first prize for a beautiful table decor-
ation, and Mrs W. Fraser obtained a

prize also for a beautifully arranged
basket of flowers. Miss Newman took
five prizes for ladies’ sprays, foliage
begonias, exotic ferns, cut flowers, etc.
The display of fruit was particularly
fine; the prize for apples and pears was

gained by Miss Beamish, and that for
grapes and quinces by Mrs M. Herd.
Amongst the visitor's to the show were:

Mrs Logan, who wore a long dark blue
cloth coat, a black skirt and blouse, and

a black hat; Miss Williams wore a black
costume, and a lace mantle; Miss Shaw
wore a tussore silk dress, and a hat of
the same colour; Mrs Bradley wore a

very pretty dress of a becoming shade
of pink, and her hat was trimmed with

pink silk; Miss N. Cotterill wore a

black serge costume, and a hat to
match; Miss Sutton had a fawn dress re-

lieved with pink, and a blaek hat with

pink roses; Miss C. Sutton wore blue,
her blaek hat was trimmed with feath-

ers; Mrs J. H. Coleman had a grey cos-

tume, black mantle and bonnet to

match with pink roses in the front;
Miss Coleman wore a biscuit-coloured

gown, pink straw hat trimmed with
black velvet; Miss Simeox was in grey,
the bodice tucked and trimmed with

black velvet; Mrs Cato wore a fawn

eoat and skirt with white satiir revers,
blaek hat; Mrs McLean wore a blue

dress trimmed with guipure lace; Mrs

Williams was in blaek.

A most enjoyable ball was inaugurated
last week and took place on Tuesday,
in the Foresters’ Hall, Dickens street.

Miss Henn played the danee music.

Supper was served in a room at the baek

of the hall. Mrs R. B. Smith was attir-

ed in blaek satin, draped and trimmed
with lace, and with passementerie on

the bodice; and Miss Bendall (Welling-
ton) was in white chiffon, trimmed with
blaek velvet; Miss Heath was in cream

silk; Miss Dean, rose pink dress with

lace on the bodice; Mrs Russell Dunean

also looked well in a pretty light silk

dress trimmed with lace; Miss Simeox.

very pretty dress of accordion-pleated
Chiffon of a pale eream colour, innumer-
able frills of chiffon were round the

skirt; Miss Cornford was admired in

black, with pale blue rosettes on the
skirt and bodice; Miss Williams wore

cream; Mies Hetley looked well in a

soft white silk dress trimmed with white
chiffon; Miss Goldsmith wore white, re-

lieved with pale pink; Miss F. Margo-
liouth looked well in a bright green cos-

tume with pink bows on the bodice; Miss

Ella Burke had a pretty dress of pale
green erepe de chine; Miss Shand was

much admired in a pretty dress of soft

pink material; Miss Dulcie Kennedy
wore white silk; Miss Martin looked
well in black, with a red sash; Miss
Kathleen Hoadley wore white silk; Mrs

Bilton was in cream, trimmed with
blaek velvet; Miss Wilson wore white
silk; Mrs Henley also had a very dainty
■white silk costume.

The concert for the Cathedral Organ
Fund was given at the Theatre Royal
on the 14th inst. The Cathedral choir

was assisted on this occasion by the

following artists: Miss Large, whose

voice possesses much sweetness, com-

bined with clearness of tone, sang, “In

the Merry, Merry Maytime,” in admir-
able style; Mrs Adair Blythe, a con-

tralto, who, having been a professional,
promises to be well to the fore, gave as

her first song, “Angus Macdonald;”
Miss King’s solo, “La Serenata” (by
Tosti), was beautifully sung; Miss Ed-
wards, a great favourite, besides giving
a mandolin solo, played several accom-

paniments; Mr. Longworth, who was in

capital form, aang several times, and

should be proud of the enthusiastic ap-

plause accorded him by the audience.

The part songs by the choir likewise

added greatly to the evening’s entertain-
ment. In fact it was a long programme
delightfully carried out. Mr Sharp
acted in his usual capacity of accompan-

ist.
MARJORIE.

NEW PLYMOUTH.

Dear Bee, April 17.

On Easter Monday night St. Joseph’s
Catholic School held a

BAZAAR

in the Theatre Royal, which was opened
by the Mayor (Mr. Doekrill). The Gar-
rison Band played several selections out-

side the building during the evening.
Many of the stall-holders were in fancy
dress, and a good deal of raffling was

done, Dean McKenna having charge of

the lottery box. Mesdames Dockrill, E.
M. Smith, Clarke, W. Bennett, Whittel,
J. Bennett, and Misses Radford, O’Con-

nor and Mcllhone presided over the plain
and fancy stall, while Misses Bleasal, R.

Bennett and Stephenson looked after the

refreshment stall; Madame Tutsehka,
Misses Hopkins and Gallagher the gen-
tlemen’s stall; Mrs. Wildermoth and Mr.
J. Parker had charge of the bran tub. Mr.
Rountree’s orchestra contributed some

excellent music, which added to the

pleasures of the evening.
On Tuesday evening Mrs. Ab. Gold-

water gave a delightful

IMPROMPTU DANCE

in the Freemasons’ Hall. It was thor-
oughly enjoyed by those who went. Mrs.

Goldwater was assisted by Miss Gold-

water and Miss Jaeob, who made splendid
hostesses. The supper room was taste-

fully arranged with flags, while the table
was very prettily decorated with cos-

mos. Mrs. Goldwater received her guests
in black silk, trimmed with jet; Miss

Goldwater, pretty white silk, with chiffon

sash; Miss Jacob, pale blue and black
blouse, dark skirt; Miss Bedford, white
silk, relieved with turquoise blue; Miss
D. Bedford, rose pink; Miss Donaldson,
pale blue blouse, blaek skirt; Miss Mc-

Kay looked well in pink; Miss R. Clarke,
white muslin; Miss Cottier, white silk

blouse, dark skirt; Miss Ramson, pink
silk; Miss —. Ramson, white silk and

chiffon; Miss Crozier, dark skirt, pink
silk blouse; Miss O’Brien, white silk;
Miss E. O’Brien, pale blue silk and ecru

insertioned blouse, blaek skirt; Miss

Morey, very pretty white tucked silk;
Miss Jackson, grey and blaek; Mrs. R.
Bayley, black net; Mrs. G. Neil, grey and
cream; Mrs. Jacob, pink silk blouse; black
skirt; Mrs. Speneer, grey, relieved with
scarlet; Miss Craigmile, blaek tucked

silk, relieved with pink roses; Miss I. El-
lis, pale pink silk; Miss A. Avery, tussore

silk: Miss Taylor, white, with scarlet

trimmings: Miss Teed, green silk, trim-

med with a darker shade; Miss Knight,
pink silk blouse, dark skirt; and Messrs.

Goldwater, Gilmour, Thomson, Brewster,
Neil, Jackson, Ramson, Brasch, Bewley,
Standish, Macey, Haise, Kebbell, Spencer,
Otterson, G. Fookes, Ryan.

NANCY LEE.

WELLINGTON.

Dear Bee, April 16.

Nothing could have been more beauti-

ful than the weather we had during the

Easter holidays. With the exception
of Sunday, which was rather dull and

windy, the holidays were perfect—-
bright and calm, and quite hot, so that

everyone who went holiday making had
n most delightful time, and came back

feeling much refreshed by the outing
and ready for their daily routine. Hun-
dreds of people took advantage of the

ferry excursions, and all the bays and
summer resorts were largely patronised.
On Monday the Union Company’s boat
Rotomaliana ran across to Picton and

baek, and was patronised by over eleven

hundred excursionists.

The lawn tennis tournament, which

was held on the College Grounds, was

a great success, and there was some very

exciting and interesting play. The
grounds looked very pretty and green,

and the large numbers of gaily dressed

spectators, as well as the players, made

it a most festive scene. Miss Powdrell,
of Wanganui, won the Ladies’ Singles,
and played most brilliantly all through.
Mr Cecil Cox was the lucky gentleman
winner. Among those whom I noticed
on the grounds during the tournament

were Mrs Simpson, wearing a grey

gown and black eoat, blaek toque with
wings; Mrs Barron, a heliotrope linen

gown, with lace collar, and a black
toque with tips; Miss Barron, in a pink
linen gown trimmed with lace, and

blaek and pink hat; Mrs Fulton, dark

green zibeline Russian gown, and black

hat ; Mrs Hunt, pale grey gown piped
■with black, and a pretty black chiffon

hat; Miss Mills, dark coat and skirt, and

black toque; Miss E. Mills, in a cerise

pink zibeline costume, and pink hat
trimmed with roses and black velvet;
Miss Mills, a tabac brown Russian

gown, and felt hat to match; and her

younger sister was in biscuit coloured
voile and lace; Mrs Louis Pharazyn,
blaek voile gown and long eoat, black

toque with tips; Mrs 11. Gore, in a dark

■kirt and fawn eoat, white hat; Mrs

C. Cooper, neat royal blue tailor-made
suit with lace collar and a blue and
white hat; Miss J. Hislop wore a grey
flecked tweed coat, and a black and

white toque; Mrs Wickham, pale grey
voile gown embroidered with white, and
a large Tuscan straw hat trimmed with

black plumes; Mrs Kettle (Napier),
royal blue voile gown, and black and
white toque; Miss Kettle, dark skirt
and fawn coat, white hat trimmed with

blue; Mrs Marchbanks, fawn coat and

pretty royal blue tucked voile with a

touch of green and white, blaek picture
hat; Mrs Biss, white blouse and black

skirt, Panama hat; Miss Cooper, in

green linen with ecru insertion, and a

dark skirt, sailor hat; Mrs A. Young,
black hat; Mrs Cashmaille (England),
black voile gown and dressy jacket with

chiffon ruffles, black and white bonnet;
Mrs Purdy, pale grey Eton gown, and
black and white toque; Mrs Webster, in

a blue gown and black hat; Mrs Betts,
in black and white; Miss Edwin, red

figured gown, and hat to match; Miss
A. Edwin wore a blue gown and large
cream hat; Miss G. Harcourt, red linen

gown, and white hat trimmed with red;
Miss Foot, a dark blue coat and skirt,
and a black hat with tips; Mrs Baxter,
black mourning costume; Miss Moss

Davis (Auckland), a cream frieze gown
with lace collar and vest, and a white
hat. with black tips: also the Misses
Gore, Simpson, Marchant, Kennedy,
Morrah, Travers, Barron, and others, in

neat tennis skirts and blouses.

On Easter Monday there was a large
attendance at the opening of the large
Bazaar organized to pay off the debt, on

the Sacred Heart Basilica, Hill-street.

The Drill Shed, where the bazaar is
being held, was quite transformed with

most gorgeous decorations and looks

splendid. The opening ceremony was

performed by Sir Joseph Ward at three

o’clock. .Lady Ward is in charge of the

New Zealand stall. Her assistants are

Mesdames Loughnan, W. Nathan, Staff-

ord. Hales, and F. Loughnan, Misses

Ward. Fraser, Nathan (2), O’Connor (2),
Kennedy (2), Stafford (2), Rose, Lough-
nan (2), and Skerrett. Other stall-

holders: Great Britain and Ireland, Mes-

danies lan Duncan, H. Johnston, and
Miss Skerrett, assisted by the Misses
Bell. Grace, Skerrett, Putnam, Harcourt,
Harner, Duncan. Johnston, Shapter and

Waldegrave; India and Africa, Mes-

danies Gibbs and Duignan, and Miss
Duignan. assisted by the Misses M. Man-

away (2), McDonald, Vincent and Kuch-

1,1 B 0, ft A 1

“WORLD- wTp U_M PT l~p M ”

gn| y Importer of Drapery and Millinery,

• odl HCj' 9 KARAN2AHAPE ROAD, AUCKLAND.
SPECIAL PARCEL POST AT TOWN PRICES. ========

CHILDREN’S WHITE ASTRACHAN 20/- SPECIAL WINTER LINE IC/6 MANCHESTER PARCEL NICE LOT TRIMMED FELT HATS
COATS 1 Fur 1 Pair Good Sheets Boat Shapes, allcolours. Is. ltd. and 2s. lid.

Very warm and well made, with HAT (any 1 Pretty Flannelette Blouse 6Towels Girls Well-trimmed Felts, from 4a. lid.’
colour) for 14s. Gd. beiwo bkirt 1 Table Cloth Ladies Trimmed straw Hals, from Ba. lid.

A nice lot COLOURED COATS from 4s. lid, Lady s Umbrella « Yards Strong Cretonne
ss. lid 6b. lid. Trimmed Felt Hat 6 Yards Pretty Art Muslin

This lino is wonderful value, bought 50 per Send measurements. We guarantee at. 1 Pair Curtains INFANTS’ PARCEL 25'“
cent off Home prices. . 3 Nice Day Gown.

nDPCCPiDCPT
For 10/6will send comfortable well- 2 Flanneletto Night Gowns

18/6
nrr:

fitting BLOUSE and SKIRT. K.'.Tffi
LADIES’ UNDERCLOTHING PARCEL Blouse Length Pretty Flannelette

—
• >

„

2 Flannelette Nightgowns With Linings. Lace Insertion andButtons FLAN NELETTES ’ Wbite"smt wT
2 Flannelette Chemines from 4k. 3d.. 5a., 6s. 6d., 7b. Gd., Bm. 6d. doz.

___________

2a'iL Wool singlets,r 8 14/6 FANCY DRESS PARCEL Uncß trledßen- wlll
a JOB LINE LADIES’ FAWN MACK-

2 AU-Wool Cashmere Hose with Linings, Trimmings, an« Button. TOWELS INTOSHES, any Size, for 116
A very specialline of

~

’ *«. M., 6s. 9d., 10s. doz.; and 100 doz. at 11s. .
WOOLLEN SINGLETS 14/6 DRESS PARCEL CHILDREN'S ASTRACHAN HATS

Cannot be equalled in Town. Two for 2a. «d. Good Heavy Material For Wall strapped BLACK LUSTRK Extra special. Is. 9d. 2a.9d.

Long sleeves, Is. td. eaeh. Linings, Velvet, Buttons to Match SKIRT, with thelatest style of flounce. Brown and Navy, only 3s. 6d.
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*n. Canada and Scotland, Alesdames
Bolton and Keefe; assistants. Misses

Saunders, Waters, Kersley, Quin, Sulli-
van., Davis. Cosgrove, Gallagher, Corliss,
Twohill. Henry, Hutchinson, Reston,
laine, McArdle, MeSherry, Bannister,
Taylor, Flanagan and Williams. Tea
Kiosk, Mrs Kelly, Misses M. Mannway,
Redmond, Ahearne, Butler, Collins,
Sheridan. Casey, Young, Fitzgerald. Cor-

rigan. Maginnity, Twohill and Sullivan.
In the evening the hall was crowded to

the doors Io sec the spectacular display,
“Britannia’s tall to Arms,” under the

direelion of Signor Borzoni. Judging
front the great business done on the
opening day, the bazaar should prove a

decided success. It is to remain open

for ten days altogether.

Mrs Dr. Findlay gave a very pleasant
afternoon tea on Wednesday for Mrs
Tola, of .Auckland. The rooms were

prettily decorated with autumn flowers
and leaves. and the dining-room
fable was laden with delici-
ous cakes and sweets around

the floral centrepiece. Mrs

Findlay received in a prettily tucked

gown of pale biscuit voile with cream

lace and a touch of blue on the bodice.
Mrs I’ole looked nice in a soft grey gown
and becoming black hat. Amongst the

guests I noticed Lady Ward. Mrs and

Miss Scddon. Lady Stout. Mrs Nathan,
Mrs Napier Beil, Mrs and Miss Quick,
Mrs Longhnan. Airs F. Dyer. Mrs Brown,
Mrs and Miss McGregor. .Mrs Ewen. Miss

Izard. Mrs Easterfield, and others.

OPHELIA.

MARLBOROUGH.

Hear Bee. April 14.

The excitement in Blenheim this week

is all over the

ADA ENT OF THE VOLI NTEERS

from Nelson and the coast to attend
the Easter Camp at the Taylor Pass.
The Wakatu (Nelson) Rifles came over-

land. but several other corps from Nel-

tbn and the West Coast camo via Pic-
ton bv the Tutanekai. There is always

n good deal of interest taken in this
sort of thing by the ladies, therefore
we like—dearly so—to have the Easter

encampment held here. Among the
varying sounds issuing from the camp
is tlie war-ery of the Blenheim Rifles,
“Ka Whawhai Tonu Matou. ' ake, ake,
nke.”

Cricket matches, regattlßS Sind ex-

cursions have been very plentiful and

very enjoyable, but the encampment at

the Taylor Pass was the attraction par
excellence.

Some people attended the
REGATTA

at Spring Creek, which was held on the.

Wairau River, the ladies of the Angli-
can Church holding a sale of work and
a refreshment stall in aid of the local
church. Some went to Picton for the
attractions there, a man-o’-war, a sail-
ing regatta, and an excursion boat, the

Rotomahana from Wellington, which
brought over about 1400 excursionists,
all of whom apparently enjoyed their
outing.

THE PICTON HOSPITAL BALL

on Easter Monday evening was a great
attraction to people from all parts of

the country, and was as well managed
as it was possible to manage anything.
Dr and Mrs Redman, who worked up
the affair, must be complimented upon
their management. The ball was cer-

tainly one of the best ever held in Pie-

ton, and that is saying ranch. Others

who worked hard for the ball were Mrs

Riddell, Airs Oxley and Mrs Stow, Aliases

Seymour, Robinson and Western. The

decorations were also uncommon. The

flags from H.AI.S. Sparrow had been ar-

tistically arranged by a couple of Jack

tars, and the ladies had arranged groups
of toi-toi plumes about wherever there

was space. The stage was furnished

as a drawing-room, and the supper laid
out artistically in a tent opening out

from the hall, and needless to say was

of the very best. Airs Redman wore

handsome yellow satin, covered /with
lace, and trimmed with narrow ribbon;
Airs Stow, handsome black silk and lace;
Airs J. B. Richardson. “Meadow Bank.”a

very handsome dress of pink silk, the

front and bodice trimmed with jewelled
embroidery; Mrs John Duncan, blaek
satin and lace; Mrs H. Howard (Blen-
heim), blaek silk and lace; Airs Riddell,
white brocade, tucked and trimmed with

lace: Mrs Radcliffe, ercain broche; Airs
Petrie, black silk, trimmed with beaded
embroidery; Airs Baillie (Blenheim),
cream brocade: Mrs C. Western, b|ack;
Alias Seymour, black silk with long droop-
ing sleeves of blaek chiffon trimmed with
sequins; Afiss Rutherford, white silk and

Alaltese laee: Miss Alasefiehl, white silk:
Miss E. AVestern, white silk, tucked and
trimmed with insertion; Miss N. Beau-

champ, black silk trimmed with chiffon,
and pink roses on the corsage; Aliss L.

(Beauchamp, pale terracotta silk and
berthc of lovely Irish point; Aliss E.

Seymour, blaek satin and red poppies;
Aliss Philpotts, pale blue silk; Alisses

E. and A. Philpotts, white ; Afiss
Smythe, white soft muslin with long
sleeves of lace; Aliss Haise, black silk,
with red chiffon; Aliss Mclntosh (Blen-
heim); black velvet skirt and blue silk
blouse; Aliss E. Greensill, yellow- silk,
with blaek velvet bows; Aliss Roberts,
green costume; Afiss Speed, green silk

with Alaltese lace; Aliss Fell (Welling-
ton), blue brocade with harlequin em-

broidery; Aliss L. Greensill, dark skirt,
cream silk blouse; Aliss Stavely (Wel-
lington), blaek satin; Aliss Afacalister,
white silk; Miss Moore, white silk;
Aliss Millington, white silk: Aliss Gragg,
white silk; Aliss Robinson, blaek silk and
red poppies; Aliss Aides, pink; Aliss L.

.Miles, white; Aliss Nash, blaek skirt,
blue silk blouse; Aliss Gullery, white;
Aliss Bragg, black, and her sister black
skirt and blue silk blouse; Aliss Young,
black skirt and white silk blouse; Aliss
Norton, black; Aliss Wilkins, white;
Aliss Godfrey, blaek skirt and white
blouse. etc., ete. Some of the men were;

—Dr Redman, the captain and officers
(3) of H.AI.S. Sparrow, Afessrs Cragg,
Baillie, Kenny, Richardron, Card, Web-

ster, Alelntosh (2), Adams, Hebley,
Searle, Petrie, Barclay, Beauchamp (2),
Greensill, Riddell, Duncan, Stow, Rad-
cliffe, Afoore (2) , Howard, Alasefiehl,
Seymour (2), Fraser-Tyther, Chaytor,
Stave, Godfrey and others.

MIRANDA.

CHRISTCHURCH.

Dear Bee.— April 14.

There has been little to do, and

would have been less to see, but for
the good collection of pictures at the

Art Gallery this week, where a very
pleasant hour can be spent. In the

evening Aliss Scrivener’s band adds the

charm of mnsie.
Numbers of people decided to spend

Easter out of town, and the weather
was perfection, and camping parties
may be seen at Sumner and Brighton.

The volunteers' had a terrible battle,
somewhere in the neighbourhood of the

Waimakariri. and since have been

peaceably in eamp at Addington,
where they were inspected by General

Babington, accompanied by Captain
Campbell, A.D.C., on Easter Monday
morning. Both No. 1 and No. 2 Bat-
talions attended the C.J.C. meeting at

TRUMAN’S

NURSERY

By one application only
effectually deatroys all Parasites of

Head or Body.

Sold in Two Sixes,

N.B.—lnsist upon having TRUMAN’S
LOTION and no disappointment
can occur.

PREPARED m—

Poingdestre & Truman,
71 Old Kent Road, London,

And soldby allChemists in the

Colonies.

THE EASIEST CHAIR IN THE WORLD.

The Masterpiece ' An exquJsite comblnation of

Comfort and Elegance designed
of a >

i X/ to give simultaneous rest to al

Skilled Upholsterer. | , parts of the human frame.

i I

EXTRACT FROM “AUCKLAND STAR,” NOVEMBER 19th, 1901.

“An armchair, which for ease and comfort may fairly be said to surpass anything of its kind, has been put in the market by
Messrs. Smith & Caughey. The chair, which has been patented, is the invention of Mr. W. Aggers, of this city. Its external appearance
is that of an ordinary armchair, but by an ingenious arrangement of springs, the new invention ismade as comfortable as one could
desire. The seat, back, and arms are all fitted with springs, which yield te every motion of the sitter, absolute ease being thus
secured. The chair is very simply constructed, there being nothing to get oat of order, and the one originally made by the patentee,
after two years of use, is now in perfect order. For invalids the chair should be very popular, and in clubs and hotels it will probably
be widely used. The maker has styled it the *’ Advance.” In a slightly'different chair the arms are made rigid."

TO BE OBTAINED ONLY FROM
’ ~

SMITH & (JAUGHEY, Ltd.,
COMPLETE FUfIMJSHERS, AUCKLAND.
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Ricearton at the invitation of the club.
Two presentations were made at tiie

eamp, one to Major Chaffey of a long-
service medal, presented by Colonel

Porter, and Major Snow presented to

Lieutenant Merton a drummer’s apron
of leopard skin, from the mounted

corps.

There has been great excitement over

a trotting match, and people who have

never ventured to enter the Metropoli-
tan Trotting Club’s grounds were there

on Saturday to sec the great race be-

tween Ribbonwood, the N.Z. champion,
and Fritz, the Australian champion.
The former won easily. A large num-

ber of ladies were also present, and as

they streamed out on to the lawn serv-

ed to remind one very forcibly of Cup
time at Riecarton.

The very fine 'weather was respon-
sible for the

LARGE ATTENDANCE AT RIC-

CARTON

bn Monday, and opinions were very di-

vided among the ladies as to the most

suitable eosttrme to appear in, but
those who elected to wear the winter
one, though much more sombre, scored

before the day ended. It is evident
everything is to be rough and coarse,

this winter; black and white will still

be one of the favourite combinations,
brown following a close second, while

the Russian blouse leads in style. 'Among
the many handsome costumes worn I

noticed Mrs G. G. Stead, in dark blue
cloth, the shoulder eapes of white cloth,
with laee applique and gold buttons,
eream laee front, white felt hat with

blue velvet, white furs; Miss Stead,
mignonette green frieze Russian cos-

tume, white picture hat and feathers;
Mrs A. E. G. Rhodes, ?i lovely black
silk voile, with pleated chiffon frills,
black picture hat and feathers, sable
furs; Lady Clifford, dark grey cloth
coat and skirt, Tuscan straw toque,
bound and trimmed with black ehiffon;
Mrs G. Rhodes (Meadowbank), brown
flecked with white, trimmed with brown
velvet and lace, pale blue vest, brown
felt hat with blue velvet and wings to

match; Mrs P. Campbell, dark green
eoat and skirt, black and white spot-

ted silk, sailor collar, black hat; Mrs

J. Gould, pale blue voile gown, trim-

med with lace, net rutile, blaek ehiffon

hat and feathers, handsome sable .cape;
Mrs Boyle, blaek and white spotted
gown, black and white but; Mrs Clif-

ford, black voile, with cream laee in-

sertion trimming, white felt hat and

quills; Mrs E. C. J. Stevens, navy eoat

and skirt, cream lace front, black vel-

vet bonnet with cream roses and laee;
Mrs D. Cameron (Methven), pale blue

frieze, strapped with white cloth, to-

que to match, white marabout necklet;
Mrs C. Louisson, dark blue doth Rus-

sian costume, cream vest, relieved with

green velvet, white felt hat, trimmed
with dark green silk; Miss Louisson,
brown zibeline cloth, white felt picture
hat, with black velvet and wings; Miss

M. Louisson, black and white flecked

cloth, made with Russian blouse, and

faced with red, red felt hat, trimmed

with silk and quills to match; Mrs V.

Harris, dark brown frieze, trimmed
with velvet to match, black and white
hat: Miss Harris, navy blue cloth, trim-

med with blue and white spotted silk,
white felt picture hat, trimmed with
blaek and white spotted ehiffon; Mrs

]’. Cunningham (Pleasant Point), navy
blue costume, black picture hat , and
feathers; Mrs V. Hargreaves, navy
blue and white striped coat and skirt,

toque of mauve velvet and paler ehif-
fon; Mrs R. D. Thomas, dark blue

cloth Russian costume, blaek and white
toque; Miss Thomas, pale grey tweed

costume, white felt hat; Mrs I.

Gibbs, pale blue silk, trimmed, with
cream laee, white felt hat witli

black and white wings; Miss Kempthoriio
(Dunedin), dark grey zibeline, Russian
costume, cream front, black picture hat.
white furs; Mrs. H. Meares, dark' blue

cloth Russian costume, relieved with
orange velvet and blaek and gold braid,
toque to match; Miss Chisholm (Sydney),

moss-green cloth skirt and silk blouse to

match, with cream laee insertion, black

hat; Mrs. F. Graham, dark green frieze,
with eream vest, pigeon blue hat, trim-
med with poppies to match; Miss

Graham, navy blue cloth..-.piped with

white, cream vest, white felt hat, trim-
med to match; Mrs. Pyne, navy cloth

dress, eream laee front, black chiffon

hat; Mrs. (Dr.) Jennings, dark brown

frieze, with brown velvet collar, white

cloth toque, with fur trimming, white os-

preys: Miss Preston, dark grey and white

flecked costume, with Russian blouse,

cream lace front, black hat and feathers;

Airs. Haydon, cream serge dress, black

satin coat, with handsome black and

white collar, blaek and white hat; Miss

Haydon, pale pink voile gown, grebe fea-

ther hat; Mrs. E. V. Palmer (Burnham),

navy cloth coat and skirt, trimmed with

embroidery, brown fur toque, with red

berries; Mrs. Wardrop, dark grey Russian
costume, trimmed with panne velvet,
blaek hat; Mrs. L. Harley, dark grey
zibeline, made with Russian eoat and

scarlet facings, hat to match; Miss Har-
ley, navy blue costume, white felt hat,
trimmed with pale blue silk and dark

quills; Mrs. Ogle, brown frieze costume,
felt hat and pompons to match; Mrs.

Denniston, blaek gown, trimmed with

eream laee, black sequin toque; Miss

Denniston, dark grey frieze costume,
white hat, with lighter silk trimming:
Miss H. Denniston, pale grey gown and

white vest, white felt hat, with black

velvet and grey bird; Mrs. Jackson, navy

blue cloth gown, blue felt hat, with green

and blue chiffon rosettes; Mrs. Lichfield,

black cloth costume, black and white
toque.

We arc all looking forward to the re-

turn of Nellie Stewart in her part of

“Sweet Nell of Old Drury,” and shall try
to forget so many years have rolled, -by
since she and Vernon drove dull care

away for hundreds of our citizens in

happy hours spent at the Theatre Royal,
where, I am sure, a warm welcome awaits

her. We are also anticipating a treat

from the Westminster singers.

This week we are speeding another of

our young colonial musicians to pursue
his studies in Berlin—Mr. A. J. W. Bunz,
who leaves very shortly, and who comes

of a very musical family. His father

taught in Christchurch for over thirty

years, and his mother was a Miss Mer-

ton, whose father may be considered to

have been the first to-have fostered music

at all in Christchurch. A concert is to

be tendered to him on the Ifith, when

Mrs, Burns, Miss Graham, Mr. F. M.

Wallace and a number of our leading mu*

sicians take part.
DOLLY VALE.

Thin Blood
Thin blood always makes trouble

Your circulation is very poor, you

havo cold hands and feet. Your
nerves are weak, you are despondent
and discouraged. Your stomach is

bad, you have indigestion and sick

headache. Your muscles are weak
and you can hardly drag about the

house. But there is a prompt cure.

Ink. j

Mrs. M.Archer, of Hobart, Tasmania,sends
her photograph andsays :

“ My blood was so thin and my circulation
was so poor that my fingers were cold and
blue all the time. I lost all energy and wan

almost lifeless. But Ayer’s Sarsaparilla soon

restored vitality to my whole system. It

purified my blood and made it rich and

healthy. I believeit is the greatest medicine
in the world for the blood.”

AYER’S

Sarsaparilla
There are many imitation “ Sarsaparillas.”

Be sure you got Ayer's.

To get theBest results from Ayer’s Sarsa-

parilla your bowels must be in good condi-

tion. Ayer’s Pills euro constipation.

Prepared by Dr. J.C. Ayer & Co., Lowell, Mass., U.S.A.

A MAGNIFICENT SELECTION J Cl T D C
OF :: Latest Novelties in Jn U frC

He® Dress Materials | ™

:: GREBE SETS; Etc.

IN THE LATEST STYLES. T

PLAIN AND FANCY. T> TTC The Largest and Best Stock of FURS

BLACK AND COLOURED. A U □HDR.VWIY
ALL SPECIAL VALVE.

— AND !
-

I

Complete ranges of AMAZONS, ZEBELINES, WRITE FOR

"TT” IB fIF A DRAPERS, CLOTHIERS AND OUTFITTERS

MERINOS. ALL-WOOL COATINGS, PATTERNS gJ* |LjP II |g Ilf I A |\| 364, 366, 368, 370,
SE“' 115 MIJJiTIVIH 11

Q ueen streetj Auckland

t
~

t SPECIAL VALUE t

(Jackets
~X* i special Lines in | -

Flannelettes

<s> . $ PLAIN AND FANCY. «>

AND
NEWEST STYLES. X HftßlF% ALL MAKES. |

t
_ . , 1 X „

Table Linen, Sheeting 1 j

Winter Goats perfect. I MACKINTOSHES. I •» Calico, curtains, and i
t 1

£ Household Drapery ;•

“BARLO MILLERAIN” AND
priC es Right. | big purchase. £ Blankets

I
“CRAVENETTE | half regular prices. | Flannels and Rugs

I RAINPROOF CLOAKS. I | » Hosiery and Underwear |

4
„ . .

.
„„ waHr.noHav ORDERS BY MAIL exceeding 20/- value sent freight

Premises Close at Ipm. on Wednesday,
<o nearest polt 01. station reac lied direct.

and are Open on Saturday until IO p.m. Prompt Attention. Careful Packing.
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PERSONAL NOTES

FROM LONDON.

(From Our London Correspondent.)

LONDON, March 6.

Miss F. Irvine (Dunedin) played at a

concert lately with the Junior Orchestra

of the Royal Academy of Music.

Mrs Sievewright (Dunedin) is at pre-
sent staying on the Riviera, on the

South Coast of France.

Mr Claude Shillitoe has come Home to

see relatives and intends to take a run

through Canada on his way back to

New Zealand.

The Anglican Bishop of Wellington

preaches this next Sunday at St. Step-
hen’s, Westbourne Grove, of which the

Bishop-Designate of Auckland is at pre-
sent vicar.

Miss Stoddart (Christchurch) has

just gone to St. Ives, in Cornwall. I

hear that some of her work has sold

very satisfactorily lately.

Mr John Baillie (Wellington) is be-

coming quite a fashionable art-dealer at

his gallery in Bayswater. His exhibi-
tion of drawings in black and white by
Academicians and other well-known ar-

tists closed last Wednesday, and Mr
Baillie is well pleased with the result.

The Board of Trinity College, London,
has decided to despatch Mr Charles Ed-
wards to conduct this year’s examin-

ation in practical musical subjects in
New Zealand, and to give to Dr. Creser

the task of putting Australian aspir-
ants to musical honours through their

fsi ings.

Mr and Mrs Addison J. Newbold, who

came Home by the Oroya last year, have

been staying with relations up at Dar-

lington, in Yorkshire, hunting and

golfing in the neighbourhood. They

are now in town and intend staying here

for the season, then go to Devonshire,
then for a couple of months abroad, and
back to London, where they intend to

live for a time.

Last Sunday afternoon at her studio in
St. John’s Wood, Miss Grace Joel (Dun-
edin) had eighteen pictures to show to
her friends. She certainly excels in

painting the nude, and it is not surpris-
ing that her mastery of the subtleties of
flesh-tints was highly praised when she
was working in Paris. A full-length por-

trait of a boy was perhaps the most at-

tractive of her collection last Sunday,
and Miss Joel has already been rewarded
by a commission to paint the boy’s sis-
ter.

Amongst this week’s visitors at the

oilices of the Agent-General have been

Miss Dora Barron, from Caversham

(Dunedin) and Miss Ella Adams (Blen-
heim), who are both staying in Leinster

Square, Bayswater. Mr Arthur H.
Adams also called; Mr Walter Hislop
(Dunedin), Air Claude Shillitoe, and Mr

Joshua Whiting (Paraparauma); Airs
Smith, Air Claude Welsby, Miss Lettie
Hassell (Timaru); Mr Kenneth Thom-
son (Gisborne); Air Bartteman of Dun-

edin; Air Wright (Alt. Somers), and

Miss Napier Hitchings.

Airs Percy Ray (Auckland) is at pre-

sent undergoing a course of treatment
at Buxton, in Derbyshire, and intends
to return to New Zealand in October.
Mrs Ray came Home by the Medic

•early a year ago to consult specialists,
and until she settled down at the Bux-
ton Hydropathic had been visiting
friends and trying several health re-

sorts. Since living at Buxton she has
become strongc r and better, and hopes
to be completely recovered before her
voyage back to Auckland.

Dr. Arnold Izard (Wellington) sails
on the 13th by the Shaw Saville s.s.

Gothic. He has seen a good deal of the
world since he left New Zealand. He
went up to Trinity College, Cambridge,
and was afterwards House Surgeon at

St. Bartholomew’s Hospital, London,
under the famous surgeon Air Walsham.
Last week he took his AI.B. degree at

Cambridge, the thesis which he read on

that occasion being “Appendicitis.”
It will be remembered that Dr. Arnold

Izard served with the Rifle Brigade in

South Africa, and now wears the medal
with two clasps.

Airs Sunderland, who lived at Gis-
borne for many years, and came Home

to England in February, 1896, has

settled down now in the west of Lon-
don. Aliss Joan Sunderland is acting
as one of the secretaries to the well-
known Miss Octavia Hill, who has taken
up so keenly the problem of the housing
of the poor, and works on the Commit-
tees of the Charity Organization Society,
the Kyrle Society, and the National
Trust for protecting places of history,
interest and beauty. The Ecclesiastical
Commissioners have handed over the

management and some of the small tene-

ment houses on their London estates to
Aliss Octavia Hill, so her lady secretar-

ies, amongst other experiences, have to
do rent-collecting in the slums. In spite
of all such unpleasant tasks, Miss Sun-
derland may well be congratulated upon
coming under such training and in-
fluence as that of Aliss Octavia Hill, and
whatever career she may eventually
adopt, her present experiences will be of
life-long value.

The Agents-General for New South
Wales and New Zealand were present
at a dinner last week, got up to “push”
the proposed Capetown Exhibition. The

Duke of Argyll, who was in the chair,
explained that the show was to be held,
primarily, if not exclusively, for the
benefit of British and colonial exhibit-

ors. During the post prandial flow of

verbosity, some very hot speeches were

made against the “shipping-ring,” and

one of the speakers accused Alessrs
Donald Currie and Co. of bringing
goods from New York to the Cape for

12/ a ton whilst charging British ma-

nufacturers up to 40/ a ton. The loud
applause which followed the demand of

another speaker that subsidised ship-
ping companies should be made common

carriers, showed what the majority
present thought of “the ring.”

Chief Inspector Dinnie, who has ac-

cepted the position of Chief of Police
for New Zealand, granted me a very

brief interview at Scotland Yard the

other day. He is a fine, healthy, firm-
looking man, just the type for the work

he has undertaken. In answer to en-

quiries as to his past experiences, Air

Dinnie said that, for the present, his

mouth was closed, as he was still in
an official position here, and it would
be against all rules and regulations for

him to talk to the press. As soon as

he is out of harness here, he promised,
however, to call upon me, and no doubt

we shall then be of mutual assistance
to each other.

“Scotland Yard,” where I saw Air

Dinnie, is no longer the mean little

courtyard out of Whitehall of the old
days—the site of that corner of the old

palace where our forefathers used to

keep troublesome Scotch kings in a

sort of back yard. The present police
headquarters is as fine a modern build-

ing as we have in all London, a huge
place—with just the suggestion of a

mediaeval Scottish stronghold—facing
on to the river and not a stone's throw
from the Houses of Parliament. The

architect was Norman Shaw, and his

design is well worthy of the admiration

it gets on all hands.

Air T. Al. Wilford, AI.H.R., and Airs

Wilford reached Plymouth last Wed-

nesday week by the Gothic, much de-
pressed by the two cases of suicide that

happened on the voyage. After landing
they first went to Land’s End and saw

Marconi’s wireless telegraph station at

Poldhu. They had a talk with Marconi
himself, and he expressed himself as

being greatly interested in New Zea-

land. Then they came on to London

by way of Bath. Air Wilford is amongst
the many New Zealanders who have

had to come Home to consult special-
ists. He has been making inquiries all

round as to who is the best man to con.

suit, and he says he cannot get two

people to agree on that point. Dr. Sin-

clair Thompson being away, Air Wilford
is going to see Dr. Henry Taylor next

week. Both Air and Mrs Wilford say
they feel the effects of our delightfully
variegated climate very much, but ns

this last winter has been one of the

mildest we have suffered for years,
they have something for which to be
thankful. They wisely defer sight-see-
ing until after the business of consult-
ing doctors is over. Mr Henniker Hca-

ton, ALP., the post-office reformer, and
Colonel Denny, M.P., have both shown

them much kindness, and they have
dined in the Members’ Diningroom at

the House of Commons. If it turns out

that any operation is necessary for Air

Wilford’s throat, they will go down af-

terwards to the South of France as

soon as the journey can be made with

safety, meanwhile they remain at the

Grand Hotel in Trafalgar Square. Mr

Wilford’s last word to me had a true

human touch in it, “I never knew how
dear New Zealand was to me until I
came to leave it.”

Alany New Zealanders will remem-

ber Air Hugh Frere, who first came out

to farm there, and settled in Canter-

bury, near Kirwce. He then went down

South, and was ordained by Bishop Ne-

ville, of Dunedin. Then he held a dis-

trict on the Waitaki, and, later, came

Home and took up church work in Pal-

estine. Last year he was made an arch-

deacon, with jurisdiction over the

whole of Palestine and Egypt. Some

months ago he returned to Beirut, and

appears to be having lively times of it

there. The anarchy in that part of
the Sultan of Turkey’s dominions seems

to be about as bad as can well be im-

agined. Alurder and robberies take

place every day, and the nominal go-

vernor of “Vali” and every official un-

der him are utterly corrupt. Com-

plaints are worse than useless; indeed,
it is dangerous to make any. Even,

Europeans are in danger. Archdeacon

Frere was stopped and fired at some

time ago whilst driving through Beirut,

but, as all his old friends know, he is

about the last man in the world to

know what fear means. He is just the

man for the place—calm, determined,
and absolutely fearless. The respect
in which he is held by all the better-
class natives, Alohammedans, or Christ-
ians, is great; he is no hot-headed pro-
selytising fanatic like many Christian
emissaries which the West so rashly
and foolishly keeps sending to the East.
Of course, the present anarchy is dis-

graceful, and will have to be put an end
to, but all the same, if all Christian
teachers were as level-headed as our

old New Zealand friend, Archdeacon

Frere, Alacedonian agitations would
soon cease to keep the whole of Europe
in a quiver of apprehension. Speaking
of that, it is exasperating to find that

though the Powers have already inter-
vened, we have the “Daily News” still
making mischief by screaming out the
most un-Christian lines that Alilton
ever wrote, “Avenge, oh Lord, Thy
slaughtered saints.” Archdeacon Frere,
we have little doubt, could tell us some

very ugly facts about those same
“saints.” The Turk cannot govern,
but we must give him his due, aud see

what sort of people his “Christian”

subjects too often are.

SURGICAL MANUFACTURING CO.,
(Dept. N.Z.) Rubber Works, Broadbestb,

Near Manchester, ENGLAND.
rjb Surgical. Medical, Hospital

g Goods, Rubber Manufactures
of every description. Any ppe-

ET gy cial Article hi Rubber Goods
made to order. Goods not ap-

proved of Exchanged. Illus-
trated Catalogues free ob

receipt of two stamps.

• • 1
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BIRD'S Custard Powder makes a perfect High-Class Custard at a minimum

of costand trouble. Used by all tho leading Dlplomees of the South

Kensington School of Cookary, London. Invaluable also for a variety

ofSweet Dishes, recipes for which accompany every packet.
MO LOGS I HO RISK I HO TROUBLE I
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NATIONAL MUTUAL
Life Association of Australasia Ltd.

Head Office for New Zealand—

CUSTOMHOUSE QUAY, WELLINGTON.

FUNDS OVER £3,250,000
ANNUAL INCOME OVER £500,000

Rates Low. Bonuses Large.

MONEY TO LEND ON FREEHOLD PROPERTY.
AGENCIES THROUGHOUT THE COLONY

Send for Prospectus.

J. KEW HARTY, ORTON STEVENS,
DISTRICT MANAGER,

Queen Street, Auckland. resident secretary
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Copyright Story.

Rattingan's Sour Acre.
By FRANK SAVILE.

(Author of “The Blessing of Esau,” etc.)

A fine crop of oats? ’Tis the thrue
Word, Master Francis. Ye’ll not find a
better wan outside a book of poethry,
an’ ’tis little the po-uts know of farmin’’
the quare creatures they are. D’ye re-
collect Shamus, ildest son of Rattigan
Reilly that had the houldin’ beyont the
wood? ’Twas he was the bhoy to poet-
ise—so he was. He’d shcraped himsilf
into a newspaper office in Cork, begin-
nin’ by lickin’ the halfpenny wrapper
f’r eounthry subscribers an’ visin’ byslow degrees to pennin’ the death an’
desthruction articles f’r the Saturday
edishun—burnin’ words that filled the
sowls of the readers wid wrath, an’ their
breeches pockets wid bricks, an’ giv’ the
polismin more to think of b’ closhin’
time than the clanin* of their ’coutre-
mints. Oh, he was a malicious ribil, he
was that.

“Like all our greatest men, though,
he’d his softher momints. Whin he’d
shtirred up appropriate disthraction f’r
the wake ind, he’d come up to visit his
father on the Sunday afthernoon, raycu-
peratin’, as he called it, wearin’ his hair
a fut beyont his collar, an’ wid the scaf-
foldin’ up f’r a beard that he’d acquired
the copyright. of from Auntie O’Gehe-
gan’s goat.

“Thin he’d shtick wan hand behint
two buttons of his vest—if two buttons
was there, for his Bohaymian instincts,
so he said, rayvolted at an over particu-
lar nateness—toss b the flowin’ locks
from his intilligent brow, an’ use words

Father Malachi denied was in any Chris-
tian man’s dictionary—an’ ’twas he
sh’d know, the orator that he is.

“’Twas there I mesilf saw him wan

afthernoon, shtandin’ beside his father,
Mrs Reilly an’ the girls wid mouths and

eyes gapin’ at him, what while he ray-
pated t’ thim the redliot sintimints he’d

been hurlin’ into the p’litical arayna the
day before. A proud bhoy he was, an’
had cause t’ be. Five of the constabu-
lary was in horspital wid shplintered
ribs, an’ but wan whole nose betwixt the
half dozen of thim, th’ Inspictor was

carryin’ his head in a sling, an’ tin of
the bhoys was jailed along wid six com-

pound fractures an a broken leg. Niver,
he declared, had he risin to such heights
of rettyrick; niver had the pathriotisin
of the people responded wid such loyal
sympathy t’ the deduesliuns of their

chosen leader.

“ ’But,’ says he, whin he’d finished
tellin’ how Thady O’Rourke had thrans-
fixed the Superintindint wid the half of

a broken hay fork, an’ Turk O’Neil had
bit two fingers from a constable, an’
three from a sergeant, ‘these are no

thames f’r a paceful Sabbath avenin’.
Let me soothe me spirit wid the calm

of th’ expirin’ day. Let us observe,’ he

savs, ‘the goulden glories of the corn.’
He was starin’ at the few heads of oats

that was peepin’ through the bouldhers
on the home allotmint, d’ye see, sorr.

“‘Goulden glories, bedad!’ says his
father, that had less poethry inside of
him than there’s tar inan egg, an’ that’s

none at all, ‘goulden glories!’ says he.
‘’Tis only shmall silver or copper, an’

little enough of that that I can see in
thim. Eight shillin’s t’ the sack is all

ye’ll arn me f’r that crop, Shamus, if ye

wag y’r tongue from now to Christmas,’
he says.

“ ‘Tut,’ says the bhoy, ‘ye rayvolt me,

father, wid y’r commershul imagina-
shuns. Let y’r sowl have play,’ he says.
‘ ’Tis the impayrial colour, not the

price, that I’m alludin’ to. Look at it!’

says he. ‘Mark the rich yellow glintin’
against the kindly brown airth I”

“ ‘I see it—bad cess to it,’ says Ratti-

gan, ‘an’ the poor playground f’r any

man’s sowl it is. There’s nothin’ there,’

says he, ‘to move me shpirit to blind-
man’s buff. A sourer, unwholesomer
paddock niver sucked the shwcat of a

poor man’s toil. If I had the due ray-
suits of me labour it sh’d grow a bushel
t’ the shquare futl’

“I giv" the gay laugh, f’r Ratty was

niver the wan to dcsthroy his consti-
tushun wid labour while pheasants

roosted low or rabbits ran on four feet.
Year in year out there was mate in the
crock on the hearth, an’ the few oats he

grew was more to athract his neighbours*
birds than t provide male f’r his fam’ly.
His corn allotmint hadn’t been more
than scratched, in a manner of shpakin,’
since the year he shquatted on it, an’
tuk. Mar y Moriarty f’r his sicond wife.

“ 'Y’r right,’ says Shamus, foldin’ his
arms acrost his chist an’ dhrawin* a

breath. ‘Th’ unrequited an’ patient toil
of the pisants cries to Hiven against th’

exacshuns of the raypeecious aristhoc-
racy,’ says he. ‘Why wudden we rayturn
t’ the innocent days of yore whin the

fruits of the airth were the rights of all,
whin rints was paid wid battleaxes or

not at all, an’ whin the hare, the rabbit,
an’ aven the mighty stag was f’r the
eatehin’ of thim that cud—catch,’ lie

says, hesitatin’ to use wan syllable when

three or aven four wud have served his
purpose.

“‘Bedad, y’r wrong about that last,’
argues Rattigan. ‘l’ll not say that
hares an’ rabbits wasn’t here wid Brian

Boru. But the stag’s an imported baste.
What time Sir Daniel had the shmall

herd of deer in the home park, ’twas his
own kaper tould me father—rest his

sowl—that they- was all the produce of
wan buck an’ three hinds that he got in

a. cattle boat fr’m England wid a dhrove
of Shorthorns.’

“Ah now, father avick, ye shpake fr’m
the depths of y’r ignorance,’ says
Shamus. ’Whin our ancesthors was

dhressed in their own clane siskins, an’
used the death dealin bow an’ arrow, deer
was as plentiful as sheep, an’ twice as

fat. An’ more than that,’ he says, ‘the

great elk, eight fut high, six fut broad,
an’ wid horns ye cuddent have housed
in the Squire’s parlour, browsed acrost

the mountains, providin’ mate f’r a fam’ly
f’r the best half of a winter.’

“ ‘An’ where did ye larn that fairy
tale, Shamus lad?’ says Ratty. “Tis
the great man ye are, an’ always was, at

discoverin’ what was niver lost,’ says he.
“ “Tis nororious,’ says the bhoy. T

seen the picture of the skeleton of wan
in Dublin Museum, an’ more than that
the horns an’ bones of another was dug
no longer ago than last wake fr’m a Tip-
perary man’s pate pit b’ an’ould homedod
of a German profissor of Ballyontology
wid a head on him like a frog’s. I seen

it mesilf,’ he says, ‘in Cork Town Hall.’
“‘Th’ horns or the frog’s head?’ says

Ratty. ‘Think shame t’ y’rsilf, ye inno-
cent child, to be fooled wid any Tipp’-
rary man’s imbellishmints. F’r the price
of his own shkinful of the good stuff, any
bhoy in Cashel w’d unairth ye th’ Ark,
wid Noah’s fottygraft on' the top
thransom.’

“ "Twas not the Tipp’rary man but the
profissor’s own silf that unairthed this
wan,’ says Shamus. "Twas this way.
Tli’ ould gossoon was wandherin’ around
like a navvy wid a hammer, hewin’ at
rocks t’ discover th’ ancient shnails that’s
embedded in thim, an’ bein’ overcome

wid the heat an’ his own exershuns,
turned aside to this O’Reilly’s cabin f’r
the chanst of a taste of milk. There
was a quare bit of bone shtuck in the
wall f’r a hat peg, an’ what time the

ould man turned up his eyes to gulp at

th* bowl, he focussed his spicticles on

to it. O’Reilly himself tould me that the

yell th’ ould omadhawn giv’ wud have
gone nigh to curdlin’ the marrow- in any
wan’s shpine.

“ “He dhropped th’ bowl—an’ be the
same token O’Reilly made him unhder-
shtand tin shillin’s wud barely buy a

new wan—plucked the thing fr’m the
plasthcr, an’ demanded where in the
divil it come from, an’ O’Reilly, not
havin’ the wits at short notice t’’ devise
anythin’ but the thruth, tould him he
turned it up wid a touch of th’ shpade in
the patch before the door.

“ ‘At that this quare ould gont
shquealed like a sehalded pig an’ offered
him a sovereign f’r ivry piece like it he
could find an* £5 to dig up the whole

patch before his eyes. O’Reilly was that

astonished that he closed on the terms
like a clasp knife, whin a momint’a eon-

siderashun should have showed him that
what was valued at five pounds cud

asily have been made worth tin by half

an hour’s bargainin’. But the long an’

the short of it was that they shtruck on

the horns afther a couple of hours’ pick-
axin’, an’ the profissor collided ivry knob
of thim, an’ had thim eiminted an’

shtuek up f’r show- within the wake.

’Twas the buck, he said, an* now he’s

back on the houldin’—’tisnear Cashel—-

worryin’ t’ find the hind, an’ givin’
O’Reilly five shillin’s the hour to dig
ivry inch of the dhirt he owns. Mrs

O’Reilly’s worn a shawl fit f’r an Impress
since last Saturday, an’ her husban’s

bought three heifers an’ a foal.’
“ ‘D’ye mane to tell me, Shamus,’ says

Ratty, ‘that th’ ould loonatick’s givin’
him five shillin’s an hour to cultivate

his own allotmint?”
“ ‘Just that,’ says the lad, ‘an’ all

on the chanst of findin’ ould bones whin
new an’ betther wans is to be bought by
th’ shovel full fr’m O’Rourke’s shlaughter
house in Moyle.’

“Ratty giv’ the deep sigh.
“‘Begor!’ says he. “’Tis ali too thrue

that the wise men was born to nourish

the fools. Why wuddent I find an elk,
or a hip’pottymouse, or a tiger in that

sour shtringy slough of a p’tatie patch
of mine that’s bruk the heart in me this

twinty years?’
“Shamus cast him a look meditative-

like. Thin a twinkle grew- in the eye
of him. He giv’ a quare laugh.

“‘’Tis a sour patch,’ he says, starin’
at it, ‘’tis sour indade. May be ’twould
be the savin’ of it t’thry th’ effects of
deep cultivashun.’

“ ‘Will ye be offerin’ y’r Sunday leisure

f’r th’ experiment?’ says Rattv, polite-
ful.

“Shamus shtuck a finger in the arm

hole of his vest.
“ ‘I will, thin,’ says he chucklin’.
‘“’Tis good bearin’,’ says Ratty, tin-

belavin’. ‘Work will be a divartin’ ex-

payrienee f’r you that’s niver thried it.”
“ ‘Civil words now,’ says Shamus, ‘or

p’rhaps I’ll not be exercisin’ me talints
f’r y’r benefit. ’Tis not the coarse la-
bours of me hands that I’ll expind. but
the fruits of an unaqualled brain. There’s

more ways of shiftin’ mud than be hew-

in’ it wid a shovel,’ he savs.
“ ‘ *Tis you should know,’ says his

father, ‘bein’ accustomed to shtir' it wid

y’r circumlocushuns in print. What

will ye bring to it here, though? It
needs little less than a steam dredger
to make an impression on what ye see

before ye.’
“ ‘Tut,’ says Shamus. ‘the pair of arms

that’s hangin’ fr’m y’r own shouldhers
c’d do all that wants doin’f’r a slitart.

Get me a hole dug three fut deep among
the p’taies here, an’ I’ll see t’ the rest

of the manipulashuns,’ he says.

“‘What’s that?’ says Ratty. ''Twill

jshpoil the best half of a bushel of the

young roots,* he says, ‘and who’ll pay
me f’r that?’

“‘Ah, father dear, don’t be afther
strainin’ y’r head beyont the size of y’r
hat,’ says th’ inip’dint lad,’ says he, ‘Do as

y’r bid, be a blessin* t’ y’r family, an’

(lave y’r eldest son watch over y’r in-

thrests,’ he says, dhrawin’ his arm

through mine, an’ fadin’ me aside. Th’

ould man growled like a bear, but f’r
all his snarls, ’twas the high opinion of
Shamus’s diplomacy he had. I heard him
cry to th’ ould woman f’r his mattoek as

we turned the corner.

“ ‘Tim,’ says the bhoy, ‘this same ould
buffalo of a profissor’s cornin’ t’ shtay
wid the Squire the wake afther nixt.”

“ “Hivins above its!’ says I. ‘The Mast-

er tould me that a Bohaymian Shcan-
dinavian sort of a gintieman was asked
f’r a fortnight come Tuesday, but he
giv’ no particulars. Will he likely bring
his shpade?’ I says. ‘The Misthress ’ll
allow no excavashuns in her flower gar-
den, but there’s a power of cats buried
in the raspberry canes. Blase I he Saints
that’ll contint him,’ says I.

“‘Ye may be asy about y’r geraniums,’
says Shamus, ‘an f’r the mather of that
about y’r currants an' y’r raspberries.
But if th’ ould grave-digger- Pi;pi en-

hauser’s the name he’s not ashamed t*
bear—sh’d happen to ask ye if ancient
remains is notorious in the disthrict, ye
might put in a good word f’r that same

sour paddock of me father's—ye might,
do so, Tim, f’r ould sake’s sake.’

“1 shtopped in the road wid me mouth
wide open. Thin I giv’ the great I-n-.Ji.

“‘Bedad, Shamus,’ soys I, ‘ye’ve the in-

ganiousness of the whole of Thrinity Col
lege undher wan hat. But how’ll I ;.t
thraet th’ ould ihnocint to the! pitch
more than any other wau? ’Tis little I

know of Ballyontology. or what Ivor ye
oall it, f’r all me larned looks.’

“‘Lave that t’ me,’ says he. ‘Do you
set the thrap, Tim, an’ I’ll sec to th’ bait-
in’ of it,’ an’ no more c’d I get fr’m him.
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He wint back to Cork an’ th' ladin’ out

of rivolushun that same avenin’, an’
/divil a word did he sind f'r the best

part of a week.

‘•Thin wan mornin’ Pethcr, the ]-:st-
bhoy, come Miweatin’ up th’ avenue wid
a large brown paper parcel peepin’ out

over the rim of his bag. lie giv’ it me

vid a sour look.

“ ‘l'll thank ye t’ have y’er shoppin’
sint home in a van nixt time, Tim.’ says
he. ‘ ’Tis no duty of the Post Office to

hoist wan cubic fut of y’r rubbish sivin
miles on me patient back. Ain I a mule?’
he savs.

"‘A near relation of the father of
wan,’ says I, takin’ the thing fr’m him,
an’ he wint away as black as the Mas-
ter’s eb'ny shtick.

“ ’Twas covered wid lashin’s on lashin’s
of brown paper, but w hin I got t’ the last
of thini nothin’ else dhropped out but an

ould bone, bleached white wid weather,
wid a scrap of paper shtuek to it wid a

tin tack.

“

‘Me devoted frind,’ wrote Shamus.
‘The inclosed was found on me parint’s
allotmint b’ the turn of the hoe among
the young whale. Bein’ aware of y’r
partiality f’r curiosities, 1 sind it you
vid me blcssin’, hopin’ it'll bring ye the

good luck ye deserve. ’Tis a shniall
token of me affeeshun, but value it f’r

the sintimints it rayprisints, which are

well known to vou,’ savs he, an’ that was

all.

“It ink no great pondherin’ t’ see his

mailin'. ’Twas the bait t’ atthract the

ould shnail-grubber, an’ 1 was the bhoy
that was to dangle it undher his nose. I
giv’ a laugh, burnt the note, tossed the

bone on the saddle room shelf, an’ be-
dad! forgot all about it f’r two days or

more.

“Thin wan mornin’ the Master an’ an

ould grizzled giutleiniii, wid spicticles on

him like bow windows, came shtruttin’ it

t’ ordher the horses to ride over to Sheila
Abbey, where I suppose the ould insurrec-

tionist meant havin’ a day's shpade work
among th’ ancient tombs.

“I'll not forget in a hurry the face that

grew upon him whin he set eyes on that

bone on the shelf. The veins on his fore-

head shwellcd like b’loons, an' his breath

seemed like to choke him.

“‘Man.’ says he in his puddeny foreign
voice, ‘man! where in the wide world did

ye rob this from!’ an’ hild up Simmus's
rilic f’r th’ Master t’ see as if it was so

much solid gould.
“ ‘That?’ says I, indifferint like. ‘ ’Twas

found on me frind’s allotmint. an’ I tuk
it to bone the Master’s ridin’ boots wid.

Hut ’tis too ould an’ too unaven f’r me

purpose I find.’ says I. slow an’ stiddy.
“He tuk oil'his glasses. Thin he tuk a

stare at the Squire; thin he peered at me.

In the ind he whipped out a magnifyin’
glass an’ examined the shplinter all over,
usin’ terrible words in his own spaehe,
till the Master interrupted him.

“‘What is it at all?’ he says. ‘ls it
the tail of an allygaytcr or th’ shnout of

a rhynos’rits that ye’ve found in me in-
nocint saddle room?' says he. ‘Luck’s
fond of qunre roostin' places,’ he savs,
‘but fossils in me shtable yard is beyont
mew hole expayrience.’

“Mister I'uppenhauser- did ye her
hear such a name?—giv’ him a look.

Tis no fossil,’ says he. ‘but a hone.’
“‘Save vs!’ says the Squire, ‘wild ye

sind f’r the Crowner? Has nnirdher been
done?’ he asks, laughin'.

“ ‘1 don't undhersthand y'r ollicial sys-
tim.' says th' mild man, 'but I'll not say
the polis mightn’t take a look at it,’ he

says. ‘Can ye show me exactly where ye
say it come from?' he asks me, peerin’
through bis giglanms like an owl.

“an 1 net?' says I. ‘Within an inch
of it,’ 1 says, plased that matthers was
coinin' to a head quick an' asv.

‘ 'Tis but
the half of half a mile fr'in where ve
sht and.’

I hin 111 thank ye to guide me

there,’ says he. an’ whin the Squire ex-

postulated that twud be a shame, an'
a -mrow t waste the mornin' on a pate
pil whin th' whole ntmosphare was ap-
palin' t’ thini t’ ride abroad an’ enjoy
such a day, he turned on him like a fox

unairthed.
‘‘‘Maul’ says he. ‘what's y'r tombs

compared t this. ’Tis no less than an

«Ik hone—as fine a wan as has been dug
in Ireland!* he says, an' giv’ me the sign
♦o hide on as if he was a (•'ineral. With-

in tin minutes I had him at the Rntti-
gan's front door.

“ Hatty was turnin' the barren soil be-

yont the p’tatie patch like a navvy, He
lifted his cnubcii. shpared me one know-

in' glint of th’ eye, an’ give us good
mornin’. Th' ould man was on to him

like a Hash " —•—~

“ ‘ ’Tis you that found this’ he say’s,

danglin’ his bit of shkeleton before his

face, an’ Ratty, pondherin’ over it cir-
cumspections, brought his nose that

elose you'd have bclaved he wanted to

recognise it b’ the shmcll.
“ ‘Thrue enough,’ he says at last.

‘ Twas resurricted b' me hoe a wake
last Thursday. But howiver it come to

y’r baud, sorr,’ he says, ‘y’r welcome to
it.’

“Th’ ould man giv’ a curious grow).
“'Have ye more like it?’ says he,

slipakin’ as if he’d a quinsy.
“ ‘Sorra wan,’ says Ratty, ‘unless

there’s more buried bennyth me p’tat-
ies, an’ that I’ll not be able to tell till

they’re dug,’ says he.

“Old Puppenhauser looked him up an'
he looked him down. For all the world

he seemed like a man fightin’ f’r his

life wid a fit.

“ ‘l’m intherested in such things,’
says he. ‘l’ve dug up the like else-

where. An’ f’r ivry bone similar to

those unairthed in Cashel that ye’ll find

in this plot, I'll giv’ wan sovereign for,’
he says.

“F’r the life of him. Ratty cuddent

help givin’ a broad smile, but he didn’t

forget t’ bargain, f’r all his eontint-

mint.
“ ‘Much as I’d like t’ favour a frind of

the Squire’s, 1 enddent do business on

those terms, sorr. Me p’taties is in an’

me oats is promisin’ five quarther to

the acre. If I dig, who’s to’ pay f’r th’

desthruetion of me crops?' says lie, vid

an eye on him like a magpie's.
“ ‘lf ye find what I’ve mintioned. I’ll

be at the cost of y’r few crops,’ says the

ould man, ‘an’, above an’ beyont that

I’ll give ye five shillin’s an hour f’r y’r
time diggin’,’ he says.

“ ‘Make it six,’ says Ratty, fair daz-
led wid such fair prospicts of wea'th,
an’ ould Puppenhauser giv’ in widout

a slitruggle. It seemed as ?f Ratty c’d
have asked lin an’ not have been ray-
fused. He wint f'r his mattock on the

shoot.

"Now I was in a fair way to susoiet

th’ ind of the performince, sirr. ’Twas

not f'r nothin’ I'd heard Shamus bid his

father dig a three fut hole. That they’d
got another bone or two hid on the

premises I knew well enough widout

bein’ tould, an’ 1 knew, too, that Ratty
was no bhoy to Hing away six shillin's

an hour b’ findin’ it at th’ shtart. An’

’twas so. F’r the whole of that afther-

noon Ratty dug an’ he dug, but divil a

shplinter of a rib or of a loin did he dis-

cover.

“The nixt mornin’ ’twas the same, an’

the mornin' after that. Each day the.

Profissor was up bright an’ early, Rap-
in’ Ratty at it, shtridin’ up an’ down,
an’ watchin’ the shpade an’ the soil like
a tallyman scintin’ a shebeen. "Twas

Saturday night, an’ the best part of tin

pounds owin’ f’r shpade work before his
hopes was gratified.

"The Master was huntin’ the Profis-

sor an’ I was afther the two of thini to

raymind thini dinner was waitin’ whin

the great, discovery was made. Ratty
had wandhered round again t’ where he

sbtailed b’ now, an’ the bint back of

him tould me iloquent that he’d had ail
the diggin’ he sought aven at six shil-

lin's the hour. He hit a great hew at
th’ airtli. There was a clatter an’ a

scrape fr’m the shpade idge, an’ Ratty
giv’ a cry. So did ould Puppenhauscr,
as he tuk a runnin’ jump, an’ tore away
what Ratty was houldin’ out to him.

He shpit on it. rubbed it elane between
his hands, an’ used a jargon that made
me teeth rattle.

“ 'There's what y’r seckin’ at long
last,’ says Ratty, lanin’ ou his shpade
an’ wipin’ the perspirashun fr’m his

chin. ‘1 hope it's worth the price of the
five an’ forty hours’ toil it’s cost me.’
says he. ‘not to mintion th' money- ye
promised f’r the crops an’ th’ article it-

silf,’ he says.
‘■‘Promised!’ shqucals th’ ould gin-

tleman. slurin’ ut him rod as n licet. I

promised no sneh thing. I offered money
f’r ivry bone ye furnished me similar
to what 1 dug up in Cashel three wakes
back!’

“Ratty giv" a jump as if a hornet had

settled on him.
“‘An’ isn’t that similar?' he cried, ‘ye

chat in’, i hkinllint in’ ould vagabond, thry-
in’ to go back on y'r words Hint two

indipindint witnesses i-an testify to. ’Tis

the very image of the wan ye had fr’m
me the first, whin ye showed me what

to toil f'r!’

"'That may lie,’ says the ould man

calmin’ down, hot slipakin’ wid a rasp

on his tongue like a cross-cut raw, but

’tis not similar to what I dug in Tipp’-

rary f’r the very good rason, ye bouid
thafe an’ robber, that ’tis wan of the

very same bones! An’ now,’ he says,

turnin’ to th’ Squire, ‘v. -e’ll have the
Crowner. if that’s what ye call y’r police
officers, f’r there’s business waitin’ f’r
him,’ he says.

“Ho! Aho! Master Francis, many’s
the night I’ve woke in me shlape t’

laugh whin I think of Ratty’s face, an*

the Squire’s face, an’ me own face too,
whin the bottom dhropped out of the
joke wid such a crash! Raity’d worked

two shtone oft' his weight wid diggin’, an’
all the pay that was cornin’ was the

ehanst of free lodgin’ at the Quane’s
ixpince.. For, d’ye see, son-, ’twas this

way.

“Each wan of those bones, as the pro-
fissor showed us plain enough wid his

magnifyin’ glass, had his own inishuls,
wid the date of their first unburyin’
scratched on them wid a needle point
like print. Fr’m that ividenee there was

no geitin’ away. He’d recognised the

first wan the momint he’d got his micro-

scope to it. What while Ratty was

sliweatin’ through his p’tatie patch the

ould man had caused examinashun t’ be
made of the shkeleton in Cork. Two
bones was found missin’, their places
bein’ supplied wid others that had grown
on an ox—later on Shamus’ landlady
tould how he begged the shin bones from

the Sunday beef—an’ the long an’ the
short of it was that Ratty was dhragged
off to Moyle lock-up nixt day, f’r bein’

in possessliun of shtolen property. But

Shamus was not to be found. ’Twouid

be tellin’ to own who got word- to him.

but that same avenin’ he shtowed away
on the Mail boat at Quanestown, an

shlipped off t’ Ameriky safe.

“What did Rattigan get, sdys you?
Little enaugh, sorr, eonsidherin’ the
throuble an’ the time that he’d wasted.

They tliried him f’r ‘resavin” first, but
none, c’d prove he’d iver had the bones

in his possession, Shamus havin’ giv’ me

the wan an’ buried the other. So that

charge wint by. Thin they put it upon
liim f’r ‘conshpirin’ wid intint t‘ defraud,’
but 'twud be a funny thing f’r an Irish
jury to send down a fellow eounthryman

an’ a friend at th’ accusashun of an ould
Schandinavian bosthoon fr’m th’ other
ind of nowhere at all. They acquitted
him wid acclamashun, an’ Ratty didn't
accipt wan penny less than five pounds
fr’m the ancient shnail catcher f’r fore-

goin’ an action f’r false imprisonment.
But f’r all that he niver forgave his son

Shamus f’r mismanagin’ th’ affair. Whin
they met in New York a year later,
where Ratty himself had to flit afther

his poachiu’ encounter wid Major Pow-

derham—bad scran t’ him!—he tackled

the bhoy upon the doek side, an’ wid
such ostentashun that they do say he

was offered an ingagemint b’ a earpet
batin’ company there an’ thin, nt twict
th’ Union rate of wages, an’ wid im-

maydiate prospicts of a partnership!”
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Auckland Chrysanthemum Show.

MAGNIFICENT DISPLAY.

The annual Chrysanthemum and Dahlia

Show of the Auckland Horticultural Society

was held in the Choral Hail last Thursday

and Friday. The show was a marked

success. In chrysanthemums, that trea-

sure of flower growers, there was one of the

grandest displays that have ever pleased an

Auckland public. The fickle god cf the wea-

ther slept too long this year to injure the

glittering “beauties’* as they hung on the

plants awaiting the hone of cutting. The

exhibits came from all parts of the city,

from distant suburbs, from the northern

shore, and even from Cambridge, whence Mr

Buckland had brought a big assortment of

the finest and newest blooms. Mr J. M.

Warn, of Mayfield, though exhibiting in the

nov’ce classes showed blooms that would

have done credit to the professional tables.

Mr E. J. Harvey,’ an older exhibitor, had
an extensive collection, some of who<e
blooms are the product of Papatoitoi soil.
There were several superb groups of put
plants from the well known nurseries of

Messrs D. Hay and Son (Kemueraj, Messrs
Bennett and Green (Kyber Pass), M. Mc-
Donald (of Epsom), Mr McNlccol, etc., be-

sides numerous collections in cut blooms
from the same firms. That popular feature,
tfie decorated dinner table, was patronised
by 4 exhibitors in the senior class, and

seven in the junior. The decorations
assumed an autumn character, & were of a

most beautiful description. Mr Sharp, the

well known Waikumete fruitgrower and ex-

perimenter, was to the fare in the fruit

classes, and showed twenty five different
varieties of apples. Messrs Bennett

and Green’s dahlias were in ex-

cellent order, although the season af the
dahlia’s prime is almost past at this late
elate. Some of their new varieties wore well

worth a study. They also showed in their
groups some exquisite specimens of that
lovely and growingly popular Japanese

palm, the Cycas Revohila. There were this
year five exhibitors of chrysanthemums in

The interesting novice class, three of whom

camo from Mt. Roskill (Messrs Leonard
Cheriton, J. Former, and Frank Shepherd!,
one from Kemucra (Mr G. W. D. Mu’gan),
and one from Mayfield (Mr J. M. Warn).

Mr Andrew Niccol’s group of maiden hair
ferns was placed in the centre of the ha I’.

Around them were four pretty hanging bas-
kets suspended from the roof, exhibited by
Messrs Bennett and Green. Mr AV. E. Lip-
piatt’s roses contained several new sped-

mens. The 2 most attractive of this year's

novelties were the Apotheca George Hofer.a

massive, deep rose-coloured flower, and the
Frau Karl Druschki, a handsome while.
The collection also contained specimens of
the E. V. Kessellstatt, a tea rose of much

beauty, cream nt base, and heavily tipped
with rose. This was an importation of two

years ago. Mr Llppiatt also showed an at-

tractive collection of apples and pears. The

interesting display of new apples created

by Mr Sharp includes his latest, an unnam-

ed late and valuable keeping apple, sale-
able in October. It ripens during May, just
after the Sharp’s Late Red (Mr Sharp’s
great favourite), which it threatens to

eclipse. The Late Red, says its raiser,

ripens in May. keeps till August and

September, and is then worth li»/ per
bushed. The new variety eclipsing this
must therefore be «»f great value. Mr
Sharp also showed two strains of the welt
known Northern Spy apple, which he lias
noticed to preserve their distinctive char-
acteristics all over the colony. One. which
is half green in colour, is described as the
English stamp, and is slow to reach bearing
age. The other, a deep rod, fruits young,
and is the one mostly met with in New
Zealand.

Messrs Arthur Yates and Co. exhibited
a collection of novelties in vegetables of
the cucumber and tomato families, among
which a pile of fantastic looking edibles
specially attracted the eye. They were the
Rhodesian edition of tin? native. African

cucumber. introduced recently by Messrs
Yates, who describe them as :t juicy fruit,
with a rock melon flavour, of hardy con-
stitution, prolific, forming nil its fruit at

the crown without runners, ami a dis-
tinct acquisition, which will be very po-
pular when known.

Mr Timewell, one of the judges, a new
arrival from England, showed an improved
method of staging dahlias in metal cups,
which will probably be copied in some

• •lasses at future shows. The committee

this year adopted the English Chrysan-
themum Society’s method of identifying
exhibits, a method which enables the
prize cards to be attached to the exhibits
immediately the classes are judged. The
method is a great improvement on the old
system, under which delay in affixing the
prize cards has always been a sore point
wherever shows have been held.

Mr J. N. Warn, of Mayfield, a novice,
was awarded the prize for the champion
chrysanthemum bloom of the show with a

bloom of Madame Carnut. The society’s
certificate for the best bloom in open
classes of chrysanthemums was awarded
to Mr W. F. Buckland (Cambridge), for a
bloom of Lady Hanham. The National
Chrysanthemum Society's certificate for
best collection of 12 Japanese and 12 in-
curved blooms alst went to Mr W. F. B ick

.

land in the open classes, and to Mr E. J.

Harvey in the amateur classes.

Protection of Women and
Children.

ANNCAL REPORT OF THE SOCIETY.

Interesting particulars of the work
achieved by the Auckland branch of the

New Zealand Society for the Protection

of Women and Children and Prevention
of Cruelty to Animals arc given in the

annual report of the committee, which
was submitted on April 16 to the an-

nual meeting. The report, after making
reference to the loss sus-

tained by the society in the

death of tiie late Bishop Cowie, Mr <T. L.

Wilson and Mrs Goodall, commented on

the falling off of subscriptions, and con-

tinued:—’‘Just as our finances were get-
ting into a critical condition we were

cheered by the announcement that the

trustees of the late Mr Bertram were

prepared to hand us the sum of £279
17/6, being a legacy left to us by that

gentleman. Of this sum £2OO lias been

placed on fixed deposit, and the balance
will have to be used to avert the other-
wise inevitable deficit. The Ladies’

Committee is again entitl'd to our

warmest thanks for the kind interest

which the ladies have taken in the so-

ciety, and for their generous aid, which

this year took the form of a grand con-

cert, which by the kindness of our noble

president was given in the ball-room of

Government House, and resulted in the

substantial sum of £5B 6/ being added

to our income.”

Reviewing the work done in the year,
the report states: “We find that in the

protection of women and children depart-
ment 242 cases have been dealt with, of

which it '..as necessary to take 19 before
the, B.M. Court, the decisions being in-

variably in our favour, thus demonstrat-
ing our care in bringing’ such cases for-
ward. From the. nature of the work it

would be difficult and inexpedient to go

into details in a report like this, but Miss

Porter (the secretary) is always please 1

to give every information as to the so-

ciety’s work to anyone sufficiently inter-
ested to rail upon her at the society’s of-

fice in Palmerston buildings. During the

year wo hove obtained orders against
husbands or putative fathers amounting
to £338 3/10 per annum, besides £328

per annum arranged for privately.
In the department for the prevention of

cruelty to animals the society has had

the services of Mr. Alder (the inspector)
for the whole period under review, and

as a result 374 cautions have been given
cither verbally or by letter, while one

case has been taken to Court: but the

best testimony to the society’s work is

to be found in the improved condition of

the horses working in the streets. Of

course the introduction of electric tram

cars has enormously reduced the number

of horses at work, and the labours of the

society to a corresponding degree. This
has enabled the in-pertur to devote more

attention to the snipnient and transit ef

horses, cattle. pigs, fowls, etc., both by
land and water. The society’s printed
warnings have lieeii placed at all railway
stations and steamer landings in the pro
vince, also in all auction sale rooms in the

city, and all possible assistance has been

rendered l.y the Railway Department and

the officers of ihe various shipping com-

panies. In uon.it el ion with this depart-
ment a yard supplied with a water

trough has been fenced oil’ in Quay
street, where. travelling stock can rest in
peace and be refre-lied with plenty of
water. The cost of fencing, etc, was

borne by Messrs. Buckland A Sons anti

the New Zealand Loan and Mercantile
Agency Company, all the arrangements
having been carried out by the inspector
(Air. Alder). Your committee is co-ope-
rating with Southern branches of the

Society for Prevention of Cruelty to Ani-
mals with a view’ to obtaining (if pos-

sible' a Government grant or subsidy in
aid of the funds. It i< wrop'-sed to a>k

the Auckland members of th* llomsc of

Representatives to confer with vour

committee as io the best n.e iu of ob-

taining this most desirable result.

A. (Sb F. PEARS, Ltd.
By Royal WarranLs SOAPMAKERS their Majesties

- THE KING and THE QUEEN. ——

Motice having Veen brought, to Messrs. A. & F. Pears, Ltd.,
that imitations of their Specialities are being offered for sale in

Australasia they have authorized Messrs. F. Forrest & Co.,
495-7., Boorke Street Melbourne, their Agents for the of

PEARS’ SOAP, to take legal proceedings against all persons

infringing their Labels, Trade Marks, Rights, etc.

Lta
-

Clarke’s B 41 Pills arc warramed to cur©
Gravel. Pains in the Baek, and all kindred
Complaints. Free from Mercury. EritabU-hcd
upwards of 30 years. In boxes Ls Cd each, ofall

Chemists and Patent Medicine Vendors
ihroiivhout l he World. Proprietors. Th© Lincoln
and Midland Counties Drug Company, Lincoln.
tCnglan 3.
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Our Cadets.

8000 LADS UNDER ARMS.

(By Telegraph.—Own Correspondent.)

WELLINGTON, April 16.

Dunng the past few months the or-

ganisation of the colonial primary de-

fence forces—school cadets—has been go-

ing ahead rapidly under the supervision
of Major Loveday. For the purpose of

securing uniformity in connection with
the organisation of the scheme Major
Loveday is at present engaged visiting
every corps in the colony, most of which

have been formed into battalions, and
uniforms, rifles and accoutrements have

been issued throughout the forces. It
is calculated there are now in the col-

ony over 8000 boys under arms as cadets.

Auckland, which is claimed to have the

best uniformed body in the colony, has
37 corps, from which it is proposed to

form three battalions. The matter of

organisation of cadets in Wellington
comes in for warm criticism, appearing
to have lagged sadly in the rear. Al-

though at head quarters and amongst
the first to have the scheme explained
them, the Wellington cadets have not yet
taken steps to form themselves into bat-

talions. Major Loveday speaks highly
of the bearing of those inspected in Dun-

edin, while he says the Auckland cadets

acquitted themselves creditably. The

increase of the eadet force has been so

great that the Defence Department will
be unable to fulfil all their requisitions
for accoutrements until orders now plac-
ed at Home come to h&nd. Over 5000

small Martini-Henri rifles have been is-
sued, and about 10,000 light •>■

rifles have also been sent out do dif-

ferent corps. Old Snider carbines have

all been called in. Last year over

100,000 rounds of ammunition were is-

sued, and as this was insufficient for all
demands, an order for 200,000 rounds
has been placed this y.-.ir, It is proposed
to give the boys a week’s camp every
year. Arangemrents are now being made
to give inducements to cadets to shoot

for prizes given by the Department. Ca-
dets in some parts have made good
shooting with their new rifles, which

have been 'found very accurate weapons.
The Department is publishing a series
of manuals for the use of cadets, and a

drill manual is being published in uni-

formity with that which is being arrang-
ed for adult corps.

Our thillan Visitors.

IMPRESSIONS OF THE COLONIES.

INTERESTING IPShORK AL FACTS.

Our Chilian visitors, the officers and

crew of the training ship General

Baquedano, have attracted a great, deal

of attention during their slay here, and

any opinions expressed by them con-

cerning their ! npressions of the colonies

would therefore interest a number of

our readers. Many of the officers speak

English remarkably well. In conversa-

tion with one of them a representative

of this paper was supplied wit., some

interesting particulars about their visit

to the colonies and their own land,
Chili, which h describes as a wonder-
ful country, with a bright future in

store for it.

Replying to a question concerning
their cruise in these waters, he express-

ed himself in budatory terms of the

progress on every hand evidenced. They

are astonished at the wealth, prosperity
and commerce of Sydney- The mercart-

tile importance of the place fairly sur-

prised them, as, indeed, does Auckland.

They can scarcely conceive that where

a town had sprung into existence only
half a century ago there should be suck

marked evidence of commercial pros-
perity’. In view of Lie fact of

the difficulties the pioneer settlers

must have had to contend with

in dealing with a warlike people,
the progress evidenced in Auckland they
regard as truly remarkable. The ac-

tivity of this place was also a matter of

comment amongst them. The electric

cars, the modern buildings, the splendid
harbour, and the large population ap

pealed to them. In their .tour they
visited the French possessions in the

Pacific, and they arc almost retrogres-
sive, affording decided contrast to the
British colonies.

The warship touched at Tahiti, which

the officer describes as “the gem of the

Pacific,” but which, however, showed

very few signs of advancement with the

times.

His own land, the officer said, is ad-
vancing in leaps and bounds in the path
of civilisation. He refuted the idea

of his people being Spanish. They cer-

tainly speak the Spanish tongue, but
do not view the Spanish with any great
favour, in explanation, he said! that
originally Chili was a colony of Spain.
There was chaos in the land, nothing
was done, there was no advancement in

the place, and at last the people decided
to overthrow the Spanish rule. With
the aid of Lord Cochrane, who came out

of the British navy, and General O’Hig-
gins, a soldier of inestimable worth,
they were successful in gaining inde-

pendence. The Chilian army was re-

modelled and made a formidable fight-
ing force, and the navy was put on a

sound basis, the two commanders men-

tioned being responsible for the respec-
tive changes. To-day Chili has an effi-

cient fleet of warships, and these would
be added io from time to tir.ie. in
fact, the officer stated, Chili is even now

only awakening. She is destined to be-

come a great nation, and it is the ambi-
tion of her people to build up a navy
that would compare with older estab-

lished nations.

Chili itself, said the officer, is a re-

markable country in many respects, and

it is surprising that so little attention

has been paid to it from the outside
world. It is a land connected with the

oldest associations of the human race,
and the comparatively small archaeolo

gieal research that has been made gives
proof conclusive that it has been inha
bited as far back as the ancient Egyp-
tians have been traced. The nitrate

mines (which afford unmistakable evi-
dence of population far back in the dis
tant ages) are destined to provide a

great source of wealth to the people,
and gold is also found in small quan-
tities. Their coal fields are extensive,
and the fuel is of high quality. They
consider their coal equal, if not superior,
to that found in Newcastle, New South
Wales. It is of high value, and gives
very little smoke, an important factor

in naval warfare.

Speaking of the people, he said the

coloured portion, who have excited some

interest here, are descendants of the

ancient race who occupied the land be-
fore the advent of the Spaniards. These

are a civilised and cultivated people.
Then there is the white population,
chiefly descended from the Spaniards,
but who-must not be regarded as such.

They are Chilians, and no more. In

the Republic there are British and Ger-
man colonies, besides smaller propor-
tions of other nationalities. In Valpar-
aiso the English and Germans publish
newspapers in their own language.

A Society Scandal.

CHEATING AT BRIDGE.

(From Our London Correspondent.)

LONDON, March 6, 1903.

The London “Daily Chronicle” gave

tongue the other day to a tale which I

heard some time ago, but feared at the

time to pass on to you. I cannot, I

think, do better than quote the story in

extenso as it appears in the columns of

your responsible contemporary, adding
thereto a few words which may serve as

a guide to the principals therein. The

“Chronicle” prefaces its tale with the re-

mark that it was almost inevitable that

the high play at bridge, which rules in

certain circles, should lead to some such

unpleasant scandal as is connected with
the name of Tranby Croft and baccarat,
and, after mentioning the case of a

young debutante who played high and

lost to an embarrassing extent, continues

thus:

■•The latest scandal of which town is
talking touches a peer and his wife, who
were staying at a country house, and,

though there is no prospect oWlegal pro-
ceedings, the particulars are freely dis-
cussed. The story goes that bridge was

being played, and, while the gentleman
in question was winning heavily, his wife,
who was standing at the opposite side of
the table, was taking no apparent inter-

est in the game. But it presently occur-

red to an onlooker that she was continu-
ally adjusting the combs in her hair or

fastening and unfastening her brooches.

The suspicion was communicated to the

host, and as the result of further watch-
ing the couple were taxed with con-

spiracy to defraud, and left suddenly on

the following morning. It is even said

that the lady openly confessed her part
in the swindle, and excused herself by
the statement that it was quite a usual

course of proceeding. Evidently this
gambling mania must be checked—or

cards must be played, as in Bret Harte’s
days, at the revolver’s muzzle.”

Now, your readers will readily remem-

ber that lot many moons ago a certain

very exalted person had a social engage-
ment to fulfil at the country seat of an

eminent person, but that on the eve of

his visit to the aforesaid seat of the emi-
nent person the very exalted person was

stricken with a most convenient ailment,
called, in lower circles, a bad cold, but
which, in what Jeames Yellowplush of

to-day might possibly call the “Hupper
Suckles, ’ is described as “mild influenza.”

You will easily remember also that the

very exalte! person was, on the morning
of the day’ fixed for his journey to the

country seat of the eminent person, quite
well, so far as his retinue could see, and

waxed merry during the process of af-
foresting a certain road.not a hundred

miles from a castle celebrated in English
history, but that in the afternoon, within
a few hours of the time when he should

have commenced his journey to the coun-

try home of the eminent person, he was

found by his physicians to have contract-

ed “mild influenza,” and was forbidden by
them to imperil his health by fulfilling his

social engagement. Also, you will read-
ily call to mind that the Great British
Public was much disturbed at the news

of the very exalted person’s indisposition,
and required to be told from hour to hour
of his condition; how some talked wildly
of cancer, ami others, with an eye to the

“main chance,” did take out insurances

on the V.E.P.’s life, and how the common

people were assured by frequent bulletins
of the very exalted patient’s progression
towards health, which was swift and
sure.

It is now alleged by evil gossips that

the very exalted person’s sudden indis-

position was not the outcome of Rude
Boreas’ blasts on the occasion of the

afforesting of the road aforementioned,
but was caused by a note from the emi-
nent person, detailing the untoward oc-

currences which had let up to the sudden

departure fiom the country seat afore-

said of two personages of lesser eminence,
of whose sin you may judge from the

narrative of the “Daily Chronicle.” The

very exaltjl personage, having no mind
to be embroiled in any scandal of a

Tranby Croft nature, decided, on dit, to

take advantage of a mere cold to forfeit
the pleasures of life at the eminent per-
son’s house. To discover the title of the

persons of lesser eminence there is no

need to go beyond the musicians’ alpha-
bet, which, as you know, is confined to
A.B.C.D.E.F. and G. In society the al-
leged sinners are spoken of as the Earl
and Countess of , and the Countess
was not born in England.

Piny Pong, it Is all the go,

Learn to play It, don’t be slow,
Lots of fun you’ll find indoors,

While outside the tempest roars,

You'll gladly think you’re snug and warm

And not out in the raging storm

To catch a cold, for whi“h be sure

To take some—

WOODS’ GREAT PEPPERMINT CURE.

HOWLAND’S
MACASSAR OIL

FOR ~ HAIR
UNSURPASSED. UNEQUALLED.

Use it for your own and your

Children's Hair and you will find
it Preserves, Nourishes, Restores
and Enriches it more effectually
than anything else. Golden Colour
for Fair or Grey Hair. Sold by
Stores and Chemists. Ask for
Rowland’s Macassar Oil of 67,

Hatton Garden, London.

H. M. SMEETON, Ltd.
=-— ■ JUST OPENED

— ... „
.

A Shipment of Choice Perfumes
LAVENDER WATER, EAU DE COLOGNE, TOILET SOAPS, etc.,

Direct from the Famous Makers—

A LINE OF VERY USEFUL HATRACKS co. and
each Ten Pegs, 1/- Set. CLEAVER,& SONS.
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FOR
A Choi.. Amortnunt of MoVITIE As PRICK’S tdlnburgh

SHORTBREADS, OAT CAKES, BANNOCKS, AND RUSKS.
MASON’S IMPROVED FRUIT JARS .. .. ►

Quarts and Half-Gallons

WIDE MOUTH AMERICAN FRUIT JARS
.. .. Quarts and Half-Gallons

LIGHTNING FRUIT JARS Quarts and Half-Gallons

JELLY CANS (two in a nest). RUBBER RINGS FOR FRUIT JARS,
Full Cash Price List on Application.

H. M. SMEETON Ltd.
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Stamp Collecting.
The practice of sending pictorial post

cards abroad which have not been is-

sued by Government is growing. It is

well therefore to remember that private
post cards are charged letter rates.

• • •

The Government of St. Vincent lias

destroyed the remainder of the Queen’s
head issue, 127,518 in number, of a face

value of £2650, to make way for the

new King Edward stamps. Had it

been a Portuguese colony, tenders would
have been invited for the remainders.

• • •

“Heaven gives almonds to those who
have no teeth to crack them,” says the

Spanish proverb, and just the same it is

sad to think that almonds in the shape
of Niue 1/ stamps were on sale for

a few days at the Auckland Post Office,
but were withdrawn before most stamp
collectors here knew they were to be

got. Human nature always wants what
it cannot get, and collectors now want

some of those Niue stamps very much.

The reason for the sudden withdrawal
from sale of New Zealand shilling
stamps surcharged for use in Niue Is-

land has not yet transpired, but it is

presumed there was an error in the

printing. It is stated that only about

80 were sold in Auckland, and of those

20 were despatched to South Africa. The

man who sent them now wishes he had
not been in such a hurry, and has cabled
to stop the stamps from being sold.

• • •

It seems somewhat of an anomaly
that while stamps with inverted sur-

charges are catalogued at high prices
(as, for instance, the Jd green Niue,
10/), yet inverted water-marks are not

taken any notice of. One should be of
as much value as the other, as in each
case the invert is due to carelessness in

printing. Not for a moment is it to be

desired that inverted water-marks

should be catalogued, but the real point
is whether the upside down surcharge
should be considered such a treasure. As

a matter of fact, surcharging has now

become such a common practice that it

is questionable whether the time is not

near when there will be a considerable
slump in values, and specialists will
learn to their sorrow that the surcharge
is of no more value in making a variety
than the post office obliterating stamp
From an artistic point of view, the sur-

charge is merely a defacement of the

stamp, just the . same as the New Zea-

land dinner-plate cancellation mark,
which, unfortunately, is used at the
Auckland Post Office.

• • •

In recent London catalogues the New
Zealand sixpence green pictorial issue,
colonial print, perforated 11, is quoted
at 3/6, used or unused, and the yellow-
green one 15/ unused, and 10/ used.
These stamps are likely to still further

rise in value, as they were only in issue
for a very short period, being replaced
by the same type of stamp printed in
rose. The sixpence green is easily dis-

tinguished from those printed in London
owing to the perforation being 11, while

the others were 12 to 14. One catalogue
quotes the 5/ New Zealand stamp of the

same issue, colonial print, at 5/, fiscally
used. The sixpence rose stamp, on

paper with no water-mark beyond the
words “Lisbon Superfine,” is virtually
an unwater-marked issue, for of the
pane of 120 no less than 96 are with-

out any water-mark, as the letters of
the trade mark are only spread over

some of the stamps in the fifth, sixth,
and seventh rows. An unused sixpence
on the Lisbon superfine paper can easily
be distinguished, because it has white

gum, whereas other printings on no

water-mark paper have dull or shiny
gum.

• • •

A correspondent writes from Master-

ton enquiring the value of certain New
Zealand and American stamps, but ua-

fortunately only the face value and

date of issue is given. The information
furnished is too meagre to enable a

satisfactory reply to be given, added to

which some of the dates mentioned are

wrong, because there was no change in
New Zealand in some of the years

stated. With New Zealand stamps es-

pecially, the perforation and water-
mark have a good deal to do with the

catalogue value. The American stamp
referred to is of no particular value.
The following quotation may, however,
serve as a guide from which to judge
the prices: If the intention is to sell,
of course a substantial reduction has
to be accepted to enable the dealer to

make his profit. The values are as

follows:—“N.Z. one penny, 1870: There

was no fresh issue till 1872. The value
of the Id brown, water-mark star, if

perforated 10, is 70/ unused, and 8/
used; if 10 to 12J, 20/ unused, 8/ used;

12 to 13, 6/ unused, 2/ used; if no

water-mark, perf. 124 to 13, 20/ used;
if water-mark N.Z. and perforated 12 J
to 13, so scarce as not to be quoted. Al-

though the penny brown of 1872, water-

mark star, and perf. 10, is quoted in

Stanley Gibbons’ catalogue at 70/ unused
and 8/ used, still, strange to say, it is

offered in Pemberton and Co.’s cata-

logue for 1903 at 5/ used and 7/9 un-

used, a marked difference in value that

is hard to understand. N.Z. penny, 1875:
No issue that date, but in 1874 appeared
the new issue with Queen’s profile. The

values are—Lilac, Id, perforated 10J,
water-mark small star, 2/ unused, 6d

used; ditto, blued paper, 7/6 unused,
2/ used; deep lilac, water-mark large
star, 15/ used; penny lilac, 1875, small

star, perforated 10 to 124, 20/ used;
ditto, blued paper, 20/ unused, 16/ used.

N.Z. penny, 1876-77-78, are also en-

quired about, but there were no changes
after ’75 (when the large star water-

mark penny and twopence appeared)
until 1882, when the penny rose and two-

pence lilac came on the scene, and lasted
until the pictorial issue of 1898. The

correspondent also asks where such

stamps are saleable. Of course, for
scarce issues, London is the real mar-

ket, but still there are dealers in the

four centres of New Zealand that ]Ay
fair prices, whose addresses may be
easily obtained. To publish names of
the dealers would be invidious, and,
what is worse, from a business point of
view, be giving them a free advertise-
ment.

UNDER THE ROYAL PATRONAGE OF

H.M. THE QUEEN OF GREECE. H.R.H. THE DUOHESS OF SPARTA.

H.R.H. PRINCESS MARIE OF GREECE. H.R.H. PRINCESS HOHENLOHB.

H.R.H. THE DUKE OF SPARTA. WSjjjlF H.R.H. PRlhjQg GEORQ* OF GREECE.
“ . i »■ r (Bioh Commissioner of Crete, Ac.. Ae.J
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CHILDREN’S PAGE.

Cousins’ Badges.

Cousins requiring badges are re-

quested to send an addressed enve-

lope, when the badge will be forward-
ed by return mail.

COUSINS’ CORRESPONDENCE.

Dear Cousin Kate,—I hope you receive!

Die doll 1 dressed all right, but you Slid

nothing about it, so 1 didn't know whe-

ther it reached its destination or not. I

am going into an office when I am able

to type correctly- and quickly. Igo every

day and practise on a machine from four

o'clock to live. 1 think I am improving
in speed. Cousin Kate, did you go to

“Sherlock Holmes’’’ J did, and thought
it was lovely. I was very disappointed
at not being able to go to the Hawtrey
< Company, but mother said I had been to

too many plays and operas, and that it

was quite time I had a rest. On Easter

Monday J am going to the Star sports,
and in the evening I am going to a

liazaar, which is to be very good. We
have had such awful weather down here

lately, but as to-day and yesterday were

tine I do hope that, we will have a

change. Since last I wrote to you we

have had another fearful earthquake,
quite as bad as the last. None of our

chimneys came down this time, but last

time they nil came down. We only lost

some glass bottles this time. All our

neighbours lost a great many t hings. It

is said that one woman was boiling a pud-
ding before the earthquake came, and

that when she frit the shake she flew
outside, but on remembering the pudding
she tore back ami fetched pot and all and

deposited it on the road, so at all events

she had something for tea. I can’t guar-
antee for iis truth. Did I tel! you that
we went to see Mdlle. Dolores, and we got
her name in our birthday books’ Isn’t it

grand to have the autographs of the two

greatest singers? Do you know I. like
Dolores’ voice better than Melba's. Which
do you prefer, Cousin Kate? .Inst fancy
Cousin Alison going to South Africa. J

don’t think I should like to go there. A

family from here went there too just a

few weeks ago. .1 wonder whether they
will meet. It would be strange, wouldn’t,

it? Now, Cousin Kate, I must elose, so

hoping yon will excuse all the mistakes,
as I have not been at typing long.—l re-

main, yours affectionately, Cousin Dora.

[Dear Cousin Dora,—lt is very curious
that to-day. for the first time, I should

receive two letters typed by cousins just
learning, for I have never had any be-
fore. and, funnily enough. J have just be-

gun doing nil my writing for the cousins

and other pages on the typewriter. Of
course I have written letters before, but
not “copy,” as we call it for the paper.
You write very well indeed, and I did not

sec any mistakes. By the way, you must
have missed the note I sent about vour

because it arrived just after that

letter where I told you it had not turned
up, and I at once posted a card saying it
had arrived after all. It was much ad-

mired, and sold well. I like Dolores bet-
ter than Melba, too, but perhaps because

she sings music one understands better. It

is scarcely fair to Melba to judge her in

opera when she has no orchestra to back

her up. Hoping to hear from you soon

again.—Cousin Kate.]

Dear Cousin Kate,—I expect that by
now you will have forgotten me, as it is

a long time since 1 last wrote. You see,
we did not get the “Graphic" for a year,
and that is why y ou have not heard from

me. I mean to try and write, regularly
now’. Does Cousin Roie write to you

now, because I have not seen any of her
letters for a good time? She used to be

your best correspondent, did she not?
But, of course, as she lived in Auckland,
then theletters would reach you perhaps
the same day that she would write. I

am writing this letter at school upon the

typewriter, as I thought you would like
to see some of my work. My Christmas

holidays were spent at Laidmore, a de-

lightful little sheep station, about twelve
miles out of Amberly. The house was a

pretty old country place, covered with

honey suckle. There was a lovely orchard,
and a kitchen garden at the side. There

were no other houses for about three or

four miles round, so you see it was a very
quiet place. At one side is a deep gully 7,

in which grew’ many pretty native trees,
such as manuka, black and silver birch,
matipo, etc. In the distance you could

see the hills, with here and there a high
mountain rising above. You could see

Mount Grey and Mount Brown, besides
two smaller ranges that go by the name

of “The Dec-tors.’’ About five minutes’
walk from the house was the river. You

had to go down a steep bank before you
came to it, but when you got down you
were well repaid. The river wound in and

5

out at the foot of towering eliifs fur

many miles, and when at last it came to

the waterfall it was lost, with a heavy’
thud in the dark waters below. On the

banks,of the river was the ruins of a cob

hut, where the family lived when they
first came to New Zealand. One day,
however, when they were all very young,
the river rose till it overflowed its banks,
surprising the inmates of the hut at the

dead of night. There was a great rush to

get the younger children saved. The

eldest boy was of great use, and very
soon they were all safe upon the top of

the hill, where the river could not reach

them. Although they’ were all very glad
that they had been saved, they were very
sorry to lose some old treasures that Lad
been in the family for many generations,
and particularly sorry were they to find

that a beautiful pair of bagpipes had

been left. The eldest boy offered to wade

back and see if lie could find them, so

amid the piayers of everyone that he

should get back safely’, his father gave

his consent. The brave boy, although the

water was foaming around him in angry

waves, at last reached the hut. The wa-

ter was almost up to his neck in the hut,
and he ran a great danger of being wash-

ed oft' his feet, but he was unable to find

what he sought, and had to make his way
back to his family, who were beginning to

fear that something had liefallen him.
They built a new house on the pretty ter-

race above the river, and added to it

when they could, until it became very
pretty’ and rambling. The ruins of the
but are now covered with creepers, but

the fruit trees, which were planted, still

bear, especially a fine large peach tree.
It would take a long time and many,
sheets of paper to dwell upon all the

beauties of Eaidmore, but I must not

make this letter too long. I have still
got the “Graphic" badge, and mean to

keep it as long as 1 can. I used to wear

it sometimes, but I was frightened that I

would lose it, so it lies in my little cabi-
net now. I think, dear Cousin Kate, that

I must stop now; with Jove to all my
cousins. I- will remain, your loving
cousin, Winnie Vincent, Christchurch.

[Dear Cousin Winnie,—As you will see

from my answer to Cousin Dora, yours is

the second typed letter I have received,
and, like hoi’s, it is most neatly and care-

fully typed, aaid I could discover no mis-
takes. It is- a very’ nice way of writing,
I think, only s if y ou do spell a word wrong
it comes out so very’ plain. Your de-

scription of your country visit is ex-

tremely’ good, and I much enjoyed read-

ing it, as 1 au sure the other cousins will.

You.have evidently a talent for descrip-
tive-writing; and I should cultivate it if

I were you. 1 hope to hear from you
more- often hi the future, but must now

stop, as 1 have several cousins to answer,

and only a short hour to do it in.—Cousin
Kate.]

Dear Cousin Kate,—I am writing to

aski you if I may become a cousin. I
havaj read the cousins’ letters, agd like
them very much. 1 ’live in Christchurch,
but, I do not like it as well as Auckland,
where we once lived. My sister Wjnnie
is a cousin, but she has not written to

you fur quite a long time; she has.

however, started again, and hopes you
will got her letter. Dear Cousin Kate,
I know Cousin Hannah, of New Ply-
mouth, and. I like her very’ much. Do

you like bathing, Cousin Kate? I do.

We-often go to Sumner or New Brigh-
ton.:and I always bathe. I had swim-
ming lessons, and I can swim very well
nowi The part of the town where I

live, is very’ pleasant, and we have a

large garden and plenty of fruit trees.

I have got a garden of my’ own, but it
diibtiot do very well this year, as it had
to be shifted. The men-of-war have

been into Eyttelton, and my brother
and I went to see' them. We were

shown all over the ship by sailors, who
were very kind in giving us curiosities
as a remembrance of their visit, I

have made this letter a very long one

for my’ first, so I will now remain, hop-
ing you will accept me as a cousin.—
I am, yours very loving. Cousin Olive.

P.S.-—Please dear Cousin Kate will

you- send me a badge if I may become a

cousin?•—Olive.’

[Dear Cousin Olive,—I am most pleas-
edrto weleowie you as a cousin, and hope
you will not only write often yourself,
but make Cousin Winnie keep it up too.

I am glad you know Cousin Hannah. I

wish more of the cousins were person-

ally’ acquainted, as it would make

things more interesting. I used to be

very fond of bathing, but have not nai

any holidays of late where I could get
any. 1 think all girls, as well as boys,
should learn to swim. I will send you a

badge if you will send me your full

name and address. —Cousin Kate.J

Dear Cousin Kate,—Just a few lines
this week, for, you see, I am going to

try and write more often. We have

been haring lovely weather here lately,
though 1 am afraid a lot of people are

wanting rain badly. I went down to

the river this evening with the intention

of going for a row; the river looked

lovely, as there wasn’t a breath of

wind; hut when I got to the bo.: I

found that the tide was right out, and
the boat was high and dry. As I was

alone I eould not very well get the boat

afloat, 1 simply’ had to come home

again. 1 shall go another day, I sup-

pose. We have such a dear little pup

here, though, like most pups, it is very

mischievous, only' tins one is a little

worse, I think, because the cat' helps
it to do lots of things. Yesterday they
got a bundle of dried moss and scat-

tered it about in the hall. I really don’t

know what they’ will do next. Dear

Cousin Kate, I wonder when Cousin

Roie is going to favour us with another
of her interesting letters? It is a long
time since we had one, isn’t it?. Well,
dear Cousin Kate, I must really stop
writing now, as it is getting late, so,

hoping you and all the cousins are well,
I remain, yours truly’, Cousin Jessamin.

P.S.—I am glad you sent my scrap-
book to the Hospital. I hope the little
child is getting belter.

[Dear Cousin Jessamin,—l was very
glad to see a letter in your very neat

writing. I recognised it at onee. I am

pleased to know that you intend to try
and write regularly in the future. It
will be a great help to the page. Per-
haps as the winter nights come on and
there is less to do out of doors in play-
time the cousins will commence to write
more regularly again. Cousin Roie is
at a boarding school in England, und
has, I expect, to work very hard, so

that I fear we shall not get many’ let-
ters from her, though I confess I should
much like one. Perhaps she never sees

the “Graphic” now, and has forgotten
us amongst til the new English friends.
I will let her know how anxiously all
the cousins wait to hear from her, and
perhaps she will write.—Cousin Kate.]

Other Children’s Sayings.

Mamma, said Harry-, “what’s the dif-
ference between goose and geese?”

“Why, don’t you know?” said four-
year-old Annie. “One geese is goose,
and a whole lot of gooses is geese!”

Harry: “I have managed to put my
Ixots on myself this morning, aunty.”

Aunty': Oh, you silly’ boy! You have
put them on the wrong feet. Put them
on the other feet directly!”

Hany: “I haven’t any- other feet to
put them on, aunty.”

’- 1 ■

Jack’s Mamma: “There were three
slices of cake in the cupboard. Jack, and
now there are only two. How does’that
happen ?”

Jaek: “It was so dark in there, mam-
ma, that I didn’t see the others.”

PURE Full nourishment, partly predigested.
MILK •
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A Day at the Seaside.

HOW GRUNTER WAS A BAD BOY

AND GOT HURT.

“It’s very hot to-day,” said Mr Pig,
as he mopped his forehead with a red

pocket-handkerchief, “much too hot

to stop in this stuffy stye, so, if yon
promise to he good children, I’ll take

you both to the seaside.”

“Oh, that will be lovely!” cried

Porka, as she smoothed ner little

brother Grunter’s hair. “When will

you be ready to start?”

Mr Pig looked at his watch.

“There’s a train in half-an-hour, so

get dressed at once, children, and I

will go out and buy you each a buc-

ket and spade.”
Porka needed no second bidding;

she hurried to her room and put on

her white frock with the frill round

the neck, and tied her green sash
in a becoming bow, and then she

dressed little Grunter in his red

and white bathing suit, which is all

a baby pig requires when he goes to

the seaside.
Such a merry party they were as

they trotted off to the station, and

when the short railway journey was

over, and they saw the blue sea danc-

ing in the sunlight, Grunter danced

for joy. Mr Pig showed them how to

make a sand castle, and sand pud-
dings, and then, finding it rather too

hot for a person at his time of life,
he sat down, and told the children
to amuse themselves for a bit.

“Porka, Porka! Just look at the

beautiful star that has fallen on the

beach,” cried Grunter, “but it doesn’t
shine as brightly as those in the sky.”

Porka had been to tlhe seaside be-

fore, and was in the Fifth Standard
at school, so she was able to explain
to her little brother that it was a

starfish he had found, and not a real

star.

Grunter began to cry at this, but

Porka dried his eyes and told him to

come and paddle.

Grunter was a little afraid of the

water, but Porka walked right in,
and showed him how nice it was, so,

after a little persuasion, Grunter

tried it too, and was so pleased with
himself that he went farther and

farther into the sea.

“Don’t go too far,” said his sister,
but Grunter was rather a naughty
little pig, and told her to mind her

own business, and I am certain that

if Mr Pig had heard him he would
have given his son a whipping. But

Mr Pig was so interested in his paper

that he did not notice what the chil-

dren were doing.
“Don’t go too far out, Grunter,”

cried Porka, “for fear you may be

drowned.”

“I don’t care,” replied Grunter, “I

shall do as I like.”

Now, all you little girls and boys
know that something unpleasant al-

ways happens if you say “you don’t

care,” and something unpleasant hap-
pened to Grunter.

He danced about in tthe water, and
threw buckets full of it over his sis-

ter till he took all the starch out of

her pretty white frock, and called
her lots of rude names when she

tried to make him do as she wanted.

He had just called her a silly saus-

age, which is, of course, one of the
worst insults you can offer a respect-
able pig, when he gave a great yell
of fright.

“Oh! oh! oh!” cried Grunter.

Mr Pig dropped his pap<&r and hur-

ried down to the water, and Porka

ran with all her might to see what
had happened to her little brother.
Grunter was hopping about on one

leg, while on the other an enormous

crab was holding firmly with his

claws.

How Grunter yelled, and what a

long time it was before Mr Pig could

free his little son from the crab’s
grip, and when at last he got rid of

the terrible fish his foot hurt him

so the could not walk, so he had to

lie on the sand, while kind Porka

found him pretty shells. And then

his father carried him to the station,

and the train took them all back
home again.

“I*ll never be rude to you again,
dear Porka,” said Grunter, when he

was snugly tucked up in his little
bed.

And after that day he was always
a well-behaved, polite, little pig.

Mr Pig sat down and told the children to amuse themselves.

A TASTE FOR MUSIC.

‘Say, Jim, w’ot’s der matter wid de billy-goat?”
"He’s bin an’ swollered a music-box, an’ I kin hear it a-playin’ ‘Dele’s a hot time’ in his stummiek.”

A Visit From a Fairy.

By ADA Al. KENDALL, 35, High Road,
Small Heath.

Ethel Raymond was a rich little girl,
six years old. She had plenty of toys,
nice food, books, pretty and good cloth-

ing. Her kind parents spoilt her by
gratifying every wish she expressed; but

still she was discontented when she

ought to have been very happy. One

night she was lying in the cosy bed

which was hers, thinking about some

trivial thing which had displeased her,
when she heard a tiny, clear voice call
her name. Turning, she saw a little

fairy standing by her bed. “Come with

me,” she said, and Ethel, feeling only a

bit startled, assented. She was given a

pair of wings, like those the fairy pos-
sessed. They tiew through the window as

if it had not been there and continued

their Hight for some miles. When they
alighted on the ground they were in the
midst of a crowded city. The fairy,
taking Ethel’s hand, led her through
narrow, back streets, until they reached

a squalid court. Of course, they were

invisible to mortal eyes. Here they
looked through a bedroom window and

saw two little girls lying on a mattress

covered only by a ragged counterpane.
"Nellie,” said the youngest child to her

sister, “don’t you wish we were as rich

as the little girl we saw go into that

large house? 1 should like to have

pretty, warm clothes to wear and a big
doll like the one she was carrying.”
"Yes.” said her sister. “It is very hard

to be poor and io have no plum pudding
or presents to-morrow.” Ethel and her

friend then wended their way through
a thronged thoroughfare, and though
a church dock had just struck the hour

of ten poor little boys, scantily clothed
ami bare footed, were endeavouring to

sell boxes of matches. Having witness-
ed these scenes of poverty the fairy took

Ethel home. Waking with a start Ethel

found that it was all a dream. She
made up her mind that she would try
to aet the part of a good fairy to poor
children who lived in the vicinity f her

home.

Sympathy was Powerless.

"Did ye get hurt, sonny?" asked the

kind hearted man.

“No!” howled the boy.
"Lost?”

“No.” with a wilder burst of sorrow.

“Where do you live?”

The boy pointed.
"Waiting for your dad?”

■‘No. Boohoo!”

“Well, then, what is the trouble?”

The boy sobbed bitterly, and answered
in tones of anguish:

"I’ve got the tummie ache.”

DOLLY’S TEA-PARTY.
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AS SEEN THROUGH WOMAN’S EYES.

Queer Marriage Customs.

The Russian Government has under-

taken the tremendous task of attempt-
ing to stop ehild marriages in Turkestan

and the adjoining countries in Asia un-

der the Russian dominion. It has been

customary for Mohammedan girls to

marry between the ages of 10 anJ 12

years, but orders have been issued now

that no Mohammedan shall marry under

14. This action of the Government has

been brought about by the reports of the

Russian officials in Turkestan, who say
that 75 per cent, of the girls who marry
under 12 die before they are 20. The

Tartar and Mohammedan chiefs are much

incensed ever the new order ot tilings, as

all of them seek to obtain brides as

v oung as possible.
The custom of ehild marriage is rapidly

passing away in all countries. Now that

it will no longer be tolerated in Turkes-

tan, the only other countries iu whieu

this custom prevails are India, Persia,
Siam, and among some ot the aboriginal
tribes in Australia and South America.

In Turkestan girls are considered mar-

riageable between 10 and 15, although it

is common for girls only nine years old

to marry. The mother, or sister, or

some female relative of the man who

wants a wife, after having found what

appears to be a suitable match, or, at all

events, a girl who pleases the man him-

self, goes to the girl’s family and dis-

cusses the advantages of the marriage.
The matchmaker is at once asked how

much kalim will be given, and she, in

her turn, is anxious to know the amount

of the dowry, as it is desired that the

kalim and dowry be nearly equal. It is

commonly believed that the kalim, or

money given by the husband, goes to the

father of the wife, and that it is in the

nature of purchase money, but this view

is declared by many travellers to be in-

correct. They say that the kalim is given
to the wife herself, and it remains her

property, so that, in case of divorce from

her husband, she may have something to

fall back upon. When the friend of the

young man has carefully looked at the

bride and found out all about her, she

returns to the man and tells him about

the appearance and manners of his future

wife. The man is then allowed to look

at her without her veil, but only on giv-
ing his solemn word that he looks at her

with the intention of marrying her, and

not out of idle curiosity.

By Musselman law every man is allow-

ed to have four wives at or-* time, but

more than this he cannot legally possess
without divorcing one he has already.
The wife is obliged to obey her husband

in all things, and to avoid evertyhing
that is unpleasant to him, and cannot,
without his consent, make any contracts.

She has, however, a right to food, cloth-

ing, lodging and servants, and to money
for those expenses which are usual among

persons of her rank. She is obliged also

to preserve her beauty as far as she can,
and to try and please her husband; and

for this purpose she is allowed by law to

use various cosmetics. The wife may be

divorced by her husband whenever he

chooses, without his being required to

give any reasons whatever.
In India, among many of the tribes, es-

pecially the Hindus, child marriage is an

old-established custom. Marrying means

simply the buying of a young girl. Her

father names as high a price as he thinks

he can in reason ask, and then he and

the man who wishes to marry the girl
haggle for days, until an agreement is

reached. Of course, there is no court-

ship, and the bride-elect, being only a

child, has no voice in the matter what-

ever. Her future husband and her father

settle the thing to suit themselves. If,
after the marriage, the bridegroom does

not pay •he agreed upon price to his

father-in-law, the wife must return to her

father limit her husband has succeeded

in raising the money.
Omens play an important part in a

Hindu wedding. If, when going over to

see his father-in-law to be, the prospec-
tive bridegroom sees a eat, fox or ser-

pent, he turns back, considering that it

would be ill fortune to go fvther that
day. The father-in-law comes out on his

porch on the evening of the day on which

he has been carrying on negotiations
with his son-in-law- to be, and listens for

the sound of the tree lizard. If he hears

within a tew minutes the shrill tones of

the lizard, he smiles happily at what he

regards a lucky omen, and says: “Every-
thing is well. The lizard has spoken.”

In Siam child marriage- are common

enough. Sir P. J. Bowring speaks of

having sat down to dinner in Siam with
five generations.

In Persia the seclusion in which the

women and young girls are kept renders

love-making impossible. Matchmakers,
who are old women, are invoked when a

man wishes to take a wife, and they visit

the parents of the girl for whom they
wish to make a marriage, and arrange
the details of the match.

In China, while parents often arrange
for the marriage of their children when

they are infants, or even before they are

born, the marriage does not actually
take place until the girl is at least four-

teen years old and the men twenty.
In the Soiomon and many others of the

South Sea islands girls of nine years old
are given in marriage. The poor little
ehild brides must suffer a great deal of

pain before the day set for the ceremony.
Their beautiful white teeth must be filed

down to one-half or one-f' ird their ordi-

nary height, and stained with betel nut.

The filing process takes two or three
hours, and during the ceremony a native
orchestra discourses wild music, which
serves to diown the moans of the poor
little sufferer.

In Afghanistan the women wear no

veils, and a man picks out his bride to
suit himself. The fond lover wastes no

time in courtship, nor does he even take

the trouble to get acquainted with th&

lady of his heart. The lover waits for

an opportune time, and then dashes out

upon the object of his affections, and
either cuts off’ a lock of her hair or else

throws a sheet over her head, and by this
act proclaims her as his bride.

In some of the countries where child

marriage prevails the custom is defended

on the ground that the women in those
climates fade so quickly that they are

old and hideously ugly before they reach

the age of 30. But this would seem to be
because the wives have the eares of mar-

ried life and motherhood thrust upon

them at such an extremely early age that

they become old women when they should

lx* just budding into womanhood.
As civilisation extends the ehild mar-

riage is falling more and more into disre-

pute. While the English Government in

India has not forbidden the custom, as

the Russian Government has in Turkes-

tan, it is doing all that it can to discour-
age the practice, and after a few years it

may be that the little Hindu and Sikh
girls will he permitted to play with their
dolls and enjoy the precious years of
childhood before they are compelled to
become wives without even being able to

realise what such a sacred role- ion means.

SOME STYLISH PELERINES AND BOAS IN FUR FOR THE COMING

WINTER.

THE WHITE HOUSE, RESIDENCE OF PRESIDENT ROOSEVELT.

A RECENT PHOTO, OF MRS. ROOSEVELT RECEIVING GUESTS
ON THE PRESIDENT’S YACHT.
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The Ideal Wooing.

(By the Bachelor of Experience.)

The poet, when he sings of love, gen-

erally surrounds his man and maid with
sylvan beauties, conjuring up for our

pleasure rural glades, purling streams,
and sweet-scented fields.

My object will be to show, however,
that the ideal wooing is not carried on

under these conditions, for I take a

practical view of all such matters, and

consider that, even when he is working

up a love-story to its climax, a novelist

should keep an eye on our climate, and

provide his hero with an overcoat, and

his heroine with a water-proof cape.

There will I make thee beds of roses,

And a thousand fragrant posies.
A cap of flowers, and a kirtle

Embroidered all with leaves of myrtle.

Yes, yes. Master Christopher Marlowe,
this is all very well—for a summer after-

noon! But how about when it rains?
Why, I will e’en parody thee in that

case:

But when the meadows full of splosh is.

We’ll true love make 'neath mackintoshes.

Or underneath—pray choose, my Molly—
The harmless, necessary brolly.

The first verse will, of course, appeal
to sentimental people more than my

hum-drum version; but mothers of

families who are in the habit of dealing
with bad colds will admit that there is,
after all, something in the latter mode of

putting it.

SUMMER-DAY WOOING

is certainly ideal, but such wooing is

for a summer day only. Consider our

long, eold winter time, when there is

mud and snow, and our long, cold sum-

mer-time, when there is also mud (and
occasionally snow); consider our bleak

spring and our inhospitable autumn,
and then deny, if you can, that much of

an ideal wooing is carried on indoors.

Take two young people and put them

in a village or small country town; let
them live somewhere where they are

bound to meet each other at least once

a week, and perhaps twice; let them at-

tend the same chureh and belong to the

same tennis club. Then, if they grow

attached to one another, what a grand
new interest adds fragrance to their

lives! Think how surprisingly regular
he will become in his church-going, and
what a sudden eagerness she will de-

velop to test her new Slazenger racquet!
Then let him become a pretty frequent

visitor at her house, and let her evince

an extraordinary liking for one of his

sisters. This will lead to constant en-

counters, when, it is true, they will not,
in all probability, have an opportunity of

saying much to each other. But what

of that? Perhaps, during a long evening
she will glance shyly in his direction
once. If he sees that glance it ought
to make him happy for days.

And the next time they meet she will,

perhaps, treat him very coldly, and

HE WON’T DIKE THAT;

but, if he has studied feminine ways at

all, he need not be very east down, for

a really nice, modest girl is chary of her

favours, dispensing them with a niggard-
ly hand until such time as she deems it

fit to shower all the treasures of her

love upon the man who has proved him-

self worthy of them.

Believe me, the ideal wooing does not

consist of wandering in meadows and

making “beds of roses.” Under such

circumstances conversation is apt to

lapse into inconsequential nothings that

may possibly grow tedious. But when a

man ean only find opportunity to talk

to a girl at odd, brief times, then will he

carry about in his heart afterwards her

least ejaculations, and recollect every de-

tail of her appearance and demeanour.

In what I will call the “local” wooing
a man and amaid become really acquaint-
ed with one another—come to know each
other as people ought before they take

hands together along the hilly and diffi-

cult road of wedlock.

How much knowledge of one another

have two London people who have only
met a dozen times or so—chie-fly at

dances—before the man proposes?
THEN COMES AN ENGAGEMENT

and—disillusionment.

People who live in London don’t see

half as much of one another as they who

live in the country: therefore the ideal

wooing is not carried on in London, al-

though a great deal of very excellent

wooing is that bears fruit and results

in happy matrimony.
Very iew tilings ean be ideal nowa-

days, and so we have to scrape along
and make the best of circumstances.

When a man does a-wooing go in

London he often has to travel by dis-
trict railways, “tubes,” and ’buses, and

turn out into bleak February nights,
homeward-bound, leaving a warm fire

and his ladylove behind him.

He generally reserves Sunday for
these expeditions, and so has something
to look forward to all the week.

And though the six days between Sun-

days are not ideal ones from the lover’s

point of view, yet it is not bad for him

to have to exercise patience; and in the
end he generally attains his object, and

takes a flat, and presently provides it

with a mistress.

But the ideal wooing is conducted in a

village or small town, where two people
don’t quite know when they won’t see

each other, as opposed to a London

wooing, when the two know with a large
measure of certainty when they will. So
the former mode of wooing must be

superior to the latter, and I maintain
that an ideal wooing is when a couple

meet unexpectedly and frequently, and

not at long or defined intervals.

Little glances, brief snatches of con-

versation. chance meetings—these con-

stitute the ideal wooing. And so. if the

maid ponders all such in her

heart, and the man considers that

Iler very frowns are fairer far
Than smiles of other ma'dens are.

we may take it that it is a genuine, a

commendable and a most promising
“affair.”

Lord Kitchener Again.

Queen Victoria once asked Lord Kit-
chener if the report which she had heard

was true. “Did he not care for any

woman?” “It is true, with one excep-
tion.” Lord Kitchener replied, with a

smile. “And who is that?” inquired
the Queen. “Your Gracious Majesty."
came the answer. It is. by the way,

quite untrue that Lord Kitchener is a

real woman hater. What he scorns is

effeminacy in men. “Is that your sis-

ter's handkerchief?” he asked of a

young lord, who sported a delicately
scented square of cambrie. “No. sir.

my own. Pretty pattern, isn’t it?”

“Very pretty, indeed,” said Lord Kit

ehener. “Now tell me your taste in

hairpins.”

When cooking greens and cauliflowers,
always put a piece of stale bread crust

in the saucepan, as it will take away all

the unpleasant smell. Take out with a

spoon before taking up the greens.
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Women Voters.

WHAT ARE THE RESULTS?

What are the results’ asks Mrs A.
R. Atkinson, of Wellington, when dis-
cussing the woman suffrage in New Zea-
land in the Australian "Review of Re-
views.” She goes on to answer the
question in this manner:—

The definite results of the women’s
vote are difficult to tabulate, and have

proved a disappointment to friends and
enemies alike; though it is only fair
to say that if the reform has not alto-

gether fulfilled the highest hopes of its

friends, it has signally falsified the
gloomy prophecies of its enemies. There
has been no revolution in the condition
of political parties, and “divided skirts
and divided hearts” have not increased.
There is no evidence at all of anv in-
crease of dissension in families. There
is, 1 think, a growing interest in politics
among the richer women, but for the
most part they, as well as working
women, vote very much as the men of

the family do. Even if it were not so

difference of opinion need not mean
loss of harmony and affection. When
Cleopatra, anxious to retain the love
of Mark Antony, asks advice of her
ladies, one of them answers: “In each
thing give him way, cross him in no-

thing.” To which the “serpent of old
Nile,” out of a probably unparalleled
experience, replies: “Thou teaehest, like

a fool, the way to lose him.” Any
musician knows that well-used discords
are of the essence of harmony.

The foolish fears that woman would
be “unsexed” by taking part in polities
have proved equally groundless; never

a word is heard now in this country of

“hysterical female agitators,” “shrieking
sisterhoods,” etc. The only election of
which it has not been true, in Mr Sod-
don's words to the National Union of

Suffrage Societies in England, that “a
woi*an could go to the polls with th?
same safety as she could go to a place
of worship,” was the election of ISIiG
It was the first time that the General

Parliamentary Election and Local Op-
tion Bill were taken together, and in

Wellington, at any rate, the Liberal and

liquor parties were in open and shame-
less alliance, and rowdyism prevailed to

a disgraceful degree. The return of one

of the candidates was petitioned agarnst
on this ground, and the judges condemn-
rd proceedings in severe terms. Chief
Justice Prendergast said:

“It is obvious that on this occasion
there was a very objectionable state of

things. I cannot understand why .it
should have been so. It is part of the

duty of the police constables to prevent
people from collecting together for the

purpose of obstruction, irrespective of
the occasion. Persons had no right to

obstruct others, and prevent them from

going from the pavement to any house

or building: it is the duty of the po!ic j

to prevent that. They do not seem to
have done their duty on this occasion.

This was a state of things which ought
to be explained and guarded against
in the future. Mr Morison has very
properly pointed out that the intro
duction of the female franchise mak°s
it more necessary that the proceedings
should be conducted in a proper man-

ner.” Subsequent elections have been

free from any such disturbances, out

there seems no more ground for credit-

ing the women's Kite with the improve-
ment than for blaming it with what
took place in ISiiC. Another of Mr Sed

uon’s statements on the occasion re-

ferred to, that the granting of the mr

Page had earned the stoppage ot can-

vassing, is not borne out by the facts.
I‘aid canvassing was abolished many

years ago, but the ordinary canvassing
by a candidate’s friends was only illegal
during two bye-elections, having become

so quite unintenticnally by a remarkab’e

series of Parliamentary accidents in

1900, which wera rectified without a

dissenting voice in 1902. His further

statement, that since woman suffrage
had been adopte I, a man whose mo al

character had the s'ightest taint upon it

might as well save his time and mone i

as present himself as a candidate, caus-

ed great amusement in this colony, the

fact being, as stated in Mr W.P. Reeves’
new book, “All but 2 or 3 per cent, of
the members of the average colonial Par-

liament have always been at least le-

spectable. All but the same proportion
are still respectable. There has been no

change whatever.” And this fact con-

stitutes perhaps the greatest disappoint
ment of the friends of woman suffrage,
many of whom believed that woman

would make moral character the firs;,

essential in a public man.

Thirty-six Hours’ Whirl.

The American girl has caught the spi-
rit of “hustle” from her male relatives,

and her society doings are now charac-

terised by the same slap dash that

marks the business houses of the land

of stars and stripes. This is a simple
narrative in diary form of one sample
instance of the strenuous social life at

the American capital. Take, for illus-

tration, the thirty-six hours beginning
with the 4 o’clock “at homes” on Wed-

nesday, February 11, and ending with

Mrs Walsh’s breakfast, which was serv-

ed at 4 o’clock in the morning of Fri-

day, February 13. During these 36

continuous hours not ope of the busy
social bees saw their beds—they were

vigorously on the move from tea to din-

ner, to reception, to wedding, to ball

and other functions. Miss Alice Roose-

velt, the Countess Cassini, Miss Patten,
Miss Root, and the rest of this “young-
er set” went from function to function,

meeting each other of course, again
and again, here and there, from hour

to hour. In this particular thirty-six
hours the social whirl began with a

round of short calls on the two score

or more matrons who have Wednesday
“at homes.” These calls being over by
5.30 p.m.. the ladies found themselves
hurriedly dressing for the ball at the

Peruvian Legation in honour of Miss

Roosevelt. But as nearly all had either
dinner parties at home or dinner out.

they had no time to lose. Thereafter
the diary runs thus: —10 p.m., Wednes-
day, February 11.—After dinner drive
to the Peruvian Legation upon invita-
tion to the ball given in honour of Miss

Alice Roosevelt. 10.20.—Arrive at the
Peruvian Legation. Everyone dancing.

no chance to “sit out” any of the dan-
ces. 3 a.m.. Thursday, February 12.—
Leave the Legation to go home and
dress for the train, which leaves at 5.30
a.m., for Charleston, W. Va., for the

Henderson-Crosby wedding. 3.30.
Home; order carriage to wait at the
door. s.—Having changed and taken a

eup of tea, start for the station. 5.30.
—Train starts for Charleston. 10 a.m.

In Charleston; barely dozed on the
train. Just time for coffee before the
ceremony. 12 m.—Baek from church;
wedding breakfast just served. 1.30
p.m.—Breakfast over; take train for
Washington. s.—Home; barely time
for tea and dress for dinner. 9.30.—
Dinner over; leave for reception at the
White House. IL—Standing in line for

nearly an hour. 11.30.—Leaving the
White House for Mrs Thomas Walsh’s
musicale. 12.10 a.m., Friday, February
13. At Mrs Walsh’s; no signs of break-
ing up. 3.30.—5ti1l at Mrs Walsh’s:
talk of breakfast. 4.—Breakfast at
Mrs Walsh’s.

o o O O o

In Waterloo Year.

“The woman’s column” is as old as

journalism itself. Very interesting is it

to read what our grandmothers wore in
the year of Waterloo. This paragraph
is taken from the “Globe” of February
2. 1815:—“A round robe of fine cambric
jaconet muslin, fastened down the front
with cotton ball tassels; a flounce of

lace or needlework at the [feet, ap-
pliqued with a narrow border of em-

broidery; long full sleeve, confined at
the hand with needlework or French

embroidery; a falling collar and cape,
trimmed with blond lace; fall back,
drawn to the shape. A French mob cap
composed of white satin and blond lace,

tied under the chin with celestial bluj

satin riband, and ornamented with a
wreath of flowers. Necklace and cross
of satin, bead, or pearl. Slippers of

blue kid. Gloves of Limerick or York
tan.” The popularity of the French mob
cap will at first glance strike one as

peculiar for that year. But it must be
remembered that in February Napoleon
was in Elba, and England had thought
she had done for ever with the ogre
Bonaparte. She little dreamed of
Waterloo.
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A Fiddler’s Romance.

Kubelik, who has the soul, the brain

and the supple fingers of Paganini, with

the dark, velvety eyes and the smile of

an innocent young girl—Kubelik, the

new king of the violin, loved by all wo-

men who have seen and heard him,

though plebian by birth is an aristocrat

in his choice of a wife. News comes

from Vienna that within a year he will

marry the Countess Marianne Czaky,
with the consent of Coloman von Szell,
Prime Minister of Hungary.

Behind this bald announcement by
cable lies one of those great romances,

so rare in real life, which, depicted by
the pen of poets, have come down the

ages, gathering new beauties all the
way.

The Countess Marianne eame into the

life of Kubelik before his fame had

travelled more than a hundred miles
from Prague, where his father still hoed

his cabbages. The great conservatory
and all the students know that Kubelik

was already great. The mysteries in-

vented by Paganini to the undoing of all

other violinists up to that time were an

open book to Kubelik.
All the cities of his native Bohemia

clamoured for him, so that soon he

found himself on the stage of the prin-
cipal theatre at Debroczin looking over

an audience musically wise and critical

for generations, with noble families oc-

cupying the boxes.

In one of these boxes, separated from

the stage only by a low balustrade, was

a dazzling Hungarian beauty, of the rich,

voluptuous, impulsive type which only

Hungary produces. This was the Coun-

tess Marianne Czaky, who at twenty-

one was already a widow. With her

were her father, Wolfgang von Szell, and

the Hungarian Prime Minister, Colomon

von Szell, her uncle.
Kubelik did not at first notice the

Countess, though it is now remembered

she started and leaned forward the mo-

ment her eyes first rested on him. He

was thinking only of the phrases which

as yet slumbered in the bosom of his

Stradivarius.
It began with the Vieuxtemps Con-

certo in E major, with its long, clear

note at the beginning. His- attitude was

graceful—before he lifted his bow—al-

most feminine, but with the first note

he was transfigured. He became a man

and a master all at once; his fingers were

brass, tipped with velvet. The sweep

of his bow was a command to all the

world. ....
Leaning forward, with red lips slightly

parted, the Countess drank in every

note. At the last note she sank back

pale and sighing, but with her eyes still

riveted on the girlish face of the young

violinist, framed in the masses of black

hair, now with some moist wisp trailing
over a brow as white and smooth as her

The audience, all but the Countess, ap

plauded rapturously; she sat as though
dazed. But the first stroke of the bow

in a Beethoven Romance in G Major
caused her to move forward to the bal-

ustrade, upon which she leaned motion-

less till the number was ended. Then an

odd thing happened, to the audience’s

way of thinking. Did the Countess

stumble that she should suddenly fall

against the barrier between the box and

the stage and throw out her arms to-

ward the violinist, not a yard away, as

though to seek support on his shoulder?

Kubelik saw the Countess’ movement,

made half a step toward her, and their

eyes met. But now the Prime Minister

whispered in his niece’s ear, and reluct-
antly withdrawing her eyes from those

of the violinist, she sank baek into her
seat. Kubelik composed himself parti-
ally with recourse, for an encore, to a

stately Bach sonata.

Now came the number which the mas-

ters and students of the Prague Con-
servatory knew would declare Kubelik’s

pre-eminence anywhere in the world—

Paganini’s impossibility, called “Nel Cor

Pin Non Mi Sento.”

When Kubelik had ended the Paganini
number in an explosion of musical fire-

works the audience sprang to its feet,

pressing toward the stage and shrieking
its plaudits. Kubelik bowed and then

turned his eyes toward the Countess’
box. Barely the distance of a step was

between them.
Suddenly the beautiful noblewoman

leaned far over the balustrade and held
out both her arms to the youth. Their

eyes met again. Kubelik drew nearer.

The Countess’ lips moved. Her whole

attitude was one of adoration.

Kubelik, for the first time under the

spell of a beautiful, loving woman’s eyes,
seemed to tremble. Though the audi-

ence continued to applaud wildly and to

inundate him with flowers, he kept his

eyes on those of the Countess. Her lips
moved again. She was speaking to him.

Only Kubelik could hear her voice, so

great was the uproar. Then he smiled

happily and answered her—answered her

both with words and glances.
Next day Kubelik received from Wolf-

gang von Szell, the Countess’ father, an

invitation to visit him at his house. The

invitation was not unexpected, for what

the Countess had whispered to him

across the footlights was:

“We shall meet soon; it must be so.”

And Kubelik’s answer was:

“It must be so.”

In the house of the Hungarian noble

the violinist was treated as all men of

genius are treated in such places—with
affable condescension, save for the Coun-

tess. Their hands met. not only as the

hands of equals, but as the hands of con-

fessed lovers. In that country love does
not have to be spoken to be known; yet

before the evening was over they found

a moment in which thev could be alone,
and in that moment all the vocabulary
of love bubbled from their lips.

Both knew that this blazing forth of

love at first sight between a Countess

who was niece of the Prime Minister
and a fiddler whose father hoed cab-

bages, if known, at once would create

consternation and probably trouble for

both. Kubelik was engaged for London

and so they agreed to wait until his re-

turn, meantime corresponding daily.
Kubelik went to London fully expect-

ing to return shortly and dreading the

interruptions of his artistic career which

his twenty-first year and compulsory
military service would entail. But in

London both the expectation and the

dread were removed. King Edward sum-

moned him to play before the Royal
Family, and straightway induced the

Hungarian authorities to absolve the

genius from his military obligations.
Then Daniel Frohman engaged him for

a tour of America.

Thus, until Kubelik’s return to Vienna

late in February the betrothed lovers
had never spent more than a single
hour in each other’s presence. Their

only conimunie itions had been by letter

and daily cablegrams.
Naturally, the Countess’ family tried

to break off the engagement, but her

constancy softened first the mother’s

heart and finally won over the father

and the Prime Minister, her uncle. The

only stipulation is that they shall not

marry for a year.
Kubelik has made a fair start on the

road to wealth. He received 100,000
dollars from his American tour alone.

Experts say that in the '.ext few years

his receipts will totally eclipse those of

Paderewski. So his plan to build a

palace for his bride near Vienna seems

likely of fulfilment.

Another Royal Romance.

Whilst we are occupied witr the vag-

aries of the ex-Crown Princess of Sax-

ony, with or against our will, and

periodically reminded—by herself—that

the Countess Lonyay is still a “Royal
Highness.” It is all tie more refreshing
to turn to the pleasant romances of the

Imperial House of Hapsburg, remarks a

correspondent in “Madame.” A friend
of mine told me a charming story of a

young married couple living in the pret-
ty little border town of Znaim. The

husband is a young captain, Baron Otto

Seefried by name, in the local regiment
of infantry. His wife has won the hearts

of the worthy townspeople by her un-

affected behaviour, and the quiet life

they lead is absolutely in keeping with
the husband’s station in life. Baroness

Seefried can be seen very often market-

ing in +he town, is famed as a model

“Haus frau,” and yet her grandfather is

none other than H.T. and R.M. Kaiser

Francis Joseph of Austria. Her mother

was, as you will recollect. Princess Gi
sela of Bavaria, and the young Princess'
romantic runaway match with a mere

lieutenant and “von” caused much talk

at the time. Then it all died away, as

it should do, and it was quite oy acci-
dent that I learnt the ch-irmin" sequel
just related.

To Brighten Up Colours.

To brighten up colours in faded wool-

work and cushions, wash the work in

soda and water and dry it in the open
ir. Faded colours become quite bright,

for the soda brings the colour up.

Just how

useful
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He-*********

°F ALL O^EALERS’ The “ SANDERSON ” Cameras.

Geo. Houghton Son, Ltd.,
Pricea fr,,,n £5 1(K

88. eg. high holborn, The “ HOLBORN ” Cameras.
LONDON, ENGLAND. Prices from £1 Is.

VIRKMAN, DENISON J. —~

Manufacturing; Jewellers,

Queen St., Auckland
‘-''H ?

We manufacture Jewellery

1
j

of all kind* to Order. Silver Match Box, 7/6 Silver Sov. Purse, Chased or Plain

- ~Ui 10/6; Gold Sov. Purse, Links, Gold, from 15/;

x
!Ui/- Silver, 3/6.

w WB
xSf

.
Faith, Hope and

Curb Bangle, from Sb/ to £lO. N"m'‘
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THE WORLD OF FASHION.

(By MARGUERITE.)

Precisely how the ease stands, wheth-

er the milliners wait upon the decision

of the hairdressers or the hairdressers

upon that of the milliners is a matter

of some uncertainty; but that very
much reciprocity exists between the two

arbiters of fate is quite sure. There-

fore, it is as well to inquire into the

latest mode ot hairdressing before pro-
ceeding to discover the trend that mil-
linery is likely to take.

In Paris at this present moment there
is a very distinct leaning towards the

abandonment of the low coiffure. The

smartest women, whose coiffures are

always well in advance of the times, are

having their hair fluffed by means of

electric brushing, but not in the small-

est degree waved. It is all brought up
to the crown of tne head a la Chinoise,
but not in the slightest degree pain
fully strained—on the contrary, left in

loose masses, and there dressed in little

curls and airy twists fastened by means

of tortoiseshell prongs, and even by
ivory combs, which look odd, especially
in brunette tresses, though most

DECIDEDLY SMART.

There is undoubtedly in one or two

particulars an air of complete novelty
about this coiffure. One misses immedi-

ately both the so long prevalent
ondulee and the fringe, or pre-

tence of a fringe, that has mark-

ed ti e mode for many a year past
Englishwomen, who have only just rea-

lised the eharms of the low dressing,
will be disposed to think the times

scarcely ripe for a revulsion to the old

mode yet, and, indeed, unless they de-

sire to be well in advance of every one

else, they need not give up either their

waved tresses or the Regency curl that

drapes their brow.

But they had better not accentuate

either if they would march closely after

Fashion, though not abreast with her.

It is very significant of the declining

favour shown to the ondulee that the
smartest makers of transformations in

London are building their wigs either

quite without or with only the merest

suspicion of a wave in the hair they
use.

Under these circumstances it is in

one way odd, though not in another,
that the milliners should be devising
the most abrupt and decided uplifting
of the brims of many of their new crea-

tions—odd because the effect produced
reveals so plainly tne straightened
tresses, but not strange considering the

natural desire every pretty woman feels
to exhibit to all eyes a new departure
in hairdressing.

Above soft and girlish features noth-
ing can be more charming than the

coiffure a la Chinoise and the plateau
hat with its well-raised brim. The fea-
tures are refined by it and yet to the
full answer the challenge of undoubt-

edly trying conditions by asserting the
roundness and charm of their you Th.
disappeared, but is now being ushered

should cause their owners to seek som:

means of

SOFTENING THE HARD OU 1 LINE

of millinery like this. To their rescue

conies the lace curtain which was a few
seasons ago very much in deman 1, then

disappeared, but it now being ushere 1

again into prominence.
Not only are lace scarves turned to

account as draperies upon the hat’s
brim, but they are tied at the back,
and are then allowed to flow almost to

the waist. Bhrek luce Ss more use 1
than white and cream, and black tulle

appears embroidered with seed pearls.
Moreover, straw traceries upon gauze
are pressed into the milliners’ service.
There is more than a little subtlety of
effect attempted by the flowing 'lace

veil, which certainly emphasises the

drooping line of the shoulders and the
picturesque blurred curves of the mod

ern gown.

But now let a few- definite descrip
tions of important efforts of early win

ter millinery be recounted. In a win-

dow full of exotic models a London mil-

liner had the temerity to show recently
just one hat with a decided crown. It

was placed in a modest position some-

what in the background, as if to a cer-

tain extent dubious as to the impres-
sion it would create. Yet, dainty as if

was. for it was made of stiffened cream

lace bound with blaek velvet round the
brim and softly plumed, its aspect was

pert and overbearing, and from it the

feminine critics who commented upon
the show, W’ith a few words of con-

temptuous toleration, as of something
likely to try to arrive but not ’ et at

all sure of a welcome, sheered away to

shower encomiums upon the flat turbans
and plateau hats that domi’-ated .he ex-

hibition.

Yet those flat turbans are r.ot so flat
as their predecessors were, and those

crowns will come. There is a Rem

brandt model being made that is half

turban, half crowned hat, the most pi ■-

turesque of ideas, with its velvet drap
erv and its beautiful ostrich plumes,
and it is the steppin" stone betwee i
the two opposed styles.

® ® ®

A GREY PROMENADE PELISSE

TRIMMED WITH GUNMETAL
BUTTONS.

For buttons the furore increases. And

of what curious materials are they
made! If one is to believe all one hears,
the homely potato compressed into a

hard substance is served up in the sew-

ing of many a gown. The chenille ones

are artistic, and the little silk thread

specimens are very smart and can be

used in great numbers unabtrusively.
ror it must be remembered that though
buttons abound they are expected to do

so with becoming modesty, making their

undoubted effect in subtle, clever ways.
There is great charm observable in the
toilet of this column, one of pavement
grey doth, with gun - metal buttons,
which figure on all the straps that em-

bellish the dress, and in double rows

round the yoke. Note the drooping
shoulder effect produced by the yoke,
and treasure the remembrance of it for
an autumn suit.

® ® ®

A REVIVAL OF PLEATED SKIRTS IS
ASSURED.

The changes are now being rung upon
that exclusive model, exclusive because
it suits only the slim, the hip-yoke skirt.

It is being stitched and strapped,
gathered, battlemented, embroiderel,
and gemmed, according to the require-
ments of the toilette on which it is or-

d-ined to appear; and what is more, it

is being elongated or extended, as the
sketched example of this column por-

t.ays it, into a stole-panel, which forms

a distinctly clever ■ decoration for the
front of a skirt. How to finish the

edges of the hip-yoke and stole with be-
coming emphasis, both as to firmness

and beauty, may puzzle the home dress
maker. Hence a moment’s contempla-
tion of the manner in which the. diffi-

culty is overcome in the pictured case

is recommended. Scallops, it will be ac-

knowledged, are the simplest possible
solution of the question, requiring as

they do less geometrical precision than
the Greek key and battlement methods.

They should be piped with velvet or

cloth of the same or a variant of the
colour that is used for the gown, and

should be firmly stitehed down to the

pleated part of the skirt. Citron, al-

mond, and watercress green are eharm-
ing autumn colours, and there is much
merit in the browns, provided cney are

examples of those attractive shades of

coffee-cream, nut, and pale tobacco.

A GREY PROMENADE PELISSE TRIMMED WITH GUNMETAL BUTTONS. THE LATEST EDITION OF THE MODISH HIP-YOKE.
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Though pinafore days have long been

left behind some at least of us cam?..':

dispense altogether with pinafores on all

occasions. The girl who takes up art,
either professionally or only as a pas-
time, is bound to provide herself with

something that will cover her dress en-

tirely, and save it from such stains and

streaks of paint as are inevitable in the
studio, and it is for the artist in par-

ticular, though not solely, that the ac-

companying sketch has been made. The
overall is made exactly on tjje lines of

a child’s pinafore, fastening behind, and

reaching almost to the bottom of the

dress; the sleeves are of bishop shape,
but not so full as now usually worn in

dresses or blouses, as the fulness would

only be liable to dabble on palette or

paint box, and might even spoil a pic-
ture. For the same reason the wrist

bands are somewhat deep, so that the

hand and wrist may be quite free. The

shaped band which finishes the neck, and

the pretty shoulder frill set into it re-

deems the overall "rom ugliness, and the
addition of a waist belt to draw in the
fulness to the figure is also a great
improvement on the style sometimes

seen. A pocket put on from the outside

is a useful adjunct, as of course that in

the dress itself is completely covered.

Millinery is very charming even now.

and this season will see some of the

most charming models ever displayed for

our ruination. The pretty hat sketched
is not, however, of a costly nature, al-

though it is distinguished by its smart-

ness. The hat is of straw, the edge of

the brim being coloured a pale green.

The crown is low and fiat, and the brim

which curves up from the face is trim-

med inside with a bird in whose plumage
white and an irridescent greenish black

with a hint of blue in it are intermin-

gled as in that of the magpie. A bow

of bright green mirror velvet rests on

the hair. There is a slight twist of

good patterned lace of a soft tone of

cream draped round the crown forming
its sole trimming. There is something
very smart looking about this style of
hat with its upturned brim, and I ex-

pect we shall see it in many cnarming
forms trimmed with different tones of
tulle intermingled or wreathed with
flowers of the small blossomed variety
The perfectly flat toque or hat (as either

name is equally applicable) with a stiff

military aigrette arranged slightly to

one side is also much in vogue and is to
be seen made entirely of pale toned net
or chiffon, or in some instances entirety
of small flowers, particularly violets.

They are very becoming and certainly
chic.

This fig. deals with marked features
in evening wear just now, having the
Victorian berthe of lace cut off the

shoulders, over which falls the floral

fringe which is so charmingly employ-
ed on so many dainty gowns. The bod-
ice is of accordionea chiffon, and the

sleeves—of lace with the skirt—are of
the newest evening vogue, that is, tran-

sparent, long, and opening on the top
from the elbow downwards to show the

arm. A big chou and ends of chiffon
finish the bodice.

A LAY’S OVERALL.

A PRETTY HAT.

(1) A moleskin dress trimmed with chinchilla and lace.

(2) A grey zibeline costume corded with green glace over palest grey silk, and
collar of sable.

A DAINTY EVEN INC. BODICE.

SOME SMART HATS.

GIVEN AWAY I
IN *°^V.l%Aßy?:RTIBE 0,,r electric
* Al rLIA.XLhS m this country we have

f
decided to distribute a cer-

tain number of our ELEC-
TRIC FOOT BATTERIES

' (insoles) in each city, town
and village. absolutely
FREE OF CHARGE. Re
member, we do this solely
for ADVERTISING PUR-
POSES.

Our Electric Foot Batter-
ies are the greatest comfort

and luxury of modern days.
They keep the feet warm,
even if standing in vater,
snow or ice. They defy
aches andpains in the feet
and limbs, and cause a
pleasant feeling of life and
vigour. Electricity under
your feet will equalise the
ci’cula‘ion ofthe blood, and
will be found to be the

greatest ofall preventsfives
against Influenza. Br< n

chitis. Coughs, Colds, etc. Do not delay your
application.

Address—

German Electric Appliance Agency
AUCAIIti BUIIDINGS.

63 Elizabeih street, Sydney, N.S.W.

5 LATEST J
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The Graphic's

Funny Leaf

CHARMING MODESTY.

“I don’t see,” said the sensible girl,
“how you could bring yourself to run

about after that actor, such a conceited

stick as he is.”

“You’re quite mistaken,” replied the

stage-struck girl. “He’s just as modest as

he can be. Why, when I asked him whom

he considered the greatest aetor in the

world, he actually blushed, and replied
that it wasn’t for him to say.”

THE WAY IT WAS.

Markley—No; I don’t like Borroughs.
Parkley—Why, I understood you to

say you thought a great deal of her.

Markley—No; I merely think of him a

great deal. He owes me money.

LOGICAL.

Stokes —Speaking of mourning, if your

rich uncle were to die, should you put on

black ?

Bickers—Certainly not. If he left me

something handsome, why should I be

such a hypocrite as to don the garb of

woe? On the other hand, if he left me

out of his will, how could I consistently

put on mourning for such a curmudgeon?

A PROFITABLE BUSINESS.

“Don’t you find it very trying,” she

asked the great man, “to have to furnish

your autograph to so many persistent
people?”

“Oh. no,” he answered, “most of them

stand stamps, and I return the autograph
on a postal card.”

HER UNINTENDED SATIRE.

‘•Charley, dear!” exclaimed young SJrs.
Torkins, “the paper has a sketch of you

as a rising young reformer.”

“Yes. I thought that would surprise
and please you. What did you think of

the biography?”
“Oh, Charley, dear, it is too good to be

true!”

BOBBY TRIED IT.

Bobby—Ma, you said that I wasn’t to

eat that piece of cake in the pantry—be-
cause it would make me sick.

Mother—Yes, Bobby.
Bobby (convincingly)—But, ma, it

hasn’t made me sick.

FIGHT SHY.

Patient’s Friend—And what did the
doctor say?

Patient’s Wife—He said he’d have to

make a diagnosis.
Patient’s Friend —Don’t you have any

diagnosis. I knew a man who was taken

sick just the same way, and the doctor

made a diagnosis—said he did, anyway—■
and the man died the next morning.

TIME, 2 A.M.

“Look me in the eye, John Henry!”
“Whish p’ticular eye, m’dear? You

sheem t’ have more eyes than a p’tato!”

POOR EDITOR.

Attendant (to irate female seeking
admission to the editor’s sanctum) :
“But I tell you, madam, that the edi-

tor is too ill to talk to anyone to-day.”
Irate Female (with determination):
“Never mind, I’ll do the talking.”

HE WAS INNOCENT.

The heat of Sunday-school was tropi-
cal, the interest of the boys beyond zero;

but the patient teacher toiled on.

“Now, surely - orne of you can tell me

who carried off the gates of Gaza? Speak
up, William.”

“I never touched ’em,” said the indig-
nant William, wrathfully. “I never had

anything to do with it; I didn’t even

know they was took.”

A SERIES OF MISFORTUNES.

"You’ll have to excuse my dolly,” said

the little four-year-old, with great dig-

nity.
“What is the matter with her, Kitty?”

asked the visitor, kindly.
“She’s lost all the sawdust out of her

stomach.” replied Kitty, “part of her left
leg’s gone, she’s got nervous prostration,
and she can’t wink her eyes.”

POOR CHAP.

Candid Friend—I think young Rymer,

the poet, felt hurt at a remark you made

the other night.
His Companion—What did I say?
Candid Friend—You said there was

only one Shakespeare.

“What. Edith going to marry Bobby
Bibb? Why, he’s only an apology for a

man!”
“Well. I suppose she thought she’d bet-

ter accept the apology.”

SAVED.

He—Did you hear about that man who

committed suicide because he couldn’t
get married?

She—Oh, Mr. Biggies, would you do

such a thing?
He—l don’t know. I might if

She—Percival! Take me. I couldn’t

live with such a thing on my conscience.

HIS TROUBLES.

“Isn’t it sad,” asked the young lady,
romantically, “to think of the roses of

yester year?”
“It is,” replied the young man, em-

phatically; “I have an unpaid florist’s bill

for £ 35.”

ALL THERE.

Bullfinch—l don’t care what people say
about Mr. Foxe. I think there is a great
deal of honesty in his face.

Chaffinch—Yes; all he has is there.

HOW COWARDLY OF HIM!

Mrs. En Peeki (to her better half, who has taken refuge in the river) — Yo’

jes- wait r.ii I kotch yo,’ yo’ miz’ble chieking-hearted, w’ite-livered, seart eat, you’!

POOR PAPA.

Stern Father—What an unearthly
hour that fellow stops till every night,
Dora! What does your mother say about

it?

Daughter—-She says meh haven’t alter-
ed a bit since she was young, pa.

A FRIENDLY TIP.

Mistress—T don’t want you to have so

much company. You have more callers in

a day than T have in a week.

Domestic—Well, mum, perhaps if you’d
tried to be a little more agreeable you’d
have as many friends as I have.

KEEPING TO THE AGREEMENT.

House-owner—You didn’t pay the rent

last month.

Tenant—No? Well, J suppose you’ll
hold me to your agreement.

Owner—Agreement—what agreement?
Tenant—Why, when I hired the house,

vou said I must pav in advance or not at

all.

CLEVER.

A little three-year-old miss, while her
mother was trying to get her to sleep, be-

came interested in a peculiar noise, and

asked what it was.

“A cricket, dear,” replied her mother.
“Well,” remarked the little lady, “he

ought to get himself oiled.”

TOO MUCH HAPPINESS.

“What’s the matter, Jinisby? You

look bothered.”
“I am. I had a happy home until my

wife joined one of those philanthropic
clubs, and promised to do some little
thing every day to add to my happiness,
and now she’s got so many ideas I can’t
rest.”

BUSINESS FORESIGHT.

Barber—You’re getting frightfullv
bald.

Customer (savagely)—Well, I don’t see

how it concernsyou.
Barber—Excuse me, sir, but it does.

You won’t have any hair left to cut, and

then I will lose a customer.

THE BRUTE.

Young Husband—Don’t you think, dar-
ling, that it would spoil the curtains if I

should smoke?

Young Wife—You are the best and

most considerate husband that ever lived,
dear; of course it would.

Young Husband—Well, then, you’d
better take them down.

NOT FOR HER.

Lady—Mary, has anyone called while
I was out?

Mary—Yes, ma’am. Mr. Bigg was

here.

Lady—Mr. Bigg? I don’t recall the
name.

Mary—No, ma’am, he called to see

me.

CONSIDERATE.

Mistress (reprovingly)—Bridget, break
fast is very late this morning. I noticed
last night that you had company in the
kitchen, and it was nearly twelve o’clock
when you went to bed.

Bridget—lt was, ma’am. I knew you
was awake, for I heard ye movin’ about;
an’ I said to meself ye’d need sleep this
mornin’, an’ I wouldn’t disturb ye wid
an early breakfast, ma’am.

THE FACETIOUS BOARDER.

The facetious boarder had the plot laid
for a killing joke.

“It’s a wonder,” he said, “that you
didn’t serve up this hen, feathers and all.”

“The next time,” said the landlady,
with marked emphasis, “I’ll serve her,
bill and all.”

A COMPARISON.

Wille: You are not so good looking
as the devil, are you?

Parson Soother: Why, Willie, what
do you mean?

Willie: Papa says he would rather see

him than you.

HOW IT WORKS.

Knicker: Our flat has special refrig-
erator service.

Bocker: So has ours. But they call
it steam heat. *

-

AS TO SQUALLOP.

“Now, there’s old Squallop. I rec-

kon he’s the stingiest man in the Unit-
ed States, and he’s got money to burn.

I believe he expects to take it with him

when he dies.”
“Well, if he does take it with him,

he’ll certainly have a chance to burn

it.”
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	A FINE EXHIBIT OF MAIDEN-HAIR.
	A FINE SHOW OF BLOOMS.
	TWENTY-FOUR DISTINCT VARIETIES. Winner Mr Buckland This also shows Prize Vase of Flowers.
	CHAMPION TWELVE BLOOMS.
	Schaef, Barony Studios, Wellington. THE MAPOURIKA JUST BEFORE SHE LEFT THE PATENT SLIP, WELLINGTON, AFTER BEING ENTIRELY REPAINTED AND OVERHAULED.
	A FISHING EXCURSION STEAMER.
	NO BITES.
	WHEN THE FISH ARE BITING.
	IN FULL SWING.
	LITERARY AND NOT PISCATORIAL TASTES.
	A SHARK.
	ONE OF THE JOYS OF SCHNAPPER-FISHING. Filing a barb off a hook in a man’s finger.
	RATHER MIXED.
	HER FIRST CATCH.
	CLEANING FISH.
	AUCKLAND TEAM, WINNERS OF THE PENNANT MATCH. Back Row.—Messrs. McCallum and Buttle. Middle Row.—Messrs. Mennie. Elliot, James and Garland. Front Row.—Messrs. Ledingham and Dingle (skips).
	DEVONPORT TEAM, RUNNERS-UP IN THE PENNANT MATCH. Back Row.—Messrs. Mitchell, Armstrong and Gardner. Middle Row—Messrs D. Harvey, Miller, and McNeil. Front Row.— Messrs. Ralfe and Eagleton (skips).
	MR RANKIN (on the right) Winner of the Championship Singles, and MR DINGWALL, Runner-up.
	GENERAL VIEW OF THE PLAY.
	THE LATE CAPTAIN MORRIS, M.L.C.
	CAPT. GEORGE ROTT, OF THE NORTH GERMAN LLOYD STEAMER RHEIN, AND HIS BRIDE, WHO WAS MISS ANNA M. SCHMIDT, OF PONSONBY.
	THE RECENT EASTER ENCAMPMENT AT AUCKLAND. THE CULINARY STAFF AT WORK.
	Untitled
	Untitled
	Schaef, Sarony Studios, Wellington.
	VIEW OF THE WELLINGTON COLLEGE LAWN. THE COLLEGE IN THE BACKGROUND.
	Schaef, Sarony Studios, Wellington. THE COMMITTEE.
	1. Spectators watching high jump. 2. Last round half-mile. 3. Start of 180yds. 4. Awaiting their events. 5. Spectators on the lawn. 6. Tug-of-war. 7. Near the end of half-mile handicap. 8. Start for 120yds.
	Untitled
	THE MAXIM GUN IN ACTION. GOING INTO ACTION.
	AFTER THE FRAY—THE SURVIVORS.
	HOMEWARD BOUND.
	WANTED IN A HURRY.
	BRINGING UP THE GUNS—TAKEN AT FULL GALEOP.
	READY TO FIRE.
	AWAITING THE ATTACK.
	A COOKERY DEMONSTRATION.
	A PRACTICAL LESSON IN COOKERY.
	GROUP ON THE OPENING DAY.
	MACHINE CONSTRUCTION AND DRAWING.
	THE PLUMBER’S WORKSHOP.
	THE CARPENTERS’ SHOP.
	THE LAWN' AFTER THE BIG RACE.
	THE PRESS AND STEWARDS’ STAND.
	A GENERAL VIEW.
	THE GRANDSTAND DURING THE HURDLE RACE.
	TE ARO RAELWAY STATION, WELLINGTON.
	Daroux, photo. PUBLIC LIBRARY AND TECHNICAL SCHOOL, WELLINGTON.
	Untitled
	CROP OF RHUBARB, “THE PRIZETAKER,” grown by Mr. McFetridge, at Lake Takapuna. Many of the stalks measure 3ft in length, and from 10 to 12 inches in circumference. Some of the leaves measure from 8 to 9ft in circumference. "WHILE THE BILLY BOILS.”
	CREEK SCENE, OREWA.
	MR. F. L. WRIGHT'S RECENTLY IMPORTED JERSEY CATTLE. 1. Mr. F. L. Wright's homestead. “Raventhorpe,” Drury. 2. "Cherry Countess,” “Jessie” and “Fury.” 3. “Jessie.” 4. “Cherry Countess.”
	Untitled
	Untitled
	Untitled
	Mr Pig sat down and told the children to amuse themselves.
	Untitled
	DOLLY’S TEA-PARTY.
	Untitled
	SOME STYLISH PELERINES AND BOAS IN FUR FOR THE COMING WINTER.
	THE WHITE HOUSE, RESIDENCE OF PRESIDENT ROOSEVELT.
	A RECENT PHOTO, OF MRS. ROOSEVELT RECEIVING GUESTS ON THE PRESIDENT’S YACHT.
	A GREY PROMENADE PELISSE TRIMMED WITH GUNMETAL BUTTONS.
	THE LATEST EDITION OF THE MODISH HIP-YOKE.
	A LAY’S OVERALL.
	A PRETTY HAT.
	(1) A moleskin dress trimmed with chinchilla and lace. (2) A grey zibeline costume corded with green glace over palest grey silk, and collar of sable.
	A DAINTY EVEN INC. BODICE.
	SOME SMART HATS.
	Untitled
	Untitled
	Untitled
	Untitled


