
Current Comment.

Australasian Warships
for China.

It is only three or four years ago,

says the Lyttelton “Times,” that Ad-
miral Pearson aroused the indignation
of the Sydney and Melbourne press

by declaring that in case of necessity
he would not hesitate to take the
whole squadron to any part of the

world without waiting for the consent

of the colonial authorities. He subse-

quently explained that he only in-

tended to emphasise the fact that the
safety of the Empire meant the safety
of the colonies, but the Australians
refused to be mollified, and for two

or three weeks their newspapers were

deluged with angry letters protesting
against the payment of £ 135,000 a

year for the maintenance of a fleet

which might be taken off without a

moment’s notice to back up Great

Britain in some quarrel in which the

colonies-had not the slightest interest.

Since then the colonies have realised

that the Mother Country can have no

quarrel in which they are not closely
interested. Mr Chamberlain has

shown a little more tact than was

displayed by Admiral Pearson—his
assurance that the assent of the Aus-

tralian colonies will be gratefully ap-

preciated by Her Majesty’s Govern-

ment flatters their sense of nossession

—but if he had framed his request in

much less courteous language it would

have been cheerfully granted. As it

is, the colonies have not only released

the war vessels that are required for

immediate service in China, but have

also offered to provide troops and to

send vessels of their own.

•fr + +

The Sword of Honour Craze.

Speaking of the craze for testimon-

ialising our successful generals, the

Wairarapa “Star,” in a leader whose

sound common sense cannot be too

highly praised, observes with much
truth: “Have those zealous patriots
who are leaders in this direction taken

any pains to ascertain in what way
men like Lord Roberts and Lieut.-

General Baden-Powell would regard a

movement which some years ago pro-
duced derision. Besides, in another

sense they may feel very strongly
upont his point. They know full well

that their best efforts and most skil-

ful plans would have failed unless

they had been so ably assisted by
those under their command, especially
by the bravery and endurance of rank

and file of the army. As it is impos-
sible for all to receive swords or any
other form of testimonial, it might be

more judicious, where they deserve so

much praise, for localities not to make

selections, which annoy those thus

honoured, because it might be a slight
to others at least in some degree de-

serving of recognition. Lieut.-General

Baden-Powell has a most distinguish-
ed career before him in the British

Army, for when peace is concluded

his valuable services will be required
to teach the army those lessons in

modern warfare so essential at the

present day. Furthermore, if external

badges are needed to give full expres-
sion to national sentiment, there are

titles and orders which can be con-

ferred upon him marking the collec-

tive feeling of the Empire more effec-

tively than the disjointed efforts of

certain individuals to distinguish
themselves by extra displays of loy-
alty.”

+ + +

Tile Preference Clanse.

The “preference clause” generally
causesa good deal of discussion when

an industrial dispute gets into the

Arbitration Court, and one day last
week the President (Mr. Justice Mar-

tin) spoke somewhat strongly on the

point in Dunedin. He said: “When
a union man spends money and takes

the risk of getting into hot water

with his employer to get his case be-

fore the Court and improve his condi-
tions of working it is unfair for an-

other man, who stands by and neither
spends his money nor allies himself
with them to share equally with the
increases that are made. If the Union
loses the case this man goes to his

employer and says: ‘Well, recollect I
had nothing to do with the Union.’
And to get over this we give prefer-
ence to Unionists. A Unionist must
be equally competent, and be ready
to undertake the work.” After His
Honor had fully explained the fairness
of this provision it seemed to lose a

great deal of its repugnance to the

employers present. His Honor then
commented somewhat pointedly on

the fact that the Court had been sit-

ting in the different provincial dis-

tricts and explaining the awards until
they were tired. The newspapers

freely printed and circulated them,
yet employers would not take the

trouble to read them. They would

read a “local” stating that preference
had been given to Unionists, but they
never troubled to find out how this

concession was qualified or hedged
round with provisions for the protec-
tion of both parties.
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Literature as a Profession.

Every now and then I receive pa-
thetic letters from correspondents
who have “dedicated themselves to

literature,” with as much earnestness

as Hannah dedicated Samuel to the

Lord. They know their work is worth

editorial consideration; they see

thousands of printed pages not half as

good; they come across thousands

more that are beneath criticism; and

yet they cannot get a line accepted,
or if one of them does succeed in ob-

taining an appearance the “hono-

rarium” (they are all too proud to use

a less commercial term) is less than a

bootblack might earn in a day at a

street corner. One of them, “with a

University education” is amazed that

“considering the vast increase of

publications the demand for cultured

work seems to grow less instead of

increasing,” and another says, “In

manuscript my poems have been

praised by men of the highest distinc-

tion, poets themselves; but quite a

dozen of my lyrics, sonnets and so-

ciety verse have grown ragged with
being sent from editor to editor, of-

ten coming back, I am convinced, un-

read. An editorial friend tells me I

am lucky to get them back at all.”

Genius will not be advised, though
genius will “get there” sooner or la-

ter—often later, alas! But talent may
take it from me that unless you have

a bread-and-cheese income outside

what you make by literature, or unless
you have regular employment and

you can make your pen a crutch, it is

madness to “take to literature as a

profession.” As for sending your
MSS. to editors, the truth is, however

tender and sympathetically an editor

may feel towards the struggling and

worthy unpublished, the time arrives
when he grows callous, and his pages
being fully occupied, he loses patience,
and returns essays, stories, poems, ar-

ticles and what not en masse. Now

and then at long intervals he may be
in the mood of discovery—but it is

very rare that he is well rewarded for
his investigations. No, my dear friends,
don’t send your MSS. on the chance
of acceptance; write to the editor, tell
him what you propose to offer him;
send him a stamp for reply; if the no-
tion appeals to him he will give you
permission to submit the matter, and
then you may have a chance of ac-

ceptance. Anyhow, the Jordan of

literature, like that of the negro bal-
lad, “is a hard road to trabble, I
b’leve.” —Joseph Hatton, in “The
Chronicle.”
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Some British Commercial
Characteristics.

“It is an unquestionable fact,” says
“Feilden’s Magazine” in an article in
the current issue, “that there is a kind
of trade* aristocracy among us based
on much the same principle and guid-
ed by many of the influences associat-
ed with family aristocracy itself. And
if we are to assume that aristocracy,
so-called, is based chiefly on posi-
tion and hereditary, there
can be no difficulty in accord-

ing a qualified form of this distinction
to notable and other mercantile houses
which look back for the period of their
establishment to the time of by-gone
generations.” We are however con-

cerned with the fact that “with many
of the old-established houses it is a

point of honour to maintain in their
integrity all the ancient traditions of
the establishment. The old customs,
the old methods of business are slav-
ishly adhered to, however discordant
with economical conditions that have
so entirely changed since they were

introduced. They do not appear to

appreciate the truth, that business
methods which might be en-

tirely appropriate fifty years ngo aro

now utterly at variance with the spirit

of modern days.” “It is natural,
however deplorable,” pursues our con-

temporary, “that the haughty spirit—-
at some times approaching arrogance
—that distinguished the British mer-

chant of the past age should have

been handed down to and been pre-
served in a- measure by his successors.

Year after year, and from all quarters
of the world, British Consuls voice the

universal complaint. He will not deign
to consult the consumer . ‘There.’ htt

says in effect, ‘are my goods, with the
accumulated prestige of seventy years

behind them. You tire the first per-
son who has dared to criticise them.

Either take them or go elsewhere.’
The consumer, as a matter of fact

goes elsewhere; and it is a circum-

stance which many of our firms, some-

what to their dismay, are beginning to

find out. They are also becoming
aware that trade is much easier to

lose than to recover—that even to re-

cover a lost market the most desperate
exertions may be made in vain.”

The Trading Stamp Bubble.

Stripped of alluring prospect of get-
ting something for nothing the process
resolves itself into the fact that tlw
Trading- Company has contrived a sys-
tem by which it divides with the
trader the discount allowed on cash

transactions, in return for which the

company gives to the purchaser who
has received a given number of

stamps something that cannot be the

equivalent of the discount surrendered
by the tradesman to the company, it

cannot be that an equivalent is given
by the "company,” else its business
would be run at a loss. The traders
who embarked upon this enterprise
were induced to believe that they
would have an extraordinary advant-

age over their competitors who were

not allowed to participate, but those?
who gave their customers trading
stamps did not realise that the com-

pany was taking- in cash from the
trader part of the discount usually al-

lowed to a cash purchaser. The com-

pany amply took toll of the trader,
and gave something of less value to hit
cash customer, the difference being
the profit of the company. It now ap-
pears that our local vendors of trading
stamps have discovered that there Is
nothing in it. excepting to the com*

pany, and that last night in the House
the Premier announced, in answer to
a; question, that legislation would be

passed to suppress the system. Mr

Seddon called it a “form of gambling,”
which is hardly true, thong- so far as

the company is concerned it may
fairly be described as a game of

“heads I Win. tails you lose.” The

company should be effaced.—Welling-
ton “Post.”

+ + ♦

Hosses in Great Battles.

There is a very general notion that

the losses suffered by the British

Army during- the South African cam-

paign have been exceptional. But the

following figures show that com-

paratively the losses have not been

at all remarkable: —

At the battle of Austerlitz. Decem-
ber 2, 1805. the French lost 7000 offi-

cers and men. and the killed and

wounded of the allies numbered more

than 3000. The French losses at Baut-

gen in 1813 were 13,000. and nt Wag-
ram in 1809 they lost 18,000. although
in that battle they took 20.000 Aus-
trian prisoners. At the .Moscova, on

the retreat from Moscow, they lost

30,000. At the great battle of Leipsic,
in 1813. a three days’ battle, the

French losses were 05.000. More than

40,000 of the French perished on the

field, altogether 80.000 men perishing
on the field.

At Waterloo the British lost G932,
the French 28,850. The total losses
of the allied armies there were 4266

killed and 14.539 wounded besides

4251 missing. In the last great at-

tack on Sebastopol, September 8,

1855, the French lost 1646 killed and

4500 wounded, besides 1400 missing,
and the English lost 385 killed. 1886

wounded, and 17G missing. At Plevna

between 18,000 and 20,000 Russians
were killed and wounded; the Tur-

kish loss was about 5000 less than the

Russian. About 16,000 men were

killed on both sides. In the war be-
tween Germany ami Austria in 1866

the Prussians lost 9172 and the Aus-

trians 44,314 at Koniggrutz; at.

Nachod the Prussians 1332 and the

Austrians 4787; and at Skalitz the
Prussians 1365 and the Austrians

5577.

In the Franco-Prussian war the

Germans at Weissenburg Worth lost

12,914 and the French 5000 in killed

and wounded, besides which the

French lost 55,000 prisoners. At

Vionville-Mars la Tour the Germans
lost 15,799. or 22 per cent, of their

army; the French loss was equally
great. The Germans at I'olombey-
Nouilly lost 4907, and at Spickeru
4871. At Gravelot-St. Privat the Ger-
man loss, according to a German au-

thority, was 20,173. Another author-
ity puts it at 25,000 and the French
loss at 19,000. At Sedan the Germans

lost 8931. The French Army of the
North consisted of 150,000 men. and

the three armies of Germany of 250,-
000 men in three days’ battle, in

which 23,000 French were taken

prisoners.
In the American Civil War the ag-

gregate losses at the battle of Stone’s

River were 13,249 on the Union side
and 10.266 on the Confederate side.
These figures include killed, wounded,
captured, and missing. The Union

killed were 1730 and the Confederate

1294. At Antietam the Union killed

numbered 2108 and the wounded

9549. At the first Bull Run battle

470 Union men were killed and 1071

wounded: the Confederate figures
were 357 killed and 1582 wounded. At

Fredericksburg 1284 Union men were

killed and 596 Confederate. the

wounded numbering 9600 on the

Union side and 4068 on the Confeder-
ate. The total losses at this battle

were 12,653 for the North and 5315

for the South.

Use Webber's Vitadatio for Your

Health.

There is only one “Vitadatio” in

the world, and that, is “Webber’s.”
You cannot afford to play with your
health, so be sure you get the Genu-
ine Article.

LADIES!

VITADATIO IS YOUR FRIEND!

TRY VITADATIO AND LIVE!

VITADATIO IS A WONDERFUL
MEDICINE.

Castlemaine-strect, Yarra ville.
Victoria, July 7, 1899.

Mr. Palmer—

Sir: Words cannot express my
gratitude to you for what your won-

derful herbal remedy, VITADATIO,
has done for me. For years I have
not known what health was, and at
times "life was just a misery.” Doc-
tors and Herbalists were in vain, and
I was told there was "no cure” for my
complaint. Hoping that some other

poor sufferer may benefit by this, I
give you leave to use it as you like.

Anyone wishing to know further can

do so by writing to me.

I remain,

E. SPEAR.

This testimonial is one of I he many
that 1 have received from ladies, who
have proted the efficacy of this great
herbal remedy. Ladies, I advise you
to call and consult with Dr. WHITE,
the eminent Lady Doctor, Free of
Charge. -Yours, for health,

S. A. PALMER.

The Price of the Medicine is: Rep.
quarts, 5/G; rep. pints. 3/6; Indian
oil of cream, 2/6.

Ask your grocer or chemist for it.

S. A. PALMER, Sole Distributor for

Australasia, India, Ceylon and Japan.

Head Office for New Zealand, 39

Manners-street, Wellington.

W. WEBBER, Launceston, Tasmania,
Sole Proprietor.

Correspondence Invited. Write for

Testimonials.

I CureFits.
any money to test whether my ;
remedy does or does not curei
Fits, Epilepsy, St. Vitus' Dance, 1
&c. All you are asked to do is to

send fora FREE bottleof medi-
cine and to try it. I am quite
prepared toabide by the result.
A Valuable and Safe Remedy.

APPBOVBDST TUB MEDICAL PROEBSSIOM.

H.G.ROOT,x«, End.l.ltb Gdn,..LONDON
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