
dining room. The music provided by
Bandmaster Savage whs excellent. Mi*

Mathew received her guests in a charm-

ing toilette of white crepe de chine,

prettily trimmed with insertion; Mrs

Walter wore a handsome black satin
bordered with jet, lovely old lace adorn-

ing the bodice; Airs bare, black silk re-

lieved with palest lavender; Mrs Brewis,

pretty pale blue crepe de chine veiled

in white; Mrs i'arrer, becoming black

mousseliae-de-soie, spray o£ pink blos-
soms on corsage; Airs Smith, lovely
ivory silk trained gown; Mrs E.

Jollie, black with lace draperies,
red roses; Mrs R. Gwynne, pretty
white trained frock, inlet with
Maltese insertion; Mrs Sheppard,
rich black satin finished with a

spray of pink flowers; Mrs Douglas,
black voile skirt, white tucked silk
blouse; Miss 11. Graham, pink silk

prettily frilled; Miss It. Graham, dainty
white frock, white blossoms in coiffure;
Miss Swarbrick, black mousseline de-soie

trimmed with yak Ince; Miss O’Neill,

pale green accordion-pleated gown, pal-
est pink flowers on corsage; Miss AL
O'Neill, a delicate shade of blue relieved

witli bunches of pink miniature rose-

buds; Miss Chitty, red brocade. Maltese

lace fichu; Miss ,Saades, becoming pink
eolienne trimmed with real lace; Miss

Stevens, deep yellow erepe de chine;
Alias Hunter, while net over silk, white

bird in coiffure; Miss Cox, pretty black

frock; Miss Holloway, black bordered

with silver; Miss Rothwell, black silk;
Miss McPherson,'black with touches of

turquoise blue; Miss Newell, black silk

voile, handsomely trimmed with lace.

The gentlemen present, were; Messrs.

Mathew (2), Walter, Save, Drury, Lord,
Starker, Sheppard, Jollie. AleDiarinid,
Turner, Swarbrick, Jolly, Birkmyer,
Clarke, Manning, Holloway (2), pease,
Chitty (2), Smith, Stevens, Shand, Gra-

ham. Fairer, O’Neill, Gwynne, Cox.

BACHELORS’ BALL.

The bachelors of Hamilton gave a

most successful dance in St. Peter’s
Schoolroom, writes my Hamilton cor-

respondent. Although the weather pre-

vented many from turning up. Hie hall

was well filled. The music was supplied
by Bosworth’s Rand. Mesdames Sandes,
Graham and Swarbrick acted as host-

esses for the evening. Mrs Stevens wore

black satin; Mrs Sandes, handsome black
merveillenx, pink opera cape; Mrs Swar-
brick, black; Mrs Jollie, pretty white

silk, veiled in net; Airs Furrer, wine-

coloured satin and cream lace; Airs Go-

ing, pretty chiffon frock; Airs Thomp-

son, black gown, handsome opera cape;

Airs Brewis. handsome black gown; Miss

Hunter looked charming in a pretty
white embroidered net over silk; Miss

Holloway, black evening gown, relieved

with green chon; Miss Sandes, pink
voile, bodice draped in Alaltese lace;
Miss Chitty looked well in crimson sat-

in evening gown; Miss Stevens, cream;

Mias B. Ramstead. blue frock; Miss

Carey, cream; Airs R. Graham, white
Bilk; Aliss Burd, pink.

Mr and Mrs Holloway gavo

A VERY PLEASANT PROGRESSIVE

A EIiIIRE PARTY

at their residence on the 21st. There

wore eleven tables. Play was kept up

with spirit till eleven o’clock, after
which a dainty supper was served. The

two first prizes, which were won by Aliss

Stevens and Air Kenneth Graham, were

pretty photo frames. The second prizes
fell to Aliss Carrie Walluutt and Ml’

Panton. The boobies were Miss Burd

and Mr T. Jolly. Mrs Holloway wore

black voile; Aliss Holloway, white silk;
Miss Clara Holloway, white, relieved
with red; Miss O’Neill, white silk gown,
trimmed with silver passementerie;
Miss M. O'Neill, white silk frock, pink
roses on corsage; Miss Stevens, white;
Alias Hunter, pretty black and cream

evening gown; Miss Burd, white silk

blouse, black skirt; Misses Edgec-umbe,
white silks, bodices finished with red
bebe ribbon; Aliss Chitty, pale apricot
shade of pink silk bodice, transparent
yoke, dark skirt; Miss Carrie Wallnutt,
glace silk blouse, transparent lace yoke
and sleeves, black voile skirt; -Miss

Sandes, white silk blouse, prettily trim-

med with lace medallions, black skirt;
Aliss Swarbrick, pink blouse, black

skirt; Miss Newell, black gown; Alias

McPherson, black, relieved with red;
Aliss Toomey, white Silk blouse, crimson
flowers on corsage, black skirt; Miss

Jolly, royal blue silk evening blouse,
black skirt; Miss H. Graham, pink silk

frock; Miss R. Graham, white silk; Miss

Roche. uale blue dress.

ZILLAH.

CAMBRIDGE.

Dear Bee, October 22.

On Wednesday evening

A MOST SUCCESSFUL AND ENJOY-

ABLE DANCE

was given as a farewell to Airs Payze
and her family prior to leaving their
new home at Alatamata. Airs Taylor
was the organiser, and took the man-

agement of affairs, and she is stuh a

splendid hostess that all were well look-
ed after and enjoyed themselves. She

was assisted by Alesdames AlcCullagh
and E. Souter and the Alisses Skeet and

Clarke. The hall was beautifully de-

corated with flags and lycopodium hung
in festoons from corner to corner of the

ceiling. Quantities of English may
decorated the stage, which was arrang-
ed as a drawingroom. The supper-room
was also decorated with lycopodium,
and on the supper table the flowers,
which were white azaleas, were arrang-
ed most artistically in the form of an

arch. The supper was most recherche,
and consisted of all the dainties of the
season. Airs Payze was wearing a

black silk and net gown; Miss H.

Payze, a pretty white muslin, wilh scar-

let chou on bodice; and Aliss Dorothy
Payze, white muslin. Jpst before sup-
per Mr G. A. Clarke made a very ap-

propriate little speech, saying how

much Airs Payze and her family would
be missed from amongst us, and wish-

ing them every happiness in their new

home, to which Air C. Payze responded
on behalf of his mother and sisters.
Airs Taylor was wearing a black silk

and lace gown, with pink roses on cor-

sage; Airs Young (Auckland), black ac-

cordion-pleated. crepe de chine; Alls C.

Hunter, black silk and lace; Airs Alc-

Cullagh. black silk blouse, black voile

skirt; Mrs E. Souter, black silk; Airs

A. Souter, black silk voile, with creme

medallions on bodice; Airs Ba eh. white

silk; Airs Wells, black broche silk, hand-

some crimson and blaek opera coat ; Mrs

James Hally, black accordion-pleated

crepe de chine; Airs A. Stone, white silk;

Airs J. Ferguson, black silk; All's Pil-

cher, blaek silk anti lace gown; Mrs

Dickinson, blaek silk blouse, black skirt;
Mrs Niblock, blaek silk, with creme lace

front; Mrs Butter, white silk blouse,

blaek skirt; Airs Earle, black silk; Airs

Worrall, black silk and lace gown; Mrs

Chitty, blaek satin; Airs G. Brown, navy

blue and white gown, with creme me-

dallions on bodice; Airs F. Gane, white

muslin, with heliotrope sash and rib-

bon on bodice; Airs A. Gibbons, white

silk, with accordion-pleated chiffon

hanging sleeves; Airs G. A. Clarke,

black silk and white lace; Mis H.

Clarke, pink silk; Airs AY . Brawn, clack

silk; Airs Tribe, fawn and heliotrope

gown; Mrs Skeet, blaek silk blouse,

black skirt; Airs R. Skeet looked well

in soft white silk evening frock, with

yellow sash; Aliss Wells, oyster white

merveilleux, with tiny pink hedge roses

in coiffure; Aliss H. Wells, was becom-

ingly gowned in black silk, with black

lace sleeves and berthe, and blue con-

volvulus in her hair; Aliss D. Giliillan

(Auckland) wore a pretty gown of

white spotted net over white satin,

trimmed with quantities of white sat-

in bebe ribbon, and touches of blacK

velvet on her corsage, and a spray of

lovely pink roses; Aliss E. Young
(Auckland), white spotted net over pale

blue silk, the bodice finished with a

pretty trellis work of pale blue ribbon,

Empire belt of pale blue and mauve silk,
and a spray of purple violets on cor-

sage; Aliss Clarke, blue silk; Aliss l’ei‘-

rin (AVaiuku), white silk; Alias -i.

Young, white silk blouse, black skirt;

Aliss Brooks, pink and white silk

blouse, blaek skirt; Aliss K. Willis,
white muslin, crimson sash and crimson

roses on bodiee; Miss Jeffries, white

silk blouse, blaek skirt; Aliss Gibbison,
white silk blouse, black skirt; Aliss
Dickinson, white silk, trimmed with in-

sertion; Aliss Walker, white silk, crim-

son roses on eorsage and in her hair;
Aliss Dunne, white silk blouse, black

skirt; Aliss Hicks white muslin; Aliss

Bancroft, fawn costume; Aliss Keesing,
white silk, with much tucking and in-

sertion, crimson roses on bodice; Aliss

Pickering, blue silk; Aliss A. Hally,
white silk; Alias Molly Taylor, white

muslin over pink silk; Aliss Pilcher,

white silk; Aliss Hill, black evening
dress, wilh crimson roses oil bodice and

in her hair; Miss P. Ferguson, vhito
muslin; Miss AL Fisher, pink muslin.
Amongst the men were Messrs Tnylor,
Slone (2), Richardson (2), Watchhorn,

Falls, Farnall, Brown (2), Clarke (3),

Payze (2), Banks, Heston, Hunter (2),
Hally, Gane (3), Fisher (2), Isherwood,
Forbes, Alartyn, Jeffries, Wells, Doug-
las, Walker.

On Thursday afternoon, at St. And-
rew’s Guild, a very pleasant function
took place, the occasion beirg

A FAREWELL TO AfRS PAYZE AND

HER TWO DAUGHTERS.

The schoolroom had been deeorated for
the occasion, and a most delicious tea

provided by the ladies of the guild. In

the absence of the Archdeacon and Mrs
Willis, Airs YVells presented Airs Payze
with a handsomely carved oak and sil-

ver biscuit barrel, and a silver bread
fork from the guild as a slight acknow-
ledgment of the good work she

had done for the cliureli. Mrs AfcCnl-
lagli presented the Alisses Payze with a

gold medallion each to held a miniature.

On Wednesday afternoon there was a

most amusing

HOCKEY MATCH

on the Bardowie grounds, between a

team of Cambridge ladies and a team

of gentlemen in fancy dress. The lat-

ter were so handicapped by their skirts

in the management of which they got
into great difficulties that the ladies

proved victorious, winning by two to

one.

ELSIE.

GISBORNE.

Dear Bee, October 21.

Last Saturday a number of lady mem-

bers of the

GOLF CLUB

assembled at the links to make a small

presentation to their secretary. Aliss

Matheson. The presentation consisted of

a silver-mounted purse and silver-topped
honey jar. Aliss Matheson has been a

most energetic secretary, and has worked

hard for the club, and her many friends
wished to show their appreciation of her

work.

His Alajesty’s has been occupied every

night this week. For show' week the
theatre has been taken for

ST. ALARY’S CHURCH BAZAAR,

which is to be a monster affair, lasting
five days. Bishop Lenihan lias kindly
lent his miniature electric railway, and

this will be exhibited. Another feature

will be the fancy dancing, for which one

hundred ladies have been practising. The

dances and costumes are very beautiful.

On Thursday afternoon the opening of
the

ROWING SEASON

took place. A most attractive programme
had been arranged, including swimming
races, boat races and a cruise round the

bay in the launches, but most of this had
to be abandoned, as the sea was rough and

the day cold. However, the Tuna, wilh

the City Band aboard, steamed up the

river to the boatshed, followed by a num-

ber of launches and small boats, and then

there was a procession of decorated boats.

After that there were boat races. Some

of the boats were beautifully decorated
with flowers and greenery, the two which

were most admired for their artistic ar-

rangement being manned by employees of

Alessrs. Williams and Kettle’s and Alessrs

Common, -Shelton & Co.’s firms.

The weather has cleared up a-t last,
and there seems every chance of fine wea-

ther for the show and races.

ELSA.

NAPIER.

Dear Bee, October 21.

The pupils of the Napier High School

were favoured with delightful weather

for their

ANNUAL SPORTS,

which took place on Tuesday afternoon

at the Recreation Ground. A large

number of visitors were present. After-

noon tea was given by Airs Polsoin.

Amongst, the onlookers were Lady
Campbell, who was wearing a smart

costume of black voile, white silk vest,
black toque with ospreys; Mrs Hum-

phries was also in black; Aliss Hum-

phries, cream eloth costume with gold
buttons, white felt hat with heliotrope
flowers; Aliss Ethel Humphries, pale
green linen, the bodice trimmed with
white lace insertion, white chip hat;
Airs Pharazyn, slate grey cloth, grey fea-
ther boa, black velvet bonnet with

phones; Airs Stedman wore a cherry-
coloured gown, embroidered with gold;
Mr* Hiddell, black voile, large and ba-

coming black hat, trimmed with rudied
white chiffon; Airs De Lisle, pale grey;
cloth, mueh tucked, and relieved with

white silk, white hat with pale blue
rosettes; Miss George White, tussore

silk costume with rows of ecru inser-

tion, run with pale green bebe ribbon*
Mrs Edgar wore a blue costume and a

becoming hat of white tulle and large
piuk roses; Aliss Ditchings (Levin)
looked well in soft white silk with a

number of narrow flounces round tha
edge of the skirt; Airs Westall, deep
cream voile, relieved with pink, pink and
white hat; Airs J. 1. Cato looked ex-

tremely well in a dark grey gown and a

large black velvet picture hat; Airs W,
Cato was beautifully dressed in sea

green voile, embroidered with white silk,
and a deep yoke of niched white chiffon,
white toque with bunches of lilac; Airs
Bradley wore black and white; Airs

Cornford, navy blue dress with white
lace on the bodice, blaek bonnet; Aliss

Cornford’s pate green linen gown was

also trimmed with white lace; Aliss

Hunter, white drill coat and skirt, helio-

trope toque; Aliss Nevill was in pink
muslin; Aliss Hovell, red linen dress
with yoke of string-coloured lace, large
red hat to mateh; Miss Headley was in
blue and white; Airs T. C. Aloore was

daintily dressed in pale blue silk voila

and blaek velvet bebe ribbon, cream

chip toque with bows of pale blue silk;
Aliss Locking, white muslin with rows

of blaek and white embroidery round
the skirt; Aliss Aladge Hindmarsh,
cream dress, white hat with pale blue

bows; Aliss Burke looked well in string-
coloured voile, chifl'on boa of the same

colour, and black velvet hat; Aliss Dean
was in white, and she wore a hat to

match; Mrs A. A. Kennedy, blouse of
white muslin and insertion, drill skirt,
burnt straw hat with pale green rib-

bons; Airs Antill, blaek dress, relieved
with white lace; Airs AlcLernon was

CUTICURA
mi

Purest of Emollients and
Greatest of Skin Cares.

The Most Wonderful Curative
of All Time

For Torturing, Disfiguring
Skin Humours

And Purest and Sweetest of
Toilet Emollients.

Cuticura Ointment is beyond question
the most successful curative for tortur-

ing,disflguringhumours of the skin and

scalp, including loss of hair, ever

compounded, in proof of which a

single anointing preceded by a hot bath
with Cuticura Soap, and followed in
the severer cases, by a dose of Cuti-‘
cura Resolvent, Is often sufficient to,
afford immediate relief in the most

distressing forms of itching, burning
and scaly humours, permit rest and
sleep, and point to a speedy cure when
all other remedies fail. It is especially
so in the treatment of infants and chil-
dren, cleansing, soothing and healing
the most distressing of infantile hu-
mours, and preserving, purifying and

beautifying the skin, scald and hair. I
Cuticura Ointment possesses, at the

same time, the charm of satisfying the

simple wants of the toilet, in caring for

the skin, scalp, hair, hands and feet,
from infancy to age, far more effect-

ually, agreeably and economically than
the most expensive of toilet emollients.
Its “Instant relief for skin-tortured'
babies," or “ Sanative,antiseptic cleans- 1
Ing,” or

“ One-night treatment of the;
hands or feet,” or “Single treatment

of the hair,” or “Use after athletics,”;
cycling, golf, tennis, riding, sparring, l
or any sport, each in connection with

the use of Cuticura Soap, is sufficient
evidence of this. I

CutieuraResolvent,Mould andin the form of Chocolate
Coatedrub. Cuticura Ointmentand Cuticura Soap ara

Bold throughout th« World. Denote:London. VT Charter-
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